Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Jojo Cheng <jojo.cheng@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 14 April 2020 4:24 PM

To: Irene Tay; LOD; Claims Dept of CTI

Cc: Andre Chow En De; Songcuan JR Lauro Araos; Loi Ai Ting; Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: LOD - Our ref: SLU8259R (KIA) / Your ref: SNM19D206172 - TP CHINA TAIPING /

DOA: 22/12/2019

Hi Irene,

Any update?

Best Regards,

JoJo Cheng

@(@: Exceptional Journeys
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wr
ﬁr A member ol the [arding Cycle & Carrizge Group

From: Jojo Cheng

Sent: 06 March 2020 12:23 PM

To: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>; LOD <lod@sg.cntaiping.com>; Claims Dept of CTI
<claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Songcuan JR Lauro Araos
<lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Loi Ai Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
<veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Subject: LOD - Our ref: SLU8259R (KIA) / Your ref: SNM19D206172 - TP CHINA TAIPING / DOA: 22/12/2019

Hi Irene,
Attached file for your reference.

For the original copy will post out later, kindly provide us your offer of settlement in order to close this case.

E;Jn; behalf of our customer, we provide the following claim for your settleme
elow:

Repair Cost . $4,663.06
Loss of Rental/ Use : $ 420.00 ($60.00x 07 days)
Total . $5,083.06




Your kind understanding and help is much appreciated.
Best Regards,

JoJo Cheng
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DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended
recipient, you are notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is
strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and
destroy the original message. Any views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the
views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its related corporations.



