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Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: CLAIMS@CHENGAUTO.COM

Sent: Thursday, 16 April 2020 5:31 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: GBF 2221K - SOLE FITNESS | DOA : 23/12/2019 | REF. NO. : CMTD1905999/SYH;

Dear Mr Rasul, 

 

We accept the lumpsum offer $4,800.00 before GST & 08 working days. 

 

Please advise if we should submit the Letter of Demand to LKK to Sompo directly. 

 

Thanks & Best Regards, 
Claims Department 

 

  

CHENG AUTO BODYWORKS 

HP: 8666 7775 | Office-Tel: 6631 0707 | Fax: 6316 2431 
 

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Thursday, 16 April 2020 3:53 PM 

To: claims@chengauto.com 

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: GBF 2221K - SOLE FITNESS | DOA : 23/12/2019 | REF. NO. : CMTD1905999/SYH; 

 

Hi Muru, 

 

Finalised amount round up lump sum is $ 4,800 / 8 days of repair 

Kindly confirm  

 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Rasul | Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

From: claims@chengauto.com [mailto:claims@chengauto.com]  

Sent: Thursday, 16 April, 2020 1:50 PM 

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) 
Subject: RE: GBF 2221K - SOLE FITNESS | DOA : 23/12/2019 | REF. NO. : CMTD1905999/SYH; 

 

Dear Mr Rasul, 
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Thank you for informing us about the changes. 

 

Attached is the amended calculation of Cost of repair. 

 

Thanks & Best Regards, 

Claims Department 

Murugesan 

  
CHENG AUTO BODYWORKS 

HP: 8666 7775 | Office-Tel: 6631 0707 | Fax: 6316 2431 

 

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Thursday, 16 April 2020 9:52 AM 

To: claims@chengauto.com 

Subject: RE: GBF 2221K - SOLE FITNESS | DOA : 23/12/2019 | REF. NO. : CMTD1905999/SYH; 

 

Hi Muru, 

 

Refer to attachment 

 

There is changes on the rear bumper part prices and the labour and  

I did inform to Wesley about this matter and he noted and agreed. Kindly check and re-calculate again on the 

finalise amount 

 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Rasul | Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

From: claims@chengauto.com [mailto:claims@chengauto.com]  

Sent: Wednesday, 15 April, 2020 4:10 PM 
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) 

Subject: RE: GBF 2221K - SOLE FITNESS | DOA : 23/12/2019 | REF. NO. : CMTD1905999/SYH;  

 

Dear Mr. Rasul, 

 

Attached is the finalisation report. 

 

Please let us know if our calculation matches yours. 

 

Thanks & Best Regards, 

Claims Department 

Murugesan 
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CHENG AUTO BODYWORKS 

HP: 8666 7775 | Office-Tel: 6631 0707 | Fax: 6316 2431 

 

From: CLAIMS@CHENGAUTO.COM <CLAIMS@CHENGAUTO.COM>  

Sent: Wednesday, 8 January 2020 5:50 PM 

To: 'Rasul (LKKAuto)' <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: GBF 2221K - SOLE FITNESS | DOA : 23/12/2019 | REF. NO. : CMTD1905999/SYH;  

 

Dear Mr Rasul, 

 

As per requested, please find the attached accident video for your perusal. 

 

Thanks & Best Regards, 

Claims Department 

 

  
CHENG AUTO BODYWORKS 

HP: 8666 7775 | Office-Tel: 6631 0707 | Fax: 6316 2431 
 
Reporting Centre 

Address: 5 Soon Lee Street #01-60 Pioneer Point, Singapore 627607 

Email: claims@chengauto.com 

 

Workshop 

Address: 5 Soon Lee Street #01-62 Pioneer Point, Singapore 627607 

Email: cab@chengauto.com 

 

Spraypainting 

Address: 1 Soon Lee Street #06-41 Pioneer Centre, Singapore 627605 

Email: cab@chengauto.com 
 


