


5/9/2020 Merimen e-Claims

Print Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*XD9303L (MCV2020D0000066)
[YP4075C]

TP
SEMBWASTE PTE LTD
Dec 28 2019 2:00PM
[

Zenith Engineering Pte Ltd

From India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (lll_SG), sent on 03/04/2020 16:33 PM.
To LKK_HQ
Subject Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$13507.45) - XD9303L - Claim Handler: C. Meenachi

Approved:13507.45.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_Print&CFID=71060188&CFTOKEN=18cfb55c82f1c5e0-ABCFEB... 1/1



- > Back to OneMotoring

Land Transport Authority

Land Transport Authority

10 Sin Mitg Drive

Singapore 575701

GST Registration No. : M4-0006529-2

Print Date/Time : 30 Dec2019/21:49:45
Receipt Date/Time : 30 Dec 2019/ 21:49:45
Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt No, : [TNET-00000-191230-003723

Previous Receipt No. :

SIN Item Description/ Amount GST Amount
Business Transaction Reference Before Amount After GST
No. GST (S%) (5%) (S%)

Result of Insurance Enquiry - YP4075C
As at 28 Dec 2019/14:40:00

Insurance Co: INDIA INT'L INS PTE LTD
1 Insurance Enquiry - YP4075C

Enquiry Fee 7.00 0.49 7.49
20181230214705645117
Sub-Total 7.00 0.49 7.49
Total Before Rounding 7.00 0.49 7.49
Rounding Difference 0.04
Total Amount Payable 7.45
Paid By
XXXXXXXXXXXX2002 \?ifailr:n::t?rbar g 7.45
Total 7.45
Cash Change - 0.00
Tendered AmoLint 7.45
Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider / financial institution, Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is cansidered void and |ate fee
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Our Ref. JC/SW ACC/206/19

19 February 2020 " CURRNGE PTE

India International Insurance Pte Ltd w By Post & Email

64 Cecil Street (motorclaim@iii.com.sq)
#04/#05 10B Building

Singapore 049711

Attention: Motor Claims Department

Dear Sirs

ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD9303L & YP4075C ALONG KJE (PIE) AFTER WOODLANDS ROAD EXIT
LANE 3 ON 28.12.2019

We refer to the above subject.

We wish to inform that we had completed the repair of our vehicle no. XD9303L and enclose the following
supporting documents for your attention:

* Zenith Engineering Pte Ltd — Tax Invoice No. SA20-L0077 dated 30.1.2020 for sum of S3%11,400.00
exclude GST;

* LTA search fee receipt dated 30.12.2019 for your insured vehicle no. YP4075C:

* A copy of colour photos of our vehicle no. XD9303L after repair; and

e A copy of your appointed surveyor, LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd's email dated 9.1.2020 on the
confirmation of the finalized repair costs of our vehicle no. XD9303L.

We are of the view that the accident was caused by the negligence of your insured vehicle no. YP4075C.
In the premises, we look towards you for the loss and damage suffered by us as a result of the said
acecident. As a resuit of the accident, our vehicle na. XOF3G3( was damaged and we fiad veen put (O

loss and expense, particulars of which are as follows:

. 1._Repair costs (exclude GST) __§$11.400.00 s
2. lLoss of use @ S$150 x 14 days S$ 2,100.00 " 8 RIS re-wiwimingion on yo e
Y |
3. LTA search S$ 7.45 - e (V2020 D 00000 66,
Total: 3513,50745 o _e_eﬂa_cﬁ” i
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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Joanne Chew <joanne.chew@sembcorp.com>

Sent: Monday, 11 May 2020 9:51 AM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto); Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Cc: Mohamad Azman Bin Rani

Subject: RE: Our Ref. JC/SW ACC/206/19 - RE: Your ref XD 9303L : Accident involving YP 4075C
and XD 9303L on 28.12.2019

Attachments: DS XD 9303L lll.pdf

Dear Cecilia,

Thank you for your email of 9 May 2020.

We would like to inform that we are the owner of the vehicle XD9303L submitting the claim and we did not authorize
Zenith Engineering Pte Ltd to claim on behalf of us.

Please amend the discharge voucher on the first paragraph to replace [Zenith Engineering Pte Ltd (“the workshop”)] to
[SembWaste Pte Ltd (“the owner”)] and the last paragraph to issue the cheque in favour of SembWaste Pte Ltd.

We look forward to receive your amended discharge voucher.

Regards
Joanne

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Saturday, May 9, 2020 7:56 PM

To: Joanne Chew <joanne.chew@sembcorp.com>; Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Mohamad Azman Bin Rani <mohamad.rani@sembcorp.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref. JC/SW ACC/206/19 - RE: Your ref XD 9303L : Accident involving YP 4075C and XD 9303L on
28.12.2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Joanne,

We are pleased to offer and settle at $13,507.45 (all-in) as per your LOD.

Kindly sign on DV as attached and email back to us (LKK) together with the LOA.

Thanks

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”
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EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

DISCHARGE VOUCHER
lll-Direct Settlement (PODS)

India Ref: MCV2020D0000066
Claimant Ref: XD 9303L

"the owner"
we/, SembWaste Pte Ltd (" XBOXREROD") hereby confirm that we/l have reached an agreement
with the appointed Surveyor of India International Insurance Pte Ltd LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name
of Surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for S$_11,400.00 (repair cost), $$.2,100.00 (loss of
use/remtal), S$ 7.45 (search fee), vehicle no.XD 9303L that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred
on_28/12/2019 (date) at__KJE(PIE) AFT WDLANDS RD EXIT LANE 3 (location) involving vehicle no.YP 4057C (insured

vehicle). This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 06/01/2020 (date) A XIKXKKREKOD".

the owner
We/l confirm that we/l are/am X2X¥XEEEXXX the owner SEMBWASTE PTE LTD " {

EXiREX") of vehicle no.XD 9303L to make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l have full authority to settle
the matter xpOtxhextekaik in a manner that we/l deem fit. XiEK XEXRINSEXDEXSIX KK Xot 6K MK FOK Y XORVIE RODY XK iKib

owner
We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of all claims of "the ¥

pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a without prejudice and without admission of liability

basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have exclusive jurisdiction over any

dispute arising out of the same.

SEMBWASTE PTE LTD

We/l authorize you to pay the totalamountof S$_13,507.45  to

Dated this .22 day of ......... May 20 ...
CLAIMANT: WITNESS: MR
Signature: Signature:
i " " (Wi Signed by appointed Surveyor

Signed by thew (with chop) g Y appol urvey
Name: Mohamad Azman Name: LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
RS 199507280G NRIC: 199607198R
Co. Registration .
Address: 30 Hill Street #05-04 Address: 51 UBI AVE 1 #02-25

Singapore 179360

PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK S(408933)

ingaporean
Nationality: S gap Nationality:

Senior Executive Occupation:

Occupation:
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