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Your Reft CMTD2000068/LOR Date: 07 January 2020
Our Ref: CS/SMO2000025 | [Esf3

The Motor Claims Department

SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PL

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVISE REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. __SMD 62555 .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle on

06/01/2020 at the premises of M/s Automotive Repair Centre Pte Ltd and have the
following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount 'S8 17.490.00 :
Revised Estimate Amount (5§ 852000 :
*“Check™ Items Amount :S§  7.350.00 .
Market Value : 8§ - ;
LTA Reimbursement Value 1 5% =

Neu Value : 8% -
Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages
at the rear portion.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages ConsistenL.
Repair days: 6 days

Yours faithfully

Chen Tsue Yee
Automotive Assessor



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Teo, Grace <grace teo@sompo.comsg>

Sent: Monday, 6 January 2020 11:33 AM

To: raymond@automaotiverepaircentre.com.sg; Wong, Lormance; ‘admin-
d@lkkauto.com’; ‘assignments@lkkauto.com’

Cc: kenguan@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg; 'Lin Shu Juan'; Ye, Yong Kang Melvin;
Henry, Irene James

Subject: CMTD2000068/LOR - LKK)/ CB7018H & SMD62555 ACC ON 03.01.20 - VEH IN

Attachments: EST2001-D01 SMDB2555. pdf, SAS2727999 PDF

Our Reference: CMTD2000068/LOR
Your Reference: SMDB2555

Without Prejudice

Date: 06/01/2020 EMAIL ONLY
OUR Email: motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg
Attention:

M/S AUTOMOTIVE REPAIR CENTRE PTE LTD

Dear Raymond,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING CB701BH & SMD62555 ON 03.01.2020
We refer to your email reply of today.

We will appoint Mr. Kenneth Kong of LKK Auto to conduct the survey.

Hi LKK AUTO,

Please make the arrangement to survey for SMDE2555 on a without prejudice basis and revert your report upon
completion of survey to my colleague, Ms, Lorriance.

Thank you.

Please note our office will be closed on 24" January 2020 (Friday). Business will resume on 28™ January
2020 (Tuesday).

Wishing you a happy and prosperous Lunar New Year, filled with wealth, good health and success always!

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D: 63295170 | T: 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147



For.motor claims survey request, please email to motorsurveyv@sompo.com.sg

@ SOMPO A century of Trust

|'~JSURAMCE

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Lid,
50 Raffies Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www sompo.com.sq | Facebook: www facebook com/SompaSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission' & Product Purchase? via Sompo 8G

o .pr Store >~ Ctéq;'c Play

Download now @ or
Fiwr Teavel, Personal Acodemt & Home Insprance | = For Travel, Personal Acoident, Home & Prvae Motor Insurnnce

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the parson(s) or company named and may contain confidential
andior legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited
If you are not the intended recipient, please delate this message

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompa Insurance Singapore Pte. Lid may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
siated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure |s permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click hare for
our Privacy Policy

From: raymond@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg <raymond@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg=>

Sent: Monday, January 6, 2020 11:30 AM

To: Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>; Wong, Lorriance <lorriance. wong@sompo.com.sg>

Cec: kenguan@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg; 'Lin Shu Juan' <shujuan(@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg>;
Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; Henry, Irene James <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>
Subject: RE: CMTD2000068/LOR - PRI(LIA)/ CB7018H & SMD62555 ACC ON 03.01.20

Dear Grace,

We shall select below surveyor:

Kenneth Kong (North
2 LKK Auto Consultants area)

Kindy arrange soonest possible.

Thank you.

Best Regards.

Raymond Tan

Automotive Repair Centre Pte Ltd
A8 Woodlands Industrial Park El
#05-18, Singapore 757700

Tel: +65 64688834

Fax: +65 64622278

From: Teo, Grace <grace.leo/ @ sompo,.com.se>

Sent: Monday, 6 January 2020 10:40 AM

To: rmyvmond @automotiverepaircentre.com.sg; Wong, Lorriance <lorriance. wong @sompo.coni.sg>

Ce: kenguan/a automotiverepaircentre.com.sg: Lin Shu Juan <shujuan(@ automotiverepaircentre.com.sg=;

2



Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye@sompo.com.se>; Henry, Irene James <irene henrviwsompo.com.se>
Subject: CMTD2000068/LOR - PRI(LIAY CB7018H & SMD6255S ACC ON 03.01.20

" Our Reference: CMTD2000068/LOR
Your Reference: SMD62555

Without Prejudice
Date: 06/01,/2020 EMAIL ONLY

OUR Email: motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg

Attention:
M/S AUTOMOTIVE REPAIR CENTRE PTE LTD

Dear Raymand,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING CB7018H & SMD62555 ON 03.01.2020
We refer to your Notice of Accident dated 05/01/2020.

Please be informed that Ms. Lorriance Wong is the handler of this case who can be contacted at 63295 175/
lorriance. wong @sompo.com.sg .

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client's/your customer’s vehicle jointly with your
client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list to conduct
the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

Pre-Repair Survey

Selection (Indicate as
Motor Surveyor Surveyor tick)
1 Raleigh Services Andrew Ow Yong
Vincent Ng
Kenneth Kong (North
2 LKK Auto Consultants area)

Marcus Chua (East area)
Maohd Rasul (West area)
Maohd Taufikh (West area)
3 Priority Services limmy Lee

Lawrence Ng

leffrey Ong

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select up to two of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost of
the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert.

Aside to Lorriance,

Please assist on the liability request from Automotive Repair Centre Pte Ltd.

|



Please note our office will be closed on 24" January 2020 (Friday), Business will resume on 28 January
2020 (Tuesday).

Wishing you a happy and prosperous Lunar New Year, filled with wealth, good health and success always!

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D: 83205170 | T. 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147

For motor claims survey request, please email to motorsurvev@sompo.com.sg

& SOMPO
@’ A Century of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower. Singapore (048623

Website: www sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www facebook com/SompoSG

Ouick & Easy Claims Submission' & Produet Purchase® vin Sompo SG

& App Store

Far Truvel Petsonal Agcident & Home Insurunce | * For Towvel, Persongl Aceldent, Home & Private Molor Insurance

Download now a ur

Disclaimer: This e-mail. including attachments. is intended for the person(s) ar company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this infarmation may be urlawful and is prohibited
If you sra not the intended recipient, please delete this message

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd may collect. use and disclose your parsonal data for the purposes
staled in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to halding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws. our third parly service providers and agents (acting on our behalfl}. Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: Raymond Tan <ravmond automotivere
Sent: Sunday, January 5, 2020 8:28 PM

To: claimsreport <claimsreportia sompo.com.sg>; Claims - Motor Survey <MotorSurveyv g sompo.com,sg>
Ce: kenguan @automotiverepaircentre.com.se; Lin Shu Juan <shujuan@automotiverepaireentre.com, sp>
Subject: SMD6255S - TP Claim against CB7018H

Wil rcentre.com.sg>

Dear Claim Officer in-charge,

Qur client’s vehicle SMD62555 wants to make a third party claim against CB7018H which is insured by Sompo
Insurance Singapore Pte, Ltd.

Attached are the accident report and estimate.
Kindly acknowledge claim officer in-charge as we would like to know the liability details.
“Vehicle SMD62555 currently at our workshop, survey to arrange soonest as possible.

Thank you.



Best Regards,
. Raymond Tan
Automotive Repair Centre I"te Lid
38 Woodlands Industrial Park F1
#U5-18, Singapore 757700
Tel: +65 64688834
Fax: +65 64622278



Steve Chen !Ll{l( Auto!

From: ARC Ken <kenguan@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, January 23, 2020 9:50 AM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Ce: ‘ARC Raymond'; 'ARC ShuJuan'

Subject: RE: SMD62555 - TP Claim against CB7018H (Sompo)
Dear Steve

Thank you for the call.
Confirm finalized at $8,454.08 (P/P, before GST). 6 repair days.

With best regards,
Ken Ng

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@|kkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 23 January 2020 9:30 AM

To: kenguan@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg

Ce: 'ARC Raymond' <raymond@automaotiverepaircentre com.sg>; 'ARC Shuluan’
<s5h u'uan@autamnlwerepalrcentre.cﬂm_sg:-

Subject: SMD6255S - TP Claim against CB7018H (Sompo)
Dear Ken,
As per our communicate earlier. Revise the finalize $8,454.08 (P/P, before GST). 6 repair days.

Kindly confirm.

Thanks.

Best Regards,
Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Emall: SteveChen®|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, H02-25 | 5{408933)

From: ARC Ken [mailto:kenguan@aytomotiverepaircentre.com.sg)
Sent: Tuesday, January 21, 2020 11:06 AM
To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)
: '"ARC Raymond'; 'ARC ShuJuan’
Subject: RE: SMD6255S - TP Claim against CB7018H (Sompo)



Shirlez Hiew (LKK Autu!

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 7 January 2020 4:43 pm

To: 'Wong, Lorriance’

Ce: SUR; assignments; ‘Teo, Grace'; 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin’; ‘Henry, Irene James
Subject: RE: CMTD2000068/LOR - LKK)/ CB7018H & SMD62555 ACC ON 03.01.20 - VEH IN
Attachments: PREL| ADVISE - SMD 6255S.pdf

Dear Lorriance,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SMD 62555.

“Wishing you a Happiness and Prosperity New Year"”

Thank you

Hest Regards,

Shirley Higw | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultanis Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Syritikkauio.com | fax: 6256-4313
Blk 31, Paya Ubi Industrial Park. LTbi Avenue |, #02-25 | (408933}

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 6 January 2020 11:55 am

To: 'Teo, Grace' <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; "Wong, Lorrance'
<lorriance.wong(@sompo.com.sg>; assignments <assignments(@lkkauto.com>

Ce: kenguan@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg: ‘Lin Shu Juan' <shujuan@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg>; 'Ye,
Yong Kang Melvin' <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; 'Henry, Irene James' <irene henry(@sompo.com.sg=>
Subject: RE: CMTD2000068/LOR - LKK)/ CB7018H & SMD62555 ACC ON 03.01.20 - VEH IN

Dear Sir/Madam.

Thank you for your assignment.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6741-8454 | email: assignments@kkauto.gom | lnx: h256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4080311)



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Crwner 1D Type: Business

Owner ITx 466)

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: 5MD&2555

Vehicle to be Exported: No

Intended Deregistration Date: 06 Jan 2020
Vehicle Make; HONDA

Vehicle Model: FREED HYERID 1.5G AUTO
Primary Colour: White
Manufacturing Year: 201B

Engine No.: LEBS&01783
Chassis No.: GB71068296
Maximum Power Outpul: 101.0 kW (135 bhp)
Open Market Value: $25.820.00

Original Registration Date: 28 Aug 2018

First Registration Date: 28 Aug 2018
Transfer Count: 0

Actual ARF Pald; £18.148.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: Yes

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 27 Aug 2028

PARF Rebate Amount: $13.611.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 27 Aug 2028

COE Category: E - Open - all except motorcycle
COE Period|Years): 10

QP Paid: $£3342000

COE Rebate Amount: £28,87400

Total Rebate Amount: $42,485.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 06 Jan 2020

OK



N

Automotive Repair Centre Pte Ltd

ARCQC gmezime e ml G 12 1y, Estimate

38 Woodlands Incustrial Park €1, | /., FESTIMATENO.: EST2001-001
#05-18, Singapore 757700 N (LA ¢ A DATE:  3-an-2020
Tel: 64688834  Fax: 64671278 p POLICY NO. :  PNCV2019-00001007
E-mail: info@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg J VEHICLE REG. ND. : SMD&62555
r' {+,, VEHICLE MAKE :  HOMNDA FREED HYBRID 1.5G AUTO

TO  motor Claim Department
Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd
50 Raffles Place
#05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower
Tel: 6221 2211, Fax: 6221 3147

" [} FORSURVEYOR

ESTIMATE REPAIR COST
NO. DESCRIFTION | UNIT COST TOTAL COST
SPARE PARTS
1 Rear Bumper {1l 1 5 1,250.00 | § 1,250.00 ﬂs/
2 Rear Bumper Clips - e 10 L1 600]|5S 60.00 3#/
3 | Rear Bumper Upper Retainer RH {;E 1 $ 30.00 | 5 30.00 |~
4 | Rear Bumper Upper Retainer LH - ;:.T L 5 30.00 | 5 30.00 |/
5 | Rear Bumper Lower RetainerRH | 7 (RU 1 s 40.00 | 4
6 | Rear Bumper Lower Retainer LH 1/ (PH 1 $ 40.00 | § %/
7 | RearBumper LHBracket | X [N 1 3 40,00 | § L4000 | X
8 | Rear Bumper Tow Eye Cover ~  [*[V 1 5 30.00 | § 30.00 |/
9 | Rear Bumper ReflectorRH X AN 1 5 60.00 | § g0.00 | X
10 | RearBumperReflector th X NN 1 5 60.00 | § 80,00 | X
1 Rear Tail Lamp RH f X W ! 5 600.00 | § 600,00 | X
12 | RearTaillampld = X ﬂll ! S 600.00 | $ W' X
13 | RearTailgate .~ /] ! S 1,000.00 | § 1,000.00 |/
14 | RearTallgate Rubberseat =, TN 1 5 120,00 | § 2000 |~
15_| Rear Tallgate Chrome Gamish [/ 1 5 240.00 | 5 240.00 |/
16 | Rear Tailgate License Plate Lamp ) X NN 2 g 60.00 | § 120000 | X
17 | Rear Tailgate Lamp RH -~ /i 1 5 450.00 | 5 450,00 | ~
18 | RearTallgatelamplH _— [ 1 5 450.00 | § 450,00 |~
19 | Rear Tailgate Honda Emblem " [fL 1 5 50.00 | § 50,00 |/~
20 Rear Tallgate Freed Emblem —~ /1L 1 5 60.00 | § 60,00 |7~
21 | Rear Tallgate Hybrid Emblem _- /I L 1 $ 70.00 | § 70,00 |~
22 | RearTailgate lockAssy - [If 1 5 100.00 | § 100,00 |~
23 | RearTaligate Lock Cover | o AJAf 1 5 40,00 | § ~40.00 | X
74 Rear Tallgate Lock Latch )( N.\U 1 5 40.00 | 5 -m.m X
25 | Rear Tailgate Absorber RH X NN 1 $ 150.00 | 150.00 | X
26 | Rear Tallgate Absorber Lt~ NN 1 s 150.00 | § 150.00 | X,
27 | Rear Taligate Cable . NAT 1 s 20000 | § 200.00 | X
8 | RearTallgateiner Trm /(R0 1 s 300,00 | § 300,00 |/
29 | Rear Taligate Inner Trim RH Cover No.4 X A/ ! 5 60.00 | § ;qmaj(
0 Rear Tailgate inner Trim Bottom Cover No.3 X NN 1 5 30,00 | § - ,“x
n Rear Tailgate Inner Trim LH Caver No. 2 X NAI 1 s 60.00 | § ﬁtﬂu X
2 | RearFender lnner TrimfH /(P4 1 $ 500.00 | § “so0.00| /6 7
13 Rear Fender Inner Trim LH 7 ~ (ﬂ 1 g 500.00 | & mﬂi"‘f{/

Page 10of 2



' Automotive Repair Centre Pte Ltd

A R C €O. Reg. No. : 201312913C Estimate
GST Reg. Mo. : 201312913C
318 Woodlands Industrial Park E1 ESTIMATE NO. ;  ESTZD01-001
#05-18, Singapore 757700 DATE :  3-Jan-2020
Tel: 64688634  Fax: 64622278 POLICY NO. :  PNCV2019-00001007
E-mail: info@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg VEHICLE REG. NO. : SMD62555
VEHICLE MAKE :  HONDA FREED HYBRID 1.5G AUTO
TO  Motor Claim Department FOR SURVEYOR B
Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte Lt
50 Raffles Place
#05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower
Tal: 6221 2211, Fax: 6221 3147
ESTIMATE REPAIR COST
NO. DESCRIPTION QUANTITY|  UNIT COST TOTAL COST
34 | Rear / End Panel Side Gamish No. 6 X NN 1 § 80.00 | 5 1 180.00 | X
35 | Rear / End Panel Gamish CoverNo.7 ./ ({0 l s 1s0.00[ s asew0| (/17
3% | EndPanel /0 ’ $ 450,00 | § “as0.00'|
37 | Rear Floor Panel Sink - XK . 1 5 100000 | §  "ajoo0ion | X
I8 Insulator Coat For Rear Floor Panel L N ;‘W 1 5 50.00 | § &_ X
39 | RearspareTyreBoardcover | X NN /7077 ! 5 65000 | § 650,00 | X
40 | RearExhaustMuffler .~ [T U vy 1 ] 750.00 | § 750.00 | {§ [/
41 | RearWindscreen - [[ — JIP l $ 1,250.00 | § 1,250.00 |[05S ~
42 | Rear Windscreen Moulding - [/t oY ¢orl ! 5 100.00 | $ 100.00 |/~
43 | Rear Windscreen Wiper Arm .~ ¢ S 0U-gV] 1 s 100.00 | § 100.00 |~
44 | Rear Windscreen Wipermotor X NN 1 s 550.00 | § 550,00 | X
45 | Longitudinal Acceleration Sensor N HH i 3 750,00 | § 750,00 | ¥
Tatal Spare Parts | § 13,410.00
SPECIAL NETT
46 | Rear Number Plate with Casing ~ ("] 1 1 20,00 [ § 40.00 |~
47 | Rear Windscreen Sealant .~ (fU 1 S 40.00 | § 40.00 |~
48 | Supsbeandisstalaionof Solar film -~ [/~ i, 1 $ 280.00 | § w.00 ||S0 /
49 | ReverseSensor .~ (i f (1 Set) T 2 $ 200.00 | § 400.00 | 900 7
Total Special Nett| § 760.00
LABOUR
50 | Spray painting Rear Bumper, Tallgate, Fenders & Inner Panels 1 5 1,000.00 | § 1,000.00
51 Remove, Replace, Repair and Refit Affected Area 1 5 1,200.00 | 5 1.10&!!11_
53 | Transfer Door Fitting and Window Mechanism to New Doar 1 5 100.00 | § 100,00 | 5¢
53 | Remove and Refit Rear Windscreen 1 5 150.00 | § 150,00 | j /¢
54 | Remove, Refit & Re-Align Rear Exhaust Pipe and Silencer 1 s 80.00 | § 80.00 | §
55 | Remove and Refit Rear Reverse Sensar 2 $ 8000 | § 160.00 | 70
56 | Diagnose and Rectify Fault Code and Calibrate Sensors 1 5 500.00 | § “so0.00| 7 )(
57 Apply Rust Prmrng an Replaced/Repaired Panel 1 5 100.00 | § 100.00 | 77
8 iy EIeCTr 1 5 30,00 | % 30.00: |~
E'::::f::ﬁmww“::;m;z: pecinmatoesnocverany /07U, Tl 8 S
= |0 Miapiny dafssbd'yl w which may be rﬁlmﬂ after W::n:m.l:::m Amount Befors Excess| § M08 q“cm‘-l-
» Pars prices & 4 a5 aged parfs are discovered which may not be evident on Add GST @ 7% 1,224.30
* Thind party sl d‘ ; thig the above price are not guaranteed. Total Amount Payable| § 18.714.30
o N6 llogel modioait S bre durrent and tu?_[egt p{;hp e - el TR, 8,714,

* Suppeementary Aam(s) mutt te resurvered s y00-1 (
o subject 12 firal approval irom nswance Company )

T 7 Il |
Ackrowiedges by Repesrer = 1/ Page2af2 (f T
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Automotive Repair Centre Pte Ltd

Supplementary

A R C €O. Reg. No, : 201312913C .

GST Reg. No. - 201312913C Estimate
38 Woodlands Industrial Park E1 ESTIMATE NO, :  EST2001-001 (SUP)
#05-18, Singapore 757700 DATE: 8-Jan-2020
Tel: 64688834  Fax: 64622278 POLICY NO, :  PNCYID19-00001007
E-mail; info@automotiverepalrcentre, com,sg VEHICLE REG. NO. :  SMD&2555

VEHICLE MAKE :  HONDA FREED HYBRID 1.5G AUTO

TO  motor Claim Department FOR SURVEYOR

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd
50 Raffles Place

#05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower
Tel: 6221 2211, Fax: 6221 1147

ESTIMATE REPAIR COST
NO. DESCRIFTION QUANTITY UMIT COST TOTAL COST
SPARE PARTS
1 | Tailgate Brake Light Top (Centre) ~~ [ h/1 ) ! s m 15080 | § ﬂ.
2 | ExhaustBush .~ TN f 1 5 200§ 12.00
3 | RearUndercover ,— (kW f 1 5 180,00 | § 180.00
§. Exhml Giimte  beel ‘EH wm -~ 00 Total Spare Parts | § 392.00
SPECIAL NETT
Total Special Nett| $ -
LABOUR
Estimate prepared by: Raymond Tan Total Labour | §
T S o which may b recbeg ses work hes bonstarted,  AmountBefors©cem| § %00
Occasionally,worn or damaged parts are discovered which may not be evident on Add GST @ 7% 27.44
the first i jon. Because of this, the above price are not guaranteed. Total Amount Payable| $ 419.44

Quotation on parts and labour are current and subject to change.
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50 RAFFLES PLACE
#05-01/08
SINGAPORE LAND TOWERSINGAPORE 048623

SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPOR

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 801-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: G256 3581 FAX: 8256 4315
Reg. MNo: 188607T108R GST Reg. No. 18-8607168-R

EPL CS/SMO20000251/Esf3n2

— ]

Code: SMOD

Insured Veh.  CB 7018H Veh. Inspected SMD 62555
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00

Claim No. CMTD2000068/LOR Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From GRACE TEO DE/01/2020

Make & Model

Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. GET71068206 Colour WHITE
Odometer 86046 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Moedification SPORTS RIM

PETLAS

THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS

185/60 R15

TR

Survey held at

AUTOMOCTIVE REPAIR CENTRE PTELTD

38 WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL PARK E1 # D5-18
SINGAPORE 757700




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapors 408933
TEL: 6258 3581 FAX: 62568 4315
Feg. Mo 199607T198R 33T Reg Mo, 19-9607198-R

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SMD 62555

Report Ref No. CS/SMO20000251/Esf3n2

1|REAR BUMPER DENTED 1.250.00 025.00
10|REAR BUMPER CLIPS @%6.00 NECESSARY B0.00 30.00

1|REAR BUMPER UPPER RETAINER RH BROKEN 30.00 30.00

1|REAR BUMPER UPPER RETAINER LH BROKEN 30.00 30.00

1|REAR BUMPER LOWER RETAINER RH CRUSHED 4000 40.00

1|REAR BUMPER LOWER RETAINER LH CRUSHED 40.00 40.00

1|REAR BUMPER LH BRACKET MNOT NECESSARY 40.00 -

1|REAR BUMPER TOW EYE COVER CRUSHED 30.00 30.00

1|REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR RH NOT NECESSARY 60.00

1|REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR LH NOT NECESSARY 60.00

1|REAR TAIL LAMP RH NOT NECESSARY 600.00 -

1|REAR TAIL LAMP LH NOT NECESSARY 600.00

1|REAR TAILGATE DENTED 1.000.00 1.000.00

1|REAR TAILGATE RUBBER SEAL TORN 120.00 120.00

1|REAR TAILGATE CHROME GARNISH BROKEMN 240.00 240.00

2|REAR TAILGATE LICENSE PLATE LAMP @$60.00 MOT NECESSARY 120.00 -

1|REAR TAILGATE LAMP RH BROKEN 450.00 450.00

1|REAR TAILGATE LAMP LH BROKEN 450.00 450.00

1]|REAR TAILGATE HONDA EMBLEM MECESSARY 50.00 50.00

1|REAR TAILGATE FREED EMBLEM NECESSARY 60.00 B0.00

1|REAR TAILGATE HYBRID EMBLEM NECESSARY 70.00 70.00

1|REAR TAILGATE LOCK ASSY BENT 100.00 100.00

1|REAR TAILGATE LOCK COVER NOT NECESSARY 40.00

1|REAR TAILGATE LOCK LATCH NOT NECESSARY 40.00

1|REAR TAILGATE ABSORBER RH NOT NECESSARY 150.00

1|REAR TAILGATE ABSORBER LH NOT NECESSARY 150.00

1|REAR TAILGATE CABLE NOT NECESSARY 200.00

1|REAR TAILGATE INNER TRIM CRUSHED 300.00 300.00

1|REAR TAILGATE INNER TRIM RH COVER NO 4 NOT NECESSARY B0.00

1|REAR TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOTTOM COVER NO.2 NOT NECESSARY 30.00

1|REAR TAILGATE INNER TRIM LH COVER ND.2 NOT NECESSARY B50.00
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REAR FENDER INNER TRIM LH
REAR/END PANEL SIDE GARNISH NO.G
REAR/END PANEL GARNISH COVER NO.7
END PAMEL

REAR FLOOR PANEL SINK

INSULATOR COAT FOR REAR FLOOR PANEL
REAR SPARE TYRE BOARD COVER

REAR EXHAUST MUFFLER

REAR WINDSCREEN

REAR WINDSCREEN MOULDING

REAR WINDSCREEN WIPER ARM

REAR WINDSCREEN WIPER MOTOR
LONGITUDINAL ACCELERATION SENSOR
TAILGATE BRAKE LIGHT TOP (CENTRENADDITIONAL)
EXHALUST BUSH (ADDITIONAL)

REAR UNDERCOVER (ADDITIONAL)

EXHAUST SILENCER HEAT SHIELD (ADDITIONAL)
LESS 20% DISCOUNT

SPECIAL NETT ITEMS

REAR NUMBER PLATE WITH CASING (SN)
REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT [SN)
SOLAR FILM (SN)

SET REVERSE SENSOR @$200.00 (SN)

LABOUR

SPRAY PAINTING REAR BUMPER, TAILGATE FENDERS &

INNER PANELS

REMOVE REPLACE REPAIR AND REFIT AFFECTED
AREA INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR FLOOR
PANEL SINK.

CRUSHED
CRUSHED
NOT NECESSARY

CRUSHED
DENTED

TO REPAIR SEE
LABOUR

NOT NECESSARY
NOT NECESSARY
BENT

BROKEN
NECESSARY

cuTt

NOT NECESSARY
NOT NECESSARY
CRACKED

TORN

CRUSHED
DENTED

cur
NECESSARY
NECESSARY
SHORTED

Report Ref No. CS/SMO20000251/Esf3n2

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6258 4315
Reg. No 199607198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-9607198-R

268.00

500.00 268.00
80.00 a
150.00 119.00
450,00 450,00
1.000.00 .
50.00 5
650.00 .
750,00 661.00
1,250.00 1,055.00
100.00 100.00
100.00 100.00
550.00 .
750.00 2
220,00 220.00
32.00 32.00
180.00 180.00
62.10 62.10
-1,496.02

13,904.10 5,084.08
40.00 40.00
40.00 40.00
280.00 150.00
400.00 200.00
T80.00 430.00
1,000.00 800.00
1,200.00 900.00




¥y L7L” LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
:""!#-. 51 il Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408533

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo 199607188R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

TRANSFER DOOR FITTING AND WINDOW MECHANISM

TO NEW DOOR

REMOVE AND REFIT REAR WINDSCREEN, 150.00 120.00
REMOVE,REFIT & RE-ALIGN REAR EXHALIST PIPE AND B0.00 80.00
SILENCER.

REMOVE AND REFIT REAR REVERSE SENSOR. 160.00 30.00
DIAGNOSE AND RECTIFY FALILT CODE AND CALIBRATE |NOT NECESSARY 500.00

SENSORS.

APPLY RUST PROOFING ON REPLACED/REPAIRED 100.00 30.00
PAMEL.

CHECK AND RECTIFY ELECTRICAL WIRING 30.00 30.00

& ML

CHEN TSUE YEE ADRIAN LING WA] PING
Automotive Assessor B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-AMMATAI
Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THRD PARTIES . This Meport i mds solsly lor e s wnd benedin of (ke Cliees nemsil on e rasl pegs of his Repon

Aapot. in whols or in sarl. doss o sl bis or her e k.



