Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 February 2021 3:43 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: YOUR REF: D19008086MFSH - SMG 2860E / Ol: SHA 3376X / DOA: 21/12/2019
Dear Cecilia,

Since no PRI was done, kindly close the file at your end.
Thank you.

Chris Lim
Motor Claims Dept.

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877

| Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3853 | Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn.
No. 195000106C

A Member of Insurance Group

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to
whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in
error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-
mail.

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 February 2021 3:37 pm

To: Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: YOUR REF: D19008086MFSH - SMG 2860E / Ol: SHA 3376X / DOA: 21/12/2019

Dear Chris,
Refer to the attached of the email from TP repairer.
They inform that they have withdraw the claim.

Kindly let u shave your approval/instruction to close the case at our end.

Thanks

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chony | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ld

Phone: 67494274 | email: CeciliaChong @[KkKauto.com | fax; 6741-4108

BIk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 23 February 2021 3:07 PM

To: Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: YOUR REF: D19008086MFSH - SMG 2860E / Ol: SHA 3376X / DOA: 21/12/2019

Dear Chris,

Till date no survey done. And we have email to TP on 09/12/2020 to arrange for survey by 14/12/2020 (as
attached).

Kindly let us have your instruction / approval to cancel case and close the case at our end as no survey has
been done.

Thanks

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 67494274 | email: CeciliaChong @lKKauto.com| fax; 67414108

BIk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



