Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 22 January, 2020 5:39 PM

To: ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg

Cc: vion.lim@eurokars.com.sg; assignments; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: ARRANGE FOR SURVEY / YOUR REF: XE2610R / OUR REF: SFD9420U QOur Ref:

19/19/20/VC06/022820 [External General] - LKK REF CC4/LPC20000190/Uha3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Ronald,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both party, the liability is clear subject to
the BOLA guideline settlement.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to
your client’s vehicle and admission of any liability to our Insured’s part. The final repair cost is subjected to the
consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the
number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor and approved by our principal.

Kindly forward the LOD and all supporting documents to us if available to proceed with the settlement.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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" Save the Larth- Print only whernr necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg [mailto:ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, 17 January, 2020 8:56 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: vion.lim@eurokars.com.sg; assignments; Admin A

Subject: RE: ARRANGE FOR SURVEY / YOUR REF: XE2610R / OUR REF: SFD9420U Our Ref: 19/19/20/VC06/022820
[External General]

Dear Vi,



Following up please.

Thank You,

Ronald Yap
Insurance Claims

Trans Eurokars Pte Ltd
5 Ubi Close, Singapore 408605
T: 6395 8899 H: 9127 7928
ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg

This email, including any attachment, is intended for the sole use of the recipient(s) named above and may contain information that is
confidential and/or proprietary to the Eurokars Group. If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then
delete this message from your system. Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other
person. Thank you.

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: 06 January 2020 07:41

To: Ronald Yap <ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg>; 'Vic (LKKAuto)' <vicalpeh@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Vion Lim <vion.lim@eurokars.com.sg>; assignments@Ikkauto.com; 'Admin A' <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: ARRANGE FOR SURVEY / YOUR REF: XE2610R / OUR REF: SFD9420U Our Ref: 19/19/20/VC06/022820
[External General]

Dear Ronald,

Thank you for the email.
Dear Vic,

Kindly assist

FYNA Our Ref : CC4/LPC20000190/Uha3

“Wishing you a Happiness and Prosperity New Year”

Best Regards
G.NIVITHA
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg [mailto:ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 3 January 2020 3:50 PM

To: admin-d@Ikkauto.com; assignments@lkkauto.com

Cc: vion.lim@eurokars.com.sg

Subject: RE: ARRANGE FOR SURVEY / YOUR REF: XE2610R / OUR REF: SFD9420U Our Ref: 19/19/20/VC06/022820
[External General]




Hi Nivitha,

Please advise liability of this case once established.

Thank You,

Ronald Yap
Insurance Claims

Trans Eurokars Pte Ltd
5 Ubi Close, Singapore 408605
T: 6395 8899 H: 9127 7928
ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg

This email, including any attachment, is intended for the sole use of the recipient(s) named above and may contain information that is
confidential and/or proprietary to the Eurokars Group. If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then
delete this message from your system. Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other
person. Thank you.

From: Ronald Yap <ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg>

Sent: 31 December 2019 13:00

To: Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>; assignments@I|kkauto.com

Cc: Vion Lim <vion.lim@eurokars.com.sg>

Subject: Re: ARRANGE FOR SURVEY / YOUR REF: XE2610R / OUR REF: SFD9420U Our Ref: 19/19/20/VC06/022820
[External General]

Ok nivitha..3.30pm on Friday confirmed..

Thank you

Ronald Yap
Insurance Claims
9127 7928

Sent from my Smartphone.

———————— Original message --------

From: "Nivitha (LKK Auto)" <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Date: 12/31/19 12:52 (GMT+08:00)

To: Ronald Yap <ronald.yap @eurokars.com.sg>, assignments @lkkauto.com

Cc: Vion Lim <vion.lim @eurokars.com.sg>

Subject: RE: ARRANGE FOR SURVEY / YOUR REF: XE2610R / OUR REF: SFD9420U Our Ref:
19/19/20/VC06/022820 [External General]

Dear Ronald,

We put it as 3.30pm.



Wishes you a Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020 ﬁ

Best Regards
G.NIVITHA
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg [mailto:ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 31 December 2019 12:50 PM

To: admin-d@lkkauto.com; assignments@Ikkauto.com

Cc: vion.lim@eurokars.com.sg

Subject: RE: ARRANGE FOR SURVEY / YOUR REF: XE2610R / OUR REF: SFD9420U Our Ref: 19/19/20/VC06/022820
[External General]

Hi Nivitha,

Friday, 03 JAN 2020 @ 3PM ok?

Thank You,

Ronald Yap
Insurance Claims

Trans Eurokars Pte Ltd
5 Ubi Close, Singapore 408605
T: 6395 8899 H: 9127 7928
ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg

This email, including any attachment, is intended for the sole use of the recipient(s) named above and may contain information that is
confidential and/or proprietary to the Eurokars Group. If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then
delete this message from your system. Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other
person. Thank you.

From: Ronald Yap

Sent: 31 December 2019 12:46

To: 'Nivitha (LKK Auto)' <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; assignments@I|kkauto.com

Cc: Vion Lim <vion.lim@eurokars.com.sg>

Subject: RE: ARRANGE FOR SURVEY / YOUR REF: XE2610R / OUR REF: SFD9420U Our Ref: 19/19/20/VC06/022820
[External General]

lll get back to you Nivitha.



Thank You,

Ronald Yap
Insurance Claims

Trans Eurokars Pte Ltd
5 Ubi Close, Singapore 408605
T: 6395 8899 H: 9127 7928
ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg

This email, including any attachment, is intended for the sole use of the recipient(s) named above and may contain information that is
confidential and/or proprietary to the Eurokars Group. If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then
delete this message from your system. Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other
person. Thank you.

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: 31 December 2019 12:40

To: Ronald Yap <ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg>; assignments@Ikkauto.com

Cc: Vion Lim <vion.lim@eurokars.com.sg>

Subject: RE: ARRANGE FOR SURVEY / YOUR REF: XE2610R / OUR REF: SFD9420U Our Ref: 19/19/20/VC06/022820
[External General]

Is there any timing Ronald?

Wishes you a Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020

Best Regards
G.NIVITHA
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg [mailto:ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 31 December 2019 12:37 PM

To: assignments@I|kkauto.com; admin-d@Ikkauto.com

Cc: vion.lim@eurokars.com.sg

Subject: RE: ARRANGE FOR SURVEY / YOUR REF: XE2610R / OUR REF: SFD9420U Our Ref: 19/19/20/VC06/022820
[External General]

Dear Nivitha,

Can arrange this Friday?

Thank You,



Ronald Yap
Insurance Claims

Trans Eurokars Pte Ltd
5 Ubi Close, Singapore 408605
T: 6395 8899 H: 9127 7928
ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg

This email, including any attachment, is intended for the sole use of the recipient(s) named above and may contain information that is
confidential and/or proprietary to the Eurokars Group. If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then
delete this message from your system. Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other
person. Thank you.

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: 31 December 2019 12:31

To: Ronald Yap <ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg>; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@Ionpac.com>;
assignments@lkkauto.com; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Vion Lim <vion.lim@eurokars.com.sg>

Subject: RE: ARRANGE FOR SURVEY / YOUR REF: XE2610R / OUR REF: SFD9420U Our Ref: 19/19/20/VC06/022820
[External General]

Lonpac External - General

Without Prejudice

Dear Ronald

Please liaise with LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd for survey and assessment of liability.
Dear Nivitha

FYA

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

From: ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg [mailto:ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 31 December 2019 12:18 PM

To: ONG LI LI; MT_Claim_SG

Cc: vion.lim@eurokars.com.sg

Subject: ARRANGE FOR SURVEY / YOUR REF: XE2610R / OUR REF: SFD9420U

Dear Maam,

Kindly arrange the survey of our client’s car as attached.
6



Thank You,

Ronald Yap
Insurance Claims

Trans Eurokars Pte Ltd
5 Ubi Close, Singapore 408605
T: 6395 8899 H: 9127 7928
ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg

This email, including any attachment, is intended for the sole use of the recipient(s) named above and may contain information that is
confidential and/or proprietary to the Eurokars Group. If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then
delete this message from your system. Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other
person. Thank you.

From: mazdacanon@mazda.com.sg <transeurokars@eurokars.com.sg>
Sent: 31 December 2019 12:42

To: Ronald Yap <ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg>

Subject: Attached Image

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.avg.com




