Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 3 April 2020 10:33 AM

To: jenlim@eurokars.com.sg

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto); insuranceclaims@eurokars.com.sg

Subject: RE: Your ref: XE2610R Our ref: SFD9420U DOA: 23/12/2019 (Mazda) - LKK REF
CC4/LPC20000190/Uha3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Jenny,

We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/gst) $3,523.19
2. Loss of Rental (3 days x $120.00) (w/gst) S 385.20
3. Loss of Use (2 days x $80.00) S 160.00
4. GIA Search Fee S 2.00

Total | $4,070.39

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Jasper Chua| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 12 March, 2020 5:17 PM

To: jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg

Cc: Admin A; insuranceclaims@eurokars.com.sg; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your ref: XE2610R Our ref: SFD9420U DOA: 23/12/2019 (Mazda) - LKK REF CC4/LPC20000190/Uha3

Without Prejudice
Dear Jenny,
We refer to your below email and the contents were noted.

We will get back to you for an update/offer in due course.
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Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg [mailto:jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 12 March, 2020 2:29 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; insuranceclaims@eurokars.com.sg

Subject: Your ref: XE2610R Our ref: SFD9420U DOA: 23/12/2019 (Mazda)

Dear Vic,

Hope this email finds you well. The purpose of writing this email is to submit invoice and documents for Letter of
Demand.

Should you require more information, please do not hesitate to contact us.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jen

Insurance Claims Dept
TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD



