Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Janice Goh <janice.goh@eginsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 26 February 2020 9:50 AM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GW888B (Ol : EQI - DM20HO00076/SG) AND

SHC5391C (TP : LKK REF - CC3/EQI20000174/Kga3) on 31/12/2019
Hi Cecilia
Please proceed to reject TP claim.

Thank you.

Janice Goh

EQ Insurance Company Limited
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Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies of it.

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, February 25, 2020 5:01 PM

To: Janice Goh <janice.goh@eginsurance.com.sg>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GW888B (Ol : EQl - TBA) AND SHC5391C (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/EQI20000174/Kga3) on 31/12/2019

Dear Janice,

Ol email in Scene Photo to us (LKK).

We are in the view that Ol is not liable for this matter as Ol is travelling straight at the main road. But TPD is turning into
the main road from MBS tower exit.

Kindly let us have your approval/instruction to reject TP claim.

Thanks

Best Regards,



