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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Darren <claims@teamworkgarage.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 3 March, 2020 7:41 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SME5392E COR

Hi Taufikh, 

 

We confirmed COR @ $2900 and DOR @ 2 Days 

 

Darren 

Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd 

53 Ubi Avenue 1 

#01-24 Paya Ubi Industrial Park 

Singapore 408934 

Tel: 68442475 

Fax: 68442474 

 

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) 

Sent: Monday, 24 February 2020 5:04 PM 

To: Darren 

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) 

Subject: SME5392E COR 

 

Hi Darren, 

 

Refer to attached. COR Lumpsum $2900, 2days. 

 

Subject to insurance approval.  

 

Regards 

Taufikh  

Lkk Auto 
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