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@ MOVA

Automotive Pte Ltd

Main Office: Mova Building, No. 22 Jalan Kilang, Singapore 159419. Tel : (65) 6476 3333 Fax:(65) 6271 5891 Website: www.mova.com.sg
Workshop: Block 1008, Bukit Merah Lane 3, #01-04/06/08/94, Singapore 159722 Tel : (65) 6272 3892 Fax : (65) 6270 8314

POWER OF ATTORNEY

ACCIDENT INVOLVING (Owner's Vehicle No.) GHGEEARAP and (Third
Party's Vehicle No.) %’Flgﬁ %T on 20 lﬂm along
Telok Po\savml/\

BY THIS POWER OF ATI'OHNEY, *I/We, clhiona Qreavd) Fouladi WOVES P\T&ﬁd
. ‘:NF{IC/PJ sport NO.J W%ﬂl (Address)*
S < . /
a company incorporate in Singapore and having its registered office at
(Address)* owner of Vehicle Registered No.
GBG 5789P hereby irrevocably appoint MOVAAUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD,
(MOVA) a company incorporated in Singapore and having its registered office at Block 1008 Bukit Merah
Lane 3 #01-04/06/08 its agents or any person authorized by MOVA to be *my/our Attorney and in *my/our
name(s) and on *my/our behalf to do all or any of the following :

1. To submit, resolve and make any claim(s) (including the commencement of legal proceedings)
which *l/we may have against the other *party/parties to the Accident and under the insurance
*policy/policies taken up by such *party/parties or alternatively under Insurance Policy No.

taken up by *me/us (subject to approval by my
Insurance Company) in respect of the cost of repairs, loss of usefrental and all other costs and
expenses, etc suffered by *me/us arising from the Accident (loss and damage).

2. For the purpose of such claim(s) as aforesaid, to appoint solicitors on *my/our behalf as *my/our Attorney
shall in MOVA absolute discretion, deem fit.

3. To collect payment(s) due in respect of any such claim(s) for the loss and damage, such payment
to be made by way of cheque in favor of MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD and to give a valid receipt
and discharge thereof.

4. For any of the purposes aforesaid, to execute, sign, seal and deliver all documents whatsoever in
relation thereto.

5. Generally do all such acts as it shall deem necessary for the purpose of settling such claim(s) and

6. To agree to any settlement at the absolute discretion of MOVA.

*I/We hereby declare that all acts, instruments and documents done by virtue of this Power of Attorney on
*my/our behalf by the Attorney, its agents or any person autharized by MOVA in its behalf shall be as good
valid and effectual to all intents and purposes whatsoever as it is the same had been done or executed by * me/us
in *my/our own proper person(s) and *l/we hereby ratify and confirm, all acts, instruments and documents done or
executed by virtue of the authority and powers hereby conferred.

*1/We hereby further declare that the powers and authority hereby conferred shall remain irrevocable.

*I/We further comfirm that the acceptance by MOVA of the settlement amount in respect of such constitute the
full discharge of my/our claim(s) in respect of such loss and damage.

*IN WITNESS WHEREOF. *I/We have hereunto tq set *my/our hand and seal this day 5I2 of the month
of , Year Two Thousand - (20 ¥

NRIC No:
Co's Rubber Stamp, where appl:ca

Customer's Nar;'le (M?ﬂ%ﬁ)m\ﬂj Wovks P"C&[ia‘

MOVA's copy *delete as appropriate.



Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Joel Goh <joel.goh@eqginsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 8 May 2020 1:15 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto); Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: TP Claim - GBG5789P - DOA : 20/12/2019 (EQ: SGF1893T // DM19HO03360-JG)

Dear Cecilia

Please proceed to resolve this matter up to $10,818.73

Announcement

In line with the MOM advisory on Safe Distancing Measures in workplace, our operation remains “Business As Usual” — except most of us are on Work-From:-

We seek your understanding in bearing with us in this adjustment and any inadvertent delay in service.

Best Regards,
Joel Goh

q

EQ Insurance Company Limited

did tel fax
L
F———

JA AN

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sen

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, May 7, 2020 2:21 PM

To: Joel Goh; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: TP Claim - GBG5789P - DOA : 20/12/2019 (EQ: SGF1893T // DM19HO03360-]G)

EQ ref : DM19HO03360-JG

LKK ref : CC4/EQI20000063/R1ga3g2

Dear Sirs/Madam,



| 3 MAR 2020

Our Ref : GBG5789P / T020120
Your Ref : DM19HQ03360-JG
Date : 12 March 2020

EQ INSURANCE CO LTD

5 Maxwell Road

#17-00 Tower Block MND Complex
Singapore 069110.

ATTN : MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT
Dear Sir/Mdm

ACCIDENT INVOLVING: GBG5789P & SGF1893T
DATE OF ACCIDENT: 20 DECEMBER 2019
ALONG: TELOK BLANGAH ROAD

We refer to the above.

We are claiming as per below:

Cost of Repairs

Loss of Use ($__ x __days)
Loss of Rental ($.180.00 x
Towing Fees

Medical Fee

LTA /GIA Search Fee
E-Day License

12 _days)+7 %

Loss of Income ($ _ x __ days)

$9,532.74
$
$2,311.20

@MOVA

Automotive Pte Ltd
Main Office:

Mova Building

MNa. 22, Jalan Kilang,

Singapore 159419

WITHOUT PREJUDICET:I: (65) 64763333
Fax: (65) 6271 5891

WWW,IMOVE.COM.sg

Workshop Dept:
Block 1008,

Bukit Merah Lane 3
#01-04/0

Singapore 159722

Tel: (65) 62723892
Fax: (65) 6270 8314

Co. Reg. 1989
(GST Reg. M2-0088864-2

Grand Total -

$11,845.94

Documents enclosed:
Car date in: 30.12.2019 Car date out: 10.01.2020

Authorized Repair Days: _08 (TP/OD/WS/Recovery of Incidental Costs)

X | Invoice
| Excess Invoice X
| Power of Attorney

Police Investigation Report/GIA

Copies of NRIC/License of Owner/Driver
Rental Bill/Rental Agreement

| Survey Report with Photographs
Vehicle Registration Card/COE

Letter from Supplier

# This is a computer generated letler and does not need a signature.

DNANY02260- dA

Certificate of Insurance
LTA/GIA Search Bill

Taxi Bill

Medical Bill (photocopy)

Income Statement

E-Day License receipt (photocopy)
Towing Fee (photocopy)

Witness Statement

Traffic Police Investigation Result




@MOVA

Automotive Pte Ltd

Please issue the payment of S$ 11,845.94 in favor of MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD. Main Office:
Mava Building

If you have any enquires, please call or email Suann Chiu — Suann@mova.com.sg G s ]

Tel - (65) 6476 3333
Fax: (65) 6271 5891
WWW.mova.com.sq

Workshop Dept:

Thank you. Block 1008,
Yours faithfully, Bukit Merah Lane 3,
. #1-.04

For Claims Manager #01-04/0

Singapore 159722

Tal: (65) 6272 3892
Fax: (65) 6270 8314

Claims Department

NOTE: # Please note that the Loss of Use/Rental will be paid based on negotiation and on the R
NIMA Protocol (Court Guideline). GST Rleg, M2-0088864-2
# As of 01.06.08 all claims scenario will be based on the BOLA, Barometer Of Liability,
set by GIA, General Insurance Association of Singapore.

* This is a computer generated letter and does not need a signature.



‘ @MOVA

Automotive Pte Ltd
Main Office:
Maova Building
No. 22, Jalan Kilang,
P 4 1 Singapore 159419
age 5 lel: (65) 6476 3333
Performa Invoice Fag. 106) €211 Beon
Veh # . GBGS?SQP wwWw.mova.com.sg
21/02/2020
Veh Model - NISSAN NV200
EQ INSURANCE CO LTD '
Performa# - CK508847
5 MAXWELL ROAD Tel: (65) 62723892
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK MND COMPLEX Claim # - T020120 Fax: (65) 6270 8314
Co. Req, 15 ¥ 3
SINGAPORE 069110 ACC. Date - 20/12/19 casfrrzerf{ ?1»1_ 00t
Terms - C.0.D Days
Attention ;- XA039 Remarks -
No.  Description Qty U.Price Amounts S$
NET ITEMS :
s REAR BUMPER 1 PC 583.00 583.00
2. REAR BUMPER SIDE BRACKET 2 PCS 70.00 140.00
3 REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR LAMP 2 PCS 48:00 96.00
4. REAR BUMPER CLIPS 2 PCS 4.00 8.00
5. REAR LH DOOR 1 PC 980.00 980.00
6. REAR LH DOOR (NV200) EMBLEM 1 PC 70.00 70.00
7. REAR LH DOOR (LOGO) 1 PC 70.00 70.00
8. REAR LH DOOR HINGE 1 PCS 120.00 120.00
9. REAR LH DOOR LOCK 1 PC 380.00 380.00
10. REAR LH DOOR RUBBER 1 PC 290.00 290.00
1. REAR RH DOOR 1 PC a975.00 975.00
12. REAR RH DOOR HINGE 2 PCS 120.00 240.00
13. REAR RH DOOR LOCK 1 PC 335.00 335.00
14. REAR RH DOOR RUBBER i PC 260.00 290.00
15. REAR LH DOOR GARNISH 1 PC 235.00 235.00
16. REAR END PANEL OUTER 1 PC 799.00 799.00
17. REAR END PANEL INNER 1 PC 645.00 645.00
18. REAR END PANEL PLATE 1 PC 298.00 298.00
19, FRONT BUMPER 1 PE 595.00 595.00
NET TOTAL S$ 7.149.00
10% DISCOUNT S% -714.90
6.434.10
SPECIALNETITEMS :
1 FRONT & REAR NUMBER PLATE 2 PCS 17.50 35.00
) REAR PARKING SENSOR 1 SET 200.00 200.00
3. REAR DOOR GLASS SEALANT 2 PCS 30.00 60.00
4. REAR DOOR 70KM/H STICKER 1 PC 10.00 10.00
5. REAR DOOR (6 PAX) STICKER 1 PC 10.00 10.00
SPECIAL NET TOTAL S% 315.00
LABOUR : S
TO INSPECT REAR LIGHTING WATER & LEAKAGE TEST 40.00
TO REMOVE AND TRANSFER ITEMS TO REAR LH & RH
NEW DOOR 160.00
TO REMOVE AND INSTALL REAR DOOR LH & RH GLASS 120.00
TO REMOVE & INSTALL REAR COMPARTMENT
GARNISHES, CARPET & ETC IN ORDER TO CUT OFF
END PANEL OUTER, INNER 120.00
TO CUT OFF END PANEL, OUTER, INNER, AND




@MOVA

Automotive Pte Litd

Main Office:
Mova Building

No. 22, Jalan |
Singapora 158119

Tel: (65) 6476 3333

Page # = 137108 el {65) 6476 3333
Performa Invoice Fax: (65) 8271 5891
Veh # - GBG5789P = .
21/02/2020 o
\Veh Model - NISSAN NV200 Bukit Merah Lane 3,
#01-0 /94
EQ INSURANCE COLTD Singapore 159722
Performa# .- CK508847 Singapore 159722
5 MAXWELL ROAD erormsa el (65) 62723892
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK MND COMPLEX Claim# - 7020120 e
Co. Reg. 198904033G
SINGAPORE 069110 ACC. Dale :- 20/12/19 GsT F'#_.sf__].gf‘ﬂ_j-f"(iéiﬁ-ﬂi‘--l
Terms - C.OD Days
Attention :- XA039 Remarks :-
No. Description Qty U.Price Amounts S$
TO APPLY RUST PROOF ON AFFECTED AREAS 80.00
TO SPRAY PAINT ON REPLACED, REPAIRED AREAS 600.00
LABOUR TOTAL S§ 2,160.00
E.&O.E
NON-TAX AMOUNT &
AMOUNT S$ 8,909.10
GST@ 7% 623.64
AMOUNT DUE S$%

Customer's Sianature/Co. Stamp M

9,5632.74



@ MOVA

AUTOMOTIVE

Bukit Merah Branch;

HE Ly

Automotive Pte Lid

Main Office: No. 22 Jalan Kilang, Singapore 159419

Blk 122 Bukit Merah Lane 1 #01-50, Singapore 150122

Fan Yoong Branch: No. 15 Fan Yoong Road, Singapore 629792
Tel: (65) 6476 3333 Fax: (65) 6270 8314

24 Hours Breakdown Service: (65) 9799 8888

RANO.: I

RECEIVED 15

RENTAL AGREEMENT

12523 ~

Website: www.mova.com.sg Bedok Branch: - 4
Co. Reg. No.: 198004033G Tel: {?35} 6&3:?83}9 e ST ’;3§0cj JAN 2920
REN:I'AL DETAILS INSURANCE EXCESS AMOUNT
Pt » 2
Vehicle Make/Model: ,@% H /@ . l\fehicle No: C'gj €060 K Singapore Malaysia Signature
caemmecu: | 30 /7> /7 7. € 1300 pelvol \evel Al 2S00 |, 256D -
Petrol Level Out: [E /8 1/4 3/8 1/2 5/8 3*";};"'3 F ] “ Per Accident . Per Accident |~ .\.__g_'j_,?.\-‘.
Dats/ Time In: fO/O/ /3’0 /%0 Charges
F y 4 r =y
Petrol Level In: [E Az 14 378 172 518 3/4 (e)F | Months @$ PerMonth |
Change Over 1 Date: Initial: i Weeks @8 340  PerWeek S5 o
Ch Over 2: Date: ol < wGo I -
}> ange Over ate ImEiI, U2 Days @$ e Per Day W e
o N2 [k Do 33X Hous @S Per Hour 2185
T HIRER DETAILS Sub-Total
Named Hirer Less Discount % N
Name: Seenivaczan Manendv= Pai - Rental Charges
Address: 'V\AM (,8 #Oz‘—m COW @$ perday/ week/ month
c % _S PAI @% perday/ week/ month | J
( b@ %-) Petral Top-Up
. Misc Charges
Identity Card No: G«SO SObq Z)( esT 1 %o JeT 50
Date of Birth: Oblo:) ‘ﬂ%% Total lhﬂ’rl ST Ve
Driving License: HOIDQ' mq, h: R

Caountry of Issue:
Tel:
Nationality:

Effective Date:

VISA/MASTER CARD/ AMEX

CASH | COMPANY BILLING OTHERS

Pre-Payment

(HP) ggbql{—g% ,|to>

Downpayment and Deposit

Amount Refunded/ Due
Signature of Refund

ldentity Card No:
Date of Birth;
Driving License:
Country of Issue:
Tel:

Nationality:

Effective Date:

Additional Hirer Remarks: q W __-C_:T%- P
Name: ‘ —rp anw B%ﬁl
Address: Mhﬂm{/\
Invoice Na: Ref. No:
Checked Out By: Checked In By: Chscked By:

Sales-In Charge:

(HP) (0)

Past 3 years accidents YES [ | NO[_|

| fully understand and agrsed to the terms and condition appended on both sides of this Vehicle Rental Agreement. | also agreed that if there is any outstanding amount payable
after the conclusion of my rental not restricted to parking or traffic infringements during my period of hire, | will agreed that these cutstanding payment be billed to my charge/
credit card voucher given above. All above information given by me are true in connection to this agreement.

_j"\—‘lﬂ—vi_ﬂ—q,\ K

Hirer's Signalory / Company Stamp (1[ corporate hirer)

IMPORTANT

Authorised Manager Signature

1. Only authorized drivers with valid driving license of minimum 2 years may drive the rental vehicle.

2. All rental vehicles are strictly for Singapore use only, and may not be driven oulside Singapore without prior approval of MOVA Automobile,

Date & Time

)2



Our Ref No:
Date of Request:

"GENERAL
INSURANCE

W ASSOCIATION
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

GR-19-210387
21/12/2019

Mova Automotive Pte Ltd
Blk 1008, #01-04/06/08/94

Bukit Merah Lane 3
Singapore 159722

Dear SirfMadam,

Your Ref No: Online Purchase

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to 5pm
GST Registration No: M400017735

Enquiry Date 21/12/2019

Enquiry By Enny

TP Vehicle No. SGF1893T

Accident Date 20/12/2019

Enquiry Result :

TP Vehicle No. Insurer Period of Ingurance Insurer Tel. No.
SGF1893T EQ Insurance Company Ltd 03/04/2019-02/04/2020 6223 9433
Thank You.

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the cenfre by the members of the General Insurance Association of
Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoever for any loss or damage arising out of

or in connection with the reports or their images.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.




" GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSURANCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax. +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to 5pm

ST Regi ion No: M40001773
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE Co! RRegistration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE
Our Ref No: GR-19-210387
Date of Request: 21/12/2019 Your Ref No: Online Purchase
Mova Automotive Pte Ltd
Blk 1008, #01-04/06/08/94
Bukit Merah Lane 3
Singapore 159722
Dear SirfMadam,
Enquiry Date 21112/2019
Enquiry By Enny
TP Vehicle No. SGF1893T
Accident Date 20/12/2019
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S$)
TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[X] GIRO [ ] Cash [ ] Chegue




Auh
! ! ! { Ct;!?-&uﬁﬂﬂfs
S s B Pte Lid

51 UBI AVE 1. #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 67414108

CC4/EQI20000063/R1ga3q2
14 FEBRUARY 2020

TOK KOK SEONG

BLK 474 ANG MO KIO AVENUE 10
#09-838

SINGAPORE 560474

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLYVING SGF 1893T / GBG 5789P / OTHERS ON 20/12/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for EQ INSURANCE COMPANY
LIMITED to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had
amongst other information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as
the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement
with third party claimant

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

You are aware that your No-Claim Discount (NCD — if applicable) will be with held for
the time being. Pending for final allocation of liability in settlement by our principal EQ
INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

. 5
Jasper Chua
DID: 6841 2928

FAX: 6741 4108
Email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com

c.c. EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED
(Motor Claims Dept)



@MOVA

Automotive Pte

Ltd
Main Office:
Maova Building

Mo. _22, Jalan Kilang,
Singapore 159419

Page # L Tails
ol: (65) 6476 3333
Tax Invoice Fax: (65) 6271 5801
VEh # 2 GBG STBQP WWW.Mova,com,sq
11/05/2020 Workshop Dept:
Veh Model - NISSAN NV200 ~ Block 1008,
Bukit Merah Lane 3,
#01-04/06/08/94
EQ INSURANCE CO LTD Tax # - CK633226 Singapore 159722
i Claim# = T020120 LLGh o et
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK MND COMPLEX Fax: (65) 62708314
i - Co. Reg. 198904033G
SINGAPORE 069110 ACC. Date - 20/12/19 ST Foe, 12.0088864.2
Terms - C.O0D Days
Attention - XA039 Remarks -
No.  Description Qty U.Price Amounts S$
NET ITEMS :
1. REAR BUMPER 1 ‘PE 583,00 583.00
2. REAR BUMPER SIDE BRACKET 2 PCS 70.00 140.00
3. REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR LAMP 2 PCS 48.00 96.00
4. REAR BUMPER CLIPS 2 PCS 4.00 8.00
8. REAR LH DOOR 1 PC 980.00 980.00
8. REAR LH DOOR (NV200) EMBLEM 1 PC 70.00 70.00
2 REAR LH DOOR (LOGO) 1 PC 70.00 70.00
8. REAR LH DOOR HINGE 1 PCS 120.00 120.00
9, REAR LH DOOR LOCK 1 PC 380.00 380.00
10. REAR LH DOOR RUBBER 1 PC 290.00 290.00
1. REAR RH DOOR 1 PC 975.00 975.00
19; REAR RH DOOR HINGE 2 PCS 120.00 240.00
13. REAR RH DOOR LOCK 1 PC 335.00 335.00
14, REAR RH DOOR RUBBER 1 PC 290.00 290.00
15. REAR LH DOOR GARNISH 1 PC 235.00 235.00
16. REAR END PANEL OUTER 1 PC 799.00 799.00
b REAR END PANEL INNER 1 PC 645.00 645.00
18. REAR END PANEL PLATE 1 P& 298.00 298.00
19, FRONT BUMPER 1 PG 595.00 595.00
NET TOTAL S§ 7,149.00
10% DISCOUNT S$ -714.90
6.434.10
SPECIALNETTEMS: . T
T FRONT & REAR NUMBER PLATE 2 PCS 17.50 35.00
Z REAR PARKING SENSOR 1 SET 200.00 200.00
3. REAR DOOR GLASS SEALANT 2 PCS 30.00 60.00
4. REAR DOOR 70KM/H STICKER 1 pPC 10.00 10.00
5. REAR DOOR (6 PAX) STICKER 1 PC 10.00 10.00
SPECIAL NET TOTAL S$ 315.00
LABOUR : T
TO INSPECT REAR LIGHTING WATER & LEAKAGE TEST 40.00
TO REMOVE AND TRANSFER ITEMS TO REAR LH & RH
NEW DOOR 160.00
TO REMOVE AND INSTALL REAR DOOR LH & RH GLASS 120.00
TO REMOVE & INSTALL REAR COMPARTMENT
GARNISHES, CARPET & ETC IN ORDER TO CUT OFF
END PANEL QUTER, INNER 120.00
TO CUT OFF END PANEL, OUTER, INNER, AND
STRAIGHTEN AFFECTED AREAS AND RENEW DAMAGED
PARTS 1,000.00

TO APPLY BODY JOINT SEALANT ON CUTTING AREAS

40.00



@ MOVA

Automotive Pte Ltd

Main Office:
Maova Building

No. 22, Jalan Kilang,
Singapore 159419

Page # -1 137108 Tel: (65) 6476 3333
Tax Invoice Fax. (65 G571 5301
Veh# . GBG5789P i e
11/05/2020 Workshop Dept:
5 oc i
Veh Model - NISSAN NV200 Bukit Merah I.fane 8
#01-04/06/08/84
EQ INSURANCE CO LTD T .. CK633226 Singapore 159722
5 MAXWELL ROAD Tel: (65) 6272 3892
Claim # - T020120 : -
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK MND COMPLEX Fax: (65) 62708314
. Co. Reg. 198904033G
SINGAPORE 069110 ACC. Date :- 20/12/19 GST??&Q?QME-DOEBSSJQQ
Terms - C.0.D Days
Attention - XA039 Remarks :-
No.  Description Qty U.Price Amounts S$
TO APPLY RUST PROOF ON AFFECTED AREAS 80.00
TO SPRAY PAINT ON REPLACED, REPAIRED AREAS 600.00
LABOUR TOTAL S$ C 2160.00
E. & O.E
. NON-TAX AMOUNT 8
| AMOUNT S$ 8,900.10
GST@ 7% 623.64
AMOUNT DUE S§ 9,532.74

Customer's Sianature/Co. Stamp MOYA AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD





