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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>
Sent: May 28, 2020 12:24 PM
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
Cc: Vic (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: LOD REMINDER - SDB8822J & SFQ872P ON 30/12/2019 *** LKK REF: 

CC3/AIG19022974/R1ha3

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs 
 
We have instructions from our client to accept your offer of settlement. 
 
Please proceed to let us have your payment soon. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Regards, 
Caroline 
C/o Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint 
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941 
DID: 6319 0174 Fax: 6479 4601 

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Monday, 18 May 2020 5:27 PM 
To: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg> 
Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: LOD REMINDER - SDB8822J & SFQ872P ON 30/12/2019 *** LKK REF: CC3/AIG19022974/R1ha3  
  
[External Mail] This email originated from outside of the organisation; be careful with requests, attachments and links.  
Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Caroline, 
  
We propose settlement  breakdown as follows: - 
  

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 18,876.35 
2. Loss of Use (10 days x $60.00) $      600.00 
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $          2.00 

Total $ 19,478.35 
  
Please confirm acceptance. 
  
  
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission 
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
  
Best Regards, 
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Jasper Chua| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: PBSP [mailto:pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg]  
Sent: May 18, 2020 3:23 PM 
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: LOD REMINDER - SDB8822J & SFQ872P ON 30/12/2019 *** LKK REF: CC3/AIG19022974/R1ha3 
  
URGENT REMINDER  

From: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg> 
Sent: Wednesday, 29 April 2020 6:27 PM 
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: LOD REMINDER - SDB8822J & SFQ872P ON 30/12/2019 *** LKK REF: CC3/AIG19022974/R1ha3  
  
Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Jasper 
  
Our client disagrees with your global settlement and please be reasonable and settle as per benchmark rate 
and surveyor's recommended repair cost. 
  
  
Thank you. 
 
Regards, 
Caroline 
C/o Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint 
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941 
DID: 6319 0174 Fax: 6479 4601 

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, 29 April 2020 4:41 PM 
To: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg> 
Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: LOD REMINDER - SDB8822J & SFQ872P ON 30/12/2019 *** LKK REF: CC3/AIG19022974/R1ha3  
  
[External Mail] This email originated from outside of the organisation; be careful with requests, attachments and links.  
Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
Thank you for your email. 
  
We propose a settlement at a global sum of $19,000.00(all-in). 
  
Please confirm acceptance. 


