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Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto)

From: Mohamed Isman <isman@motorimage.net>
Sent: Tuesday, 31 December, 2019 7:43 AM

To: Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto)

Ce: David Koh; TPY Insurance Team

Subject: SMD4667A invoice

Hi Sherwin,

£s spoken please send the invoice to me.
Company reference: Motor Image Enterprises Pte Ltd (198102032R)

Thank You.

Best Regards

Mohd Isman

Service Executive

Motor Image Enterprises Pte Ltd

19 Lorong 8 Toa Payoh Singapore 319255

HP: 9668 9313

Email: isman@motorimage.net

Website: www.tanchong.com : www.motorimage.net
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Cisclaimer: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee you may not copy, forward, disclose or
use any part of this message. If you have received this message in error, please delete it and all copies from your system and notify the
sender immediately by return e-mail. Internet communications cannot be guaranteed to be timely, secure, error-free or virus-free. The
sander does not accept liability for any errors or omissions.



Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Cc:

Subject:

Follow Up Flag:
Flag Status:

Dear Isman

Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)

Monday, 9 December, 2019 7:10 PM

Mohamed Isman; Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto)

assignments; Admin A; Admin-B; David Koh; Daniel Jude; Daniel Lim; Jassy Chang;
Ooi Siow Hooi

Re: QUOTATION FOR VEHICLE DIAGNOSTIC

Follow up
Flagged

Our fees for the inspection and thereafter to put up a report to comment on whether the accident could have been
e result of an unintended acceleration of the vehicle will be $500\- excluding gst.

| will be away from office and my colleague Sherwin who is copied in this email will carry out the inspection. You

rnay contact him directly.

Eryan Ang
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

On 9 Dec 2019, at 18:41, Mohamed Isman <isman@motorimage.net> wrote:

Hi Bryan,

As spoken last week can you send me a quotation.

Need to arrange with customer asap

Thank You.

Best Regards
Mohd Isman
Service Executive

Motor Image Enterprises Pte Ltd
19 Lorong 8 Toa Payoh Singapore 319255

HP: 9668 9313

Email: isman@motorimage.net

Website: www.tanchong.com : www.motorimage.net
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Disclaimer: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee you may not copy,
forward, disclose or use any part of this message. If you have received this message in error, please delete it and all
copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. Internet communications cannot be
guaranteed to be timely, secure, error-free or virus-free. The sender does not accept liability for any errors or
Omissions.

From: Mohamed Isman

Sent: Tuesday, December 3, 2019 6:37 PM

To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; ‘admin-
b@lkkauto.com' <admin-b@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: David Koh <davidkoh@motorimage.net>; Daniel Jude <danieljude @motorimage.net>; Daniel
Lim <daniellim@motorimage.net>; Jassy Chang <jassy@ motorimage.net>; Ooi Siow Hooi
<hooi@motorimage.net>

Subject: QUOTATION FOR VEHICLE DIAGNOSTIC

Importance: High

Hi LKK Team,

Attention to: Whom it may concern

We wish to enquire for a quotation for a vehicle diagnostic which is required for a SUBARU
FORESTER 2.0i-L AWD CVT.

There is a Customer whom wishes to conduct diagnostic checks to see if the vehicle has sudden
acceleration issues by either a third party or a neutral party with us.

Kindly advise if it can be carried out by your end or if you know someone/someplace which will be
able to assist to conduct the requested checks.

We seek your swift revetment to this email and appreciate your time that has been given to this
matter.

We look forward to your soonest reply

Thank You.

Thank You.

Best Regards

Mohd Isman

Service Executive

Motor Image Enterprises Pte Ltd

19 Lorong 8 Toa Payoh Singapore 319255

HP: 9668 9313

Email: isman@motorimage.net

Website: www.tanchong.com : www.motorimage.net
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Disclaimer: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee you may not copy,
forward, disclose or use any part of this message. If you have received this message in error, please delete it and all
copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. Internet communications cannot be
guaranteed to be timely, secure, error-free or virus-free. The sender does not accept liability for any errors or
omissions.
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