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51 UBTAVE 1, #00-25 PAYA URTINDIUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPVRE 40R9A3 THL 1 (065 62563561 FAX : (65) 62364018

Your Ref: CMTD1906021/RUC

Our Ref: CSSMO190228T4/Gd3

The Motor Claims Department

SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE P

Dear Sirs/Mdm

Date: 10/01/2019

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO, SKL 9440K .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above-mentioned vehicle

on _26/12/2019_at the premises of M/s My Car Consultant _and have the

following to report: -

Workshop Estimate Amount
Revised Estimate Amount
“Check™ Items Amount
Market Value

LTA Reimbursement Value
Nen Value

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustaimed damages
ut the rear portion and parts.

Repair days: |

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.

Yours faithfully
Guo Qiang
Automotive Assessor




Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 30 December 2019 9:53 AM

To: admin@mycar.sg: ‘admin-d@lkkauto.com’; ‘assignments®Ilkkauto.com'

Ce: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin; Chua, Gek Tiang Ruth; Henry, Irene James

Subject: CMTD1906021/RUC \ YR REF: SKL9440K - LKK/ YNBSG4S & SKL9440K ACC ON
26,12.19

Attachments: GIA REPORT _ SKL 9440 K pdf

Our Reference - CMTD1906021/RUC
Your Reference : SKL9440K

Witho i
EMAIL ONLY
Date: 30.12 2019
OUR Emall: motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg
Attention

MY CAR CONSULTANT PTE LTD

Dear Huy

ACCIDENT INVOLVING YN8564S & SKL9440K ON 26.12.2019

We ref

We will

Hi LKK

Please
revert v

Thank

Ou
203
Wae

Be:
Gra:
Cla
DE

For

10 your email reply of 27/12/19.

[Ppuint LKK Auto Consultants to conduct the survey.

JID,

«l&r 1o the email below and make the arrangement to survey for SKL9440K on a without prejudice basis and

1t your report upon completion of survey to my colleague, Ms. Ruth.

' closed on New Year's Eve (31/12/19) and New Year Day (01/01/20). Business will resume on 2 January

Happy New Year!

I G461 6555 | F: 6221 3147

s survey request, please emall to motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg



@ SQMPO A Century of Trust

Sam; ance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
501 # #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Wel, + . 5ompo.com.sq | Facebook: www facebook.com/SompoSG
Qul laims Submission' & Product Purchase® via Sompo SG
Do

Accident & Home Insurance | ¥ For Travel, Personal Accident. Home & Private Motor Insurance
Disc| - ==mall, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may conlain confidential
g «leged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be uniawful and is prohibited
Hy - imended recipient, please delete this message
Priva Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Lid. may collect. use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stale acy Policy This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
dise nitted/required by laws. our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
(i i) ¥
From: 11y Car Consultant <admin@mycar.sg>
Sent: [ riiuy, December 27, 2019 6:07 PM
To: Chua, Gik Tiang Ruth <ruth.chua@sompo.com.sg>; Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>
Ce: Ye, Vonp Kang Melvin <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: 1. CMTD1906021/RUC \ YR REF: SKLS440K - PRI/ YN85645 & SKL9440K ACC ON26.12.19

WITHOU T PHEJUDICE

Dea 1

We propose to appoint LKK auto consultants for surveay

Best Regarcds
Huiqin

Claims | &'y Car Consultant Pte Ltd

§ ve | Poyas Ubi Industrial Park, 01-33, 5408934

iing attached files, may contain confidential information and is intended only for the use of the individual andior
¢ nddressed If you have received this message In ermor. please notify the sander of the error and delete the

i ViU

From: 1o Grace" <graceteo@sompo.com.sg>
Sent: Frioay, December 27, 2019 6:00 PM
To: "aromycansg” <admin@mycar.sa>, "Chua, Gek Tiang Ruth" <puth.chua@sompo.com.sg>

Cc: e rung Kang Melvin® <melvin,ye@sompo.com.sg>
Subject: _TD1906021/RUC \ YR REF: SKL9440K - PRI/ YNB564S & SKL9440K ACC ON26.12.19

Our tererece : CMTD1906021/RUC



" Your fleference - SKL9440K

Without Prejudice
EMAIL ONLY
Date: 27 12 2019
OUR Emall: motorsurvey Esompo.com.sg
Attention

MY CAR CONSULTANT PTE LTD

Dear Hul (3
ACCIDENT INVOLVING YNB564S & SKL9440K ON 26.12,2019
We relir 1o your Notice of Accident dated 27.12.2019.
Please Le (ijormed that Ms. Ruth Chua the handler of this case who can be contacted at 63295 153/
futh. S A0mpo.com.sg .
We inten 1o conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s vehicle jointly with your
client/vour motor workshop, We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list to conduct
the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.
Pre-Repair Survey
Selection (Indicate as
Motaor Surveyor Surveyor tick)
Raleigh Services Andrew Ow Yong
Vincent Ng
Kenneth Kong (North
LKK Auto Consultants area)
Marcus Chua (East area)
' Mohd Rasul (West area)
Mohd Taufikh (West area)
Priority Services Jimmy Lee
Lawrence Ng
leffery Ong
Please w11 know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surve s oo asingle joint expert. You may select up to two of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost of
the pro oo survey carried out by the single joint expert.
{ closed on Christmas, New Year's Eve and Now Year Day. Business will resume on 26™ December 2019
020 respectively
ry Christmas and a Happy New Year!
E
€



"0 I 65481 6555 | F 6221 3147

Fo /s survey request, please email to motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg

¢ ~OMPO A Century of Trust

Sal rance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
5( : #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
We <. sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www facebook com/SompoSG
(& ‘aims Submission’ & Product Purchase’ via Sompo SG

[ sl e ‘ " " :_;'_H_:. o
b : ® App Store Bl Google Play

Accident & Home Insurante | 7 For Travel, Personal Accidint, Home & Private Motor Insurance

Di » e-mail, Including attachments, is intended for the person(s) of company named and may contain confidential
ai ieged information. Unautherised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited
" Intended recipient, please delete this message.
Pr ¢ Netice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Ple. Lid. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
-1 icy Policy This may include disclosure 10 holding and associated companies, cradit bureau, parties o whom
i iedrequired by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acling on our behal). Please click here for

ou ¥

From: viy Lar Consultant <admin@mycar.sg>

Sent: Fidny December 27, 2019 4:34 PM
To: Clovny Motor Survey <MotorSury 0.COM.SE>
Subject: Uut REF: SKL9440K YOUR REF: YNB85645 PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION FOR SKL9440K

WITHOU #REJUDICE

Ol LS9440K

¥ HE45E5 YNESGAS

D iam,

PRE - NSPECTION FOR SKL2440K

ACLCI WOLVING SKL9440K AND YNB456S

We e above matter and enclosed herewith our client's GIA report and Notification of Pre-repair

b your attention.

We a sed herewith the State Court of the Republic of Singapore Practice Direction - Amendment No. 1 of
2 f Pre-repair Inspection for your attention

Best Regards

Huiqin
Claim= |}y Car Consultant Pte Ltd
v & .1.‘”-.&.@

o | Pava Lbi Industrial Park, 01-33, 8408934
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mng aftached files, may contain confidential information and is intended only for the use of the individual andior
= addressed If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender of the error and delete the

e



Denise Taz {LI{KAutaz

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 10 January 2020 4:59 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto), Teo, Grace'; assignments

Cc 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin'; ‘Chua, Gek Tiang Ruth'; ‘Henry, Irene James’, SUR

Subject: RE: CMTD1906021/RUC \ YR REF: SKLO440K - LKK/ YNB564S & SKL9440K ACC ON
26.12.19

Attachments: PRELI ADVISED OF SKL 9440K pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SKL 9440K
Number of days (estimnted) : | days

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone; 6256-3561 | email! denlsetav@®lkkauto.com | fax 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, R02-25 | 5(408933)

From:; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 30 December 2019 2:53 PM

To: 'Teo, Grace' <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>, assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>

Cc: 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin' <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; 'Chua, Gek Tiang Ruth' <ruth.chua@sompo.com.sg>;
'Henry, Irene James' <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: CMTD1906021/RUC\ YR REF: SKL9440K - LKK/ YNBS564S & SKL9440K ACC ON 26.12.19

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Wishes you a Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020 A’

Best Regards

GNIVITHA

LEKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: 6841-1572 | emall: aeslgnments@kkauto.cam | fox: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Averroe 1. #02-25 | S(408631)

From: Teo, Grace [mailto:grace.tec@sompo.com.sg)
Sent: Monday, 30 December 2019 9:53 AM

To: admin@mycar.sg; 'admin-d@lkkauto.com’ <admin-d@|kkauto.com>; ‘assignments@lkkauto.com’
1



> Back to OneMotoring

PARFICOE Rebate Enquiry

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner ID Type:
Owner ID:

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model;

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:

Singapore NRIC
2048

SKL9440K

No

08 Jan 2020
HONDA
CIVICTYPE-R2.0M
White

2008
K20A5824569
FD21404365

165.0 kW (221 bhp)
$27,241.00

05 Sep 2008

05 Sep 2008

3

$27,241.00

Forfeited

$0.00

04 Sep 2028

B -Car (1601cc & above)
10

$33,377.00

$28.892.00

$28,892.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 08 Jan 2020

ittpszifvrl ita. gov sgal:n.".-rr:ummna'ar'-uu:mRuhateE!yPubI-cﬂnrnrnDamglnpu!"FUNC?iGN_buﬁDEI}JDDETT in



P,

MY eg no.: 2016058787

Address: 53 Ubl Ave 1 #01-33 Paya Ubi Industrial Park Singapore 408934

su8uLrant HP:9BBEBEAS

MY CAR CONSULTANT PTELTD

Estimation
08 January 2019
Vehicle: SKL9440K
Make / Model: HONDA/CIVIC 2.0 TYPE-R

No. Description Unit | Unit Price Amount
Parts Replacement: > 8
1 FRONT RH WING MIRROR ASSY _ & (A, 1 | $ 99210|5  992.10
S 992.10
Less20% | S 198.42
Total S 793.68
Labour to: L
2 CHECK FRONT WIRING AND LIGHTING SYSTEM S 60.00|S . 60.00
3 PANEL BEATING ON AFFECTED AREAS 1 |1S 200.00|5tee 200.00
4 SPRAY PAINTING ON AFECTED AREAS S 300.00 | $tec 300.00
5 | ISEﬂ.ﬂD
Parts Replacement Amount S 793.68
Total Amount for Labour S 560.00
Total Amount |$ 1,353.68
| Drws
LXK Auto Consultants hence nobfy

[uﬂﬁvr MpAY -
Dter el “phet
bua G{W"\P

0%/ 1/

iha Repairer of the following:

» To resurvey belorealiae spray peneng

« To depiay damaged pary) derning e

« Parts prices ora subject o confrmaion.

« Third pacty survey |8 on @ ‘Without Prajudics’ Boss
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' 7d 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
- 51 Uibl Ave 1 #01.25 Paya Ubl ingusirial Park, Singapore 408833
/A‘_. TEL 5256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 198607188R GST Reg. No. 18-860T158-R

SDMPD INSUWCE SINGAPGRE PL Raf : Cmmﬂmﬂfﬂtd:!n!

50 RAFFLES PLACE

|#05-01/06 Date:  14-01-2020 |||I||I|I||III"|I

SINGAPORE LAND TOWERSINGAPORE 048623

Claim No. CMTD1806021/RUC Excess (§) 0.00

Make & Model HﬂHDﬁ CwIC T‘I"PE-R ZG = 1898
Engine No, HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2008
Chassis No. FD21404365 Colour WHITE
Odometer 251723 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Meodification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD

R/H Front Tyre |225/45R17 DUNLOP 6 mm

L/ Front Tyre [225/45 R17 DUNLOP 6 mm

R/H Rear Tyre |225M5R17 DUNLOP 6 mm

L.'H Ranyn 225/45 R17 auump B mm

THE "u"EHIBLE SUSTMHED DMM.GES .\\T THE 01'5 FRGN‘T PDRTIDH
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.

51 UB! AVE 1 #01-25 PAYA UB| IND.PARK S (408933)
MY CAR CONSULTANT PTELTD

[AITHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON AWITHOUT PREJUDICE” BASIS.
1B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YO '- WE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

TESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:




' 74 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Al i 2B 57 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industnal Park, Singapore 408033
- TEL G256 3581 FAX: A256 4315

Reg. No: 19060T188R GST Reg. No. 19-56071898-R

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKL 8440K

Page No.:1af 1

1|FRONT RH WING MIRROR ASSY CRACKED 89210 550.00
LESS 20% DISCOUNT =198 42 -110.00
793.68 440.00
LABOUR
CHECK FRONT WIRING AND LIGHTING SYSTEM, £0.00 30.00
PANEL BEATING ON AFFECTED AREAS 200.00 80.00
SPRAY PAINTING OMN AFFECTED AREAS. 300.00 100,00
560.00 210.00
GRAND TOTAL 1,353.68 650.00
Report Ref No, CS/SMO19022874/Gid3n2
%2‘
XING GUO QIANG ADRIAN LING WAI PING
M.MATAI, AMSAE-A B.Eng. AMSOE AMIRTE.AMSAE-A M.MATAI
Automotive Assessor Licensad Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LLABILITY TO THIRD PARTEES - This Report is macke salely far the wss snd bensfit of the Client named on the front page of this Repart.




