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488 REC!BY. MereeS - S /
| b ASSIGNMENT é
From: Date; Veh No: tL 7' 7? .Sf 2 ﬁr Regn: | / f’

Estimated Cost:

Type: M.Gaf LM.Cycle | Bus | Van | Lorry | Taxi | Prime Mover /

Truck | Trailer or (/5’ /

To Inspect Vehicle No: L 7’755’-(} 2 ?C Make: 7 t 7[15"- é’!ﬂmf’ & GE f ) dag’
at Workshop mis Uﬁ t )

of

Insured: F&;ﬁ_{"?” U

Policy Mo

Claims Mo.

Sum Insured: Excess:
(Client's Record)

Make of Veh:

{Policy Condition)

Remark: The veh had commencad its W5 | OfF
repair at the time of inspection.

Bal. or Market Value: 7(?(5- .

IDAC Accident Rport Consistent? : Yes or No

Gl& | PR Seen Consistent? ; Yes or No

Est. Repairs: E‘"‘ days Res: Yes or No

Lurm Surm; o 3Val: Yes or No

LY
CA | REV | REP. | 24HRS ~A 1’539f’

Vehicle: INTOUT

Date: Person Contacted:

Colour AIS:  Insured ! Std/ NI/ NA
Sp.Reading ./ @) ? é TiRadio: Insured | Std | NI/ NA
Eng/No:

CiNo: S' 6 OZ(F
2’“ o 0J3 /07

Fair [ Poor | Burnt

Tyre Size: F:

R ?fficfrx- T of
G-S‘I UN | EXNOVA | GY | FS/ LIZA / MIC | OHTSU [ PIR./ SUMIT
TOYO ! YOKO or

Front ;“ Bear /6'

Ri/Bal.

e

L/Bal. L/Bal 6 :’“
D.OA 2 L7¢ ;/ ol SV~ /
Survey heﬂ/ f Q/ /),

Des. of Damages : Frt | Rear | O/S | NIS | UJC | Rooftop or

The UIC | Chassis frame | Body Structure affected due to collision

rt [ Time Action [ Instruction

(0 Ys 6o QMCMJI witr Pl . g1V, 3’?,??‘/.-}

DateiTime, Fia Pass fo? D: Preli. Report

1]@5[! er;}v I:l:Final Report

DataTime, File Return ta?

Z

Report Format : 7."1

Lump Sumflﬁet/[ﬁ {aﬂ?{}

)

REC

Add Fee:

EIVED 41 2020
Days Of Repair: X
Resurvey No. of Trip: 2. Survey Fee:
Transporation

‘Site Insp (9 y__S+R5.__ 8
El: Interview (% ) Photos

‘Tech.lnvs (§ ) otes I\
E;Weekend ($ )
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51 UBI AVE 1, 801-25 PAYA UBT INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: CMTD1906037/GPL Date: 06" January 2020
Our Ref: CS/SMO19022854/Ugd3 Without Prejudice

The Motor Claims Department
Sompo Insurance

Atin: Grace

Dear Sirs/Mdm

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO__SKT 7952X .

We thank you for the instruction on _30/12/2019.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle

on 30/12/2019 at the premises of M/s FASTECH AUTO and have the
following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5% 2443632 .

Revised Estimate Amount : S% 6.500.00 (Lump Sum)

“Check” Items Amount : S% - :

Market Value : S8 -

LTA Reimbursement Value : S$ -

Nett Value : S$ -

Description of Damage: P

The vehicle sustained damages at the —

rear n/s portion. - front
offsge

Comments/ Present Status:

Damages consistent.
We have NOT authorize repair.

Yours faithfully

Marcus Chua
Licensed Appraiser



Wivitha (LKK Auto)

T T T T e e e e

From: Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 30 December 2019 2:19 PM

To: Ong Shiying; ‘admin-d@lkkauto.com’; 'assignments@lkkauto.com’

Cc: Jason; Lina Pang; Gnoh, Pau Loong; Ye, Yong Kang Melvin; Henry, Irene James
Subject: CMTD1906037/GPL - LKK/ FEG5111U & SKT7952X DOA: 28.12.2019

Our Reference: CMTD1906037/GPL
Your Reference: SKT7952X

Without Prejudice
Date: 30/12/2019 EMAIL ONLY

OUR Email: motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg

Attention:
M/S FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

Dear Shi Ying,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBG5111U & SKT7952X ON 28.12.2019
We refer to your email reply of today.

We will appoint Mr. Marcus Chua of LKK Auto to conduct the survey.

Hi LKK AUTO,

Please make the arrangement to survey for SKT7952X on a without prejudice basis and revert your report upon
completion of survey to my colleague, Mr. Pau Loong.

Thank you.

Our office will be closed on New Year's Eve (31/12/19) and New Year Day (01/01/20). Business will resume on 2™ January
2020,

We wish you a Happy New Year!

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D. 63295170 | T;: 6481 6555 | F. 6221 3147

For motor claims survey request, please email to motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg
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SOMPO
@/ A Century of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/08 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo.com.sq | Facebook: www.facebook com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission' & Product Purchase? via Sompo SG

#  Downboed on the

@& App Store

Download now (g or

For Travel. Personal Accident & Home Insurance | ? For Travel, Personal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
andlor legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient. please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Ple. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws. our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: Ong Shiying <shiying.ong@fastechauto.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, December 30, 2019 2:03 PM

To: Teo, Grace <grace.teo{@sompo.com.sg=>

Ce: Jason <Jason(@fastechauto.com.sg>; Lina Pang <Lina.pang(@fastechauto.com.sg>; Gnoh, Pau Loong
<Paul.oong.Gnoh(@sompo.com.sg=; Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; Henry, Irene
James <irene.henry(@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: RE: CMTD1906037/GPL - PRI(NR) FBG5111U & SKT7952X DOA: 28.12.2019

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir and Madam,
Please arrange (LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS- MARCUS CHUA) to conduct the pre- repair survey.

Thank you,

Regards.

Shiving

Fastech Auto Pte Lid

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-46/48/50
Autobay Singapore 417883

Tel: 6746 5405

Fax: 6745 8520

From: Teo, Grace [mailto:grace.teo’@ sompo.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, December 30, 2019 1:55 PM

To: Ong Shiying <shiving.ong(a fastechauto.com.sg>

Ce: Jason <Jason/w/fastechauto.com.sg>; Lina Pang <Lina.panga fastechauto.com.sg™>; Gnoh, Pau Loong
<Pauloong.Gnoh@sompo.com.sg>; Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ve@ sompo.com.sg>; Henry, Irene
James <irene henrvigsompo.com.sg>

Subject: CMTDI1906037/GPL - PRI(NR)Y FBG5111U & SKT7952X DOA: 28.12.2019

i




Our Reference: CMTD1906037/GPL
Your Reference: SKT7952X

Without Prejudice
Date: 30/12/2019 EMAIL ONLY

OUR Email: motorsurvey@sompao.com.sg

Attention:
M/S FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

Dear Shi Ying,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBG5111U & SKT7952X ON 28.12.2015

We refer to your Notice of Accident dated 30/12/2019.

Please be informed that Mr. Gnoh Pau Loong is the handler of this case who can be contacted at 63295 217/
Pauloong. Gnoh@sompo.com.sg .

Please be informed that we have yet to receive our insured’s accident report.

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s vehicle jointly with your
client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list to conduct
the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

Pre-Repair Survey

Selection (Indicate as

Motor Surveyor Surveyor tick)
1 Raleigh Services Andrew Ow Yong
Vincent Ng
Kenneth Kong (North
2 LKK Auto Consultants area)

Marcus Chua (East area)
Mohd Rasul (West area)
Mohd Taufikh (West area)
3 Priority Services Jimmy Lee

Lawrence Ng

Jeffrey Ong

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select up to two of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost of
the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert.

Our office will be closed on New Year's Eve (31/12/19) and New Year Day (01/01/20). Business will resume on 2™ January
2020.
We wish you a Happy New Year!



Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D: 6329 5170 | T. 6461 6555 | F. 6221 3147

For motor claims survey request, please email to motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg

e/ SOMPO A Century of Trust

INSU

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www . sompo.com.sq | Facebook: www.facebook.com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission' & Product Purchase? via Sompo SG

Dommidcad on the

. GETTON
' App Store [ * Google Play

For Travel, Personal Accident & THome Insurance | * For Travel, Personal Accident. Home & Private Motor Insurance

Download now (a or

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
andfor legally privileged information. Unautharised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Ple. Lid. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Paolicy, This may include disclosure to helding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties 1o whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: Ong Shiying <shiving.ong/@ fastechauto.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, December 30, 2019 12:37 PM

To: Claims - Motor Survey <MotorSurvevigisompo.com.sg>

Ce: Jason <Jasona fastechauto.com.sg>; Lina Pang <Lina.pang(u fastechauto.com.sg>
Subject: REQUEST FOR PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION FOR SKT 7952X DOA: 28.12.2019

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Madam
Your insured’s vehicle: FBG 511101
Date of accident: 28/12/2019

Please arrange Pre-repair Inspection for my client’s vehicle no: SKT 7952X.

In accordance to APPENDIX C Pre-action Protocol for Non-Injury Motor Accident Cases of PRACTICE
DIRECTIONS

AMENDMENT NO. 1 OF 2016 paragraph 2.3, please provide a list of at least 10 motor surveyors within 2
days of the notice.

Thank you.



Regards. .

Shiving

Fastech Auto Pte Ltd

I Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-46/48/50
Autobay Singapore 417883

Tel: 6746 5405

Fax: 6745 8520



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

f S =

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 6 January 2020 4:16 PM

To: "Teg, Grace'; assignments

Cc: ‘Gnoh, Pau Loong’; 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin'; 'Henry, Irene James'; SUR
Subject: RE: CMTD1906037/GPL - LKK/ FBG5111U & SKT7952X DOA: 28.12.2019
Attachments: CSSM01902284Uqd3.pdf

Dear Grace,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SKT 7952X.

Wishing you a Happiness and Prosperity New Year

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Shiau Chan (LKK Auto) <siewsc(@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 30 December 2019 3:31 PM

To: Teo, Grace' <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>; assignments <assignments(@lkkauto.com>
Ce: 'Gnoh, Pau Loong' <PauLoong.Gnoh@sompo.com.sg>; 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin'
<melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; 'Henry, Irene James' <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg=; SUR
<sur(@lkkauto.com=>

Subjeet: RE: CMTD1906037/GPL - LKK/ FBG5111U & SKT7952X DOA: 28. 12.2019

Dear Grace,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SKT 7952X on 30/12/2019.
We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Best Wishes for Happy New Year 2020

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: sipwse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com=>

Sent: Monday, 30 December 2019 3:07 PM

To: 'Teo, Grace' <grace.leo sOmMpo.com.sg>; assignments <assignmentsilkkauto.com=
Ce: 'Gnoh, Pau Loong' <Paul.oong.Gnoh@sompo.com.sg>; 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin'
<melvin.vei@sompo.com.sg>; 'Henry, Irene James' <ircne.henry@sompo.com.sg>; SUR
<suri@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: CMTD1906037/GPL - LKK/ FBG5111U & SKT7952X DOA: 28.12.2019

1




Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 30 December 2019 3:31 PM

To: 'Teo, Grace'; assignments

Cc: 'Gnoh, Pau Loang'; 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin’; "Henry, Irene James', SUR
Subject: RE: CMTD1906037/GPL - LKK/ FBG5111U & SKT7952X DOA: 28.12.201%
Dear Grace,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SKT 7952X on 30/12/2019.
We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Best Wishes for Happy New Year 2020

Best Repards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKE Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: ha56-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 3(408033)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 30 December 2019 3:07 PM

To: 'Teo, Grace' <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Ce: 'Gnoh. Pau Loong' <PauLoong.Gnoh@sompo.com.sg>; 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin'
<melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg=; 'Henry, Irene James' <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg=; SUR
<sur(@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: CMTD1906037/GPL - LKK/ FBGS5111U & SKT7952X DOA: 28.12.2019

Dear Sir/Mdm.

Thank you for the assignment.

Wishes you a Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020 &’

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: hz56-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408033)

From: Teo, Grace [maiEm:grm:e.teu:?E.:smnm,cum.sq]
Sent: Monday, 30 December 2019 2:19 PM
To: Ong Shiying <shiving.ong/@ fastechauto.

com.se>; 'admin-d@lkkauto.com' <admin-d/@lkkauto.com=;




Used harrier Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart

SECAR'M&RT-E“M Login  Sign up

New Cars

Browse by Category

19 vehicles

Search Selection

Compare

Post an Advertisement
Sall it yaurgalf! Advertise it at just

$58 until it's SOLD!

Used Cars Rental Cars Sell My Car Directory Praducts Insurance Articles

Forum

Page 1 of 3

Resources

New 5 Years Renewal COE Toyota Wish 2.0A VALUE FOR MONEY
' VALUE FOR TIME

A PEACE OF MIND

v Credit S HOTLINE: 6741 9997

Yiew our Cars

| Sart by Date Fosted ) 20 results/ page ~|
harmer N Submiti
Model Price Depreciation £g Dats Eng Cap Mileage Weh Type
[ iar 2015 Avallable
Toyota Harrier 2.0A Premium 87,500 $12, 280 fyr (&-Dec-2015 1,966 cc S Available
Panoramic -
Elegant Black SUY, Premiurn Model With Panoramss Moonroof And Electric Tadgate, This Is Not & Rental/Limausing Unit, One Ownar Onl
Prme Motor & Leasing
Toyota Harrier 2,04 Premium 581,800 512,220 fyr 20-Aug-2015 1,986 oc 72,800 km S Available
Panoramic
1 Cwner, Very Wel Kept, Regulary Serviced, Beautiful Comisnation With Leather And Fabric Seat In Diamond Cut Design. In Immaculat .
Toyota Harrler 2.04 Premium 463,000 $11,500 fyr 21-Dec-2015 1,986 ot 59,055 km 5L Available
Panoramic
finad Tax TAl June 2020, Many Upgraded Accessorias, Mot PHY Car. Accident Free. ho Further Repair Needed. Excellent Condition Very TR
Toyota Harrier 2.0A Premium 575,800 £12.500 fyr 25-Ium-2015 1,986 oC Si Available
Panoramic
[
Rear LED Bumper Reflector Lamp
Fiear LED Bumper Reflector Lamp (Toyata Harrier 2015 Onwards)
More mfo about this product
Toyota Harrier 2.04 Elegance 76,000 312,900 fyr 22-May-2015 1,966 oc 58,000 km S Available
Panoramic
Diract Dwiner Seling! Well Taken Cara By Careful Owner and Is In Excelient Condition! Very Low Mieage And Underutilize As It Is Selda., FF pat s v an 1
Toyota Harrier L.0A G's 587,000 $12,550 fyr F4-Jul- 2015 1,586 cx 125,000 km Sedan Available
Elegance
The Rare G5 Variant Comes With Spartier Outlock, Lowered Suspension, Upgraded Brakes, Reinforced Chassis, Chrome Exhaust Tip, 157 PP PRLANM 4D |

https://www.sgcarmart.com/used_cars/listing.php?MOD=harrier& PRC=0& DEP=0&RGD=201 S5&VEH... 30-Dec-19



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Page 1 of 1

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner |D:

Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Singapore NRIC
266H

SKT7952X

No

30 Dec 2019
TOYOTA

HARRIER PREMIUM 2.0 A
White

2014

3ZRB516176
Z5U600038707
111.0 kW (148 bhp)
$29,433.00

23 Jun 2015

23 Jun 2015

0

$23,207.00

Yes

22 Jun 2025
$17,405.00

22 Jun 2025

B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW (130bhp)
10

$71,509.00

$39,190.00

$56,595.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 30 Dec 2019

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebateBy PublicBeforeDeregInput?FUNCTION_ID=F030...  30-Dec-19



FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD
BLK1 KAKI BUKIT AVE &
#01-46,48,50 AUTOBAY

 SINGAPORE 417883
VEHICLE NO: SKTT4LLY
ary PARTICULAR
1PCS REAR WINDSCREEN MOULDING /7 20
1PCS TAILGATE REAR LOGO
1PCS TAILGATE 7 2-of
1PCS TAILGATE 'HARRIER' EMBLEM 6 (0
1PCS TAILGATE TURBO' EMBLEM
| PCS TAILGATE guber gerpigly 785 /o
1PCS TAILGATE WEATHERSTRIP
1PCS TAILGATE INNER LOCK
1PCS TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD
2PCS TAILGATE DAMPERS @S$580.10
1PCS REAR BUMPER DIFUSSER
1PCS REAR BUMPER 25700
1PCS REAR BUMPER SPONGE
2PCS REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINERS @$68.10
1SET REAR BUMFER CLIPS
1PCS REAR BUMPER SUPPORT BAR
2 PCS REAR BUMPER SUPPORT BAR BRACKETS @$165.00
2PCS REAR BUMPER SIDE HOLDERS @$75.50
1PCS REAR END PANEL da‘,:,., ¢t O
1PCS REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH
2 PCS TAILLAMPS @$541.10
1PCS REAR FLOOR PANEL TOP BOARD
1PCS REAR FLOOR PANEL
2PCS REAR FENDERS @$1021.10
2PCS REAR FENDER INNER TRIM BOARDS @$645.20
1PCS REAR EXHAUST
4PCS REAR BUMPER PDC SENSORS @$361.10
1PC3 REAR SMART KEYLESS ANTENNE
Iset REAR BUMPER raigl Seagos
S.NETT
1 SET REAR FLOOR PANEL INSULATOR
1PCS REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT
1PCS REAR END PANEL SEALANT
1PCS REAR LICENCE PLATE W/HOLDER
LABOUR CHARGES
TO CHECK WIRING

TO DISMANTLE & REPLACING PDC SENSOR

TO DISMANTLE & REFIX REAR WINDSCREEN

TO DISMANTLE & REFIX REAR EXHALUST

TO DISMANTLE & REFIX CUSHION UPHOLSTREY

TO SPRAY RUST PROOFING

TO MOUNT VEHICLE ON CAR O-LINER

TO TRAMSFER TAILGATE MECHANISM

LABOUR FOR PANEL BEATING & REPLACING PARTS

A Pmﬁ 4 ﬁ‘“’_‘} fqnh'h:j

W o AMMW/
A

3%

1/ 5 8800

/ S’c(“-T

.

AL $28154

—$68.10 ~
AorliPD 5171235
AL 89160~
~ME - 36000 X
Cna 378320
Apq  $34166 —
> $459.10_—

Den $460.32 —
A1 $1.16020 X
731 $45500 —
Jt8 sass10—
/ 0.4 "$14500
MISBant 13620 ¢ PC
$50.00 e
NT $1,195.00
AJE $330.00
nA  $151.00 X
'Seu[j e $631.60 —
Tr 36089 —
A1 108220 X
fFLa $820.10 X
L $1,186.50 €
A1 5204220

/v(i /e $1,29040 cpc.

A 51,135.00)(
A= $1,444.40

252 A= $199.20
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$80.00 K¢ <
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A 10000 A,
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Uibi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PL Ref : CS/SMO19022854/Ugd3n2
oot " WA
#05-01/08 Date: 09-01-2020
SINGAPORE LAND TOWERSINGAPORE 048623
Code : SMOD
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh, FBG 511U Veh. Inspected SKT 7852X
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. CMTD190603T/GPL Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From GRACE TEO Assign Date 30122018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA HARRIER (A) c.C 1986
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. ZSUB00038707 Colour WHITE
Odometer 109466 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |235/55 R18 BRIDGESTONE & mm
L/H Front Tyre |235/55 R18 BRIDGESTONE & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |235/55R18 BRIDGESTONE & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |235/55R18 BRIDGESTONE & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR N/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS,
5, General Information
Accident Date  28/1212019 |inspection Date 30/12/2019
Survey held at FASTECH AUTO PTELTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE &
#01-46/48/50 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKT 7952X
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. Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) (s)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR WINDSCREEN MOULDING NECESSARY 297.54 113.10
1|TAILGATE REAR LOGO MECESSARY 68.10 68.10
1| TAILGATE BADLY DENTED 1,712.35 1,712.05
1| TAILGATE "HARRIER" EMBLEM NECESSARY 91.60 68.10
1| TAILGATE "TURBO" EMBLEM NOT FITTED 60.00 -
1| TAILGATE OUTER GARNISH CRACKED 783.20 705.10
1|TAILGATE WEATHERSTRIP TWISTED 341 66 341.66
1|TAILGATE INNER LOCK SHORTED 45810 459.10
1| TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD DEFORMED / TORN 460.32 460.32
2| TAILGATE DAMPERS @$580.10 NOT NECESSARY 1,160.20 .
1|REAR BUMPER DIFUSSER DISTORTED 455.00 45500
1|REAR BUMPER DISTORTED 955,10 95510
1|REAR BUMPER SPONGE TORN 145.00 145.00
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINERS @$68.10 M/S BENT 136.20 68.10
1|SET REAR BUMPER CLIPS MECESSARY 50.00 50,00
1|REAR BUMPER SUPPORT BAR MOT FITTED 1,195.00 .
2|REAR BUMPER SUPPORT BAR BRACKETS @%165.00 NOT FITTED 330.00 -
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE HOLDERS @$75.50 NOT NECESSARY 151.00 -
1|REAR END PANEL BADLY DENTED 831.60 B03.10
1|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH TWISTED 360.89 360.89
2| TAILLAMPS @$541.10 NOT NECESSARY 1,082.20 -
1|REAR FLOOR PANEL TOP BOARD SERVICEABLE 820.10 -
1|REAR FLOOR PAMEL TO REPAIR SEE 1,166.50 -
LABOUR

2|REAR FENDERS @%1021.10 NOT NECESSARY 2,042.20 -
2|REAR FENDER INNER TRIM BOARDS @3$645.20 ¥§.RE‘EFGRMED f 1,290.40 64520
1|REAR EXHAUST NOT NECESSARY 1,185.00 i
4|REAR BUMPER PDC SENSORS @%361.10 NOT NECESSARY 1,444.40 -
1|REAR SMART KEYLESS ANTENME NOT NECESSARY 199,20 -
1|SET REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR SHORTED 250.00 250.00

Report Ref No. CS/SMO12022854/Ugd3n2
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Qty Description of Parts Condition WE::;T;; ?:ll Our ﬁl.:ts[j}uﬂnd
LESS 25% DISCOUNT ! -1,914.98
19,523.86 5,744.94
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET REAR FLOOR PANEL INSULATOR (SN) NOT NECESSARY 180.00 -
1|REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 50.00 40.00
1|REAR END PANEL SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 50.00 50.00
1|REAR LICENCE PLATE W/HOLDER (SN) NOT NECESSARY 50.00 ;
330.00 90.00
LABOUR
TO CHECK WIRING. 80.00 30.00
TO DISMANTLE & REPLACING PDC SENSOR. £80.00 50.00
TO DISMANTLE & REFIX REAR WINDSCREEN. 150.00 120.00
TO DISMANTLE & REFIX REAR EXHAUST. NOT NECESSARY 100.00 2
TO DISMANTLE & REFIX CUSHION UPHOLSTERY. 150.00 80.00
TO SPRAY RUST PROOFING. 120.00 60.00
TO MOUNT VEHICLE ON CAR O-LINER. NOT NECESSARY 380.00 .
TO TRANSFER TAILGATE MECHANISM. 120.00 80.00
LABOUR FOR PANEL BEATING & REPLACING 2,200.00 880.00
PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR FLOOR
PANEL.
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING. 1,500.00 1,000.00
4,880.00 2,300.00
GRAND TOTAL 24,733.86 8,134.94
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMFP SUM REPAIRS 6,500.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/SM019022854/Uqd3n2

CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is mads sclaly for the use and benefit of the Client named on the Iront page of this Repart.
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