Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@gbe.com>

Sent: 9 September 2020 1:15 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Cc: claims-singapore

Subject: VC013284 MANDATE REQUEST - VC013284 Direct Settlement - Accident Involving
SLP2696C (Ol : QBE ) AND GBG1166M (TP : LKK REF - CC6/QBE19022844/Uka3) on
20/12/2019

Attachments: LKK Reinspection Photos.pdf; LKK Survey Photos.pdf; LOD.pdf; LKK Adjustment

Report.pdf; LKK Inspection Report.pdf

Hi Khanchna
Please proceed as per advise.

Thank you.

Jenny Toh

Senior Assistant

Claims | Asia

1 Raffles Quay, #29-10 South Tower, Singapore 048583
+65 6477 1225

Website LinkedIn Twitter

/\3 QBE @ IIISU.I'al’lCE
Awards 2020
Winner of Insurance Asia Awards 2020 — Digital General Insurance Initiative of the Year, Singapore

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 9 September 2020 9:59 am

To: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@qgbe.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@]lkkauto.com>; claims-singapore <claims-singapore@qbe.com>; Andrew Lim
<andrew.lim@gbe.com>

Subject: MANDATE REQUEST - VC013284 Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLP2696C (OI : QBE )
AND GBG1166M (TP : LKK REF - CC6/QBE19022844/Uka3) on 20/12/2019

This email was sent from someone outside of QBE. Be cautious opening links and attachments. Use the ‘Report
Phishing’ button if suspicious.

QBE REF: VC013284
LKK REF: CC6/QBE19022844/Uka3




Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES GBG1166M (TP) & SLP2696C (OI) ON 20.12.2019

We refer to the above matter.

Head to rear collision.

We informed to the Insured driver of the TP claim and NCD issues and agreed to let Insurance handle.
In view of the above, we are of the view that BOLA 27 is applicable.

Summary to offer to FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD is as follows:

TP CLAIMED REVISED - TO OFFER
Cost of Repair (w/GST) S 26,157.22 S 3,263.50
Loss of Use ($100 X 4 days) S 400.00 S 400.00 ($100 x 4 days)
GIA Search S 2.00 S 2.00
TOTAL | $ 26,559.22 $ 3,665.50

Breakdown of days is as follows:

* 4 days recommendation for repair

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.
For your approval and/or further instructions please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@I|kkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

1 and destroy any hard copies produced.

------------------ IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are
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unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly inform us by reply email
or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies produced.




