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“Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

F SESSS e e —
From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 2 January 2020 12:53 PM

To: Claims; SUR

Cc: (nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg); (boojohnny@gmail.com)

Subject: RE: OD CLAIMS FOR SDA 1389 U -DOA: 23/12/2019

Dear George,
As instructed by our client ., please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SDA 1389U (Excess $1000/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel:
6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company
before completion of the repair.

*Qur client reserve their rights not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

AIG OIC- Azlan, Syazairdina| svazairdina.azlan@aig.com

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 5256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 23 December 2019 6:49 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: OD CLAIMS FOR 5DA 1383 U

Dear All,

Please assist to register own policy claims for the above mentioned vehicle.
Attached is the GIA report, DL, Insurance certificate for your reference.

Kindly arrange the survey on 30 of Dec@10am, owner waiting.

Address : 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938

Thank you.



Best Regards,
George Wong
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)
281 Alexandra Road Singapore 155938

p. +65 6366 2323, option 1

e. Claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg
Audi Showroom 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 68362223

WELCOME TO THE P S
8TH DIMENSION. :

THE ALL-MNEW AUDI OQB.

i—pmb OUT MORE |

Ernall Disclaimer

This email, Including any attachment, Is confidential and may also be privileged.

If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you
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View Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SDA1389U (44450899565G)
oD
Dec 23 2019 10:30AM
[AH YAT ABALONE FORLIM RESTAURANT HOLDIMGS PTE LTD]
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

"Reply | _Reply All | _Mark as Unread | _Print Message | Delete Message | Forward |

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd. (AIG_SG), sent on 02/01/2020 12:30 PM.
To LKK_HGQ
Subject

Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$6649.00) - SDA1389U - Claim Handler: Azlan, Syazairdina

ﬁppmved:6649.00:Reﬁinspettla.r:| to be done for damage :hm.:k and supplementary items [/ Iabnur..

'DOCUMENTS SUMMARY - _ - -
There are no documents,

https:/isingapore. merimen.com/claims/index ofm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_view&mode=1A&linboxid=1608600&iDomainld=11&I0bjld=1...  1/2




Premium Automobiles |

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408639
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183 WIP: 24010

Email;: Nora. khai@premiumauto.com.sg / claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Telefax

Estimate :  Accident Repairs
Workshop :  UbiRoad 1

Contact No : 63662323

Fax No : 6841 1183

Reference = PA/OD/1515/2019/NS
Date : 26-Dec-19

Vehicle NOT IN workshop. Kindly arrange for survey.

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
78 Shenton Way

#07-16 AIG Building

Singapore 079120

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept
Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315

Owner's Name :  AhYat Abalone Forum Restaurant Holdings Pte Ltd
Address : 200 Turf Club Road
#03-01
Singapore 287994
Telephone 1 +6598772618
Type of Claim :  Own Damage Claims
Policy No. : 1900168047
Vehicle No : SDA1389U
Model Code + AudiQs 2.0TFSIQU
Model / Year ! 30-09-19
Engine No - DAX 057741
Chassis No : WAUZZZFYOK2118021
Mileage T
Date In o=
Estimated By 1 lohnny Boo / Allan Wu
Accident Date : 23-Dec-19

Place of Accident ¢ Dunearn road



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Read 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax

Estimated Labour Charges for Accident Vehicle SDA 1389 U

Estimated Surveyor's
s/n Mature of Jobs Charges Recommendations
To remove, check and reinstall front wire
1 harness for headlights, horns, outside SN S 480.00 /

temperature sensor, headlight washer assy and
front parking aid.

To dismantle and renew front bumper and lhs 7 .
2 headlight. Re-organise crash management S 1,600.00 47
components. Reinstall all parts removed.

To respray front bymper, front bumper Euvi:f'é'r

3 spoiler, lhs front fender and both front wheel , | S 3,500.00 /77 ¢
arch trims. (&%
4 To carry out diagnostic check. S/N S 192.00 .~

TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES 5 5 B 712.00




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408695
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SDA 1389 U
Damaged Parts & Prices

S/N  Parts Description S/Nett Remarks
1 FRONTBUMPER / ([ S 2,364.00
2 FRONT BUMPER FIXING PARTS . A s 244.00
3 FRONT BUMPER SECURING STRIP-LH /¥« $ 34.00
4 FRONT BUMPER CLOSING ELEMENT-LH . M ¢ 101.00
5  FRONT BUMPER SPOILER ¥ K $ 685.00
6 FRONT BUMPER UNDERRUN BAR ¥ VN $ 431.00
7 FRONT BUMPER CLOSING ELEMENT % NAI $ 156.00
8  FRONT BUMPER AIR GUIDE GRILLE-LH X MM ¢ 519.00
9 FRONT BUMPER END CAP-LH X M/ $ 83.00

10 FRONT BUMPER GUIDE SECTION-LH | M 34.00
11 FRONT BUMPER FOAM FILLER prece X MV 5 259.00
12 FRONTBUMPER CARRIER X MA/ 5 831.00
13 HEADLIGHT MOUNTING-LH < NV 3 107.00
14  LED HEADLIGHT-LH X Al S 7,227.00
15  LIFTCYLINDER-LH X WA/ 3 128.00
16  FRONT WHEEL COVER-LH/RH .~ /( 25 1,154.00 92> W
17 sunories Ty 5 300.00
TOTAL SPARE PARTS : $ 14,657.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES : § 5,772.00
GRAND TOTAL : S 20,429.00

All charges are not inclusive of GST.
Legend : Remarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks (X) = Mot approved
Spare parts are Special Nett.



.

Premium Automobilés

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax : 6841 1183

Telefax W e
o)219, 1715
Name . St (LKK ) 1) I A L. (e )
3] o
Surveyed Date Yy v
Authorised Date - Iy ’;? o/
T,

Excess Cost : / 0,
Liability . o i Jj ,-'

. P ol I_.H, 4
Remarks , [cos )
Please Note :  This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle,

Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Norah Khai at

Tel:G768 9828 for appointment,

LK Auto Consutants hence

. the Rapairer of the foliowing:

Yours faithfully, 'ID G g
* 1o ;esplay damaged padis|

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd » Parts prices are ot Shed

* Third party
= N B3 N s fin
& S

] 'EL'L'-:—"_! o final ans

RC#:‘:M-};QQ by Repaires
Signature:

= —

Johnny Boo Allan Wu
Body Repair Manager Claims Consultant




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408693
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

WIP : 24010

Email: Nora khai@premiumauto.com.sg / claims@premiumauto.com sg

Telefax

Estimate
Workshop
Contact No
Fax No
Reference
Date

Accident Repairs

Ubi Road 1

6366 2323

6841 1183
PA/QODMS15/2019/NS
26-Dec-19

Vehicle NOT IN workshop. Kindly arrange for survey.

AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

78 Shenton Way

#07-16 AIG Building

Singapore 079120

Hi Steve = -
5 days exclude 1 Sunday - jb 4 Mar 20

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept

Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315

Owner's Name
Address

Telephone
Type of Claim
Policy No.
Vehicle No

Model Code
Model / Year
Engine No
Chassis No
Mileage

Date In

Estimated By
Accident Date
Place of Accident

Ah Yat Abalone Forum Restaurant Holdings Pte Ltd
200 Turf Club Road

#03-01

Singapore 287994

+65 98772618

Own Damage Claims

1900168047

SDA 1389 U

Audi Q5 2.0 TFSI QU
30/9/2018
DAX 057741

WAUZZZFYOKZ2118021

Johnny Boo / Allan Wu
23-Dec-19
Dunearn road



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408599
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax: 68411183

Telefax

Estimated Labour Charges for Accident Vehicle SDA 1389 U

Estimated Surveyor's
Sin Mature of Jobs Charges ecommendations

To remove, check and reinstall front wire harness

1 for headlights, horns, outside temperature sensor, SIN 480.00 5 480.00
headlight washer assy and front parking aid.
To dismantle and renew front bumper and lhs

2 headlight. Re-organise crash management 1,600.00 5 500.00
components. Reinstall all parts removed.
Te respray front bumper, front bumper lower

3 spoiler, Ins front fender and both front wheel arch 3,500.00 b 1,825.00
trims.

4  To carry out diagnostic check, SN 192.00 5 192.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES - 5,772.00 ¥ 3,097.00




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SDA 1389 U

Damaged Parts & Prices

S/N___Parts Description S/Nett Remarks
1 FRONT BUMPER $ 2,364.00 § 1,891.20
2 FRONT BUMPER FIXING PARTS 3 244 00
3 FRONT BUMPER SECURING STRIP - LH 3 34.00 5 26.48
4 FRONT BUMFER CLOSING ELEMENT - LH 5 101.00
5 FRONT BUMFER SPOILER 3 6B85.00
6 FRONT BUMPER UNDERRUN BAR 5 431.00
7 FRONT BUMPER CLOSING ELEMENT 5 156.00
8§ FRONT BUMPER AIR GUIDE GRILLE - LH ] 518.00
9 FRONT BUMPER END CAP - LH $ 83.00
10 FRONT BUMPER GUIDE SECTION - LH 3 34.00
11 FRONT BUMPER FOAM FILLER PIECE $ 259.00
12  FRONT BUMPER CARRIER $ 831.00
13 HEADLIGHT MOUNTING - LH 3 107.00
14  LED HEADLIGHT - LH $ 7,227.00
15  LIFT CYLINDER - LH $ 128.00
16 FRONT WHEEL COVER - LH/RH 2 3 1,154.00 § 922.40
17 SUNDRIES 3 300.00
TOTAL SPARE PARTS $ 14,657.00 $§ 2,840.08
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES $ 5,772.00 $ 3,097.00
GRAND TOTAL $ 20,429.00 § 5937.08

All charges are not inclusive of GST.
Legend : Remarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks (X) = Not approved
Spare parts are Special Nett,



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408639
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183

Telefax

Name

Surveyed Date
Authorised Date
Excess Cost
Liability
Remarks

Please Note : This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle.
Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Morah Khai at
Tel:6768 9828 for appointment,

Yours faithfully,

Premium Automobiles Pte Lid

Johnny Boo Allan Wu
Body Repair Manager Claims Consultant




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 5 March 2020 11:27 AM

To: Boo seng yak; Steve Chen (LKK Auto); SUR; Carrine Leong; Chang Chee Sing;
jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg

Subject: RE: FINAL REVISION - SDA1389U - OD AIG - SURVEYED 30 DEC 19

Dear Mr Boo,

Confirm repair cost of $5937.08 before excess $1000 and GST @ 5 days

Kindly send us invoice and discharge voucher for us to close file.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Boo seng yak <boojohnny@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 4 March 2020 6:18 PM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com=>; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
<veronchen@lkkauto.com>; Carrine Leong <carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg>; Chang Chee Sing
<claims@premiumauto.com.sg>; jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg

Subject: FINAL REVISION - 5DA1389U - OD AIG - SURVEYED 30 DEC 19

Hi Steve and all,

Revised and photographs is attached.

Please confirm repair cost of 55937.08 @ 5 days exclude 1 Sunday.

Your early closure is well appreciated.

Best regards - jb



