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- GOLD AUTOWORKS PTE LTD
48 Toh Guan Road East Enterprise Hub #01-119 Singapore 608586

Email : claims @goldautoworks.com.sg
CAR MODEL : HONDA VEZEL
CHASSIS NO:

Company Reg no. 201716329M
VEH NO: SLLES0T
HF:8199-9145

Estimate Bill

Hs- 6Fmru

!

n-#-.-..'

“lc-iwj

e

B
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List Item ity Unit Price Amount _;N\
1 |reartailgate b4 < 1% 98000 | 5 880.00
7 |rear tailgate lock %3 VG 1 |5 264805 264.80 !(Z\g ;s
3 |rear tailgate inner trim 7 o™ 1 5 33490 | 5 334.90 I L.l,
4 |tailgate inner trim clip  Ade 7 L. 10 | & 300 |5 30.00
5 |rear tailamp L/R *TAILGATE* LA -X [RH -7, tm = lpe | £, s (345.00))5 690.00 [ LIF Toweo
6 |rear tailamp L/R *BODY* W AW-0% /7 [LH A [,,H 1 5 (385.00) $ 770.00 |«
7 |rear side garnishes  de ~ 1: 5 27600 % 276.00 7(%‘27)
8 |rear tailgate outer garnishes % Fv— 1 5 329.00| % 329.00 [¥
9 [rear bumper Mo RE 863.70 | 5 863.70 L/S
10 |rear bumper clip  pae 10 |5 3.00]5 30.00
11 |rear bumper retainer L/R *TOP* ¥ SY¥& 2 5 12000 ] 5 240.00 X 25/!1{,'0(
12 |rear bumper retainer L/R *LOWER® 3£ vt z 5 100,00 | & 200.00
13 |rear wheel arch garnishes RH  dlt =~ 1 5 200,00 % 200.00 @ “{' ; &
14 |wheel arch garnishes clip Aga = g8 |[s 3.00] 5 24,00
15 |rear lower garnishes  de » 1 |5 250,00 | & 250.00
16 rearlc:-werggrnishestlip A S 10 5 200| 5 0.00 MW")
17 |rearend panel b4 ~ I ] 5 876.40 | & 876.40
18 |rear exhaust muffler -"J.F-:f"?" i I |5 1,059.60 | 5 1,059.60 a T
19 |exhaust muffler heat shield H ~ 1 5 28890 | 5 288.90 %
20 |rear radar sensor "wx VL 1 5 360,00 | 5 360.00 [ [ at”
21 |rear VEZEL emblem Ae 1 |5 9000 | 5 50.00
22 |rear HONDA logo ages — 1 5 90.00 | & 20.00
23 |rear end panelinnertrim *. el & T 285.00 | & 285.00
24 |end panel inner trim clip Age = T 3.00( s 15.00
25 |rear car tools compartment box €%~ R 32800 | 5 328.00 "
2b |orLlloor pant| regec E B 73 645-(0 0
' ' Total List 5 emam (181"
List 20% Discount g g 208,
After Discount 5 & R ¢ w
Special Mett Item e
26  |rear windscreen moulding  Ass 4 |3 6000 |5 j2% 24870 'f"""“—‘ Yy v
27 |rear windscreen sealant Aga — 1 5 100.00 | & Loaﬁ'éu
28 |[rear PHV sticker b 1 5 25.00 | & 2500 | ¥
20 |rear parking sensorae—" 1 |5 250.00 | & 25670 |2ou A™ =
30 |body panel sealant  Ase 1 |8 80,00 | 5 80 | o
Labour
A [to check rear electrical system and reapir wire harness & 100.00 |5 %%_ﬂﬂ' Zo
B |torepairstraighten,realign on affected area 5 1,200.00 | 5 12800 *:J&I] -
C  |tospray painting & blending on affected area 5 1,500.00 | 5 ]_,gﬁﬁ'ﬁﬁn TCTU f{,, fU
0 |to apply anti rust coating on affected area - ] 20000 | 5 EﬁB’ﬁD Po '_,..-"”
E [|tostraighten, repair exhaust pipe system - 5 120,00 | 5 1 bo
Total S/N & Labour §  381500| tl)sa0
Lump-sum 20% 5 8,751.39 3T o0
VA 42] [E—?ﬂ.":.}

o
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» Back to OneMotoring

‘Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Onwoner 10 Type:

Owener |0

Vehicle Details

Wehicle Ma.:

Wehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine MNo,:

Chassis No.

M aximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Criginal Reglstration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period{Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 30 Dec 2019

OK

Businoss
&17W

SLLASOT

Mo

30 Dec 2019
HOM DA,
WEZEL 1.5% CVT
Green

2018
L15B4408120
RU11208120
96.0 kW (128 bhp)
$21,894.00

13 Feb 2017
13Feb 2017

0

112,452.00

Yes
12 Feb 2027
£7.489.00

12 Feb 2027

A-Carupto 1600cc & 97kW [1306hg)

10

$48,401.00
$34 449.00
$43,958.00

Ky

sv\J



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

%

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 26 December 2019 11:35 AM

To: assignments

Subject: FW: [EXTERNAL] Re: Your Ref : SLL650T  Qur Ref : S9MO02B5AMC/RA
Hi

Kindly assist.

TP SMART.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

----- Original Message-----

From: claims@goldautoworks.com.sg <claims@goldautoworks.com.sg>
sent: Tuesday, 24 December, 2019 3:42 PM

To: KADRI Mateen <mateen.kadri@axa.com.sg>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: Your Ref : SLL650T Our Ref : S9M02 BSAMC/RA

Hi Mateen Kadri, without prejudice
We would like to choose 1) LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

REGARDS,

SIMON TAN

GOLD AUTOWORKS PTE LTD
8195-9149

On 2019-12-24 15:29, KADRI Mateen wrote:

> "WITHOUT PREJUDICE'

> SAVE ASTO COSTS

>

> Dear Sir,

>

> We want to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your

> client’s/your customer's vehicle jointly with your client/your motor

> workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the
> attached list below to conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a Single
> Joint Expert,

>

> List of our motor surveyors:

> 1.LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

> 2.Infiniti Appraisal Services

> 3.Priority Services Pte Ltd

> 4. AXA in house surveyor

>

> Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to

1



> the appointment of any of these motor surveyors as a single joint

> experi. You may select one or more of the listed motor surveyors, We
> will bear the cost of the pre-repair survey carried out by the single

> joint expert. Meanwhile, please furnish us with estimate quotation in
> order for our surveyor to complete the pre repair survey.

>

> If there be any injury claims by your client, please combine it in one

> Letter of Demand in light of one cause of action, save as to costs and
> eXpenses.

>

»

> Regards,

> Mateen Kadri

>

Vo oW oW vy

> From: claims@goldautoworks.com.sg [mailto:claims@goldautoworks.com.sg]
> Sent: Tuesday, December 24, 2019 3:02 PM

> To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey

> <motor.survey @axa.com.sg>

> Subject: [EXTERNAL] Requesting for PRE-Repair survey for our vehicle
> number SLLESOT

>

> ATTENTION MOTOR CLAIM DEPARTMENT

=

> Dear Sir/Mdm,

>

> Accident involving SLL65S0T & FZ2324S AT UPP CHANGI ROAD EAST INFRONT
> SUMMER GARDENS

>

> 1. We are here to notify you of a road traffic accident on 23/12/2019
>; 18:30HRS at UPP CHANGI ROAD EAST INFRONT SUMMER GARDENS
>

> involving our client vehicle registration number SLL650T and

> vehicle registration number FZ23245 driven by your insured

=

> atthe material time.

>

> 2. As a result of the accident, our client vehicle SLLE50T has been

> damaged.

>

> Please arrange and conduct a PRE- REPAIR SURVEY of the vehicle. If
> we do not receive any reply from you within the

>

> stipulated timeline, OUR client shall proceed to repair the

> vehicle without further reference to you.

>

> 3. Please arrange a PRE-REPAIR SURVEY at 48,TOH GUAN RD EAST,

> ENTERPRISE HUB #01-119 5{608586)
>

]



>
>

> THANKS & REGARDS,

>  SIMON TAN

> GOLD AUTOWORKS PTE LTD
> B159-9149

> —---Disclaimer-----

> This message may contain confidential information intended solely for
> the use of the named addressee. If you are not the intended recipient,
> you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this

> message. If you have received this message by mistake, please notify
> the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this

> message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily

> represent those of AXA Singapore - Externals or any other entity of

> the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly

> authorized by the said companies,
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Immediate Advice
To : AXA Insurance Pte Ltd Date: 21/2/2020

Survey Details:

Date of loss 23-Dec-2019
Date of appointment 26-Dec-2019
Date of survey 26-Dec-2019
Location of survey GOLD AUTOWOREKS PTELTD

Vehicle Details:

Claim Type: THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Yehicle number SLL 650T

Make and Model HONDA VEZEL 1.5% C\VT

Date of registration 13/2/2017

Parf Rebate

Market Value 5 £5,000.00

Parf Rebate 5 43,958.00

Mett Loss 5 21,042.00

Repair details:

Initial Estimate B 9,183.78
Proposed/Revised repair cost:

Parts 5 5,850.20

Check items (estimate) S -

Labour 5 1,670.00

Total 5 7.520.20

Lump Sum(if applicable) ] 6,000.00

MNumber of days for repair | 7




! f { Hura

— Congwtanis
i Pre Lig Company Registration Mo, 190607 1088
2] LBIAVE L I 22 PAYA LB INDUSTREAL PARK, SINGAPUKE JEEYEY PEL 7 (6d I8 560 FAN @ el 625812
Remarks:
Mandate:
Liability(TF) 100%
Proposed repair cost 5 6,420.00 |W/GST
Loss of use 5 -
Loss of rental ] 455.00 |7days x 565
Loss of income 5 i
LTA search fees 5 7.45
Others 5 3
Proposed Total 5 6,882.45
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&

hitps:iivp.smartclaims.axa.com.sg/claim-poral/htmllindex-vendor-sarvice-reguasts. htmi#service-requestsiview-message/fserviceReguesiiumber=15. ..

Claim Portal
<MANI?ATE IA> - S9OMO2B5A {ACCIDENT INVOLVING FZ
2423S (Ol) & SLL 650T (TP) ON 23/12/2019}
Type
@ Question

Message

LIABILITY: 100% BOLA 527 - INFORMED Ol ABOUT TP CLAIM AND NCD ISSUE, AGREED TO SETTLE AT
BEST. WE SEEK YOUR MANDATE AT $6882.45 (CLAIMING LOR). MANDATE |A HAS BEEN UPLOADED IN
SMARTCLAIM. KINDLY LET US HAVE YOUR APPROVAL/INSTRUCTION. THANKS - CCL 21/02/2020

1M1



2i28f2020 Claim Portal

Re:<MANDATE IA> - SIMO2B5A {ACCIDENT
« INVOLVING FZ 24233 (Ol) & SLL 650T (TP) ON
23/12/2019}

Type
@ Question

Message
HI, pls proceed as per mandate. TY.

httpsJivp.smartclaims.axa.com.sg'claim-portalhtmlfiindex-vendor-service-requests. himk/'service-requests/view-message/?serviceReguesthumbe ... 11



8/2/2020

48 Toh Guan Rd East, Enterprise Hub

#01-119, Singapore 608586

Email : claims@goldautoworks.com.sg

Fax : 62645948 Contact No : 8199-91459

Letter of Demand

Dear Sir/ Mdm,

CLAIMS FOR DAMAGE ARISING FROM AN ACCIDENT ON 23/12/20; 18:30HRS INVOLVING
VEHICLE NO.(S) SLL650T & FZ2423S Location Of Accident : UPP CHANGI RD EAST
INFRONT SUMMER GARDENS

We refer to the above captioned accident,and demanding the following payment for the
property damages with regards to the accident

Please find attached the followings :

1) Final Bil

2) GIA Report

3) Loss Of Rental $65.00 per day from: 27/12-3/1/20
4) LTA Search

5) Letter of Authorization

ITEMIZATION OF THE DAMAGES

COST OF REPAIR *GST* 5 6,420.00
LOSS OF RENTAL 5 455.00
LTA SEARCH FEE s 7.45
TOTAL : 5 6,882.45

Yours truly,

Gold Autoworks Pte Ltd
Company Reg No. 201716325M
48 Toh Guan Road East #01-1159,
Enterprise Hub

Singapore 608586



48 Toh Guan Rd East, Enterprise Hub
#01-119, Singapare 608586

Email : claims@goldautoworks.com. sg
Company Registration : 201716329M
GST Reglstration Mo ; 200716329M

Fax : 6264 5548

Tax Invoice : GA-20-650T
Customer Mamae DRIVE L SERVICES Accident Date 23/Dec/19
Vehicla Na + SLLESOT Contact Na B199-0149
Make : HOMDA Mileage
Model . WEZEL Attended By WINSTON CHUA
Chassis No Delivery Date
5/N| DESCRIPTION aTy UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
1 JLUMP-5LIM REPAIR 5 B,000.00
2 |GET ™% 5 420.00
SINGAPORE DOLLARS
1] GOODSS0LD ARE NOT RETURMNABLE. GRAMND TOTAL ? £,420.00
3] ALL CHEQWUE TO BE CROSSED AND DRAWN IN FAVOUR
OF GOLD AUTO WORKS PTE LTD MNETT TOTAL 5 6,420.00
[LESS DISCOUNT |
FOR & N BEHALF OF
GOLD AUTO WORKS PTELTD <4. TOTAL PAYMENT
' 5 6,420.00

BALANCE

AUTHORISED SIGNATLIRE AND COMPANY

ETABAP




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

/4’4

AV 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
AXA INSURANCE PTELTD Ref : CC4/ASM19022676/R1ga3s2
A TOWERSINGAFORE e oue: woasao [N
ATTN: RICHARD ANG Code: ASM
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. FZ 24235 Veh. Inspected SLL 650T
Policy No. AN3175757 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SOMOZBSAMC/RA Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From KADRI MATEEN Assign Date 26M12/2019
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDAVEZEL 1.5X CVT c.c 1496
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 207
Chassis No. RU11208120 Colour GREEN
Odometer 247832 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |[215/60 R16 LING LONG 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |[215/60 R18 LING LONG & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/60 R16 LING LONG & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/60 R16 LING LONG & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR O/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  23/12/2019 Inspection Date 28/12/2019
Survey held at GOLD AUTOWORKS PTE LTD
48 TOH GUAN ROAD EAST
#01-119 ENTERPRISE HUB
SINGAPORE 608588
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

IESTMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: T Working Days
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AdS BE

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLL 650T

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4215
Reg. Mo: 198607198R GST Reg. No. 18-8607198-R

Page No.1of 2

; Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | ¢ mhhp?}] *‘ﬁj}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR TAILGATE (CONSISTENT) BENT 980.00 Ga0.00
1|REAR TAILGATE LOCK (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 264.80 -
1|REAR TAILGATE INNER TRIM (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 33490 334 90
10| TAILGATE INNER TRIM CLIP @ $3.00 (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 30.00 30,00
2|REAR TAILLAMP L/R (TAILGATE) @ $345.00 NIS NOT 690.00 345.00
(COMSISTENT) NECESSARY | V3
CRACKED
2|REAR TAILLAMP L/R (BODY) @ $385.00 (CONSISTENT) /S CRACKED / NIS 770.00 385.00
NOT NECESSARY
1|REAR SIDE GARNISHES (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 276.00 276.00
1|REAR TAILGATE OUTER GARMISHES (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 329.00 -
1|REAR BUMPER (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 863.70 863.70
10|REAR BUMPER CLIP @ $3.00 (CONSISTENT) MECESSARY 30.00 30.00
2|REAR BUMPER RETAINER LR (TOP) @ $120.00 SERVICEABLE 240.00 -
(CONSISTENT)
2|REAR BUMPER RETAINER L/R (LOWER) @ $100.00 SERVICEABLE 200.00
(CONSISTENT)
1|REAR WHEEL ARCH GARMNISHES RH (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 200.00 200.00
&8|WHEEL ARCH GARNISHES CLIP @ $3.00 (CONSISTENT) |[NECESSARY 24.00 2400
1|REAR LOWER GARNISES (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 250.00 250.00
10|REAR LOWER GARNISHES CLIP @ $3.00 (CONSISTENT) |NECESSARY 30.00 30.00
1|REAR END PANEL (CONSISTENT) BENT 876.40 876.40
1|REAR EXHAUST MUFFLER (COMNSISTENT) BENT 1,059.60 1,059.60
1|EXHAUST MUFFLER HEAT SHIELD (CONSISTENT) BENT 28890 288.90
1|REAR RADAR SENSOR (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 360.00 -
1|REAR VEZEL EMBLEM [CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 90.00 a0.00
1|REAR HONDA LOGO (CONSISTENT) MECESSARY 0.00 an.oo
1|REAR END PAMEL INNER TRIM (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 285.00 285.00
5|END PANEL INNER TRIM CLIP @ $3.00 (CONSISTENT) MECESSARY 15.00 15.00
1|REAR CAR TOOLS COMPARTMENT BOX (CONSISTENT) |CRACKED 328.00 328.00
1|REAR FLOOR PANEL (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE B75.60 -
LABOUR
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: Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition -
Sl P - Workshop ($)|  ($)
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -1,916.18 -1,356.30
7.664.72 542520
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
4|REAR WINDSCREEN MOULDING @$60.00 (SN) NECESSARY 240.00 125.00
(CONSISTENT)
1|REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 100.00 60.00
1|REAR PHV STICKER (SN) (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 25.00 g
1|REAR PARKING SENSOR (SN) (CONSISTENT) NOT WORKING 250.00 200.00
1|BODY PANEL SEALANT (SN) (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 80.00 40.00
695.00 42500
LABOUR
TO CHECK REAR ELECTRICAL SYSTEM AND REPAIR 100.00 30.00
WIRE HARNESS.
TO REPAIR, STRAIGHTEN, REALIGN ON AFFECTED 1,200.00 800.00
AREA. INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR FLOOR
PANEL.
TO SPRAY PAINTING & BLENDING ON AFFECTED AREA. 1,500.00 700.00
TO APPLY ANTI RUST COATING ON AFFECTED AREA. 200.00 80.00
TO STRAIGHTEN, REPAIR EXHAUST PIPE SYSTEM. 120.00 60.00
3,120.00 1,670.00
GRAND TOTAL 11,479.72 7,520.20
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 6,000.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
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