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51 URLAVE L #01-15 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL © (065) 62560501 FAX : (0aS) 62504315

Your Ref: CMTD1905965/THE

Our Ref: CS/SMO19022673/Kqgd3

The Motor Claims Department

SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE P

Dear Sirs’Mdm

Date: 27/12/2019

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO, SLW 52164 .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above-mentioned vehicle

on _26/12/2019 at the premises of M/s ___Autoexcel Engineering _and have the

following to report: -

Workshop Estimate Amount
Revised Estimate Amount
“Check™ Items Amount
Market Value

LTA Reimbursement Value
Nett Value

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages
at the rear portion and parts.

Repair days: 6

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.

Yours faithfully
Taufikh
Automotive Assessor

:88 2391205
5% 5.793.00
: 5% 8.272.10



Nivitha (LKK Auto!
From:

Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 26 December 2019 9:54 AM

To: Autoexcel Engineering ; ‘admin-d@Ikkauto.com": ‘assignments@Ikkauto.com’
Cc: Ye. Yong Kang Maelvin: Henry, Irene James; Choo, Thelma

Subject: CMTD1905965/THE - LKK/ GBA2831B & SLW5216Z ACC ON 23.12.19
Attachments: SLW5216Z - GIA.PDF

Our Reference - CMTDI1905965/THE
Your Reference: SLW52167

Without Prejudice

EMAIL ONLY
OUR Email; mulurﬁunﬂ'r&:.\um[m.cum.sg

Date: 26.12.2019

Attention:
AUTOEXCEL ENGINEERING PTE LTD

Dear Sharon,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBA2831B & SLW52167 ON 23.12.2019
We refer to your email reply of today.

We will appoint Mr. Kenneth Kong of LKK Auto Consultants to conduct the survey,

Hi LKK Auto,

Please refer to the emall below and make the arrangement to survey for SLW5216Z on a without prejudice basis and
revert with your report upon completion of survey to my colleague, Ms. Thelma.

Thank You.

Our office will be closed on Christmas, New Year's Eve and New Year Day. Business will resume on 26" December 2019
and 2™ January 2020 respectively
We wish you a Merry Christmas and a Happy New Year!

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Ciaims Division

D 63295170 | T- 6461 6555 | F 8221 3147

For motor claims survey request, please email to motorsurvev@sompo.com.s



. @ SOMPO ' A century of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
30 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623

Website: WWW.SOmMpo.com.sq | Facebook: Mﬁg@w

Quick & Easy Claims Submission' & Product Purchase® via Sompo SG

I* Google Play

Download now /a & App Store ar

'For Travel. Personal Accident & Home Insurmce |2 For Trovel, Personal Accideni Home & Private Motar lisurance

Disclaimer; This e-mail, Including attachments, is intended for the parson(s) or company named and may contain confidential
andior legally privileged information Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be untawful and is prohibied
It you are not the Intended recipient, please deleta this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Ple. Lid. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the PUrposes
stated in our Privacy Palicy This may Include disclosure to holding and associated companies, cradit bureau, parties 1o whoem
disclosure is permittedi/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for

From: Autoexcel Engincering <aeexcel@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, December 26, 2019 9-46 AM

To: Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>; Choo, Thelma <thelma.choo@sompo.com.sg>
Ce: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; Henry. Irene James
<irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: RE: CMTD1905965/THE - PRI/ GBA2831B & SLW5216Z ACC ON 23.12.19
Importance: High

Dear Sirs,

We wish fo appoint LKK Auto Consultants - Kenneth Kong

Thank you

Best Regards
Ryan Soh
§3825367

From: Teo, Grace <grace.feol@'sompo.com. sg>

Sent: Thursday, December 26, 2019 9:38 AM

To: Autoexcel Engineering (scexcel singnet.com.sg) <aeexcel@sin
<thelma.choo@sompo.com.sg>

Ce: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.vei sompo.com.sg>; Henry, Irene James
<irene.henry@sompo.com,sg>

Subject: CMTD1905965/THE - PRI/ GBA2831B & SLW5216Z ACC ON 23.12.19
Importance: High

et.com.sg>: Choo, Thelma

Our Reference : CMTD1905965/THE
Your Reference: SLW3216Z
Without Prejudice
EMAIL ONLY
Date: 26.12.2019



OUR Email: motors un’nv&’sgg@.rum.g

Attention:
AUTOEXCEL ENGINEERING PTE LTD
Dear Sharon,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBA2831B & SLW5216Z ON 23.12.2019
We refer to your Notice of Accident dated 26.12.2019,

Please be informed that Ms. Thelma Choo the handler of this case who can be contacted at 63224 681/

thelma,chool@sompo.com.sp

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s vehicle Jointly with
your client/your motor workshop. We Propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list
to conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

Pre-Repair Survey

Selection (Indicate as

Motor Surveyor Surveyor tick)
1 | Raleigh Services Andrew Ow Yong
Vincent Ng
Kenneth Kong (North
2 | LKK Auto Consultants area)

Marcus Chua (East area)
Mohd Rasul (West area)
Mohd Taufikh (West area)
3 | Priority Services limmy Lee

Lawrence Ng

Jeffery Ong

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these
motor surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select up to two of the listed motor surveyors. We will
bear the cost of the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert.

Cur office will be closed on Christmas, New Year's Eve and New Year Day. Business will resume on 26t December 2014
and 2™ January 2020 respectively.
We wish you a Merry Christmas and a Happy New Year!

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D: 83295170 | T 8461 6555 | F: 6221 3147

For motor ¢laims survey request, please email to motorsurvev@sompo.com.sg

3



| O SOMPO A Century of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower. Singapore 048623

Website: www sompo com.sg | Facebook: www. facebook com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission' & Product Purchase® via Sompo SG

& App Store

Download now ar
For Trovel. Personal Accident & Home Insurnee | 7 For Travel, Personnl Aveldent, Home & Privaite Marar Insurnmee

Disclaimer: This e-mail including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may cantain confidential
and/or legally privileged information Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited
It you are not the intended recpient, please delete this message

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Lid. may collect, use and disciose your persanal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Palicy This may inciude disciosure 1o holding and associaled companies, credit bureau, parties 1o whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and Bgents (acting on our behall). Please dick here for
our Privacy Palicy

From: Autoexcel Engineering <acexcelld singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, December 24, 2019 12:52 PM

To: Claims - Motor Survey <MotorSurvey @ sompo.com.se>
Subject: PRE REPAIR SURVEY FOR SLW 52167
Importance: High

Dear Officer,

Please help us arrange for pre repair survey.

Our vehicle - SLW 521627

Accident date —23/12/2019

Your insure - GBA 2831B

Location - AUTOEXCEL ENGINEERING PTE LTD
160 SIN MING DRIVE # 06-01
SIN MING AUTOCITY (S) 575722

Please also let us have the list of surveyor to appoint.

Kindly note that vehicle is already in our workshop.

Thank you

Regards
Sharon Tan
93824978



Denise ‘l‘ax (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 27 December 2019 11:22 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); 'Teo, Grace'; assignments

Cc: "Ye, Yong Kang Melvin'; 'Henry, Irene James'; 'Choo, Thelma’; SUR
Subject: RE: CMTD1905965/THE - LKK/ GBA2B31B & SLW5216Z ACC ON 231219
Attachments: PRELI ADVISED OF SLW 5216Z pdf

Dear SirMadam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLW 5216Z
Number of days (estimated) : 6 days

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lud

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetayif (kknuio.com | fax; 62564315
BIk $1. Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ui Avenue 1, #02-25 | S[408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 26 December 2019 10:11 AM

To: 'Teo, Grace' <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Ce: 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin' <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; 'Henry, Irene James'
<irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>; 'Choo, Thelma' <thelma.choo@sompo.com.sg>; SUR <surfalkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: CMTD1905965/THE - LKK/ GBA2831B & SLW5216Z ACC ON 23.12.19

Dear Sir'Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Wishes you a Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020 A

Best Regurds

G.NIVITHA

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: gssignmems@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51. Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Teo, Grace [mailto:grac !
Sent: Thursday, 26 December 2019 9:54 AM
To: Autoexcel Engineering <acexcel@@singnet.com.sg>; ‘admin-d@lkkauto.com’ <admin-d'¢ Ikkauto.com=;
‘assignments@lkkauto.com' <assignments/a [kkauto com>
1




Autoexcel Enﬂineeriﬂ

From: Teo, Grace <grace teo@sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, December 26, 2019 9:54 AM

To: Autoexcel Engineering ; "admin-d@lkkauto.com’; ‘assignmentsi@lkkauto.com’
Cc Ye, Yong Kang Melvin; Henry, Irene James; Choo, Thelma

Subject: CMTD1905965/THE - LKK/ GBA2831B & SLW5216Z ACC ON 23.12.19
Attachments: SLW5216Z - GIA.PDF

Our Reference : CMTDI1905965/THE
Your Reference: SLW32167

Without Prejudice
EMAIL ONLY

Date: 26.12.2019

MR Email u_ll'il"r‘EI___":;._"L:‘_u_r!"_!._ln'_i_'_il_l__:_.;

Attention:
AUTOEXCEL ENGINEERING PTE LTD

Dear Sharon,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBA2831B & SLW5216Z ON 23.12.2019
We refer to your emall reply of today.

We will appoint Mr. Kenneth Kong of LKK Auto Consultants to conduct the survey.

Hi LKK Auto,

Please refer to the emall below and make the arrangement to survey for SLW5216Z on a without prejudice basis and
revert with your repart upon completion of survey to my colleague, Ms. Thelma.

Thank You,

Far motor claims sprvey reguest, plesse cmsil 1o o 1 ol S D O




24N2r0a PARFICOE Robate Enguiry
2 ' > Back to OneMotoring
" Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Crverrer |0 Types Sngapare NRIC
Owner |0 BTTL
Vehicle Details
Wehicle Mo SLWa267
Veehicle Lo be Exported: Yee
Intended Derpglatration Date: 24 Dec 2019
Vehicks Make: VOLKSWAGEM
Wehicls Modl: POLOGR 12 TSIATSCIIEZSRLED
Frimary Colour Red
Manutacturing Year: 2017
Engine MNew: CIZDM97 3y
Chassis Mo WWYWIZZZERZHUOS9220
Manimim Power Output: 6.0 KW (88 bihp)
Open Market Value: £17 AD800
Orlginal Registration Date: 31 Jul 2017
First Registration Date: a1 2017
Transfer Count: 1
Actual ARF Paid: £7.608.00
Intended PARF Rebate Detalls
PARF Eligihility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 30 Jul 2027
PARF Rebmate Amount: $5.704.00
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date: 30 Jul 2027
COE Catrgory: E - Open - all except motoroyels
COE Perbsd{Years): 10
QP Paid: $50,101.00
COE Rebate Amount: 53343900
Total Rebate Amount: $39,145.00

The information contained herein is correct is at 24 Doc 2019

OK

hitps:/ivrl lta gov.sgitalvilactionfenquireRetaleByPublicBaforaDersginput PFUNCTION_ID=F0304008T7



Date : 24/09/2019

SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD

Claim Third Party Claim
Veh. No - SLW 5216 Z
Accident on . 23/12/2019 Model - VW POLO
Insured Ins LIBERTY INSURANCE
Qry PARTICULARS AMOUNT _ |[SURVEYOR
Your Insurer Vehicle No ;: GBA 2831 B
1[TAILGATE 780737 7% | 2.485.00 —
1|TAILGATE LOCK 354 oo $ #¢/ 680,00 z—
1| TAILGATE LOCK LOWER SWITCH e |5 44500 | X
1|TAILGATE TRIM BOARD $ /i 84000 x
1|TAILGATE CENTER LOGO WITH HANDLE Pe | § 7800 X
1| TAILGATE POLO EMBLEM § Az, 6800 —
1| TAILGATE A180 EMBLEM §Ac, 6800| —
1|TAILGATE TS| EMBLEM §/;. 6800 —
1|TAILGATE W/SCREEN MOULDING /7 ¢ év x| § 24000 —/
1|TAILGATE WEATHERSTRIP, /4 Y-2¢ i [ 25000 &
1|REAR W/SCREEN P57 77 vt R |S  1,80000 | A—
1|REAR WIPER MOTOR 031 55 $ 72 B4050| ZT—
2TAILLAMPS __ # &d%- 30 ATT g;; o/7fe x| $ 168000 &7
2| TAILLAMPS SIDE CLIPS $§ A+~ a000| X
2|TAILLAMP PANELS $ /U 48000 | »
2|TAIL.LAMP LOWER BRACKETS § '~ 44000] x
2|REAR No.PLATE LAMPS 1IN 46000 | X
1|END PANEL S/ 7-33 . |5 680.00 | =—
1|END PANEL TOP GARNISH $ Jon 38500 X
1|FLOOR PANEL $/Z 78050 A
1|FLOOR PANEL TOP BOARD EE 68800 | x
1|REAR BUMPER rsgzi MBev7em|s 1688500
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINERS e7; D7 |8 48000 | o+ 1)
1|REAR BUMPER SPONGE | % 336.00 ‘L'
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT 755 2 1s 72250
2|REAR BUMPER BRACKETS s/ 48000 K
2|REAR BUMPER SCREWS f3 B0.0D | X
B|REAR BUMPER CLIPS § 4e, 3600 — |
2|REAR BUMPER REFLECTORS (2 /3d. & ey enh|s 560.00 | «*
2|REAR BUMPER SENSORS TAes s 480.00 | Z v~
iset [REAR BUMPER SENSOR CABLE . [5 /50| ¥
2|REAR FENDERS REPAIR
1|REAR EXHAUST Z |s 157800 X
1|REAR EXHAUST MOUNTING fiu | § 22600 X
$ 2092450
Less 10 % § 200245
$ 1883205

Page 1



SINETT PARTS

=2 Z
REAR W/SCREEN SEALANT 7w |5 000 | TeIAe
REAR NO.PLATE WITH FRAME SCAl 22000 7 37a—
TOTAL SINETT 5 360.00
TOTAL PARTS : § 1919205
LABOUR AMOUNT __ |SURVEYOR
Balance bif $§ 1819205
Labour charges, to do cutting, weiding, replace. repair $ 1.200.00 f’%ﬁ(
accidden! damage area
Transfer taiigale parts o another tailgate 3 10000 | de¢
Replace rear w/screen 3 14000 | 2oy
To check rear wiring system, electrical door control, reset  # § 50000 X
diagnose sensors, decoding reprogramme _after repair
To replace malfunction reverse camera & setting 5 20000| 2er
Remove reffix, replace rear car seat, garnish , inm board, S 500.00 0‘;'2'
upholstery etc for accident repair
To replace rear exhaust S4~ 25000| X
To do anh rust -] 150.00 dri'é
To do sealant, seal gap, water proofing on culting, welding
affected area s 28000 | 327
To do spray painting on inner ouler _ accident affected area § 140000 dos7
TOTAL LABOUR : | § 4,720.00
Total Parts & Labour $ 2391205

Page 2




_I LL” LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

il B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Libi Industrinl Park. Singapore 408833
- TEL: 6258 3581 FAX: 8258 4315

Reg. No: 186960T188R GST Reg. No. 18-8607188-R

|| n ke fh Ll L4 ik gt et = e
SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE Ref CRISMO19022673/Kqd3n2

50 RAFFLES PLACE
#05-01/06 Date: 30-01-2020

SINGAPORE LAND TOWERSINGAPORE 048623

Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017

Chassis No. WVYWIZZZERZHUD58220 Colour RED

Odometer 36689 Steering IN ORDER

Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM

R/H Front Tyre |215/45 R16 PIRELLI Bmm
L/H Front Tyre |215/45R16 PIRELLI B mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/45R16 PIRELLI B mm

L/H Rear Tyre |[21545R16 PIRELLI B mm

231122019

Survey held at AUTOEXCEL ENGINEERING PTE LTD
160 SIN MING DRIVE

AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON AWITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS. WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

imata Lays of k

[ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 5




' V V LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Sdm BE B 51 Ubj Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industnat Park, Singapore 408933
TEL @256 3581 FAX: 6258 4315

Reg. Mo 1B8807186R GS5T Reg, Mo 19-9607198-R Page No./1al 3
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLW 5216Z

I___-. | J—I—-..—I——__ -

REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|TAILGATE BENT 2,485.00 1,601.32
1| TAILGATE LOCK DENTED B80.00 356.00
1| TAILGATE LOCK LOWER SWITCH SERVICEABLE 445,00 -
1| TAILGATE TRIM BOARD SERVICEAHLE B40.00 -
1| TAILGATE CENTER LOGO WITH HANDLE SERVICEABLE 78.00 =
1| TAILGATE POLO EMBLEM NECESSARY 68,00 68.00
1| TAILGATE A180 EMBLEM NECESSARY 68.00 68.00
1| TAILGATE TSI EMBLEM NECESSARY 68.00 68.00
1| TAILGATE W/SCREEN MOULDING NECESSARY 240,00 124.00
1| TAILGATE WEATHERSTRIP DISTORTED/ 250,00 188.20
DENTED
1|REAR WISCREEN curt 1,800.00 856.56
1|REAR WIPER MOTOR JAMMED B40.50 632.50
2| TAILLAMPS NIS MTG 1,680.00 486.50
CRACKED /QJS
SERVICEABLE
2| TAILLAMPS SIDE CLIPS NOT NECESSARY 40.00 -
2| TAILLAMP PANELS TO REPAIR SEE 480.00 -
LABOUR
2| TAIL LAMP LOWER BRACKETS SERVICEABLE 440.00 -
2|REAR NO PLATE LAMPS SERVICEABLE 460.00 -
1]END PANEL BUCKLED 680,00 517.3
1|END PANEL TOP GARNISH SERVICEABLE 385,00 =
1|FLOOR PANEL TO REPAIR SEE T80.50 -
LABOUR
1|FLOOR PANEL TOP BOARD SERVICEABLE 6868.00 -
1|REAR BUMPER BUCKLED / 1.685.00 1.063.75
CRACKED
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINERS /S DISTORTED 480.00 240.00
1|REAR BUMPER SPONGE SERVICEABLE 336.00 s
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BENT T22.50 455.00
2|REAR BUMPER BRACKETS TO REPAIR SEE 460,00 -
LABOUR

Report Ref No. CS/SM0O19022673/Kqd3n2



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Litd Ave 1 £01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408333
TEL G256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

REAR BUMPER SCREWS

Reg No 198807198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

SERVICEABLE

2 -
8|REAR BUMPER CLIPS NECESSARY 36.00 36.00
2|REAR BUMPER REFLECTORS OIS CRACKED 560.00 128.00
1|SET REAR BUMPER SENSOR CABLE SERVICEABLE 385.00 .
2|REAR FENDERS (NPA) TO REPAIR SEE -
LABOUR
1|REAR EXHAUST TO REPAIR SEE 1,978.00 -
LABOUR
1|REAR EXHAUST MOUNTING SERVICEABLE 226.00 s
LESS 10% DISCOUNT 2,044 45 -589.22
18,400.05 6,202.84
2|REAR BUMPER SENSORS (SN) SHORTED 480.00 200.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT 48.00
432,00 200.00
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|2T REAR W/SCREEN SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 140.00 40.00
1|SET REAR NO PLATE WITH FRAME (SN) CRACKED 220.00 45.00
360.00 85.00
LABOUR
LABOUR CHARGES, TO DO 1,200.00 600.00
CUTTING,WELDING,REPLACE REPAIR ACCIDENT
DAMAGE AREA.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF
TAILLAMP PANELS FLOOR PANEL.REAR BUMPER
BRACKETS,REAR FENDERS AND REAR EXHAUST.
TRANSFER TAILGATE PARTS TO ANOTHER TAILGATE. 100,00 60.00
REPLACE REAR WISCREEN 140,00 120,00
TO CHECK REAR WIRING SYSTEMELECTRICAL DOOR  [NOT NECESSARY 500.00
CONTROL,RESET DIAGNOSE SENSORS DECODING
REPROGRAMME AFTER REPAIR.
TO REPLACE MALFUNCTION REVERSE CAMERA & 200.00 50.00
SETTING,
REMOVE REFIX,REPLACE REAR CAR 500.00 60.00
SEAT GARNISH.TRIM BOARD,UPHOLSTERY ETC FOR
ACCIDENT REPAIR.
TO REPLACE REAR EXHAUST. NOT NECESSARY 250.00 -

Report Ref No. CS/SMO19022673/Kqd3n2




' 74 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

e r- 51 Ui Ave 1 801-25 Paya Ubl indusinial Park, Singapore 408833
- TEL: 6258 3581 FAX: 6256 4115

Reg No: 199607108R GST Reg. No. 19-0607198-R

TO DO ANTI RUST

TO DO SEALANT SEAL GAP WATER PROOFING ON
CUTTING,WELDING AFFECTED AREA.

TO DO SPRAY PAINTING ON INNER OUTER ACCIDENT 1,400.00| 600.00
AFFECTED AREA.

4720.00 1,580.00
GRAND TOTAL 23,912.05 8.067.94

4%

KONG SENG CHEONG
Licensed Appraiser

CHECLAIMER OF LLARILITY TO THIRD PARTIES - This Bepart ls mads solery for the ues and benslil of the Clest samed oo tha ront page of this Rapar

Bapod in whols or in perl. doss & ol his o0 het own ek,



