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Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

From: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, December 30, 2019 3:38 PM
To: claims@premiumauto.com.sg; SUR
Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SMC 9414 K
Dear Sir,

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SMC9414K (excess $1000/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434 to
arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

*Qur client reserve their right_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: yvonnewong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 85(408933)

From: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, December 30, 2019 10:17 AM

To: claims@premiumauto.com.sg; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SMC 9414 K

Morning All

Still pending for AlG approval.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: yvonnewong@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315



View Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SMC9414K (79786672845G)
oD
Dec 21 2019 11:00AM
[HENET PTE LTD]
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

' Reply ] Reply All i Mark as Unread .Print Message ] Delete Message ] FdMard }

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd. (AIG_SG), sent on 17/03/2020 14:17 PM.
To LKK_HQ
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved ($$9272.00) - SMC9414K - Claim Handler: Azlan, Syazairdina

Approved:9272.00:Re-inspection to be done for damage check and supplementary items / labour,

[DOCUMENTS SUMMARY

There are no documents.




View Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SMC9414K (79786672845G)
(a]3]
Dec 21 2019 12:20PM
[HENET PTE LTD]
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Reply i Reply All I Mark as Unr;:éi] Print Message | D.éle-:te Message [ Forward_f

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (AIG_SG), sent on 30/12/2019 14:52 PM.
To  LKK HQ - e
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved ($$8222.00) - SMC9414K - Claim Handler: Azlan, Syazairdina

[Ap\pm\red:ﬁ'lll 00:Re-inspection to be done for damage check and supplementary items labour..

'DOCUMENTS SUMMARY

There are no documnents.




View Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SMC9414K (79786672845G)
0D
Dec 21 2019 12:20PM
[HENET PTE LTD]
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

. Reply] Reply_Ail [ Mark as-Unread i Print Messageﬂ Delete Message I Forward i

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (AIG_SG), sent on 27/ 12/2019 16:05 PM,
To LKK_HQ

Subject SMC9414K / OD / 21/12/2019 / Coverage & Excess update

Dear LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Please note that policy is in force and excess amount is $1000.00

Thank you
Azlan, Syazairdina

'DOCUMENTS SUMMARY

There are no documents,




Note: This document has not been finalised.

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd {Co.Reg.No:199607198R)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@Ilkkauto.com

To: AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd. From: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
AIG Building 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 079120 Singapore 408933

Atin:  Azlan, Syazairdina Date: 11 Mar 2020

Preliminary Advice

Vehicle No : SMC9414K Accident Date :2112/2019
Make : AUDI Q5 Policy No. :
Assignment Date : 26/12/2019 Excess : 851,000.00
Date of Inspection : 26/12/2019 Est, Duration of Repair 1 5.00
Inspection At : PREMIUM AUTOMOBILES PTE LTD (UBI)

55 UBI ROAD 1

SINGAPORE 408699

Point of Impact / General Description of Damages
The vehicle sustained impact / damages rear lhs portion and parts claimed are consistent to the accident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross) 5% 14,627.00 (Includ supp $2,000.00)
Revised Amount :S$ 9,272.00 (Includ supp $1,050.00)
Check Items (Estimated) :8% 1,742.00

Total :S% 11,014.00

Lump Sum Repair :S$

Total Loss Consideration

New for Old Value 8%
Pre-Accident Value :S$ 178,000.00
COE / PARF Rebate :S% 70,541.00
Salvage Value 8%
Margin for Repair :S$ 107,459.00
Remarks
( X') The vehicle is repairable at our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage. Kindly let us

have your authorisation.

( ) The vehicle is uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised to invite tender for the wreck.

( ) Other comments :



Note: This document has not been finalised.

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregNo:1sss07198R)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

To: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd. From: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
AIG Building 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 079120 Singapore 408933

Attn: Date: 27 Dec 2019

Preliminary Advice

Vehicle No : SMC9414K Accident Date : 21/12/2019
Make : AUDI Q5 Policy No. : 1800085103
Assignment Date : 26/12/2019 Excess : §$0.00
Date of Inspection 1 26/12/2019 Est. Duration of Repair :3.00
Inspection At : PREMIUM AUTOMOBILES PTE LTD (UBI)

55 UBI ROAD 1

SINGAPORE 408699

Point of Impact / General Description of Damages
The vehicle sustained impact / damages rear Ihs portion and parts claimed are consistent to the accident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross) 5% 12,627.00
Revised Amount 5% 8,222.00
Check Items (Estimated) 8% 1,742.00
Total 5% 9,964.00
Lump Sum Repair :S%

Total Loss Consideration

New for Old Value :5%
Pre-Accident Value :S§ 178,000.00
COE / PARF Rebate :S% 70,541.00
Salvage Value :S%
Margin for Repair 8% 107,459.00

Remarks

( X ) The vehicle is repairable at our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage. Kindly let us
have your authorisation.

( ) The vehicle is uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised to invite tender for the wreck.

{ ) Other comments :



MPA119168786 / Premium Automobiles Pt Ltd - UBI
ENTRY DATE & TIME: 23/12/2019 18:57
SUBMITTED BY: Chang Chee Sing

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report correctly the details of the accident ta speed up the claims process.

2. This Form must be completed by the Policyholder and/or the Authorised Driver.

3. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or witholding of material facts may allow insurance companies to
repudiate policy liability.

4. The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies is not an admission of policy liability on the part of the insurance companies.

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

6. This report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA) for
archiving and that copies of this report will, for a fee, be made available upon application by interested parties.

7. By the lodgement of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and to copies of the report being made available
aforesaid.

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report 23/12/2019 18:57
Date Of Accident 21/12/2019 12:20
Exact Location Of Accident 200 PANDAN GARDENS SINGAPORE 609336
Country/State of Loss SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE
Vehicle Registration Number SMC9414K
Insured/Policyholder
Name Of Registered Owner HENET PTE LTD
Co Reg No XXXXXX928M
Email Address IVYLEEO2Z@NAVER.COM
Mobile Phone No (LOCAL) +65-81367590
Alternative Phone No OFFICE-81367590
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer AUDI
Model Q5 SPORT 2.0 TFSI QU

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at

time of accident PRIVATE USE

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy

for repair to your vehicle? VE2

If No, Please state action to be taken

Vehicle Category PRIVATE CAR
Insurance Company

Name of Insurance Company AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
Type Of Coverage COMPREHENSIVE
Fleet Policy NO

Policy Number 1800085103

Cover Note Number

Driver

Name of Driver LEE IN YOUNG
Passport No/FIN GXXXXX62P

Date Of Birth 10/09/1970

Occupation INDOOR

Date Of Driving Pass 11/10/2017

Driving Experience 2 YEARS AND 2 MONTHS
Gender FEMALE

Mobile Number (LOCAL) +65-81367590
Fax Number

Contart Numhbar



29 KEPPEL ROAD VIEW
#33-86

Postcode 098417

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company YES

Address

If No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured
Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own -
Vehicle =

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle -

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident COLLISION - MAJOR/MINOR RD
Weather Conditions CLEAR
Road Surface DRY

Other Information
Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO

Number of vehicles (including own vehicle)

involved in the accident g

Was any body injured in the Accident? NO

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by NO

ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged? YES

| hgvg_ been a;_:»proached by unknownlperson(s) NO

soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Number of Passengers (Including Driver) 5

PRSSERgERT NAME: . HYEJEN PARK

GENDER: : FEMALE

Passenger 2 NAME: . JEAN
GENDER: : FEMALE

Passenger 3 NAME: . JANET LEE
GENDER: : FEMALE

Passenger 4 NAME: : NUREE OH
GENDER: : FEMALE

Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the police? NO
If Yes,Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intended Prosecution given? NO
If Yes,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

WHEN MY CAR WAS ENTERING TO PARKING LOT, THERE WAS ANOTHER ONE CAR IN FRONT OF MY CAR, BECAUSE
ENTRANCE GATE OF PARKING LOT WAS OUT OF ORDER. CAR #1 WAS MOVING REVERSED SUDDENLY SO MY CAR
WAS REVERSED SLOWLY TO FROTECT MY CAR. AT THAT TIME THE OTHER CAR AT BACK OF MY CAR MOVED
FASTELY ON THE ROAD AND HIT MY CAR (LEFT BACK SIDE OF MY CAR).

Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for attachment? YES
Was there any video captured by Car Camera? NO
Was there any audio recorded? NO

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1



Vehicle Make/Model/Colour HONDA
Details Of Properties

Vehicle Category PRIVATE CAR

Name of Driver WONG WAI CHEUNG
NRIC/Passport Number

Contact Number 90125010

Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Name
Nature Of Damage
No. Of Passenger (Including Driver)



Sketch Plan

SKETCH PLAN

IMPORTANT NOTICE

. This Form must be ¢o

Please report correctly the details of the accident 10 speed up the claims process

- Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or withholding of material
facts may allow insurance companies to repudiate policy liability.

. The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies bs not an admission of policy liability on the part of the insurance
companies

. The report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance
Association of Singapore (GIA) for archiving and that copies of this report will for a fee be made available upon application by
interested parties.

. By the lodgment of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre gnd 10 copies of
the report being made available aforesaid.

. Consent under the Personal Data Protection Act (PDPA)
I understand, acknowledge, agree and consent that:

(a) My insurer, my workshop and the General Insurance Association of Singapore ("GIA") may/are permitted to collect, use,
disclose and/or process my personal data/personal information set out in this [form) and any other personal information
provided by me or possessed by my insurer (collectively the “Personal Information®) and disclose and transfer such
Personal information to all insurer(s) who have insured vehicle{s) involved in this accident (all insurer(s) who have insured
vehicle(s) involved in this accident shall be collectively referred 10 as the “Insurers”), the Insurers’ lawyers/law firms, the
Manetary Authority of Singapore and any refevant government agency/authority (such as the police], for the purpase(s)
of

(i) processing, handling and/or dealing with my claims including the settiement of the claims and any necessary
investigations relating to the daims;

(1} investigating the accident and/d} my claims;
{iii) carrying out andfor dealing with my instructions or responding to any enquiries by me;

(iv) administering my claims (including the mailing of correspondence, statements, Invoices, reports or notices 1o me,
which could involve disclosure of certain personal data about me to bring about delivery of the same as well as on the
external cover of envelopes/mail packages); and/ar

(v) complying with applicable law in administering. processing, handiing and/or dealing with my claimm {collectively the
“Purposes”)
{b}  all insurer(s) who have insured vehicle{s) involved in this accident and the Insurers’ lawyers/law firms, may/are permitted
to collect, use, disclose and/or process my Personal Information for one or more of the above Purposes: and

{e)  my Personal information may/ean be disclosed by any of the Insurers and/ot GIA to their third party service providers or
agents{including their lawyers/law firms), which may be sited outside of Singapare, for ene or more of the above Purposes

{d} my Personal Information will also be collected and used 1o compile claims history for the purpose of fraud detection,
Investigation and management in present and all future claims.

{e] the information so collected under (d) above may be shared / disclosed

{i} toall insurers and/or any other third parties that assist in evaluating. investigating, controlling or managing fraud,
regulators, law enfarcement and government agencies as reasonably required for the purposes stated, or

{u] for complying with requirements under any regulations, laws or court orders.

Date & Time: (If driver is not the policyholder|

F:DI-LM:IMQ | Oriver's Signat P __Mre Personnel’s Sgnature
~"Name. \Ats.th

- Widea, SCam 'f"_'?
Cate & Tum.m 33,4 g_q,—.u NRIC/FIN No. "\W 4&'\
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| ABOUT THE COVER

fl Make/Model . AUDI @5 Sport 2.0 TFSI qu
i Engine Capacity/Tonnage : 1,884.00 CC Sum Insured Market VaIua - First Year of Registration : 2018
Driver Restriction I NA Off Peak Car : insuring with COE/PARF ! 'Yes

Person or Classes of Persons Entitled to Drive* :

i MymmanhmePolqhddmuWormmukp«m
Bl This Palicy will i ider or any authorisad driver only if ha/she meets tha spacified age condition.

! Youhlwwplwmwuuandsumdilﬂm::’fmwwmlmperhnmnmuamu ("IIDR‘}HYouamorYwMHbﬁHdnw{nsmorunnam;hunwmeusdﬁmwuswm :

| Age Condition : All Age Condition

§ Limitation as to use”

8 Usa only for social, ic and p T and for the Policyholder's business -
TthdwdunlmtmruuforMurm Mwhoiumnndrhhglestmk\g.mm mi&obllynhlwspeoﬁ-lem.MMaoaufgoodaom«'thmmplummwmmmym«
business or uss for any purpose in connection with Molor Treda.

Loss of Use 1800cc - 2000cc Optional
‘mmmmmwsmnadhmvmm;rrmmmumaw compmuum}m{Cap 189) and Saction 96 of the Road Transport Act, 1987 (Malaysle), arg not 1o be -

1 Bection1
Fire - $0 Own Damage - smoomu $0 Flood Cover - SIJ

Section 2
Property Damage - $0

Windscreen : $100

Named Driver and EXCe58 (whers appcable)

N e MR Gt Bt i 2 Y F T o A S

{ APPROVED REPORTING CENTRESIAUTHORISED REPAIRERS (F OR Ol AIMS RELATED REPAIRS)

1MCUHOWSOMOBOQMH MEWR@N‘!QI‘IIWW’W
For other Approved Reporting C JAIG Authorised 5, pleasa contact our 24-hour accident emergency hofiine at +65 6338 6200. Altematively, you may refet to AIG websie mxiuuomsg

"= or AIG 5G Mobtia App. Sﬁmmmdmnm'AlGSG'mrrm«wM

R R S T T 0




> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type: Company

Owner ID; 928M

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: SMC9414K

Vehicle to be Exported:; No

Intended Deregistration Date: 26 Dec 2019

Vehicle Make: AUDI

Vehicle Model: Q5 SPORT 2.0 TFSI QU S TRONIC
Primary Colour: Silver “ .
Manufacturing Year: 2018

Engine No.: DAX033244

Chassis No.: WAUZZZFYXJ2141806
Maximum Power Qutput: 185.0kW (248 bhp)

Open Market Value: $45,185.00

Original Registration Date: 27 Jul 2018

First Registration Date: 27 Jul 2018

Transfer Count: 0

Actual ARF Paid: $55,259.00

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: Yes

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 26 Jul 2028

PARF Rebate Amount: $41,444.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 26 Jul 2028

COE Category: B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW (130bhp)
COE Period(Years):; 10

QP Paid: $33,900.00

COE Rebate Amount: $29,097.00

Total Rebate Amount: $70,541.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 26 Dec 2019

OK






I
Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 63662323 Fax:68411183
Email: Nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg / claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Telefax

Estimate i Accident Repairs
Workshop : UbiRoadl

Contact No i 63662323

Fax No : 68411183

Reference :  PA/OD/1513/2019/NS
Date i 26-Dec-19

Vehicle NOT IN workshop. Please arrange for survey

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
78 Shenton Way

#07-16 AIG Building
Singapore 079120

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept
Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315

Owner's Name
Address

Telephone
Type of Claim
Policy No.

Vehicle No

Model Code
Model / Year
Engine No
Chassis No
Mileage

Date In
Estimated By
Accident Date
Place of Accident

Henet Pte Ltd

1 Maritime Square
#09-19

Singapore 099253
HP +65 81367590
Own Damage Claim
1800085103

SMC 9414 K

Audi Q5 SPORT 2.0 TFSI QU
27-07-18

DAX 033244
WAUZZZFYX]2141806

Johnny Boo / Allan Wu
21-Dec-19
200 Pandan Gardens Singapore 609336

WIP : 24058



J
Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax:68411183

Telefax

Estimated Labour Charges for Accident Vehicle SMC 9414 K

Estimated Surveyor's
S/n Nature of Jobs Charges Recommendations

To remove and transfer rear parking aid and rear ,
1 lid kick sensor. Check function and renew S/IN S 360.00 / ﬁ‘(-%(j—(j‘@
accroding to damage.

Ve
To dismantle and renew rear bumper. Re- #500’00
2 organise crash management components. $ 1,200.00 § 79
Reinstall all parts removed. e S92
] -~ ., 1
_ . _ -00
3 To respray rear bumper, rear bumger lovger / s 2,700.00 | 5 g f}r)(:‘;’c
spoiler and both rear wheel arch trims. (¢o y 7
00
4 To carry out diagnostic checks. S/N S 192.00 .~ iﬁfl G2-0(

TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES : $ 4,452.00




el

{
Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 68411183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SMC 9414 K

Damaged Parts & Prices

S/N  Parts Description S/Nett Remarks
1 reAarBuMmpPer  JII $ 1,571.00 $125¢- 50
2 REARBUMPERCOVER ~ [I{ s 1,077.00 #?{6!-(;0
3 REARBUMPERSPOILER .~ /][ $ 754.00 %60213’6
4 REARBUMPER TOWING EYE COVER-LH ~ (/¥ $ 43.00 #54—(50
5  REAR BUMPER TOWING EYE COVER-RH y K/M $ 26.00
6  REAR BUMPER CLOSING ELEMENT-LH 7 X NN $ 86.00
7 REARBUMPERTRIM-LH | XNN s 213.00
8  TAILLIGHT-LH [ $ 627.00 $s01-60
9  BOOTLID CONTROLUNIT - XNN $ ° 387.00
10  REAR BUMPER CARRIER X IRl $ 831.00
11  REAR BUMPER HOLDING STRAP q X NN $ 151.00
12 REAR BUMPER GUIDE SECTION - LH / RH T swort 2/ ¢ 152.00 .\{_!gQ--B’C
13 REAR BUMPER FOAM FILLER PIECE-LH Y e $ 56.00
14 REAR PARKING AID SENSOR e o\ 2/ S 462.00
15  REARPARKING AID SEALRING sl y nn 4 S 12.00
16  REAR BUMPER WIRING SET “J x NN S 453.00
17 REARWHEELCOVER-LH/RH /i - J o7400  ¥719-20
18  SUNDRIES % nec S 300.00 $’é§‘q7«
TOTAL SPARE PARTS : $ 8,175.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES : $ 4,452.00
GRAND TOTAL : $ 12,627.00

All charges are not inclusive of GST.
Legend : Remarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks (X) = Not approved
Spare parts are Special Nett.

13
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Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183

Telefax

Name

Surveyed Date
Authorised Date
Excess Cost
Liability
Remarks

Please Note

Yours faithfully,

211214, 11 Wa,

s (LK) Ol _of A, (toed)
EA(Pff — 7

- 3y
Yy ﬂj

This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle.
Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Norah Khai at

Tel:6768 9828 for appointment.

LKK Auto Consultants hence notify
the Repairer of the following:

» To resurvey before/after spray painting

» To display damaged part(s) during resurvey
® Parts prices are subject td confirmation

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd « Third pary survey is on a ‘Without Prejudice” basis

Johnny Boo

Body Repair Manager

® No illegal modification(s) is allowed
@ Suppigmen!aw item{s) must be resurveyed and
is subject to final approval from Insurance Company

Acknowledged by Repairer
Signature:
Date:

Allan Wu
Claims Consultant




Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd
55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408599

Tel:(65) 6366 2323 Fax: (65) 68411183

Supplementary Estimate 1
GST Reg Mo. 18-9902271-w

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd Estimate No. PA/OD/1513/2019/NS

78 Shenton Way Date 30-Jan-20

#07-16 AIC Building Service Advisor Glory Tan

Singapore 072120 Pages lofl

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept Regn No SMC 9414 K

Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315 Model No Audi Q5 SPORT 2.0 TFSI QU

' Quantity - Description _ Unit Price  Amount |
Labours ; ‘
Labours 6-00

1 To repair end panelling. 1 ﬁf"/ s goo.oo S97 - EF‘EC

2 Torespray end panelling. 1, ;ﬁ > 120000 ¢¢y %550--00

AN ] Jf-']j

TOTAL S 2,000.00

For Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

ot
q /J/jo Authorised Signature




Premium Automobiles

55 Uhi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 68411183

Telefax

Estimate
Workshop
Contact No
Fax No
Reference
Date

Vehicle NOT IN workshop. Please arrange for survey

AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

78 Shenton Way
#07-16 AIG Building
Singapore 079120

Accident Repairs

Ubi Road 1

6366 2323

6841 1183
PA/OD/1513/2019/NS
26-Dec-19

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept

Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315

Owner's Name
Address

Telephone
Type of Claim
Policy No.
Vehicle No

Model Code
Model / Year
Engine No
Chassis No
Mileage

Date In

Estimated By
Accident Date
Place of Accident

Henet Pte Ltd

1 Maritime Square
#09-19

Singapore 099253
HP +65 81367590
Own Damage Claim
1800085103

SMC 9414 K

Audi Q5 SPORT 2.0 TFSI QU

27/07/2018
DAX 033244

WAUZZZFYXJ2141808

Johnny Boo / Allan Wu

21-Dec-19

200 Pandan Gardens Singapore 609336

WIP : 24058

3 days - ok - jb - 10 Sep 20



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax

Estimated Labour Charges for Accident Vehicle SMC 9414 K

Estimated Surveyor's
Sin Nature of Jobs Charges Yecommendations

To remove and transfer rear parking aid and rear
1 lid kick sensor. Check function and renew SIN § 360.00 $ 360.00
accroding to damage.

To dismantle and renew rear bumper. Re-organise

2 crash management components. Reinstall all parts $ 1,200.00 $ 500.00
removed.
To respray rear bumper, rear bumper lower spoiler
. and both rear wheel arch trims. $ 240000 $ 1650.00
3a Added labour charges - see attached $ 2,000.00 $ 1,050.00
4 To carry out diagnostic checks. SIN $ 192.00 $ 192.00

TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES : $  6,452.00 $ 3,752.00




Premium Automobiles
55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SMC 9414 K

Damaged Parts & Prices

S/N  Parts Description S/Nett Remarks
1 REAR BUMPER $ 1,671.00 $ 1,256.80
Z REAR BUMPER COVER $ 1,077.00 $ 861.60
3 REAR BUMPER SPOILER $ 754.00 $ 602.80
4 REAR BUMPER TOWING EYE COVER - LH $ 43.00 $ 34.00
5 REAR BUMPER TOWING EYE COVER - RH $ 26.00
6 REAR BUMPER CLOSING ELEMENT - LH $ 86.00
7 REAR BUMPER TRIM - LH $ 213.00
8 TAIL LIGHT - LH $ 627.00 $ 501.60
9 BOOT LID CONTROL UNIT $ 387.00
10 REAR BUMPER CARRIER 3 831.00
11 REAR BUMPER HOLDING STRAP $ 151.00
12 REAR BUMPER GUIDE SECTION - LH /RH $ 152.00
13 REAR BUMPER FOAM FILLER PIECE - LH 3 56.00
14 REAR PARKING AID SENSOR $ 462.00 $ 184.80
15 REAR PARKING AID SEAL RING $ 12.00
16 REAR BUMPER WIRING SET $ 453.00
1z REAR WHEEL COVER - LH/RH $ 974.00 $ 779.20
18 SUNDRIES $ 300.00 $ 63.92
TOTAL SPARE PARTS $ 8,1 75.00 $ 4,284.72
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES $ 6,452.00 $ 3,752.00
GRAND TOTAL $ 14,627.00 $ 8,036.72

All charges are not inclusive of GST.
Legend : Remarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks (X) = Not approved
Spare parts are Spegcial Nett.




Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : (65) 6366 2323 Fax: (65) 6841 1183

Supplementary Estimate 1
GST Reg No. 19-9902271-W

'AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd Estimate No. 'PA/OD/1513/2019/NS |
78 Shenton Way Date 130-Jan-20 :
#07-16 AIG Building Service Advisor Glory Tan
Singapore 079120 Pages 10f1
|Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept | Regn No SMC 9414 K
‘Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315 |Model No Audi Q5 SPORT 2.0 TFSI QU
' i
 Quantity Description ~ Unit Price  Amount
| i
' Labours I !
1 To repair end panelling. S 800.00 | $ 500.00
2 To respray end panelling. $ 1,200.00 I S 550.00 |
|
|
| |
! !
| | TOTAL § 2,000.00 $1,050.00

For Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Authorised Signature



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel . 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax

Name

Surveyed Date
Authorised Date
Excess Cost
Liability
Remarks

Please Note : This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle.
Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Norah Khai at
Tel:6768 9828 for appointment.

Yours faithfully,

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Johnny Boo Allan Wu
Body Repair Manager Claims Consultant



