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RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] First Reminder - Peg Ref : VSR19 - 34937 ; LONPAC Ref:
19/19/20/VC05/022812 ; Accident involving SLR4564B (GRAB) and GBF1405D
(LONPAC) on 23/12/2019 [External General]

ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>
Tue 7/21/2020 2:50 PM
To:  Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Cc:  MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Lonpac External - General
Dear Asher
 
Please proceed with your recommendation.
 
 
Regards,
Ong Li Li
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.
 
Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.
 
From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com] 
Sent: Tuesday, 21 July 2020 2:15 PM
To: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>
Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] Re: First Reminder - Peg Ref : VSR19 - 34937 ; LONPAC Ref:
19/19/20/VC05/022812 ; Accident involving SLR4564B (GRAB) and GBF1405D (LONPAC) on 23/12/2019
[External General]
 
Dear Sirs,
 
We refer to the above matter.
 
We have highlighted to your good office on 30/12/2019 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.
 
The accident occurred when our insured rear ended third party vehicle.
 
Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 100%
liability.
 
Summary to offer to repairer PEGASUS ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD is as follows: -
 

 Claimed Amount Revised Amount
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 3,389.76 $ 472.94
2. Loss of Rental (2days x $66.95) $    133.90 $ 133.90 (2days x $66.95)

https://www.lonpac.com.sg/
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3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $        7.45 $     7.45
Total $ 614.29

 
**2 days recommendation for repair.
 
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.
 
The above is for your approval please.
 
 
Thank You.
 
Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim
related documents will be in so�copy. Any inconvenience caused is much regre�ed.
 
 

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>
Sent: Thursday, July 9, 2020 1:31 PM
To: Johnson Chua <johnsonchua@pegasusengrg.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong
(LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng
(LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Xian Chern Chin <xianchern.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>; Alexx Kuah
<alexx.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>; Pauline Ngu <pauline.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>; Diane Wang
<diane.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>
Subject: RE: First Reminder - Peg Ref : VSR19 - 34937 ; LONPAC Ref: 19/19/20/VC05/022812 ; Accident
involving SLR4564B (GRAB) and GBF1405D (LONPAC) on 23/12/2019 [External General]
 
Lonpac External - General
Dear LKK
 
Please respond to workshop.
 
 
Regards,
Ong Li Li
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.
 
Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.
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From: Johnson Chua [mailto:johnsonchua@pegasusengrg.com.sg] 
Sent: Thursday, 9 July 2020 1:19 PM
To: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng
(LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Xian Chern Chin <xianchern.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>; Alexx Kuah
<alexx.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>; Pauline Ngu <pauline.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>; Diane Wang
<diane.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: First Reminder - Peg Ref : VSR19 - 34937 ; LONPAC Ref: 19/19/20/VC05/022812 ; Accident
involving SLR4564B (GRAB) and GBF1405D (LONPAC) on 23/12/2019 [External General]
 
Hi Li Li,
 
We have sent reminders to LKK, but no response yet.

Regards,
Johnson Chua
Senior Claims Manager
Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd

Tel : 6513 7748  I  Fax : 6251 3161   
Add : 74 Kian Teck Road Singapore 628800 

Make Life a Beautiful Ride
 
 
On Thu, Jul 9, 2020 at 1:11 PM ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com> wrote:

Lonpac External - General
Without Prejudice
 
Dear Johnson
 
Did you follow up with them?

Dear Asher
 
FYA
 
 
Regards,
Ong Li Li
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or
corrupt practices.
 
Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.
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From: Johnson Chua [mailto:johnsonchua@pegasusengrg.com.sg] 
Sent: Thursday, 9 July 2020 12:53 PM
To: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng
(LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Xian Chern Chin <xianchern.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>; Alexx Kuah
<alexx.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>; Pauline Ngu <pauline.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>; Diane Wang
<diane.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: First Reminder - Peg Ref : VSR19 - 34937 ; LONPAC Ref: 19/19/20/VC05/022812 ; Accident
involving SLR4564B (GRAB) and GBF1405D (LONPAC) on 23/12/2019 [External General]
 
Dear Li Li,
 
We have not received any response from your appointed surveyors since April 2020.
 
We hereby give your good office a FIVE (5) days' notice to resolve this matter.  Failing
which, our clients will engage their solicitors to take over the conduct of this matter without
further reference to you.
 
Thank you.

Regards,
Johnson Chua
Senior Claims Manager
Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd

Tel : 6513 7748  I  Fax : 6251 3161   
Add : 74 Kian Teck Road Singapore 628800 

Make Life a Beautiful Ride

On Thu, Jul 9, 2020 at 12:33 PM ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com> wrote:

Lonpac External - General
 
Without Prejudice
 
Dear Johnson
 
Please liaise with LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd.
 
Dear Mei Kwan/Asher
 
fya
 
Regards,
Ong Li Li
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or
corrupt practices.
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Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.
 
From: Johnson Chua [mailto:johnsonchua@pegasusengrg.com.sg] 
Sent: Thursday, 9 July 2020 11:49 AM
To: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@lonpac.com>; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>
Cc: Xian Chern Chin <xianchern.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>; Alexx Kuah
<alexx.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>; Pauline Ngu <pauline.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>; Diane Wang
<diane.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>
Subject: First Reminder - Peg Ref : VSR19 - 34937 ; LONPAC Ref: 19/19/20/VC05/022812 ; Accident
involving SLR4564B (GRAB) and GBF1405D (LONPAC) on 23/12/2019
 
URGENT
 
Hi Kenny,
 
We have not received any response from your appointed surveyors since April 2020.
 
Please look into the matter and resolve our clients' property damage claim as soon as possible.

Regards,
Johnson Chua
Senior Claims Manager
Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd

Tel : 6513 7748  I  Fax : 6251 3161   
Add : 74 Kian Teck Road Singapore 628800 

Make Life a Beautiful Ride
 
 
On Thu, Jul 9, 2020 at 11:27 AM Xian Chern Chin <xianchern.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>
wrote:

Without Prejudice
 
Dear Claims Officers,
 
We refer to the above matter.
 
We have not received any of your offers yet. 
 
As such, please let us have an offer settlement within the next 5 (FIVE) days from the
date hereof. 

 
Thank you.
 
Regards,
Xian Chern
Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd

Tel : 6513 7748  I  Fax : 6251 3161   
Add : 74 Kian Teck Road Singapore 628800 

Make Life a Beautiful Ride
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On Thu, Jul 9, 2020 at 10:12 AM Alexx Kuah <alexx.pegasusengrg@gmail.com> wrote:

 
Regards,
Alexx Kuah
Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd

Tel : 6513 7748  I  Fax : 6251 3161   
Add : 74 Kian Teck Road Singapore 628800 

Make Life a Beautiful Ride
 

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Date: Tue, 7 Apr 2020 at 12:31
Subject: Re: LOD - Peg Ref: VSR19-34937 ; LONPAC Ref: TBA ; Accident involving
SLR4564B (GRAB) and GBF1405D (LONPAC) on 23/12/2019
To: Pauline Ngu <pauline.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>, Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>,
Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Johnson Chua <johnsonchua@pegasusengrg.com.sg>, Alexx Kuah
<alexx.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>, Diane Wang <diane.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>
 

‘WITHOUT	PREJUDICE’
 
		SAVE	AS	TO	COSTS
 
Hi Pauline,
 
Thank you for the email.
 
We will seek approval from our principal and revert to you once our principal approved.
 
Thank You.
 
Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Pauline Ngu <pauline.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, April 6, 2020 4:29 PM
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D
(LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Johnson Chua <johnsonchua@pegasusengrg.com.sg>; Alexx Kuah
<alexx.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>; Diane Wang <diane.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>
Subject: LOD - Peg Ref: VSR19-34937 ; LONPAC Ref: TBA ; Accident involving SLR4564B (GRAB) and
GBF1405D (LONPAC) on 23/12/2019
 

mailto:alexx.pegasusengrg@gmail.com
mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com
mailto:pauline.pegasusengrg@gmail.com
mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com
mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com
mailto:johnsonchua@pegasusengrg.com.sg
mailto:alexx.pegasusengrg@gmail.com
mailto:diane.pegasusengrg@gmail.com
mailto:olivialau@lkkauto.com
mailto:pauline.pegasusengrg@gmail.com
mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com
mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com
mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com
mailto:johnsonchua@pegasusengrg.com.sg
mailto:alexx.pegasusengrg@gmail.com
mailto:diane.pegasusengrg@gmail.com


7/22/2020 Mail - Asher Sng (LKKAuto) - Outlook

https://outlook.office365.com/mail/search/id/AAQkAGVlNDlkMTdjLTM3MDgtNDY5ZC1hZTdkLWQ3ZDMyNTE0MGFhMgAQAOvwwRwRykW0oGf… 7/7

Without Prejudice
 
Dear Sir / Madam,
 
Refer to above accident. 
 
It appears that the accident was caused by your insured. We enclose the
documents to substantiate our client's property damaged claim as our client had
authorized us to quatify, to act and to reach settlement within 6 weeks on
their behalf.
 
Please inform us the officer in charge as well.
 
Kindly let me know if you need any hard copy for the LOD, if not we will be
sending by email only. Kindly advise.
 
 
 
Thank you!
 
Have a great day ahead!
Regards,
Pauline Ngu
Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd

Tel : 6513 7748  I  Fax : 6251 3161   
Add : 74 Kian Teck Road Singapore 628800 

Make Life a Beautiful Ride
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