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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 26 December 2019 12:15 PM

To: Claims; SUR

Cc: (nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg); (boojohnny@gmail.com)
Subject: RE: OD CLAIMS FOR SCW 9208 C -DOA: 19/12/2019

Dear TRoy,

As instructed by our client , please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SCW 9208C (Excess S800/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel:
6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company
before completion of the repair.

*Qur client reserve their rights not te pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.
NOTE: Re-inspection require in repaired panel.

AIG OIC- Nadaraja, Deeban| Deebanalnadaraja.Nadaraja@aig.com

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Fhone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 24 December 2019 2:01 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: 'Claims’ <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: OD CLAIMS FOR SCW 9208 C

Dear all,

Survey was just carrier up by surveyor this morning, herein attached the estimate repair with marking
for your next action,

Kindly assist and advise the mentioned claims for approval and who is the case handler for this.
Thanks
Best Regards,

TRoy Goh
Claims Advisor



Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd tregne ooz

55 Lbi Road 1 Road Singapore 408693

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 768 9828 f. +65 6841 1183

. claims@ premiumauto.com.sg  W. www.audi.Com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 15

“It comes i

9938 p. +65 6836 2223

Ty oF

slue.” =

Tha new Audi A7 Sportback. Do you really need a reason?
¥

s
Find ouE more

Ernail Disclaimer
This emall, incleding any attachment, i confidential and may 3150 be privileges

fyau have recanad it Inarrof, please notify us immediately by regly amall and then o2 ghe this message rgm yo

From: Claims [mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sa]
Sent: Monday, 23 December 2019 4:52 PM

To: 'SUR'; 'assignments'

Cc: 'Claims'

Subject: RE: OD CLAIMS FOR SCW 9208 C

Dear all,
Attached Is the estimate for your reference.

Best Regards,
Syafig
Claims Admin Assistant

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd {Reg No 199902271W)
55 bl Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9911 f. +65 6841 1183
e, claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.5g
audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223

WELCOME TO THE
8TH DIMENSION.

THE ALL-NEW AUDI Q8.

Ermail Disclaimer
This email, incleding any attachment, i

fyau have recaivad it in arros

Please do not copy it or usa it for any purpose, or disclos



From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 20 December 2019 1:58 PM

To: 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>; 'assignments’ <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: OD CLAIMS FOR SCW 9208 C

Dear All,

Please assist to register own policy claims for the above mentioned vehicle.

Attached is the GIA report, DL, Insurance certificate, undertaking and interview form for your reference.
Kindly arrange the survey on 24 of Dec@10am, owner waiting.

Address : 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938

Thank you.

Best Regards,
George Wong
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)
281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938

p. +65 6366 2323, option 1

e. Claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg
Audi Showroom 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 68362223

WELCOME TO THE
8TH DIMENSION.

THE ALL-NEW AUDI Q8.

Emall Disclaimer

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be pr ileged

If you have received it in arror, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system
Plaass do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you
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From ALG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd. (AIG_SG), sent on 26/12/2019 11:38 AM.

To LKK_HQ
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved {5%2316.00) - SCWI208C - Claim Handler: Madaraja, Deeban

-lpprl:wed:231.é.ﬂ-ﬂ:re-inspev.:.tlon require in rebal.rad panel.
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Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 40B699
Tel: 63662323 Fax:BB41 1183 WIP: 23927

Email: Nora_khai@premiumauto.com.sg / claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Telefax

Estimate :  Accident Repairs
Woaorkshop *  UbiRoad1

Contact No : 6366 2323

Fax No : 68411183

Reference : PA/OD/1506/2019/NS
Date : 23-Dec-19

Vehicle NOT IN workshop. Please arrange for survey

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
78 Shenton Way

#07-16 AIG Building

Singapore 079120

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept
Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315

Owner's Name :  MsAnita Boentoro
Address : 9 MNewton Road

#12-07

Singapore 307997
Telephone :  HP+6598623193
Type of Claim :  Own Damage Claim
Policy No. :  2100408855-04
Vehicle No : SCW 9208 C
Model Code : AudiAGCT 2.0 TFSI MU 4G
Model / Year i Apr-15
Engine No : (DN 41705
Chassis No I WAUZZZAGOEN201672
Mileage =
Date In B
Estimated By :  Johnny Boo / Allan Wu
Accident Date s 19-Dec-19

Place of Accident * 9 Mewton Road Car Park B1



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore A0B6SS
Tel: 63662323 Fax:68411183

Telefax

Estimated Labour Charges for Accident Vehicle SCW 9208 C

Estimated Surveyor's
S/MN Nature of Jobs Charges Recommendations
To dismantleand renew Lhs sill panel trim. To
, repair lhs sill panel. Re-organlge crash ¢ 1,600.00
management components. Reinstall all parts
removed.
2 Torespray Lhs sill panel trim and lhs sill panel. $ 2,000.00 <
3 To carry out disgnostic check. S/N § 192.00 .

SUB TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES

$ 3,792.00




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 63662323 Fax:6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Rean No, SCW 9208 C

Damage Parts & Prices
5/N Parts Description S/NETT REMARES
1 SIDEMEMBER - LH 5 783.00
2 CLIP ATTACHMENT PARTS 4 s 96.00
3 ADHESIVE TAPE ATTACHMENT PARTS 5 15.00
a stonechr 7= X MM SIN 180.00
5 SUNDRIES IV 5 300.00 | vl
TOTAL SPARE PARTS $ 1,374.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES $ 3,792.00 5‘{0{].




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699

Tel: 63662323 Fax:6B41 1183
*3.30\ \}b\"\

Telefax 0y f12/14 9.1 e
1] Il i fehd

Name : 'F? It (L k) 'II | 7

Surveyed Date : L

Authorised Date : 71

Excess Cost s o L

Liability : [« e §) }

Remarks - '

Please Note : This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle.
Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Norah Khai at
Tel:6768 9828 for appointment.

LKK Auto Consultants hence notify
the Repairer of the Tollowmg
-Turemwewhe‘ refatter spray painting
« To display d & oA FAD TESUREY
Yours faithfully, o Parts prices are <. . :
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd = Yo paey

® Mo illaga

» Supplementary Hem s

I8 subject to final approval fro

Achnowiedged by Reparer
Signadure:
Date:

Johnny Boo Allan Wu
Body Repair Manager Claims Consultant




" Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAUtD)

Sent: Thursday, 13 February 2020 10:36 AM
To: glory.tan@premiumauto.com.sg; SUR
Cc: allan.wu@premiumauto.com.sg; 'Claims’
Subject: RE: Supplermentary item for SCW 9208 C
Attachments: IMG.pdf

Dear Glory,

Refer marking.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-2561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: glory.tan@premiumauto.com.sg <glory.tan@premiumauto.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 13 February 2020 10:16 AM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: allan.wu@premiumauto.com.sg; 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>
Subject: Supplementary item for SCW 9208 C

Hi all,
Please refer to the attached for supplementary item for SCW 9208 C.
The stone guard film is a necessary item whenever the sill panel trim is renewed.

Herby attached with the sample of the stone guard film looks like.

Please revise the supplementary list in the attached and get back to us.

Thank you.

Best Regard,

Glory Tan
Bodyworks Department

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd jreg s wssnzzrwg
55 Ubi Road 1 Read Singapore 408695
p. +65 6388 2323 . +65 6841 1183

e. glory.tan@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: glory.tan@premiumauto.com.sg

Sent: Thursday, 13 February 2020 10:16 AM

To: SUR

Cc: allan.wu@premiumauto.com.sg; 'Claims’

Subject: Supplementary item for SCW 9208 C

Attachments: 13022020101034-0001.pdf; WhatsApp Image 2020-02-13 at 9.42.11 AM jpeg
Hi all,

Please refer to the attached for supplementary item for SCW 9208 C.

The stone guard film is a necessary item whenever the sill panel trim is renewed.

Herby attached with the sample of the stone guard film looks like.

Please revise the supplementary list in the attached and get back to us.

Thank you.

Best Regard,

Glory Tan
Bodyworks Department

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd jsegno 1omoaiiw)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408653

p. +65 6388 2323 f. +65 6841 1183

e, glony tan@premivmauto,com.sg  w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 158938 p. +65 6836 2223




Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

L5 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408695
Tel: (65) 6366 2323 Fax:(65) 6841 1183

Supplementary Estimate 1
GS5T Reg No, 19-8902271-W

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd Estimate No. PA/OD/1506/2019/NS
78 Shenton Way Date 13-Feb-20
#07-16 AIC Building Service Advisor Glory Tan
Singapore 079120 Pages lofl
Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept Regn No SCW 208 C
Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315 Model No Audi AB C7 2.0 TFSI MU 4G

Quantity Description Unit Price  Amount

Parts
1 Stone guard filmLHs ~ ~ HC $ 11200 =
............................ TOTAL  §  112.00
For Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd
St 13)2[30

Authorised Signature



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183 WIP : 23927
Email: Nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg / claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Telefax

Estimate ’ Accident Repairs
Workshop :  UbiRoad 1

Contact No :  B366 2323

Fax No : 68411183
Reference : PA/ODMS06/2018/NS
Date i 23-Dec-18

Vehicle NOT IN workshop. Please arrange for survey

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
78 Shenton Way

#07-16 AlIG Building

Singapore 079120

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept
Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315

Owner's Name :  Ms Anita Boentoro
Address : 9 Newton Road

#12-07

Singapore 307887
Telephone :  HP+65 58623193
Type of Claim ¢ Own Damage Claim
Policy No. i 2100408855-04
Vehicle No : SCW 9208 C
Model Code : Audi AE C7 2.0 TFSI MU 4G
Model / Year : Apr-15
Engine No : CDN 41705
Chassis No r WAUZZZ4GOEN201672
Mileage g
Date In L -
Estimated By :  Johnny Boo / Allan Wu
Accident Date : 19-Dec-19

Place of Accident . 8 Newton Road Car Park B1



Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408693
Tel : {B5) 6366 2323 Fax . (65) 6841 1183

Supplementary Estimate 1
GST Reg No. 19-8902271-W

AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd Estimate No. PA/OD/1506/2019/NS
78 Shenton Way Date 13-Feb-20
#07-16 AlG Building Service Advisor Glory Tan
Singapore 079120 Pages 10f 1
Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept Regn No SCwW g208 C
Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315 Model No Audi A8 CT 2.0 TFSI MU 4G
Quantity Description Unit Price Amount
Parts
1 Stone guard film LHS 5 11200 S 89.20
TOTAL D 11200 | 589.20

For Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Authorised Signature



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 68411183

Telefax

Name

Surveyed Date
Authorised Date
Excess Cost
Liability
Remarks

Please Note : This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle
Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Norah Khai at
Tel:6768 9828 for appointment.

Yours faithfully,
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Johnny Boo Allan Wu
Body Repair Manager Claims Consultant



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 5 March 2020 11:15 AM

To: jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg; Steve Chen (LKK Auto); SUR; Admin A; C5 A Team
Ce: 'Boo seng yak'; 'Carrine Leong'; 'Chang Chee Sing'

Subject: RE: FINAL REVISION - SCW9208C - OD AIG - SURVEYED 24 DEC 19

Dear Jia Yee,
Confirm repair cost of $2064.16 before excess $800 and GST (@ 3 days.

Kindly send us invoice and discharge voucher for us to close file.

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg <jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 4 March 2020 2:19 PM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com=; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>;
CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Adrian Ling (LKKAuto) <adrianling@lkkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
<veronchen@lkkauto.com=

Cc: 'Boo seng yak' <boojohnny@gmail.com>; 'Carrine Leong' <carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg=; "Chang Chee
Sing' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: FINAL REVISION - SCW9208C - OD AIG - SURVEYED 24 DEC 19

Hi Steve and all,

Revised estimate is attached.

Please confirm repair cost of $2064.16 @ 3 days.
Your early closure is well appreciated.

Thanks & Best Regard

liaYee Yap
Claims Administrator

Premium Automaobiles Pte Ltd jreg nn 1sss0z27190
55 Ubl Road 1 Road Singapure 40EEe99
p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9925 f. +65 6841 1183

e. fayee yap@premiumauto.com.sg  w. www.audi.com.sg
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. 465 6836 2223



