
Our Ref:  CC4/EQI19022536/R1gb3 
 
30 DECEMBER 2019 
 
SUNYU PRODUCT & SERVICES PTE LTD 
67 TAMPINES INDUSTRIAL AVE 5 
T5@TAMPINES  
SINGAPORE 528643 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SDM 6336B AND SMC 9191C ON 19/12/2019 
 
We refer to the above accident. We are the Appointed Surveyor and Loss Adjuster 
Company by your Motor Insurer (EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED) to resolve 
the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy 
taken up with them. 
 
This is to inform you that we received a Third Party Claim from SMC 9191C. 
  
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will 
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party. 
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and 
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter. 
 
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. 
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this 
claim and your NCD will be protected. 
 
Please call us if you have further queries. (NO ACTION IS REQUIRED) 
 
Yours faithfully, 

 
CECILIA CHONG 
Case Handler 
DID:  6749 4274 
FAX: 6741 4108 
EMAIL: ceciliachong@lkkauto.com 
 
c.c. EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED 
            (Motor Claims Dept) 
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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Loi Ai Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 26 May 2020 3:28 PM
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Cc: Jaime Tay; Jojo Cheng; Songcuan JR Lauro Araos; Andre Chow En De
Subject: RE: EQ Ref: DM19HO03328/JT, C&C Ref: SMC9191C, claim TP EQ SDM6336B, DOA: 

19/12/2019

Dear Cecilia, 
  
Offer accepted for amicable settlement. 
  
COR                       $ 11,684.40 
LOR                        $   1,712.00 ($107/day x 16 days) 
Medical fee        $        14.55 
GIA Search Fee $          2.00 
                           ----------------- 
Total                      $ 13,412.95 
                           ----------------- 
  
Kindly issue DV through email. 
  
Thanks. 
  
  
 ᏑᏒᏓᏔᏕᏖ In view of the current COVID-19 situation, there will be certain operation disruption from 7 April 2020 until 
further notice. Please bear with us should there be some service delay during this period.  
  
*** Work from Home *** 
  
  
Best Regards, 
  
Loi Ai Ting 
Senior Officer - Admin 
  

 
  
Cycle & Carriage Singapore •  209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339 
T: +65 6568 4556  •  F: +65 6565 1240  •  www.cyclecarriage.com.sg 
  

 
  
  
  

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, 26 May, 2020 3:03 PM 
To: Loi Ai Ting 
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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Jaime Tay <jaime.tay@eqinsurance.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 26 May 2020 2:35 PM
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Subject: RE: EQ Ref: DM19HO03328/JT, C&C Ref: SMC9191C, claim TP EQ SDM6336B, DOA: 

19/12/2019

Dear Cecilia,  
 
Please proceed to offer up to max $13,412.95 as recommended. 
 
Announcement 
In line with the MOM advisory on Safe Distancing Measures in workplace, our operation remains “Business As Usual” – except most of us are on 
Work-From-Home arrangement - still reachable by phone or email. We seek your understanding in bearing with us in this adjustment and any 
inadvertent delay in service 

Thank you. 
 
Regards, 

Jaime Tay 
Executive | Claims 

  

  
EQ Insurance Company Limited 
 

5 Maxwell Road  #17-00  Tower Block  MND Complex  Singapore 069110 

         
 

did 65 6496 9882 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 882 | fax 65 6223 4190 
www.eqinsurance.com.sg        
  

 

  
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies of it.        
 

 
 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: 23 May 2020 14:21 
To: Jaime Tay <jaime.tay@eqinsurance.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: EQ Ref: DM19HO03328/JT, C&C Ref: SMC9191C, claim TP EQ SDM6336B, DOA: 19/12/2019 
 

EQ ref : DM19HO03328/JT 

LKK ref : CC4/EQI19022536/R1gb3q2 

  

Dear Sirs/Madam, 
























