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DATE: 3¢ ha/20\9
Desar Sir / Mdm

ACCIDENT INVOLVING MOTOR VEHICLES

ALONG gleter herospace Lk
W | the owner of Vehicle No
oo L
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¥ |||.-;tIH|‘|'|,|'qI rm

HE. 5098568

JCK3293H 4 SHD vSS6T
ON _14/13/3019

selhvich was invabvet in thie abcs

Ily/Our Vehicle sustained damages o5 3 resull ol he above said accident and |/ we are now clismmng

pamnst you for the followings -

Cost ol repon
Loss-of-Use/Hentatter
Police/GIA report/LTA T

Surveyor report fees
Others
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-

-

-

$ 1960, 8%

Plgase advise whether you are now prepare o settle my caims a5 outhined above

| /we hereby authorised my repaiters Han Motor Repair, Lo vegotiate and settle miy chatn on my beball
L el tO miy repairers the outstanding vopar bill and

If there I settlement |/we further authorie you
incitdentals due to them.

Tours Faithiully
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e & Stamp



HAN MOTOR REPAIR
HOC. AGeaamoe |
BLE L SIN MU THDUSTRIAL SECTOR C
#0121 SINGAPDRE 575636 h
Emall: eshicorpor nte@ g com
TEL B4%E 3057 HP- 90998568

LETTER OF AUTHORITY

ACCIDENT INVOLVING

ALONG = seletar  Aerospace  Linl4

ON 4 /13 faoq i —
¢ THE LETTER OF AUTHORITY, 1/W( Tan Jee Luwan.
SHIC / ROCAHD 5'4'5‘-_""'!“?1-_- . cowner of Weincle No.  §eR 3393

Hereby will like to appoint Han Muto: ilep_mr, Al BT Sig Ming ldustrial Estate Sector C 0] -13 1

ingapore 575636, to represent to process the Third Party clanm on my/our behalf and do all or any of
e followmngs: -

1. To submit, negotiate/compromise and 1o resolve sertlements of my/our above mentions
claim

2, To collect payment(s) due in respect < any such clam{s) for the loss and damage, such
payment to be made by way of chegoe i tavour of
Han Motor Repalir

3. For any of the purpose aloiesam, 1o secute, st ind dedisver all documents whatsaever as
they deem necessary for the purpos. of wetthing ooy our sad claim

i/wWe hereby declare that all the processing and docaments done by vittue of this letter ol authority oo
miyfour behalf by my/our repairers or any person authorized by them shall be as pood valio and aflectus
o all intends and purposes whatsoever as if the same had been done or exscuted by me/Zus in s

| We Turther confirm that acceptance by Han Motor Repair of 1l settlsment amount constitute the full
discharge of my claim/our claim(s) in respact 0f the above acodent

“ined on \ 4 (day) L= {muonth) gﬂ_\q Iyear)

ny stamp if applicable)



Msb_FirstCapitat

[ Brpes)

i Mt Dhiags L AR PO | bl R bk

1«4 ; Fiw PSS Bl 2 5D

B iy Fitiek ] 1 E-0F Tty Hiolse Singiiioee

DISCHARGE RECEIPT

CLAIM REFERENCE Pt Gl i

ACCIDENT DATE LU el
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INSURED DORFEDAT THRAEFOHIATCHEFIELTD
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SETTLEMENT SUM $1 060 57
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HAN AHOTOR REPAIR
RO 4664 MM N
BLK 1 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL SECTOR ©
#1-121 Singupore 5375636
Email: esheorporaie @ gmail.com
TEL: 6458 MW7 HI": 9D99R568

Vehicle Insured: SHD4556X tE))  Date: 207122019
Accident Date: 19122019 Bs Fest
Our Ref: SCK3203H oo

Fam Jee Lian
C0n Han Motor Bepair

Final Repair Bill for Lexus ES2S0 Lpsury SO RI293H

TOLAL
REAR BUMPER FASCIA 5  KEou0
REAR L/S BUMPER REFLECTOR $ LRALL
REAR L/S BUMPER SIDE RETAINER £ 1e2in
b ]

REAR BUMPER SPONGI 121.40
Subtotal (55) S 1.234.30
Less 10% s (123.41)
5 WK

BOLU
TOPLTTY AND SPRAY REPLACE PARITS 5 50,00
O REMOVE PANEL BEATING. DDAMAGI I‘.rl‘u_-t!.k b 20000
ALLIGN, ADJUST AND REFIX REPLACE PARTS

5 156087

Singapore Dollars: Ooe thousand five hundred sixiy and cents eighiy -seven vnly



* Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 28 February 2020 5:44 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: EXPRESS SETTLEMENT: -OUR
REF:D19008029MFSHACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD4556X AND SCK3293H ON
19-12-2019

Attachments: LKK INSPECTION pdf, LKK ADJUSTMENT pdf; LKK SURVEY PHOTO.pdf; LKK RESURVEY
PHOTO.pdf; LKK RESURVEY PHOTO 1.pdf; TP LOD,pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Dear Asher,

We refer to your email dated 26.02.2020.

Please find our mandate as follows:

Amount Claimed ount Revised MSFCI Mandate
1. Cost of Repairs S 2,683.27 5 1,560.87 51.560.87
2. Loss of Use (4days x $100) 5 400.00 5 1,560.87 5 160.00 to $400.00 (2-4 days x 580-5100)
Total & 1,960.87 51,720.87 to $1,960.87

Please also request for a copy of the Certificate of Insurance.

Best Regards,

KLOrewm TR

Moror Claims Dept
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877 | DID : 6507 3582 | Fax No. :

6507 3849 | Company Regn. No. 195000106C
& Memons of dﬂmumuu GROUP

i ie f 1 i i I i o httn £ v malicsteapital.com sg i

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, February 26, 2020 12:39 PM

To: Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg=>

Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: EXPRESS SETTLEMENT: -QUR REF:D19D08029MFSH;ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHDA4556X
AND S5CK3293H ON 19-12-2019



. Your ref : D19008029MFSH

Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 4556X (01} AND SCK 3293H (TP] ON 15/12,/2019
We refer to the above matter.

The accident occurred when our insured rear ended third party vehicle.
Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 100% liability.

We seek your approval to offer repairer " HAN MOTOR REPAIR " at 5 1,960.87 (all
The summary is as follows: -

Amount Claimed Amount Revised

1. Cost of Repairs S 2,683.27 $1,560.87
2. Loss of Use (4days x $100) S 400.00 S 400.00 (4days x $100)
Total $1,960.87

Surveyor recommended 2days for repair,

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

Kindly let us have your approval / instruction.

Thank You.

Besl Regoncs

Asher Sng | Case Hondler

LEK Auto Consultanis Ple Lid

phone, &84 1-4051 | emai; gshenng@ikkguio.com | lox 6741-3)08
Bk 51, Payo Uk ingustnial Pork. U Avenue |, 202-25 | 5[408733)

From: Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 17 February 2020 3:42 PM
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Subject: EXPRESS SETTLEMENT: -OUR REF:D19008029MFSH;ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD4556X AND SCK3293H ON 19-12-
2019

Dear Asher,



. We refer to our tele-conversation a moment ago

As spoken, you may proceed with Express Settlement for this matter.

Best Regards,

artn TARw

Motor Claims Dept

M5 First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877 | DID : 6507 3582 | Fax No. :
6507 3849 | Company Regn. No. 195000106C

A Membes of INSURANCE GROUP

te it S, maficibcapital com g |

From: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, February 17, 2020 2:40 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims @msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: REQUEST OF SURVEY REPORT-OUR REF:D19008029MFSH;ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD4556X AND 5CK3293H ON
19-12-2019

Dear Sir,

We received LOD from workshop/solicitor.

Please let us have the Survey Report including Vehicle Inspection Photos & Survey Fees Invoice asap.

Kindly upload the survey report through CWS from document management screen by selecting option Survey report.
Thanks & Regards,

Motor Claims Department
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd

cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg



