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HAN MOTOR REPAIR
ROC: 46643000X
BLK 1 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL SECTOR C
#01-121 Singapore 575636
Email: eshcorporate@gmail.com
TEL: 6458 3097 HP: 90998568
Vehicle Insured: SHD4556X (FIRST) Date: 19/12/2019
Accident Date: 19/12/2019 (CAPITAL)
Our Ref: SCK3293H
Tan Jee Lian
C/O: Han Motor Repair
Estimaste cost of repair for Lexus ES250 Luxury SCK3293H
TOTAL _
IPC |[REAR BUMPER FASCIA cHL S §86.90 | § 886.90
IPC_|REAR L/S BUMPER REFLECTOR cryl 8 6390 | § 63.90
IPC_|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT '3 65820 | § 658.20
IPC [REAR L/S BUMPER SIDE RETAINER A E 162.10 | § 162.10
IPC_[REAR BUMPER SPONGE ) 12140 | § €27 121.40
IPC |[REAR L/S BUMPER PARKING SENSOR Ri|$ 47780 | $ 477.80
TOTAL SPARE PARTS $ 2,370.30
LESS 10% ($2370.30*0.9) b} 2,133.27
LABOUR
TO PUTTY AND SPRAY REPLACE PARTS $ 300.00
TO REMOVE PANEL BEATING, DAMAGED PARTS,
ALLIGN, ADJUST AND REFIX REPLACE PARTS b 250.00
$ 2,683.27
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trmy B peie et
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HAN MOTOR REPAIR
ROC: 46643000X

BLK 1 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL SECTOR C

#01-121 Singapore 575636

Email: eshcorporate@gmail.com

TEL: 6458 3097 HP: 90998568

Vehicle Insured: SHD4556X

(FIRST)

Date: 19/1272019

Accidemt Date: 19/1272019

(CAPITAL)

Our Ref: SCK3293H

Tan Jee Lian

C/0: Han Motor Repair

Estimaste cost of repair for Lexus ES250 Luxury SCK3293H

TOTAL
IPC_|[REAR BUMPER FASCIA CAIs 88690 S 886.90
IPC_|REAR L/S BUMPER REFLECTOR c|S  6390]S 63.90
IPC_|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT S 65820 S 658.20
IPC_|REAR L/S BUMPER SIDE RETAINER 24s 16210 § 162.10
IPC_|REAR BUMPER SPONGE S 12140 S 121.40
IPC_|REAR LS BUMPER PARKING SENSOR A|S 47780 477.80
TOTAL SPARE PARTS S 237030
LESS 10% (52370.30%0.9) S 213327
LABOUR
TO PUTTY AND SPRAY REPLACE PARTS 5 300.00
TO REMOVE PANEL BEATING, DAMAGED PARTS,
ALLIGN. ADJUST AND REFIX REPLACE PARTS s 250.00
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MS‘ First(:apital MS First Capital Inurance Lmited tseg b |900S1060 C31 Sem b 50 CODLEM-§

& Ralties Quay 82100 Singapore D4BSE0
Tok: [65) 8222 7311 Faxc [B5) 6222 3547

s & arior oy Bt 35 Robimmon Rosd #1601 City House Srgapore DGEET?
Tel: (65) 6507 3548 Fax: (55) G507 3849

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person
Contact Number.

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST
Cc : Workshop HAN CAR REPAIRS Attention. NIL
Ce : TP Solicitor NA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge KARENT

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection

wowrns rreFiryiTaQItAl fomLg
MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
20-12-2019 Our Ref No, D18008028MFSH
18-12-2019 Claim Type. Third Party I
q-45uml) 23 2| 14

SHD4556X Third Party Vehicle. SCK3283H p. | cleenan

v. | Mot In
BLK 1001 #01-48 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3ALEXANDRA VILLAGE )
ELEENA TAN -

s Hun rrot"r

64583097/ 90998568 Fax No. 0 wigp v

i
DIRECT SETTLEMENT =

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD

MNA Fax No. 68416315
NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required
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Nivitha (LKK Autn!

From: Aini Binte <Aini@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 20 December 2019 11:24 AM

To: IL Process Centre

Cc Karen Tan

Subject: FW: Request Surveryor list - First Capital Insurance
Attachments: accident rpt - SCK3293H.pdf; SCK3293H - CLAIM.xlsx

[External Email Warning: Do not click on any attachment or links/URL in this email unless sender is
reliable]

Dear IL

NC-15012583

New survey request for your handling.
Thanks & Regards

Aini
Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House, #16-01 Singapore 068877 | TEL: 6507 3848
Fax: 6507 3849 | Company Reg. No. 195000106C

A Moo of m INSURANCE GROUP

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 (“PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data,
Please refer to www mafirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. it may also be legally privileged.

If you are not the addressee or to whom it is Intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it.

If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender
immediately by return e-mail.

From: ILPROCESSCENTRE //ICICILOMBARD/HYD <ilprocesscentre@icicilombard.com>
Sent: Friday, December 20, 2019 11:13 AM

To: Motor Claims <MotorClaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: FW: Request Surveryor list - First Capital Insurance

From: Eleena Tan [ma lto:eshcorporate@gmall.com)

Sent: Thursday, December 19, 2019 5:03 PM

Tn:-:wsmgmrciaims@msfigt;ggital,mm.gg

Subject: Request Surveryor list - First Capital Insurance

|External Email Warning: Do not click on any attachment or links/URL in this email unless sender is
reliable)



. Dear Sir / Mdm,

I will like to request for joint expert surveyor list for us to choose to conduct a pre-survey claiming insured
vehicle SCK3293H for the accident which occurred on 19/12/2019.

| have attached the documents for your reference. If you still have any doubts please revert back to me.
Thank you.

Regards
Eleena Tan
Manager

Han Motor Repair

usiness No.:
| Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector C
#01-121 Sin Ming Industrial Estate
Singapore 575636
Tel: 6458 3097 HP: 9099 8568
“Please note that this email, including any attachments, is intended solely for the individual (s) or entity [les) to
whom they are addressed and may contain information that is private, confidential and privileged. In case you are
not the intended recipient, request you to notify the sender by reply mail and delete this email, including any copies
or attachments from your system. Any unauthorized dissemination, disclosure and/or use of the contents of this
communication to anyone is strictly prohibited and punishable by law,

Opinions, conclusions and statements of intent expressed in this e-mail are of the sender and ICICI Lombard General
Insurance Company Limited (Company) does not accept liability for the views expressed in this email unless
confirmed by an authorized representative of the Company independently of this communication or for the
consequences of any viruses that may be transmitted with this email.”



36 ROBINSON ROAD
#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPCRE 088877

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg Mo 199807198R GST Reg. No. 18-8607198-R

MS FIRST CAPITAL msuuce LTD

Ref : CC4/FCI180226356/Kealq2

\'nh Inspcr.tnd

VAR

Insured Veh. SCK 3293H
Policy No. D-18088836MFSH Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. D19008029MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From KARENT Assign Date 23n22018

Z - T hicla Particulars & Conditi
Make & Model LEXUS ES250 (A) c.c 2494
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg 2018
Chassis No. JTHBJ1GGB02105370 Colour METALLIC GREY
Odometer 3g185 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM

GOOoD

R/H Front Tyre |215/55 R17 YOKOHAMA 8 mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/55 R17 YOKOHAMA 8 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/55R17 YOKOHAMA & mm

215/55 R17

THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DﬁMﬂGES AT THE REAR N/S PGHTH)N

ESTIMATED NORMAL PER#DD FOR REF.AIFI

BLK 1 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL SECTOR C #01-121 SINGAPORE 5?553&

DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
[Accident Date  19/1272018 Inspection Date 231212019
Survey held at HAN MOTOR REPAIR

AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CDNDUCTED ON A"-I'WTHDUT PREJUD!GE' BASIS,
BiIN .ﬁGGﬂRDANGE TO YOUR INST RUCHDNS WE HA'!."E HDT AU'I'H'DHISED FIEPAIRS

1 Wurkinn Dm




_l LL” LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Sds BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industnal Park, Singapore 408823
TEL 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 198607188R GST Reg. No. 18-8607198-R Pege No.:1of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SCK 3293H

1|REAR BUMPER FASCIA CRACKED B86.890 886.90
1|REAR L/S BUMPER REFLECTOR CRACKED 63.80 63.90
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT TO REPAIR SEE B58.20 -
LABOUR
1|REAR LS BUMPER SIDE RETAINER DISTORTED 162.10 162.10
1|REAR BUMPER SPONGE CRACKED 121.40| 121.40
1|REAR /S BUMPER PARKING SENSOR SERVICEABLE 477.80
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -237.03 -123.43
2133z 1.11087
LABOUR
TO PUTTY AND SPRAY REPLACE PARTS. 300.00 250.00
TO REMOVE PANEL BEATING . DAMAGED 250,00) 200.00
PARTS,ALIGN ADJUST AND REFIX REPLACE
PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR BUMPER
REINFORCEMENT
550.00 450,00
GRAND TOTAL 2,683.27 1,560.87

JREPAIRS * Toaireiel | s g 1 | Beamo

Report Ref No. CC4/FCI19022535/Kea3q2

A

KONG SENG CHEONG
Licansed Appralser

CHSCLAIMER OF LIABILITY 7O THIRD PARTIES - This Repan s made solely for the use snd benelil of the Client named on the frani page af this Repert.




