> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner D Type: Singapore NRIC

Owner ID:; 315H

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: SGR7444D

Vehicle to be Exported: Mo

Intended Deregistration Date: 23 Dec 2019

Vehicle Make: OPEL

Vehicle Model: INSIGNIANB4 1.6 COTI AT
Primary Colour: Red

Manufacturing Year: 2016

Engine No.: A1161245GU7X0316
Chassis No.: WOLGS5E3XG1112624
Maximum Power Output; 100.0 kW (134 bhp)

Open Market Value: $25,366.00

Original Registration Date: 18 Jan 2017

First Registration Date; 18 Jan 2017

Transfer Count: 0]

Actual ARF Paid: $22,513.00 195K
Intended PARF Rebate Details )
PARF Eligibility: Yes

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 17 Jan 2027

PARF Rebate Amount; $16,884.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 17 Jan 2027

COE Category: E - Open Category

COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: $53,001.00

COE Rebate Amount: $37.456.00

Total Rebate Amount: $54,340.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 23 Dec 2019

OK



Asher SI‘!E (LKKAuto)

From: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com=

Sent: Friday, 6 March 2020 9:55 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Admin A

Cc: Irene Tay; Alfred Toh; Chee So Chow; Claims Dept of CTI

Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YQ1085M (Ol:
SNM19D206047C02/5(thp) and SGR7444D (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI19022531/Hea3) on
171272019

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

LKK REF- CC6/CTI19022531/Hea3
CTPIS REF - SNM19D206047C02/5(thp)

Dear Asher

We refer to your email pertaining to the above matter.

Please proceed to resolve the third party property damage claim at 529,186.45.
We await your payment advice to enable our Irene to act accordingly.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh
Senior Executive
Claims Department
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: 65 6389 6183
Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.comichinataipingsq/ | WeChat: J % %fi# TaipingSG
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain
confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or
partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the
e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Asher 5ng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, March 5, 2020 2:29 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.comz

Cc: Alfred Toh <alfred toh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YQ1085M (O SNM19D206047C02/5(thp) and
S5GR7444D (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI19022531/Hea3) on 17/12/2019

Your ref : TBA
Our ref : CCA/CTI19022531/Heal3s2

Dear Sirs,



We refer to the above matter.

ACCIDENT INVOLVING YQ 1085M (01I) AND SGR 7444D (TP) ON 05/03/2020

The said chain collision involved 3 vehicles whereby our insured was the last vehicle.

In accordance to the MCF guideline for chain collision, we have to settle the front vehicle's claim at 100%.
We seek your approval to offer repairer " T K LEE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD" at 529,186.45 (all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Claimed Amount Revised

1. Cost of Repairs / Nett Value S 68,000.00 S 27,660.00
2. Loss of Rental (14days x 5160) S 2,240.00 S 1,400.00 (14days x $100)
3. LTA Search Fee 5 36.45 S 36.45
4. Towing Fee 5 90.00 S 90.00
Total 529,186.45

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

MARKET VALUE 5 82,000
LTA REBATE 5 54,340
NETT VALUE $ 27,660

For your approval please.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Cose Handker

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

phone; &841-4051 | emal; gshesng@lkkavio.com | fox 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ul Industricl Pork, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408%33)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuUto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com=

Sent: Tuesday, 24 December 2019 11:07 AM

To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

Cc: Asher 5ng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-ai@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YQ1085M (Ol : CTI - TBA) and SGR7444D (TP : LKK REF -
CCe/CTI19022531/Hea3) on 17/12/2019

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVEAS TO COSTS

Dear Sir /f Madam,

We refer to the above matter.



‘We have inspected TP vehicle SGR 7444D at M/s T K Lee Automotive Pte Ltd on a WP basis and TF repairer
proposed for a direct settlement

Enclosed for your perusal is:

o TP GIA report
» TP estimated cost of repair

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051.

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.
"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020"

Thank vou,

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)



T K LEE AUTOMOTIVE PTE.LTD.

NO. 1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 #02-47 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883 Co.Reg. No. : 2012102667
TEL: 6509 5521 / 6509 5524 FAX: 6509 5523

Attn:The Motor Claims Department
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD
3 ANSON ROAD #16-00
SPRINGLEAF TOWER
SINGAPORE 079909 Yrs Ref.: YQU085M
Our Ref.; TKL1219-2761
Date.: 11.01.2020

Accident involving  SGR7444D  And  YQI085M  On 17.12.2019 At 1850hrs Along
PIE towards Changi Airport

M We refer to the above matter. We are instructed that above accident was caused solely and completely by the
negligence of your insured. as a result of which, our client have sufferd loss and expenses.

We are insturcted by our client to make a property damages claims as:-

Amount

1. Total Loss 5% 27,660.00
2. Loss of Rental {14days @ S$160Per day ) 5% 2,240.00
3. Towing S$ 90.00
4. LTA Search Fee S$ 7.45
5. E-File Search Fee b 269.00

Claim Amount 88 30,026.45

Enclosed are the following documents for your perusal.
-

v |Original Final repair Bill v |Letter of Authority

Original Survey Report & Inv v |Rental Agreement / Receipt

Original Photographs of [ SGR7444D ] v |E-File Serach Fee/ LTA Receipt
v |GIAS Reports of [SGR7444D ] W |Vehicle Registration Card
v |Certificate of Insurance v |Driver's Driving License / Identity Card
v [Report Of A Traffic Accident

Your prompt action will be greatly appreciated.

Kindly acknowledge receipt of the above said documents and your favourable reply is
greatly appreciated.

Yours faithfully,
T K Lee Automotive Pte. Ltd.

8
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S1EBLAVE 1 #0128 PAY A UBLINDUSTRIAL FARK, SINGAPORE 408033 TEL : 0031 62363561 FAN IS h256AR]E

Our Ref: CC6/CTI19022531/Hea3
31 DEC 2019

ACTINIUM ENGINEERING PTE LTD
27D LOYANG CRESCENT

#02-00

SINGAPORE 506823

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING Y 1085M AND SGR 7444D / OTHERS ON 17/12/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Lid to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under
the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them,

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had
amongst other information given us your version of how the accident had occurred. we as
the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement
with third party claimant

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further gueries.

Yours faithfully,

Asher

Case Handler

DID: 6841 6051

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: ashersng @lkkauto.com

¢.c.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Fre Ltd
{Muator Claims Depr)



Date:

To! Ching TalP-.r\(j Insurance (s) Pte  Lid

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO.; SGRAS4HD  and  Y@lo85H

AT/ALONG__PIE fowards Changi Airport

ON i#- 12. 2019

I/We, kKoh Pin Joo of (NRIC No./ROC NO.)
S64183315 H of Bik 58 Pasir Ris Street 53, #11-59, 5 510586

i a
owner of vehicle no. _ SGRIu44D in consideration of M;’ST K Leg Automotive Pte. Ltd
repairing myfour vehicle _ SGRI4HHD at my/our Instruction and hereby authorise
M/S 1K Leg Automotive Pte |td to demand claim settle receive whatever

amount settled / payable by the Insurance Company and/or third party or to commence legal

proceedings, if necessary, under my name, for the cost of repairs, car rental and/or loss of use,
etc. and to their appointing solicitor to act for me/us in respect of the said accident/claim and

all claimed and/or settled shall belong to them absolutely.

| further agree and undertzke to indemnify them against the above mentioned claim costs

which my arisen therewith.

Signature of Owner : \%W

Date; ol 1l |




MOTOR CLAIMS DISCHARGE WVOUCHER

Policy No : DMCVSN3054lel300 Claim No : SNMLSDZOE027C0OL
Claimant @ KOH PIN JOO
Amount : 85529,185.45

DOLLARS TWEMNTY NINE THCOUSAND ONE HUNDRED EIGHTY SIX AND
CENTS FCORTY FIVE ONLY.

I/We agree to accept the above mentioned amcunt to be paid to mefus in full &
final settlement of all claims, costs & disbursemsnts for injuries / damages
sustained by me/us through an accldent involwving

Claimant Vehicle No. @ SGR 7444D

Insured Vehicle Mo. ¢ ¥YQ 1085M
Date of Loss s IT/I24301%
Place of Accident : PIE TWDS CHAMGI AIRFORT

IN CONSIDERATION of the payment made to mefus of the aforementioned sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE} PTE. LTD,, I/We agree absolutely to
discharge CHINA TAIFING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) FTE. LTD. and/or

Insured Mame : ACTINIUM ENGINEERING FPTE LTD
Driver Name : MUTHIAR RAJAKUMAR

from all claims, present or future in respect of all loss, injury or damage
sustained by mefus arising out of the =aid accident.

1 acknowledge that this payment ls made without admisaion of liability aon the
part of CHINA TATFING INSURANCE (SINGAFCORE) PTE. LTD.

(1) General Damages 85
{2} Cost of Repair/Esesss/Nett Value 85 27, 660.00
{3} Loss of Use/Rental/Earning 55 1,400.00
{4} GIA/Police Reports/
Investigation Results/Search Fess 55 36.45
{5} Medical Reports/Expenses 5%
{6} Survey Fees/Towing Fee/Disbursement 35 90.00
{7} Cost including Disbursement 55
TOTRAE & & ¥ & & 9 Sedieds 2 8 w5 BE 29,186.45
Claimant Name : KOH PIN JOO MRIC Wo @ SMMMNI1SH
-

V@W 1 12.02. 2039

Signature H Date




CARZ RENTAL PTE. LTD.

| Kaki Bukit Avenue 6, #02-47 Autobay,

Singapore 417883
Fax: (65) 6509 5523

Tel: (65) 6509 5521

— )
5

SarFpuaD

VEHICLE RENTAL AGREEMENT

3852

ROC NO: 201312119K RA NO:
Hirer Particulars - Veh. No. a2 #1428 | Replace veh. No. SGHILLLD
Name Mg Sin Ain Make f Model Toyota wWish Auto/Manual
Address Bik S&E fuoic Ris Sreet B3 Date/Time Out | 13 +12.2018 @ |12200Wrs KM Out
¥1-53,5 510586 DatelTime In | OF 01.2020 (@ 0325PH KM In
NRIC/Passport| SE90A4FIF Maobile g3552899 | Estimated Date/Time Return
Tel (0) Fax Rental charges - S$ S$
Authorised Driver's Particulars - Hours @ Per Hour
MName 14 Days @ 60 Per day LANG .00
Addrass Weeks i1} Per Week
Months i Per Month
ﬂlC)Passpon Maticnality Sub-Total
w ie of Birth Occupation Less Discount
DiLicence No. Mobile Sub-Total
Expiry Date Tel () Optional Charges -
Country of lssus Tel (H) Delivery (@ Pear Trip
(A)-ACCIDENTS (D)- DENTS (S)- SCRATCHES Collection | @ Per Trip
Others
Sub-Total
Add 7% GST
(A) Estimated Total Rental
Exlension -
RIGHT Extension Rental X
Surcharge (Malaysia) W
PALL x -
1 x i
Others -
Misc :
Cash/Neis/ChequeVISAMC Card Mo
ACCESSORIES CHECK Sub-Total
[Jdacx [ ] sTD Tools Add 7% GST
g W e {B) Extension/others Total
[ 1s/rRM [ Radio/CD
Physical Damage Excess Hirer's Acknowledgameant () + (B) Grand Total Rental Charges
Singapore % Less Frepayment
Malaysia 55 5 Balance Due | 2140.00
Young, Elderly & s$ S Deposit :
Inexparienca driver Ry Deposit Refunded
(Additional ) Remarks: Received by

IMPORTANT NOTE:

Unly persons aged 24 and above o below 65 with 2 years or more driving
expenence, authorized, licensed and signing this agreement may drive the
vehicle.

In case of accident, the Hirer shall report to rental office immediately. 1F there
is any bodily injury, a police report must be made within 24 hours.

Vehicle is strictly for SINGAPORE USE ONLY, and may not be driven out
of Singapore without prior conscent of Carz Rental Pte. Ltd.
Unauthorised drivers, drivers who did not fulfill the above requirement are
liable for the full cost & other losses suffered by Carz Rental Pte. Lid.
should the vehicle is damaged or stolen

The hirer hereby read and understood all terms and conditions
stated on this page and overleaf ;

for Carz Rental Pte. Ltd.

Y e

Hirer Signature/Co’s Stamp/Date




/ Hotline: +65 8595 6999
e — Email: info.autow@gmail.com
AUTOW Recovery Services

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #04-19 Singapore 415875
ROC: 53347242C

CASH ORDER / WORK ORDER No.A 15955

Service Date: | ‘{'E ~{ :?' ( g/ Time Received: __
O : X
Member Name: L@L \f-,ﬂ'(’-t[,u?_,-"f: Time Arrived:

e
NRIC No.: \a s Time Completed:

A— E -
Contact No.: From: L. A,

Car Reg Nao.. ,Q,G‘i F—? WD To: ﬂd 1%{{3&_.4;‘( -
Car Make/Model: hﬂﬂﬂ_\g__& Tow Truck No.: \'“ 'E; . 1{_{3?

Remarks: Amount: £ Cif../} .
Cash / Cé:qﬂ
ADDITIONAL CHARGES: BODY & PAINT CONDITION:

Dc@t&els { Flat Bed
BaZement / Multi Storey
Crane up / Bogged

Causeway / Second Link

Low Body Kit

Collection of Key

0000000

ERF / Carpark

Cepn
Tow Diver's Name & Signature Member's Name & Signature

Mabs: Vahiclo & lownd st cwned's isk, Tha comoany acoapts no resporsiiily for camage of other mesdemenrur i your snhicie | Bsel wheles baing it
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Land Transport Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore ST5701
GST Registration No. | M4-0006528-2
Print Date/Time 19 Dec 2018/ 10:36:59

Receipt Date/Time : 19 Dec 2019/ 10:36:59
Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt No. - ITNET-00000-191219-000916

Pravious Recaipt No.

S/N ltem Description/ Amount GST Amount
Business Transaction Reference Before Amount After GST
Mo. GST (5%) (5%) (S$)

Resull of Insurance Enguiry - YQ1085M
As at 17 Dec 2019/18:50:00
Insurance Co: CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD

1 Insurance Enguiry - ¥Q1085M
Endquiry Fee 7.00 .48 748
20191219103620833730
Sub-Total 7.00 049 T.49
Total Before Rounding .00 0.45 749
Rounding Difference 0.04
Total Amount Payable 745
Paid By
20191219103632150 Diract Debit: aﬂETS Debit 7 45
{Intermat Banking)
Total T.45
Cash Change 0.00
Tendered Amount 745
Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

THANK ¥YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider [ financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee
may apply.



@ RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
I P % GEHERAL & Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
\ I‘ﬂﬁfp " INSURANCE rrone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Manday to Friday Sam to Spm
GST Registration No: M400017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

TAX INVOICE

Cur Ref No: GR-19-210011
Date of Request: 20/112/2018 Your Ref No: WALK IN JASON

TK LEE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
1 KAK] BUKIT AVE B, #02-14 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883

Dear SirfMadam,

Your Vehicle Na: SGR7444D

Date of Accident: 17122019

Place of Accident: PIE

Involving Vehicle No: YQ1085M XE4085T

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

DESCRIPTION [AMOUNT (S$) |
E-File Search Fee (Public) ' ' ' 14.02
GST Amount 0.98
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive} 15.00

Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[] GIRO [X] Cash [ ] Cheque



GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

"GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

1
A
b

P
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i usey

"%? |NSURANCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
~ " ASSOCIATION Operating Hours; Monday to Friday 8am to Spm
= i i 4
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE

Cur Ref Mo: GR-19-210012
Date of Request: 201122019 Your Ref No: WALK IN JASON

TK LEE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6, #02-14 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883

Dear SirMadam,

Date of Accident: 171122019
Wehicle No: SGRT4440
Place of Accident; ALONG PIE TWDS CHANGI AIRPORT

Invelving Vehicle No: Y Q1085M

\With reference to your application for the accident report, we have attached the following accident reports as requested:

DOCUMENTS  |ACCIDENT LOCATION PERDOC (S$)  |QTY |AMOUNT (S§)

YQ1085M 'ALONG PIE TWDS CHANGI AIRPORT 14.00| 1 13.08
(GST Amount ) 0.92
|Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 14.00

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General
Insurance Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability
whatsoever for any loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the reports or their images.

Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[1GIRO [X] Cash [] Cheque




