Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 3 April, 2020 11:13 AM

To: Nicole Chong

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: RE : SJV 1502C FINALIZED - LKK REF CC6/AIG19022530/Hha3

Without Prejudice

Dear Nicole,

We refer to your below email.

Kindly forward to us your LOD and supporting documents for our further action.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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" Save the Larth- Print only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Hock Ann (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 31 January, 2020 10:03 AM
To: Nicole Chong

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: RE : SJV 1502C FINALIZED

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear allan,

Good day, o.k will be process base on finalized total amount COR $ 7000 L/sump REPAIR and DOR 9 days close.

Noted : All finalized document > LOA ,LOD,DV,LTA need send direct Ikk person handler (vic) vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com




Thanks.

Best Regards,
Hock Ann| Assistant Automotive Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6741 3061 | Email: HockAnn@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Nicole Chong [mailto:nicole@casgarage.sg]
Sent: Thursday, 30 January, 2020 11:00 AM

To: Hock Ann (LKK Auto)

Cc: ALLAN@CASGARAGE.SG; Vic (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: RE : SJV 1502C FINALIZED

Dear Hock Ann,

Agreed lump sum 7k / 9 days

On Wed, 22 Jan 2020 at 12:07, Hock Ann (LKK Auto) <HockAnn@lkkauto.com> wrote:

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear allan ,

Good day, kindly refer management ament adjustment offer with your vehicle SJV 1502C
L/sump repair amount COR - $ 7000 and DOA-9 days .

if agree amount will be to close case .

please update soon asap .

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Hock Annl Assistant Automotive Assessor



LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6741 3061 | Email: HockAnn@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hock Ann (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 16 January, 2020 4:15 PM
To: 'ALLAN@CASGARAGE.SG'

Cec: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE : SJV 1502C FINALIZED

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear allan ,

Good day , Kindly attached refer SJV 1502C TOYOTA ALTIS finalized updated calculate adjustment on
16.1.2020

COR - $ 6600
DOR -9 DAYS

Please refer adjustment updated total L/SUMP amount $ 6300 if agree total L/SUMP amount and repair
days, will be to close case.

Please to updated email back asap.

Thanks.



Best Regards,

Hock Annl Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6741 3061 | Email: HockAnn@]lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Regards,

Nicole Chong

Admin and Finance Officer

CAS Garage Pte. Ltd.

Addr: 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #02-22
Autobay. Singapore (417883)

Hp: 9791 6119

Office: 6484 2220

UEN: 201828067M



