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Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: andrew pang <andrewpanglijian@hotmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 13 May 2020 9:46 PM
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SCJ 813H & SKX 8098J ALONG/AT STAMFORD ROAD 

ON 15/12/2019
Attachments: Accident.jpg

Hi Jia Le, 
 
Thank you for the advice and the photos from the inspector. 
 
In addition to the photos, will you be able to provide the 'report' or 'write-up' by the inspector which 
corresponds to these photo attached to help me understand what repair was required due to the 
incident.  
 
Apologies as i'm quite puzzled by the focus of the repair done. There seems to be a lot of focus on the 
bumper of the vehicle, but as per the photo from the day of the incident (See attached), the damage was 
only on the rear bonnet. The close to perfect layer of 'dust' on the 3rd part's vehicle bumper indicates that 
there was unlikely any contact made with the rear bumper. Hence I'm puzzle by the focus of the repair 
done.  
 
Apologies for the question as I will like to ensure that there was no fraudulent claims either by the 3rd 
party or the 3rd party mechanic to inflating cost and magnitude of damage. This is to be fair to all parties 
(including AIG). Thanks for your assistance on this.  
 
Could i also check, what is cost of the "inspection fee" your referring to? 
 
 
Thanks for your assistance. 
 
 
Andrew 
 
 
 

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, May 13, 2020 9:51 AM 
To: andrew pang <andrewpanglijian@hotmail.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SCJ 813H & SKX 8098J ALONG/AT STAMFORD ROAD ON 15/12/2019  
  
Hi Andrew, 
  
There are 2 options open to you towards the claim: 
  

1.      To settle privately with third party including our inspection fee without involving your insurer. 
2.      To claim under your motor policy under section 2 whereby your insurer would take over the 

conduct of negotiation with third party and settle the claim. 
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Our qualified assessor has conducted the inspection at the workshop before the actual repairs. The 
existing accident is a typical rear ended case. As a result most of the parts of rear portion of third party 
vehicle are affected. Our assessor has physically checked and inspected each and every item listed in the 
estimate of TP workshop, confirmed the listed parts with its respective price are warranted a replacement. 
We also attached some inspection photos taken by our assessor for your reference. 
  
Thank you. 
  
  
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via 
email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much 
regretted. 
  
Best Regards, 
Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  

From: andrew pang [mailto:andrewpanglijian@hotmail.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, 6 May 2020 12:29 AM 
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto) 
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SCJ 813H & SKX 8098J ALONG/AT STAMFORD ROAD ON 15/12/2019 
  
Hi Jia Le, 
  
Thanks for the email.  
  
To clarify, what are the options available to this proposed settlement amount?  
  
(1) Is this open for private settlement or must we proceed with an insurance claim? 
  
(2) Is there bases to dispute this amount? 
  
Seeking your clarification. Thanks 
  
Andrew 
  

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, May 5, 2020 6:22 AM 
To: ANDREWPANGLIJIAN@HOTMAIL.COM <ANDREWPANGLIJIAN@HOTMAIL.COM> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SCJ 813H & SKX 8098J ALONG/AT STAMFORD ROAD ON 15/12/2019  
  
Dear Andrew, 
  
Please find below the adjusted breakdown for the proposed settlement amount to the claimant for your reference. 
  

Cost of Repair (w/gst) $ 2,702.05   
Loss of Rental ($100 x 5 days) $    500.00  
LTA Search Fee $         8.00  
 TOTAL $ 3,210.05  
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Our surveyor is in the opinion that based on the damages sustained to the claimant’s vehicle and the adjusted 
amount is already fair and reasonable. 
  
If you have further clarifications, please reply within 5 days from the date of this email, otherwise, we will proceed 
accordingly. 
  
We hope the above matter clarifies. 
  
Thank you. 
  
  
  
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via 
email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much 
regretted. 
  
Best Regards, 
Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Tuesday, 4 February 2020 4:48 PM 
To: ANDREWPANGLIJIAN@HOTMAIL.COM 
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SCJ 813H & SKX 8098J ALONG/AT STAMFORD ROAD ON 15/12/2019 
  
Our Ref: CC4/AIG19022527/da3 
  
Attn: PANG LI JIAN ANDREW 
  
Dear Sir/Madam, 
                                                         
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SCJ 813H & SKX 8098J ALONG/AT STAMFORD ROAD ON 15/12/2019 
  
We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor 
insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy. 
  
We have received a claim from SKX 8098J against your motor insurance policy. 
  
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your favour as it is head 
to rear collision. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party. 
  
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us 
within 10 days from the date of this letter. 
  
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial 
vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will 
be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected. 
  
Please call us if you have further queries. 
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Best Regards, 
Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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Claim Audit

 

 
AUDIT TRAIL
No. On Audit Remarks By

1
23 Dec
2019
21:01

Clm Dtl
Modified Claimant's Name: -> FAHRURAZI BIN ABAS. Claimant's ID: -> S7520148F. [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

2
23 Dec
2019
21:01

Clm Veh
Model
Changed

(204445) HONDA JAZZ 1.3 CVT (A). [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

3
23 Dec
2019
21:01

Clm Created
Reg No: SKX8098J. Acct Date: 2019/12/15. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pt
e. Ltd. (SG). TP Insurer: China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. (HQ). Workshop: Cheng Ho
e Motor Pte Ltd (Yishun)

[A] HOW MEI
KWAN

4
23 Dec
2019
21:01

Adj Co
Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

5
23 Dec
2019
21:01

Adj Next
Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2020/01/03 [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

6
23 Dec
2019
21:01

Adj
Mandate
Set

Approved:0.00.Reinsp:Adj decides. [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

7
23 Dec
2019
21:01

Clm Ins Co
Changed

[200005] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG) -> [203630] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.
(Express)

[I] Merimen
Administrator

8
23 Dec
2019
21:02

Label Added (19):Fastlane. [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

9
23 Dec
2019
21:02

Adj
Adjuster
Assigned

[None] -> KENNETH KONG [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

10
04 Feb
2020
12:00

Clm
Registration
Modified

Acct Time:20:00:00->08:40:00. [I] AIG OneClaim
Integration User

11
04 May
2020
08:19

Adj Rpt
Initiated

[A] NUR
SHAQILAH BTE
ABDOL WAHAB

12
04 May
2020
08:19

Clm Dtl
Modified Insured ID: -> -. Claim Conclusion: -> 3.

[A] NUR
SHAQILAH BTE
ABDOL WAHAB

13
04 May
2020
08:19

Clm Dtl
Modified JPJ Reg. Date: -> 2015/12/19.

[A] NUR
SHAQILAH BTE
ABDOL WAHAB

14
04 May
2020
08:19

Clm Details
Notified

[A] NUR
SHAQILAH BTE
ABDOL WAHAB

15
17 Aug
2021
11:24

Adj Next
Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2020/01/03 [I] Lee, Ming-Yao

16
17 Aug
2021
11:24

Adj
Mandate
Set

Approved:3200.00. [I] Lee, Ming-Yao

Date From       Date To       Audit Type None Go



ACTIVITY
[17/01/2020 09:14] Lee Su Li:
OINR *** SENT OUT FIRST NON-REPORTING LETTER



Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History

Bill Ref No Bill Date Bill Type Acc Type Acc Name Co Name
(Branch) Ref 1 Ref 2 Amount

2500305 04 May 2020
08:19:53

OD/TP Case
(Adjuster) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

LKK Auto
Consultants
Pte Ltd (HQ)

SKX8098J SCJ813H 11.00
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