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Our Ref: CC6/AIG19022526/Kha3               
 

09 JANUARY 2020      

     

GOLDBELL CAR RENTAL PTE LTD     By Post & By Email 

10 RAEBURN PARK 

#03-10 

SINGAPORE 088702 
 

Dear Sir/Madam, 

 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLU 7866U AND SGG 9082J ON 19/12/2019  
 

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte 

Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto 

Insurance policy taken up with them. 

 

We have received a claim from Body Repairer/Workshop acting on behalf of the owner 

of SGG 9082J against your motor insurance policy. 

  

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had 

amongst other information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as 

the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement 

with third party claimant. 

 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and 

settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter. 

 

Please call us if you have further queries. 

 

 

Yours faithfully, 

 

 

 

Vic Alpeh  

DID: 6841 2096 

FAX: 6741 4108 

Email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com 

 

c.c. AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd  

            (Motor Claims Dept) 

 Junjie.lee@prosegur.com.sg  

(Email) 



4/29/2020 Merimen e-Claims

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_Print&CFID=70701795&CFTOKEN=92a179b6959d6203-B… 1/1

Print Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SGG9082J (8124480995SG)
[SLU7866U]

TP
NG CHWEE SENG

Dec 19 2019 8:00AM
[GOLDBELL CAR RENTAL PTE LTD]

Performance Motors Limited

From   AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) (AIG_SG_EXPRESS), sent on 24/04/2020 10:57 AM.
To   LKK_HQ
Subject   Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$8727.79) - SGG9082J - Claim Handler: Goh, Jeremy-CX

Approved:8727.79:Subject to Final Repair Bill in order - LOU at 3days up to max. $110.
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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>
Sent: May 18, 2020 3:58 PM
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
Cc: Vic (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: URGENT LOD REMINDER - SGG9082J & SLU7866U ON 19/12/2019 *** LKK REF: 

CC6/AIG19022526/Eha3 
Attachments: SGG9082J TO LKK.pdf

Dear Sirs 
 
Please see attached duly signed DV and please arrange for payment soon. 
 

 
Thank you. 
 
Regards, 
Caroline 
C/o Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint 
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941 
DID: 6319 0174 Fax: 6479 4601 

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Monday, 18 May 2020 12:08 PM 
To: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg> 
Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: URGENT LOD REMINDER - SGG9082J & SLU7866U ON 19/12/2019 *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG19022526/Eha3  
  
[External Mail] This email originated from outside of the organisation; be careful with requests, attachments and links.  
Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
Thank you for acceptance. 
  
Please duly sign the DV enclosed and return document to us (LKK) for our necessary action. 
  
Thank you. 
  
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the 
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
  
  
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission 
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
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Best Regards, 
Jasper Chua| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: PBSP [mailto:pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg]  
Sent: May 18, 2020 11:56 AM 
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: URGENT LOD REMINDER - SGG9082J & SLU7866U ON 19/12/2019 *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG19022526/Eha3  
  
Dear Jasper 
  
We have instructions to accept your revised LOU. 
  
Please proceed with payment using the pre-signed DV we sent to you. 
  
  
Thank you. 
 
Regards, 
Caroline 
C/o Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint 
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941 
DID: 6319 0174 Fax: 6479 4601 

From: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg> 
Sent: Thursday, 30 April 2020 3:01 PM 
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: URGENT LOD REMINDER - SGG9082J & SLU7866U ON 19/12/2019 *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG19022526/Eha3  
  
Dear Jasper 
  
We have instructions to accept your revised LOU. 
  
Please proceed with payment using the pre-signed DV we sent to you. 
  
Thank you. 
 
Regards, 
Caroline 
C/o Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint 
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941 
DID: 6319 0174 Fax: 6479 4601 

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Thursday, 30 April 2020 9:43 AM 
To: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg> 
Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: URGENT LOD REMINDER - SGG9082J & SLU7866U ON 19/12/2019 *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG19022526/Eha3  
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[External Mail] This email originated from outside of the organisation; be careful with requests, attachments and links.  
Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
   
We refer to the above matter. 
  
We propose settlement as follows: - 
  

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 8,397.79 
2. Loss of Use (3 days x $110.00) $    330.00 

Total $ 8,727.79 
  
Please confirm acceptance. 
  
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the 
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
  
  
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission 
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
  
Best Regards, 
Jasper Chua| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: PBSP [mailto:pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg]  
Sent: Wednesday, 29 April, 2020 7:36 PM 
To: Vic (LKKAuto) 
Cc: Admin A; Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) 
Subject: Re: URGENT LOD REMINDER - SGG9082J & SLU7866U ON 19/12/2019 *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG19022526/Eha3  
  
Dear Sirs, 
  
REMINDER. 
  
Thank you. 
 
Regards, 
Caroline 
C/o Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint 
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941 
DID: 6319 0174 Fax: 6479 4601 

From: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Thursday, 2 April 2020 4:45 PM 


