Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Sharon Heng L K <sharon.heng.leekun@simedarby.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 7 February, 2020 7:54 PM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Cc: Toh Jing Xuan; Bernard Wan Chong Huat; Keith Leo Chi Yung; Teng Wai Khan; Jia Le
(LKK Auto)

Subject: DIRECT SETTLEMENT FINAL REPORT - SGG9082J

Attachments: SKM_C45820020719480.pdf

Dear Steve

For your perusal :

Labor$3793.00
Parts$4055.40
Total$7848.40

Owner is claimingLOSS OF USE = $120 X 3 DAYS.
Note : please seek MANDATE from your Priciple ASAP.

Note : 5 working days.

Sharon Heng
Admin Executive
Bodyshop

BMW
Performance Motors

DDI: +65 6319 0123

FAX: +65 6474 3229

Address : 303 Alexandra Road, Singapore 159941
EMail: sharon.heng.leekun@simedarby.com.sg

www.bmw.com.sg

Sime Darby Motors
A member of the Sime Darby Group

From: service.pml@simedarby.com.sg [mailto:service.pml@simedarby.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, 7 February, 2020 7:48 PM

To: Sharon Heng L K

Subject: Message from KM _C458



“This electronic mail content and any accompanying attachments ("the Message") is intended only for the named
addressee ("the Recipient") and may contain information that is confidential, privileged and/or proprietary to the
Sime Darby group of companies ("Sime Darby") and/or protected under applicable laws. If you are not the intended
Recipient, you are strictly prohibited from using, disseminating, forwarding and/or printing the Message. Please
notify the sender immediately by return e-mail and permanently delete all copies of the Message. Sime Darby
disclaims all liability for any error, loss or damage arising from the Message being infected by computer virus or
other malicious software. Any views and/or opinions expressed in the Message are solely those of the author's and
do not necessarily represent those of Sime Darby's.”



