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Company Registration No 19960T198R

SEUBEAVE L2225 PAY AL B INDUSTHIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL = (a5 62563500 FAX : (651 62564315

Y our ref: DI19007842MFSH Date: 23/1272019
Owr ref: CC4/FCI119022523/T1ka3

The Motor Claims Department

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. PA 4750Y

We refer 1o the above matter,

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on PA 4750Y
at the premises of M/s EM-1 Auto Pte Ltd and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 8% 11,914.50

Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 7.074.50

"Check" ltems Amount - S -

Total (Including Check Trems) : S§ 7.074.50

Murket Value : §% - (est)

LTA Reimbursement Value - S% - (est,)

Nett Value S8 - (est)

Description of Damage: e

The vehicle sustained damages at the o @ oot

O/S Rear Portion : g ==
R =

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 7.0 day

Yours faithfully,

MOHD. TAUFIKH
Licensed Appraiser




EM-1 AUTO PTE LTD

BLK 8 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE SECTOR C

#01-68 SINGAPORE 575643

Contact Number: 6452 3298 (0) 9666 6556 (H/P) 6457 5776 (F)
Email Address: emlautopteltd @ gmail.com
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COMPANY / GST REG. NO. : 201316380R
Vehicle Number : PA 4750Y Date : 19.11.2019
Vehicle Model : MIT.ROSA BUS Chassis : BEB9J0D00105
Accident Date : 10.12.2019 TP Ins. FIRST CAP
Original Reg Date : 16.06.2004 (30.04.2024)
ESTIMATE
1|1 pc |Rear Bumper Ay 2,600.00 | N
2 |1pc |Rear Side Panel RH s 3,560.00 | N L5
3 |1 pc |Rear Side Panel Air Grille RH (Small) b{— 350.00 | N
4 |1pc |Rear Mudilap RH a 120.00 | N
5 |1 pc |Rear Mudiiap Inner Shield RH e .~ 175.00 | N
6,805.00
Less 10 % 680.50
s 6,124.50
Special Nett
1|1 pc |Rear Side Panel Sticker EXCURSION BUS nn » 40.00
2 |5 pcs |Rear Side Glass Inner Seal ade 5000 | *250.00 |1 5*®
3 |5 pcs |Rear Side Panel Glass Sealant ate 60.00 300.00 | £5Y
4 [1pc |Rear Tyre an 380.00 | X
Labour charge
Panel Beating /00 o 1,800.00
Spray painting - 3 Tones j2a9 1,800.00
Anti rust b0 150.00
Remove and install carpet and seat. e 580.00
Remove and install side panel glass Z S0 400.00
To perform computerize wheel alignment. » 90.00
7 A aavey ¢ 11,914.50
[agphe YT § Less20% ___ 2,382.90
W r, z Lump 5um=5 @1 .60
~] ) T Y
_,:/r"l‘./iq [( L) LKK Auto Consultants hence nott
“ Y, T Reparer of n ”:., 1; -
f’ j ‘l‘t b / Ll ‘Pa ¥ ;—hnlra:a”n'




EM-1 AUTO PTE LTD

BLK 8 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE SECTOR C
#01-68 SINGAPORE 575643
Contact Number: 6452 3298 (O) 9666 6556 (H/P) 6457 5776 (F)
Email Address: em1autopteltd @ gmail.com

COMPANY / GST REG. NO. - 201316380R

Vehicle Number:  PA 4750Y 19.11.2019
Vehicle Model : MIT.ROSA BUS Chassis :  sessupooios
Accident Date : 10.12.2019 TP ins. FIRST CAP
Original Reg Date : 16.08.2004 (30.04.2024)
ESTIMATE
1|1 pc_|Rear Bumper K 2,600.00 | N
2 |1 pc_|Rear Side Panel RH i 3,560.00 | N 2550
3 |1 pc_|Rear Side Panel Air Grille RH (Small) b~ 350.00 | N
4 |1 pc |Rear Mudfiap RH de ~ 120.00 | N
5 |1pc [Rear Mudfiap Inner Shield RH e ~ 17500 |N
680500 195
Less 10 % 680.50 ¢35 S0
$ 6,12450
1|1 pc |Rear Side Panel Sticker EXCURSION BUS o w4 40.00
2 |5 pcs |Rear Side Glass Inner Seal 5000  ™2s0.00]/5®
3 _ |5 pcs |Rear Side Panel Glass Sealant 60.00 300.00 | 25V
4 [1pc |Rear Tyre 380.00 | X
].{r"d{:
Labour charge
Panel Beating /000 1,800.00
Spray painting -3 Tones 200 1 180000
Anti rust g0 150.00
Remove and install carpet and seat. 8 580.00
Remove and mum nuf T So 400.00
To perform com ignment. X wn 90.00 | 7 g4v
11,914.50
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Khanchna (LKK Auto)

To: ‘Rachel Wu'

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: PROPOSAL ON LIABILITY - YOUR REF; D19007842MFSH/1 // | EXPRESS
SETTLEMENT VIA LKK] [ACCIDENT BETWEEN PA 4750Y & SHA 88108 [Ol- FCI] OMN
10/12/2019]

. Wishing you @ Happy ana rrosperous Lunar New Yeg, «

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@Ilkkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 20 January 2020 2:42 PM

To: 'Rachel Wu' <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.coms=

Subject: PROPOSAL ON LIABILITY - YOUR REF: D19007842MFSH/1 // [ EXPRESS SETTLEMENT VIA LKK] [ACCIDENT
BETWEEN PA 4750Y & SHA B810B [OI- FCI] ON 10/12/2019 |

Dear Ms, Rachel,

We refer to the above matter.

Liability: 100% (BOLA 2)

Remarks: Insured driver turning at the intersection and third party has right of way

Kindly let us have your approval on liability.

Thank you.

« Wishing you a Happy ana rrosperous Lunar New Yeg, »

Best Regards,
Khanchna| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd




0ID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@|kkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com sg>

Sent: Thursday, 9 lanuary 2020 4:12 PM

To: Khanchna [LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto coms

Cc: Admin A <admin-ai@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Request for Insured accident video - YOUR REF: D19007842MFSH/1 // EXPRESS SETTLEMENT [ACCIDENT
BETWEEN PA 4750Y & SHA B810B [Ol- FCI] ON 10/12/2019 ]

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Khanchna,
Attached video footage as per request.

***The video footage is confidential information. In possessing, using or viewing the CCTV footage, you do not acquire
any rights, title or interest in the CCTV footage and undertake to preserve Its confidentiality. By downloading, using or
viewing the video, you agree that you will not disclose, provide, reproduce, store, transmit or otherwise make avallable
the CCTV footage, in whole or in part, to your client, any third party, or any social media or media platform.

Best Regards

Rachel Wu
Motor Claim Department

M5 First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877 | Tel: 6507 3848 | DID - 5507
3862| Fax No.:6507 3849 |Email: rachelwu@msfirstcapital.com.sg | Company Regn, No. 195000106C
x Member of EEEEI Insurance Group

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer 1o
hito://www msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential, It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to
whom It is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it, If you have received this message in
error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mall

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, December 27, 2019 4:40 PM

To: Rachel Wu <Rache!lWu@msfirstcapital. com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>

Subject: Request for Insured accident video - YOUR REF: D19007842MFSH/1 // EXPRESS SETTLEMENT [ACCIDENT
BETWEEN PA 4750Y & SHA 88108 [OI- FCI) ON 10/12/2019 |

YOUR REF: D19007842ZMFSH
LKK REF: CC4/FC119022523/T1ka3

Dear Ms. Rachel,

We refer to the above matter,




Please let us have a copy of our Insured driver's accident video.
Thank you.
“Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020"

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna®@|kkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Melkwan @ lkkauto cam>

Sent: Tuesday, 24 December 2019 10:42 AM

To: 'Rachel Wu' <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007842MFSH/1 // EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

YOUR REF: D19007842ZMFSH
LKK REF: CC4/FCI119022523/T1ka3

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter,

We had inspected TP vehicle PA 4750Y at M/s EM-1 Auto Pte Ltd on a WP basis and TP repairer proposed for =
direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
= TP estimated cost of repair
e Preliminary advice

Please take note that the case handler in-charge Is Khanchna and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2360.
To check avatlability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admiin

LRK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 ooss5 | email: MeiKwan@ kkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Ik 51, Poyva Ui Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S{4080:3%4)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto coms

Sent: Monday, 23 December, 2019 8:03 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmaotorclaims@msfirstcapital. com.sg>; assignments <assignments(@lkkauto com>
Cc: 'Rachel Wu' <RachelWu@msfirsteapital.com sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007842MF5SH/1




Bear 5".4" Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Wishes you & Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020 &

Best Regords

C.NIVITHA

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Mhone: 6841-1972 | email: gssignments@Elkkauto.com | fax: berb-4m15
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(qo8a033)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims @ msfirstcapital com.sgl

Sent: Friday, 20 December 2019 5:33 FM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LEKALUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmaotorclaims@msfirstcapital. com.sg>; Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007842MF5H/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Hest Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
lel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

P5: This Is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.
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PARF/CUE Rebate Enguiry

| of 1

’ A Singapore Government Agency Website
> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owmner ID Type: Business

Owner |D: 394M

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No,: PA4AT50Y

Vehicle to be Exported: No

Intended 18 Dec 2019

Deregistration Date:

Vehicle Make: MITSUBISHI

Vehicle Model: BE637JRMHDEA

Primary Colour: White

Manufacturing Year: 2004

Engine No.: 4D34)89067

Chassis No.: BE&6391D00105

Maximum Power

Dutput:

Open Market Value: $69,344 .00

Original Registration 16 Jun 2004

Date:

First Registration Date: 16 Jun 2004

Transfer Count: 3

Actual ARF Paid: $3,448.00

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: MNo

PARF Eligibility Expiry

Date:

PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 30 Apr 2024

COE Category: C - Goods Vehicle &
Bus

COE Period(Years): 5

PQP Paid: $13,380.00

COE Rebate Amount: $11.685.00

Total Rebate Amount: $11.685.00

Message

hups:ivel . gov.sg/MadvelfactionfenquireRebate By PublicBefore..

Please note that all future COE renewals for this vehicle can only be for a 5-year period. subject to the statutory

lifespan (if applicable) of the vehicle,
The information contained herein is correct as at 18 Dec 2019

OK

18-Dec-19, 4:36 PM




MS@FirstCapital

£ Raffies Quay 171-00 Singapore MBSE0
Tek (R5] 6222 2311 Fax 165} BF22 3547

M5 First Lapital Insurance Limited Cnfteg Se THMBOUIURE CT Meg b L2 G0 LR -y

Clhotrmn & Pustur Lbermtting Dapt: 36 Ratbirgon Soad #16-01 Gty Hewme Singapere DERETT

Teel. (65) E507 3848 Fax (65) 6507 3545

wierw e firairapital rom ag

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
Date 11-12-2018 Our Ref No. D19007842MFSH
Accident Date 10-12-20189 Claim Type, Third Pa b 1
pe ry 3410 am 9 PR
Insured Vehicle SHABB10B Third Party Vehicle. PA4750Y ny Cheek
W ""1

Survey Location BLK 8 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE SECTOR C #01-68 g ’IHUf‘Uﬂ
Contact Person. CHIA SIN MUK (MR)
Contact No. 64523208/ 98666556 Fax No. 64575776
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE:
Appoinied LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Persan MNA Fax No. 68416315
Contact Number, NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Warkshop EM-1 AUTO PTELTD Attention. NIL
Cc: TP Solicitor NA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge RACHELWU LIMEI

IMFORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days far survey assignmant and 7 days for re-inspection,

This is a computer generated leiter, no signalure required




Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 24 December, 2019 10:42 AM

To: ‘Rachel Wu'

Cc: Khanchna (LKK Auto); Admin A

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMEMT - D19007842MFSH/1 // EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
Attachments: Preliminary Advice pdf: TP ESTIMATE - MARKED pdf

YOUR REF: D19007842MFSH

LKK REF: CC4/FCI19022523 /T1ka3
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We had inspected TP vehicle PA 4750Y at M/s EM-1 Auto Pte Ltd on a WP basis and TP repairer proposed for a
direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
e TP estimated cost of repair
* Prelimmary advice

Please take note that the case handler in-charge is Khanchna and she can be contacted at D1D: 6841 2360.
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020"

Thank vou.

Hest Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultunts Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | emoil: MeilKwan@lkkouto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Payva Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D [LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 23 December, 2019 8:03 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments(@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Rachel Wu' <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007842MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Wishes you a Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020 ﬁ

Bost Regards
G.NIVITHA
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd




EM-1 AUTO PTE LTD

BLK 8 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE SECTOR C
#01-68 SINGAPORE 575643
Contact Number: 6452 3298 (O) 9666 6556 (H/P) 6457 5776 (F)
Email Address: em|autopteltd@gmail.com
COMPANY / GST REG. NO: 201316380R

M/S SFX TRANSPORT SERVICES Proforma Invoice ¢ 200P1I00008/S500TP
Date : 20-Jan-2020

MS First Capital Insurance Lid

Motor Claim Department

36 Robinson Road

#16-01 City House

Singapore 068877

Attn : Ms Khanchna

Date of Accident : 10-Dec-2019

Our Client's Vehicle Number PA 4750Y st

Vehicle Make / Model . MITSUBISHI ROSA Without Prejudice

Your Insurer . SHA E810B

DESCRIPTION SUB-AMOUNT GST 7%  AMOUNT (SGD)

Lump Sum Repair Cost (Recommend by LKK Taufikh) 4.900.00 343.00 5,243.00 SR

GIA Fee 27.10 1.90 29.00 SR

Loss of Use (7 Davs X $250) - Bus with 23 seaters 1,750.00 1,750.00 ES

SGD  ( Seven Thousand Twenty-Two only ) GRAND TOTAL 7,022.00
Subject to 7% GST — 344.90

P~ - 'rL-. chr
oo faduli 15 Ertzih

Authonised Signature and Company Stamp

a




Khanchna (LKK Auto)

== & =4t e — —_——— e ——
From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Sent: Friday, 6 March 2020 11:59 AM
To: Chia Sin Muk
Cc Admin A
Subject: RE: PA 4750Y, your ref. no.D19007842MFSH, DOA : 10.12.2019 TP - First Cap
Attachments: FCl DV.pdf
Without Prejudice
(save as to cosls)
Dear Karen.
We confirm setflermnent as per your e-mail below for (54,322 00{all in}).

We attach herewith a copy of the DV for your further acfion.
Kindly send us [LEK] all the documents below for our necessary aclion; -

’ Original Final Repair Tax Inveice (Fis remove the Loss of use and GIA fee as the bill should only have
repair cost amount only)
. Hardcopy of the DV

Thank you.

Kindly note that this negotintion between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resalving the
matter amicably withoul parties resorting to legul proceedings. No admission of Hability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotintion of terma/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affectinfluence on the issues of
linbility/dnmages, either party 15 not bound, thereafter, by the pegotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Khanchna Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchnau lkkauto.com|Fax: 67414108

Blk 51. Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Chia Sin Muk <em | autopteltdi@ gmail.com=>

Sent: Thursday, 5 March 2020 4:31 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@ lkkauto.com=

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@ lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: PA 4750Y, your ref. no.D19007842MFSH, DOA : 10.12.2019 TP - First Cap



-

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Khanchna,
We confirmed as follow :

Cost of Repair (w/GST) : 5% 5,243.00 (agreed)
GIA Search Fee . 5% 29.00 (agreed)
Loss of Use - we propose : S$ 1,050.00 (7 Days X $150 - School Bus with 23 Seat)

s ses s ssss==

TOTAL : 5%$6,322.00

——a——4—F—4—4—1

Thanks & Best Regards,

Karen, on behalf of,

Chia Sin Muk (Mr)

m: (65) 9666 6556 | o: (65) 6452 3298 | f: (65) 6457 5776

EM-1 Auto Pte Ltd
Bk 8 #0i-68 Sn Ming Industrial Estate Sector C Singapore 575643
Lo, / GST Rogistration Murmber; 200 3106 il

On Wed, 4 Mar 2020 at 15:31, Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchnai lkkauo.com> wrote:
Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer 1o the above matter.

We propose setflement as follows:-

|, Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 5.243.00
Z. Loss of Use [7 days x $100) $ 700.00
3, Gla Search Fee $F 2900

Total | 5 5.972.00

Please confirm acceptance.
Kindly also amend your invoice as it should only have the Repair amount enly.
Thank you,

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter ks purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of llability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.
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in the ;untul' new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by elther party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party Is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlemeant.”

Best Regards,
Khanchna| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna alkkauto.comFax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Chia Sin Muk <em lautopteltd/a@ gmail.com=>

Sent: Tuesday, 21 January 2020 4:40 PM

To: Rachel Wu@msfirstcapital.com.sg: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchnafa Ikkauto.com>
Subject: LOD - PA 4750Y, your ref. no.D19007842MFSH, DOA ; 10.12.2019 TP - First Cap

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir/Madam,

Please find the attached LOD.

COR :$5,243.00

GIA : $ 29.00
LOU : $ 1,750.00




Total : § 7,022.00

Kindly arrange for settlement.

Thanks & Best Regards,
Karen, on behalf of,
Chia Sin Muk (Mr)

m: (65) 9666 6556 | 0: (65) 6452 3298 | f: (65) 6457 5776

EM-1 Auto Pte Ltd

filk B =01-68 S Ming Industrial Estate Sector C Sngapore 575641

Co. j G5T Regstranon Number: 20151 n380R




' B 74l 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

-y 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6258 35681 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607188R GST Reg. No. 19-D807196-R

ef CC4/FCI19022523/T 1kadq2

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

36 ROBINSON ROAD :
#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 DR (IO |||IIII|I[II|“II

Insured Veh. SHA 88108 \\'gh |nw PA 4T50Y

Policy No. D-19808257T9MF SH Coverage (§) 0.00

Claim No. D19007842MFSH/1 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  RACHEL WU Aulgn Data 20/12/2019
Haku & Model MITSUBISHI EIEB:!D c.c 1908
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 200
Chassis No. BEB38JD00105 Colour YELLOW
Odometer B17304 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL

General GOOoD

R/H Front Tyre |215/75R17.5 FALKEN 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |21575R17.5 FALKEN B mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/75R17.5(D) FALKEN Iﬁfﬂmrrl

215!?5 R1?.5 (D)

THE VEHICLE EUSTAINED DAMAGES A.T THE oIS HEAFI PDR’T‘II’.‘IN

DAM&GES EEE DEI'NLB

101272019
Survey held at EM-1 AUTO PTELTD

BLK 8 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE SECTOR C #01-68
SINGAPORE 5?’5543

AJTHE INSPECHI‘JN WAS CDNDUG’TED ON A"WI'I'HDUT PREJUDI-EE' BﬁElS
BJIN MCORDAHCE TD YI‘JUR INSTHUG"!'IDNS WE Hﬁ.U‘E NDT A.UTHDH!SED REPAIRS.

ESTIM&TED NEIF.M&L FERIDD FOR REF'J\IH




! ” ” LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

d il WA B 51 Uibl Ave 1 £01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX 8256 4315
Reg Mo 19980T128R GST Reg No. 18-9807198-R Paga No_:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. PA 4750Y
at | ~ Description S
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER (N) TO REPAIR SEE 2 600.00
LABOUR
1|REAR SIDE PANEL RH (N) BENT 3,560.00 2.550.00
1|REAR SIDE PANEL AIR GRILLE RH (SMALL){N) BENT 350.00 350.00
1|REAR MUDFLAP RH (M) DEFORMED 120.00 120.00
1|REAR MUDFLAP INNER SHIELD RH (N} DEFORMED 175.00 175.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -B80.50 -318.50
6,124.50 287550
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR SIDE PANEL STICKER EXCURSION BUS (SN) NOT NECESSARY 40.00 -
5|REAR SIDE GLASS INNER SEAL @3%50.00 (SN) NECESSARY 250,00 150.00
5|REAR SIDE PANEL GLASS SEALANT @$50.00 (SN) NECESSARY 300.00 250.00
1|REAR TYRE (SN) NOT NECESSARY 380.00
g70.00 400.00
LABOUR
PAMEL BEATING.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR 1,800.00 1.000.00
BUMPER.
SPRAY PAINTING-3 TOMNES. 1,800.00 1.200.00
ANTI RUST. 150.00 60.00
REMOVE AND INSTALL CARPET AND SEAT 580.00 280.00
REMOVE AND INSTALL SIDE PANEL GLASS 400.00 350.00
TO PERFORM COMPUTERIZE WHEEL ALIGNMENT NOT NECESSARY 90.00 -
4 820,00 2,890.00
GRAND TOTAL 11,914.50 6,165.50
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP uun'lmsla'gumr T = ilﬂ 2 ' E ~ 4,800,00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION) | TP il

Report Ref No. CCMFCH 8022523/T1ka3qg2

_@ | a
MOHAMAD TAUFIKH HO LEONG CHUAN

M.MATAI, AMSAE-A Automotive Assessor
Autamotive Assessor

DISCLAIMER OF LIARILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is mace solely 1or the use and benofit of the Clent nemes on the froni page of this Report.




