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' Hsiao Tuna (LKKAuto)

From: JP Conceptz Pte Ltd <jpconceptz.711@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 24 December 2019 10:57 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Fwd: [EXTERNAL] Re: Acknowledgement Your ref : SMJ2024L Our ref :
SAMOZAYHMC/JT *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM19022518/pa3 - To explore DS

Attachments: SMJ2024L Accident Reporting pdf

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Please refer to the attached GIA report and video footage from our client's vehicle.
You may click on the link to view/download the footage.

Feel free to contact me at 86600224 if you require any assistance.

Thank you.

EHPFM‘IE!HLHH’HBF.mpll

Best Regards,

6909 9907 | B660 0214
Insyirah Ramlan {pconceptz. 711@emall.com
el o www, |pconceptz.com
JP Conceptz Pte L1d

160 Sin Ming Drive, Autocity, #07-11/07, Singapore 575722

Thank you very much for your support and looking forward to serve you more in the near
future.

—-———- Forwarded message -—-—-

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Date: Mon, 23 Dec 2019 at 18:52

Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] Re: Acknowledgement Your ref : SMJ2024L Our ref : SOMO2AYHMC/IT *** LKK REF:
CCA/ASM19022518/pa3 - To explare DS

To: IP Conceptz Pte Ltd <jpconceptz.711 all, >

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com>, Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>, assignments
<assignments@|kkauto.com>

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE"




 SAVEAS T0 COSTS
Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that Ol has reported. Please refer to the below O1's sketch plan and statement.

SHETCH FLAN

AR \
DESCHIBE CIRCUMSTANCES DF THE ACTIDENT
Fraai .rILI.-.J...‘ n‘_,l.:l.l. P-w--ll Li--lr.; l‘ul LAl W] L bl L\--1
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Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Hsiao Tong at 6742 3197,

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

“Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020"

Thank you.




:_ .Bust Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lud

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@ lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Bk 51. Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: JP Conceptz Pte Ltd <]pconceptz.711 il >
Sent: Monday, 23 December, 2019 12:53 PM

To: NIKAM Santosh Pandurang <santosh.nikam@axa.com.sg>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: Acknowledgement Your ref : SMI2024L Our ref : SOMOZAYHMC/IT

Dear Santosh,
We agree to the appointment of LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd.

Could you kindly arrange for surveyor to come today at 5pm or tomorrow morning for pre-repair inspection?

Thank you,
Best Regards,

| 6909 9907 | 8660 0224
Insyirah Ramlan ipconceptz. 711@gmail.com
Offos Sansan. www, |pconceptz. com

JP Conceptz Pre Ltd
160 Sin Ming Drive, Autocity, #07-11/07, Singapore 575711

Thank you very much for your support and looking forward to serve you more in the near future.

On Mon, 23 Dec 2019 at 12:24, NIKAM Santosh Pandurang <santosh.nikam®axa.com.sg> wrole:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE’

SAVE AS TO COSTS




Dear Sir,

We want to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s vehicle jointly with your
client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list below to
conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a Single Joint Expert.

List of our motor surveyors:
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Infiniti Appraisal Services
Priority Services Pte Ltd
AXA in house surveyor

P e L e

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select one or more of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost
of the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert. Meanwhile, please furnish us with estimate
guotation in order for our surveyor to complete the pre repair survey.

If there be any injury claims by your client, please combine it in one Letter of Demand in light of one cause
of action, save as to costs and expenses.

From: P Conceptz Pte Ltd [mailto:[pconceptz. 711 @gmail.com]

Sent: Monday, December 23, 2019 11:45 AM

To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey <motor.surve a.Com.sg>
Subject: |EXTERNAL] Notification of accident - SMJ2024L

Dear Sir/Madam,

| would like to report an accident on behalf of SMJ2024L. We're claiming against your insured,
SGX7091B.

Kindly arrange for surveyor to conduct pre-repair inspection

Please find attached NOA; GIA is still processing by reporting centre.




Thank you

Best Regards,
[0 69099907 | 8660 0224
Insyirah Ramlan I [] ipconceptz.711@gmail.com
Offic Nanager [[] www.ipconceptz.com
¥ Concasla Pt | [ 160Sin Ming Drive, Autocity, #07-11/07, Singapore 575722

Thank you very much for your support and looking forward to serve you more in the near future.

—Disclaimer—

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you are
not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you have
received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this
message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Singapore - Externals or any
other entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.




Hsiao Tuna {LKKA.utn!

From:

Sent:

To:

Subject:
Attachments:

Categories:

Dear Sir/Mdm,

JP Conceptz Pte Ltd <jpconceptz.711@gmail.com:

Wednesday, 19 February 2020 12:53 PM

SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey

[EXTERNAL] SMJ2024L - ACCIDENT CLAIMS SUBMISSION

LOD.pdf; CAR RENTAL AGREEMENT pdf; LTA Search.pdf, GIA REPORT.pdf; Repair
bills.pdf

Shekhar

please find attached LOD and other documents required for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Jaycie Tay

Managing Director
JP Conceptz Pre Ltd

6909 9907 | 9101 7011

11 1l.com

www, |peoncepts. com

160 5in Ming Drive, Autocity, #07-11/07, Singapore 575722

Thank you very much for your support and looking forward to serve you more in the near future.




ABi2020 Claim Portal

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP) = Menu

<TP - Mandate IA> - S9MO YI-”ACCI DENT INVOLVING
« SGX 90718 1) / SMJ 2024L(TP) / OTHERS ON

Type
@ Question

Message

Liability: 100%. 3 vehicle chain collision whereby insured was the last car. Inform Ol about third party claim.
Agreed to settle at best and aware NCD issue. We seek your mandate at $6,302.27(all-in). TP-Mandate |A
had been uploaded in Smartclaims, Kindly let us have your approval/instruction. Hsiao Tong - é-Mar-2020

Reply

h'.'tps:va...-.mmda-imumm,ugf:tnim-pmhmmmnm-wmamwmhtmwmawlmmumwmmﬂngﬂ?mmﬁuqmmum... i




374 74—

Seds WA B Pmlid Campany Fagistration Ho. 10960T106R
1 U AVE | SU2-28 PAYA U INDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE #8033 TEL | (065) 62563561 FAX | (D65) &2560015
Immediate Advice
To : AXA Insurance Pte Ltd Date: 6/3/2020
Survey Details:

Date of loss 21-Dec-19

Date of appointment 23-Dec-19

Date of survey 24-Dec-19

Location of survey JP Conceptz Pte Ltd

Vehicle Details:

Claim Type: THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Vehicle number SMJ2024L

Make and Model HYUNDAI AD AVANTE 1.6 GLS (A) S

Date of registration 26-Feb-19

Parf Rebate

Market Value s 67,000.00

Parf Rebate ] 32,007.00

Nett Loss S 34,993.00

Repai Is:

|initial Estimate | s 8,329.52 |
Proposed/Revised repair cost:

Parts s 3,928.80

Check items (estimate) S -

Labour 5 1,300.00

Total 3 5,228.80

Lump Sum(if applicable) s =

|Number of days for repair | 5 |




F WL 5

B B = Pt Lol Campany Hegiatration Mo 196607 1§88

1 UTH AVE 1, #2225 PAYA UL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE S08083 TEL @ (065) 62563561 FAX 1 (065) 62584015

Remarks:

3 vehicles chain collision whereby insured was the last cor.

Mandate:
Liability(TP) 100%
Proposed repair cost (w/GST) S 5,594.82
Loss of use NIL |no. of days
Loss of rental 5 700.00 |(7days x $100)
Loss of income NIL |no. of days
LTA search fees 5 7.45
Others NIL
Proposed Total 9 6,302.27




Hsiao Tuna {lenutu!

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuUTo)

Sent: Friday, 6 March 2020 10:38 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: New message for service request 152859, vehicle number SMJ2024L

6/3/20 9:15 AM*** Messageoffer 5 days for downtime and proceed with others. thanks. - TAN Jas#02-25 |
5(408933)

-—0Qriginal Message—

From: Jas.tan@axa.com.sg <jas.tan@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 6 March, 2020 2:16 AM

To: admin-d@|kkauto.com

Subject: New message for service request 152859, vehicle number SMJ2024L

AXA Insurance has sent you a message for claim number S9M0D2AYH.

Please click here https://vp.smartclaims.axa.com.sg/claim-portal/ to view the message in Vendor Portal.

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by AXA except where provided for in a
written agreement between you and AXA. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or
partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.




Hsiao Tnna (LKKAuto)

From: JP Conceptz Pte Ltd <jpconceptz.711@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 9 March 2020 5:59 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc Admin A

Subject: Re: LKK REF : CC4/ASM19022518/Kpa3 *** RE: [EXTERNAL] Re: Fwd: TPPD LOD from

SMJ2024L - ACCIDENT CLAIMS SUBMISSION - SSMO2AYH

Dear Hsiao Tong,

we accept the $6100 global sum.

Best Regards,
&909 9907 | 9101 7011
Jaycie Tay 711®@gmail.com
Managing Director www. pconceptz.com
JP Conc Pte Ltd
ey 160 Sin Ming Drive, Autocity, #07-11/07, Singapore 575722

Thank you very much for your support and looking forward to serve you more in the near future.

On Maon, 9 Mar 2020 at 17:07, Hsiao Tong [LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.
We propose settlement at a global sum of $6,100.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice
engagement should not be disclosed in any other refated matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related
claims.”




Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Melkwa kau >
Sent: Thursday, 5 March 2020 3:12 PM
To: TAN Jas <|as.tan@axa.com.sg>; JP Conceptz Pte Ltd <jpconceptz.71 il

Ce: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <agdmin-a@Ikkauto. mm:-
Subject: LKK REF : CC4/ASM19022518/Kpa3 *** RE: [EXTERNAL] Re: Fwd: TPPD LOD from SMJ2024L - ACCIDENT

CLAIMS SUBMISSION - 59MO2AYH

Dear Sirs / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.

Hi Hsiao Tong,

Kindly assist.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mel Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

2




Blk 51, Pava Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: TAN Jas <jas.tan(@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 5 March, 2020 2:07 PM

To: IP Conceptz Pte Lid <jpconceptz.711@gmail.com>; Admin-B < in-b@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] Re: Fwd: TPPD LOD from SMJ2024L - ACCIDENT CLAIMS SUBMISSION - SSMODZAYH

Aside to LKK,

Please assist.

Regards

*Please note we have terminated our fax-line. Hence, please send in your correspondences to our two common
mail boxes instead. For OD/TP survey , send it to motor.survey@axa.com.sg and other correspondences send it to
motor.doc@axa.com.sg,

Jas Tan | Snr Specialist, Motor Claims Department
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | B Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 | www.axa.com.sg

Email: jas.tan({@axa.com.sg

Customer Care No. 1800 8804741

A A
'

50 Years
in Singapore




Please consider the environment before printing this message
This message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is prohibited. If
you are not the intended reciplent of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

From: JP Conceptz Pte Ltd <jpconceptz.711 ail.com>
Sent: Thursday, March 5, 2020 12:39 PM

To: TAN Jas <jas.tan@axa.com.sg>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: Fwd: TPPD LOD from SMJ2024L - ACCIDENT CLAIMS SUBMISSION - S9MO2AYH

Can | have the email?

On Thu, 5 Mar 2020, 09:42 TAN las, <jas.tan@axa.com.sg> wrote:

Without Prejudice,

Please liaise with LKK for direct settlement.thanks.

Regards

*Please note we have terminated our fax-line. Hence, please send in your correspondences to our two commaon
mall boxes instead. For OD/TP survey , send it to motor.survey@axa.com.sg and other correspondences send it to
maotor.doc@axa.com.sg,

Jas Tan | Snr Specialist, Motor Claims Department
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 | www.axa.com.sg

Email; jas.tan®axa.com.sg

Customer Care No. 1800 8804741




Please consider the environment before printing this message
This message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, Is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify tha sender immediataly.

From: JP Conceptz Pte Ltd < n 7 all.com>

Sent: Wednesday, March 4, 2020 5:29 PM

To: TAN Jas <jas.tan(@axa.com.sg>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Fwd: TPPD LOD from SMJ2024L - ACCIDENT CLAIMS SUBMISSION - S9MO2AYH

Dear Jas,

can | check the status of this claim?

Best Regards,
6909 9907 | 9101 7011
Managing Director www.ipconceptz.com
JP Conceptz Pre Lid 160 Sin Ming Drive, Autocity, #07-11/07, Singapore 575722

Thank you very much for your support and looking forward to serve you more in the near future.

Forwarded message
From: CST <cst@axa.com.sg>

Date: Wed, 19 Feb 2020 at 20:06

Subject: TPPD LOD from SMJ2024L - ACCIDENT CLAIMS SUBMISSION - S59MO2AYH

To: jpconceptz. 711 @gmail.com <jpconceptz.711 il.com>
Cec: mntar.dac@aﬂ.:um.g <mator, .COM.Sg>
Dear Jaycie,




Thank you for your email with the attachments well-received.

We have copied our Motor claim team for their required action.

Dear Motor Doc,

Please update file and inform claim handler for action

Thank you & With Best Regards,

Janat Tay | Specialist. Gl Call Centre-Claims Service Team
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | B Shenlon Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapare 088811 | www axa.com.sg
Email.csti@axa com.sg

Phone: (65) 6880 4888

—————— Onginal Message ————

From: JP Conceptz Pte Lid [[jpconceptz. 711 il.c
Sent: 19/02/2020 12:40

To: csti@axa com.sq

Subject: [EXTERNAL] SMJ2024L - ACCIDENT CLAIMS SUBMISSION

Dear SirfMdm,

please find attached LOD and other documents required for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Jaycie Tay 909 9907 | 9101 7011
managing Director




JP Conceptz Pte

Lia

160 5in Ming Drive, Autocity, #07-11/07,
ingapore 575721

Thank you very much for your support and looking forward to serve you more in the near future.

This message is confidential, its contents do not constitute a commitment by

AXA except where provided for in a written agreement between you and AXA. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is
prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify

the sender immediately.

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by

AXA except where provided for in a written agreement between you and AXA. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is
prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify

the sender immediately.

Thank you
With Best Regards,

Janet Tay | Specialist, Gl Call Centre
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 | www.axa.com.sg

Phone: (65) 6880 4BB

ref:_DODbOKy1f._5002v2gVdFx:ref

—--Disclaimer—

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee, If you are
not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you
have received this message by mistake, please notify the sender Iimmediately. Any views or opinions presented in
this message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or any
other entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.

——Disclaimer——

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you are
not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you
have received this message by mistake, please notify the sender Iimmediately. Any views or opinions presented in
this message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or any
other entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by
AXA except where provided for in a written agreement between you and AXA. Any
unauthaorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is

7




prohibited. If you are not the intended reciplent of the message, please notify
the sender immediately.

—~Disclaimer—

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you are
not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you have
received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this
message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or any
other entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.

—~——Disclaimer——

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you are
not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you have
received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this
message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or any
other entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the sald companies.

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by

AXA except where provided for in a written agreement between you and AXA. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is
prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify

the sender immediately.




JP CONCEPTZ PTE LTD
UEN: 201902737E
160 Sin Ming Drive, Autocity
#07-11/07 Singapore 575722
Tel: 6909 9907 Mobile: 9101 7011 Fax: 6909 9905

Date: 19" February 2020
Your Ref:
AXA Insurance
r Clai ent
8 Shenton Way
#24-01 AXA Tower
Singapore 068811
Dear Sirs.
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMJ2024L and SGX70918 and SMM4109Y ON 21/12/2019 ALONG KPE
T NEAR DEFU E
We are the representative for KELVIN TAN KAUUN, whose vehicle registration number 5MJ2024L

was damaged in the above accident.

We are instructed to claim for damages against your insured’s negligence and/or management of
motor vehicle registration SGX9071B. As a result of the accident, our client’s vehicle was damaged

and our client had been put to loss and expense, particulars of which are as follows:-

Cast of repairs (GST 7%: 5366.02) 5559482
Loss of rental @ $120/day for 7 days (GST 7%: 50) 5840.00
Assessor fee $0.00
LTA Search fee §7.45

56442.27

Enclosed are the supporting documents for your perusal:-
GIA

LTA search

Repair bill

Car rental bill

Kindly let us have your payment of $6442.27 in our workshop's name within the next 14 days.




JP CONCEPTZ PIELID
UEN: 201902737E
160 Sin Ming Drive, Autocity
#07-11/07 Singapore 575722
Tel: 6909 9907 Mobile: 9101 7011 Fax: 6909 9905

Please do not hesitate to contact our Jaycie Tay 91017011 or email jpconceptz.711@gmail.com

should you have any queries on your matter, We thank you for your kind attention and appreciate
your quick remittance.
Yours faithfully,

IP CONCEPTZ PTE LTD
End.



JP CONCEPTZ PTE. LTD.
180 SIN MING DRIVE

#07-11/07

SN MING AUTOCITY

SINGAPORE [576722)

Tel 6309 9207 Fax 5006 8905

JE-.

Email jpeoncepts. T11@gmaileom  Websie: hitps:iwww £om
Company Reg. Mo 201802737E  G5T Reg Mo 201802737E
PROFORMA INVOICE: HQPIDOO020
AXA INSURANCE DATE ! 19-FEB-2020
CONTACT : 18008804858 JOB SHEET NO - HQIS00166
SERVICE ADVISOR : JAYCIE TAY
VEHICLE NO @ SMDZI024L OB START ;
MAKE : HYUNDAL JOB COMPLETED i
MODEL : AD AVANTE 1.6 GLS (A} 5 PAGE ' 10F1
MILEAGE : DKM
NO DESCRIPTION qQrY UNIT PRICE SUM (SGD)
1 LUMP SUM 1 8329.52 5,228.80
0% DISCOUNT
SGD : FIVE THOUSAND FIVE HUNDRED AND NINETY-FOUR AND EIGHTY-TWO CENTS SUB-TOTAL : 5,228.80
ONLY
GST -7 % : 366,02
TOTAL : 5,594.82
JP CONCEPTZ PTE. LTD.

FREPARED BY



ATTN.JAS TAN

Insured Veh.

AXA INSURANCE PTELTD

8 SHENTON WAY #24-01 . _
AXA TOWERSINGAPORE 068811 Déta:: 12-09:2020 I”Wll'“lll“"l

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL 6256 25681 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 198607198R GST Reg No. 19-09607198-R

CAIASM

18022518/Kpadq2

SGX 80718

Policy No.

GA260720

Claim No,

S8MO2AYH

TR .._-.J,

vanicie r

HYUNDAI AVANTE (A)

Engine No. HIDDEN 2019

Chassis No. KMHDB41CMKLIBE5634 Colour METALLIC RED
Odometer 10336 ' Steering IN ORDER

Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM

GOOD

Accident Date

| Size Balance
R/H Front Tyre |[205/55 R18 KUMHO 8 mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/55R18 KUMHO 8 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/55R16 KUMHO 8 mm
205/55 R18

DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.

212208

Survey held at
Repairer

=04 il

S =

AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHCIIR!S REPAIRS.

160 SIN MING DRIVE AUTOCITY #07-07
JP CONCEPTZ PTELTD

.1 1:

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:




|4 -

1|FRONT BUMPER (CONSISTENT) (WCF)

1|FRONT BUMPER GRILL (CONSISTENT) (WCP)
1|FRONT BUMPER SPONGE (CONSISTENT) (WCP)
2

FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER FLFR (CONSISTENT)
(WCP)

1|FRONT BUMPER LICENSE PLATE (CONSISTENT) (WCP)
1|REAR BUMPER UPPER COVER ASSY (CONSISTENT)
(WCP)

1|REAR BUMPER LOWER COVER (CONSISTENT) (WCP)
1|REAR BUMPER BEAM (CONSISTENT) (WCP)

2|REAR BUMPER BEAM BRACKET (CONSISTENT) (WCF)
1|PANEL ASSY -BACK (CONSISTENT) (WCP)

1|REAR RIGHT LAMP ASSY -LICENSE PLATE
(CONSISTENT) (WCF)

1|REAR LEFT LAMP ASSY -LICENSE PLATE (CONSISTENT)
(WCP)

1|REAR LEFT COMBINSIDE -LAMP ASSY (CONSISTENT)
(WCP)

1|REAR RIGHT COMBINSIDE -LAMP ASSY (CONSISTENT)
(WCP)

2|REAR BUMPER STAY LR RR (CONSISTENT) (WCF)
1|REAR LEFT BUMPER SIDE MOUNTING BRACKET
(CONSISTENT) (WCP)

REAR RIGHT BUMPER SIDE MOUNTING BRACKET
(CONSISTENT) (WCF)

REVERSE SENSOR (CONSISTENT) (WCF}
LESS 20% DISCOUNT
COST PLUS 20%

—

—

SPECIAL NETT ITEMS

1|FRONT & REAR NUMBER PLATE WITH FRAME COVER
(SN) (CONSISTENT)

CRACKED
CRACKED
CRACKED
CRACKED

BENT

BUCKLED /
CRACKED

CRACKED
BENT
CRACKED

TO REPAIR SEE

LABOUR
MISSING
MISSING
MTG CRACKED
MTG CRACKED

CRACKED
CRACKED

CRACKED

SHORTED

DENTED

Report Ref No. CC4/ASM18022518/Kpa3q2

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3567 FAX: G256 4315
Reg No 199807198R GST Reg. Mo. 19-9807198-R
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SMJ 2024L

474 40 474 40
1,082.80 1,082.80
110.70 110.70
44 00 44 00
35.50 35.50
458 40 459 40
353.50 353.50
294 80 294 BO
44 .00 44 00
454 B0
28.00 28.00
28.00 28.00
86420 68420
664.20 BE4 20
157.20 15720
29.40 29 40|
29.40 2940
299.00 299.00
- -959.70
1,050.64 -
6,303.74 3.838.80
120.00 80.00
120.00 80.00




, ” V LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Sda BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL 6256 3561 FAX. 6256 4315
Reg. No 199680T198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page Mo 20f 2

FRONT & REAR SPRAY PAINTING. B0O.0O 600.00
FRONT & REAR PANEL BEATING FOR REPLACE AND 1,200.00 700.00
REPAIR AFFECTED PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR
OF PANEL ASSY -BACK

2,000.00 1,300.00
GRAND TOTAL 8.423.74 5,228.80

ASr

KONG SENG CHEONG
Licensed Appraiser

MSCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES: Tnis Report is mase solahy for fhe uas and benefit of ihe Client named an the front page of this fepan.
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