Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Friday, 26 March 2021 10:02 AM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A; MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YN 2190B & YQ 8899K ON 02/11/2019 *** LKK REF :

CC4/LPC19022504/rb3 [External General]

Lonpac External - General
Hi Jasline

Noted with thanks. You may proceed to close the file.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555

Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt practices.

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) [mailto:jaslinkok@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 26 March 2021 10:00 AM

To: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YN 2190B & YQ 8899K ON 02/11/2019 *** LKK REF : CC4/LPC19022504/rb3 [External
General]

Dear Li Li

There’s no bill incurred.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Friday, 26 March 2021 9:58 AM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; MT_Claim_SG <mt claim@]lonpac.com>
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Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YN 2190B & YQ 8899K ON 02/11/2019 *** LKK REF : CC4/LPC19022504/rb3 [External
General]

Lonpac External - General
Dear Jaslin

Ok, so is there any bill incurred at your end?

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555

Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt practices.

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) [mailto:jaslinkok@I|kkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 26 March 2021 9:45 AM

To: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YN 2190B & YQ 8899K ON 02/11/2019 *** LKK REF : CC4/LPC19022504/rb3

Dear Li Li
Third Party did not arrange to survey vehicle till date.
Attached TP’s workshop email for your reference.

Kindly let us have your approval to close file.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 15 March 2021 4:35 PM

To: June Phua ( Cheng Hoe Motor)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YQ 8899K & YN 2190B ON 02/11/2019
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

There’s no survey done till date.
Kindly advise if your client is still claiming.

Kindly let us have your client’s decision within 10 days from the date of this e-mail. Otherwise, we will proceed to
close file at our end.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 10 March 2021 2:08 PM

To: June Phua ( Cheng Hoe Motor) <chmotor@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YQ 8899K & YN 2190B ON 02/11/2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

There’s no survey done till date.

Kindly advise if your client is still claiming.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 12 January 2021 12:49 PM

To: June Phua ( Cheng Hoe Motor) <chmotor@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YQ 8899K & YN 2190B ON 02/11/2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
There’s no survey done till date.

Kindly advise if your client is still claiming.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



