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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Mandy Lim <Mandy@ltm.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 20 August 2020 9:25 AM
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto); 'motor claims Dept'
Cc: 'venus'; Admin A
Subject: RE: DV Submission for  TP (AIG), Our client SLR 1821 D, AIG Insured SKH 6859 C 

DOA 15.12.2019 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIG19022450/Kha3 
Attachments: 19082020192604-0001.pdf

Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Jasper, 
 
Thank you for the DV. 
 
Enclosed the signed, endorsed and completed DV for your principal early payment. 
 
Thank you and regards, 
 

Mandy Lim 
 
Lim Tan Motor Pte Ltd 
 
www. LTM.sg 
+65 6452 0893 (Office) 
+65 6458 9127 (Facsimile) 
 

Like us in Facebook!! 
www.facebook.com/LTMsg 
www.facebook.com/LTM.Performance.Singapore 
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From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) [mailto:jasperchua@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, August 19, 2020 4:19 PM 
To: Mandy Lim; 'motor claims Dept' 
Cc: 'venus'; Admin A 
Subject: RE: Reminder Claim Submission for TP (AIG), Our client SLR 1821 D, AIG Insured SKH 6859 C 
DOA 15.12.2019 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIG19022450/Kha3  
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
Thank you for acceptance. 
 
Please duly sign the DV enclosed and return document to us (LKK) for our necessary action. 
 
Thank you. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / 
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the 
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Mandy Lim <Mandy@ltm.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 19 August 2020 4:06 PM 
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com>; 'motor claims Dept' <motorclaims@ltm.sg> 
Cc: 'venus' <venus@ltm.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Reminder Claim Submission for TP (AIG), Our client SLR 1821 D, AIG Insured SKH 6859 C 
DOA 15.12.2019 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIG19022450/Kha3  
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Jasper, 
 
Your offer accepted. 
 
Pls forward the DV as usual. 
 
Thank you and regards, 
 

Mandy Lim 
 
Lim Tan Motor Pte Ltd 
 
www. LTM.sg 
+65 6452 0893 (Office) 
+65 6458 9127 (Facsimile) 
 

Like us in Facebook!! 
www.facebook.com/LTMsg 
www.facebook.com/LTM.Performance.Singapore 
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From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) [mailto:jasperchua@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, August 19, 2020 12:24 PM 
To: Mandy; 'motor claims Dept' 
Cc: 'venus'; Admin A 
Subject: RE: Reminder Claim Submission for TP (AIG), Our client SLR 1821 D, AIG Insured SKH 6859 C 
DOA 15.12.2019 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIG19022450/Kha3  
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
GENTLE REMINDER  
 
Thanks  
 
 
Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Monday, 3 August 2020 2:34 PM 
To: Mandy <mandy@ltm.sg>; 'motor claims Dept' <motorclaims@ltm.sg> 
Cc: 'venus' <venus@ltm.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Reminder Claim Submission for TP (AIG), Our client SLR 1821 D, AIG Insured SKH 6859 C 
DOA 15.12.2019 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIG19022450/Kha3  
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
Thank you for your email. 
 
We propose a settlement at a global sum of $5,750.00(all-in). 
 
Please confirm acceptance. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / 
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the 
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Mandy <mandy@ltm.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, 30 July 2020 11:10 AM 
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com>; 'motor claims Dept' <motorclaims@ltm.sg>; 
'AIG SGP, CCU Referral' <AIGSGPCCUReferral@aig.com> 
Cc: 'venus' <venus@ltm.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
<chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Reminder Claim Submission for TP (AIG), Our client SLR 1821 D, AIG Insured SKH 6859 C 
DOA 15.12.2019 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIG19022450/Kha3  
Importance: High 
 
WITHOUT PREJUIDCE / URGENT 
 
Dear Jasper, 
 
Your email refers. 
 
Any new from your Principal for settlement. 
 
 
Thank you and regards, 
 

Mandy Lim 
 
Lim Tan Motor Pte Ltd 
 
www. LTM.sg 
+65 6452 0893 (Office) 
+65 6458 9127 (Facsimile) 
 

Like us in Facebook!! 
www.facebook.com/LTMsg 
www.facebook.com/LTM.Performance.Singapore 
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From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) [mailto:jasperchua@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Monday, 20 July, 2020 4:06 PM 
To: Mandy <mandy@ltm.sg>; 'motor claims Dept' <motorclaims@ltm.sg> 
Cc: 'venus' <venus@ltm.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
<chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Reminder Claim Submission for TP (AIG), Our client SLR 1821 D, AIG Insured SKH 6859 C 
DOA 15.12.2019 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIG19022450/Kha3  
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE  
 
Dear Mandy, 
 
Please be informed that we are currently pending for mandate approval from our principal. 
 
We will get back to you for an update/offer in due course. 
 
Thank you. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / 
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the 
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Mandy <mandy@ltm.sg>  
Sent: Monday, 20 July 2020 3:36 PM 
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com>; 'motor claims Dept' <motorclaims@ltm.sg> 
Cc: 'venus' <venus@ltm.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
<chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Reminder Claim Submission for TP (AIG), Our client SLR 1821 D, AIG Insured SKH 6859 C 
DOA 15.12.2019 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIG19022450/Kha3  
Importance: High 
 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE / URGENT 
  

 Dear Jasper, 
 
We refer to your email to you dated 11th Jun 2020 which we had not hear from you since your last email to us. 
 
Please advised if your principal had given you mandate for settlement. 
 
Please revert. 
 
Thank you and regards, 
 

Mandy Lim 
 
Lim Tan Motor Pte Ltd 
 
www. LTM.sg 
+65 6452 0893 (Office) 
+65 6458 9127 (Facsimile) 
 

Like us in Facebook!! 
www.facebook.com/LTMsg 
www.facebook.com/LTM.Performance.Singapore 
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From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) [mailto:jasperchua@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Thursday, 11 June, 2020 11:23 AM 
To: Mandy <mandy@ltm.sg>; 'motor claims Dept' <motorclaims@ltm.sg> 
Cc: 'venus' <venus@ltm.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
<chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Claim Submission for TP (AIG), Our client SLR 1821 D, AIG Insured SKH 6859 C DOA 
15.12.2019 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIG19022450/Kha3  
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Mandy, 
 
Thank you for the email. 
 
Please be informed that we are currently seeking for mandate approval to our principal. 
 
We will get back to you for an update/offer in due course. 
 
Thank you. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / 
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the 
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
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Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Mandy <mandy@ltm.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 10 June 2020 3:45 PM 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; 'motor claims Dept' <motorclaims@ltm.sg>; Jasper 
Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: 'venus' <venus@ltm.sg>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Claim Submission for TP (AIG), Our client SLR 1821 D, AIG Insured SKH 6859 C DOA 
15.12.2019 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIG19022450/Kha3  
 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
Dear Jasper, 
 
In reference to the above claim, we hereby now enclosed the Letter of Demand for your necessary action. 
 
Please look into our client’s claim and seek mandate from your principal to revert with a proposed offer 
soonest. 
 
Please acknowledge receipt and we look forward hearing from you soonest. 
 
Thank you and regards, 
 

Mandy Lim 
 
Lim Tan Motor Pte Ltd 
 
www. LTM.sg 
+65 6452 0893 (Office) 
+65 6458 9127 (Facsimile) 
 

Like us in Facebook!! 
www.facebook.com/LTMsg 
www.facebook.com/LTM.Performance.Singapore 
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From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Saturday, 2 May, 2020 12:05 PM 
To: motor claims Dept <motorclaims@ltm.sg>; Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: 'Mandy' <mandy@ltm.sg>; 'venus' <venus@ltm.sg>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; 
Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: RE : TP (AIG), Our client SLR 1821 D, AIG Insured SKH 6859 C DOA 15.12.2019 *** 
LKK REF: CC4/AIG19022450/Kha3  
 
Dear Sir / Madam, 
 
Thank you for your email. 
 
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course. 
 
Hi Jasper, 
 
Kindly assist. 
 
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via 
email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much 
regretted. 
 

Thank you. 
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Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: motor claims Dept [mailto:motorclaims@ltm.sg]  
Sent: Saturday, 2 May 2020 11:28 AM 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) 
Cc: 'Mandy'; 'venus' 
Subject: RE : TP (AIG), Our client SLR 1821 D, AIG Insured SKH 6859 C DOA 15.12.2019 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Hi Ms Mei Kwan, 
 
Please revert on the OIC and reference number. 
 
 
Thank you and regards, 
 

Tina 
Motor Claim Department  
 
www. LTM.sg 
+65 6452 0893 (Office) 
+65 6458 9127 (Facsimile) 
+65 9159 1616 (Mobile) 
 

Like us in Facebook!! 
www.facebook.com/LTMsg 
www.facebook.com/LTM.Performance.Singapore 
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