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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 26 December 2019 2:02 PM

To: Claims: Admin A; SUR

Cc: (nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg); (boojohnny@gmail.com)
Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SGB 9029 R ON 19/12/2019, VEH IN
Dear TRoy.

As instructed by our client , please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SGB 9029R (Excess 50/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel:
6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company
before completion of the repair.

#Our client reserve their rights not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

NOTE: Before paint photos for Front Bumper, Front Fender RH and Bonnet required.

AIG OIC-Azlan, Syazairdina] syazairdina.azlan@aig.com

Best Regards,

veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 26 December 2019 9:39 AM

To: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=>
Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SGB 9029 R ON 19,/12/2019, VEH IN

Dear TRoy,
Pending approval from AIG, have gave them a chaser.

Once approved will send you email.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315



Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

Erom: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 26 December 2019 8:52 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Ce: 'Claims’ <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SGB 9029 R ON 19/12/201%, VEH IN

Dear Veron,

Any update from AIG?
Thanks

Best Regards,

TRoy Goh

Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (regne tossamiw

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408695

p. +65 6388 2323 d. 465 H768 9828 f. +65 6841 1133

e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg W, www.audi.com.sg

audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6B36

“It comes in blue.”

2223

The new Audi A7 Sportback. Do you really need a reason?

Ernail Disclaimer

This email, including any attac mment, i confidential and may also be privileged
f yau have recaived it in error, please natify us immadiately by rep ly email and then deteta this message tram your sysiem
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disciose its contents or any attachment 10 any othar person. Thank you.

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 24 December 2019 11:38 AM

To: Claims; Admin A; SUR
Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SGB 9029 R ON 19/12/2019, VEH IN

Dear TRoy,

Pending approval from AIG.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)
2



From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 24 December 2019 11:01 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SGB 9029 R ON 19/12/2019, VEH IN

Dear All,
Any update on this?
Thanks

Best Regards,
TRoy Goh
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd e no tssscrin

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408693

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 QfZE f. +65 6841 1183
e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg  w. www.audi.com.sg
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alesandra Road Singapore 159935 p. +65 6836 2223

m . e LY |

“It comes in blue.” ==

The new Audi A7 Sportback. Do you really need o reason?

Find out mara :

Email Disclalmer
This ematl, including any attachmaent, is confidential and may also be provilagad
f viou have recalved it in error, please notify us immadiately by reply email and then delete this message trom your system

Please do not copy it or use it far any purpose, or disclose its contents or any stiachment 1o any oiher person. Thank you.

From: Claims [mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sd

Sent: Monday, 23 December 2019 11:3% AM

To: "Admin A'; 'SUR

Cc: 'Claims'

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR 5GB 9029 R ON 19/12/2015, VEH IN

Dear all,

Kindly assist and advise the mentioned claims for approval and who is the case handler for this case.

Thanks

Best Regards,
TRoy Goh
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (e e sz
55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699



p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9828 f. +65 6841 1183
e. claims@premiumauto.cOMm.SE W, WWW.3udl.COM.58
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 1559938 p.

+65 GA3G 2223

The new Audl A7 Sportback. Do you reatly need are

Find out more

Email Disclaimer

This amail, inciuding any attachment, is Car fidential ard m: be pr g e
If wou have received it in error, please notify us immediat z an i 2
Please do not copy it of use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents af any attachmant b ar ank you

From: Claims [mailto:claims@premiumauto com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 23 December 2019 9:10 AM

To: 'Admin A'; "SUR'

Cc: 'Claims’

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SGB 9029 R ON 19/12/2019, VEH IN

Dear all,

survey was done by last week, herein attached the estimate repair and video footage for your next action.
Kindly assist and advise the claim status for approval.

Thanks

Best Regards,

TRoy Goh

Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd jme no 1sssoazrw)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408609

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9828 f, +65 6841 1183

e. claims@premiumauto.COM.SE W, Www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 158338 p. +65 6836 2223

“1t comes |n bl.ue.

The new Addl A7 Sportback. Do you really need a reas n?
Find out more

Ernall Disclaimer
This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged
f ywou have received itin error, please not fy s immediately by reply email and then dedete this message [ram your systemn

Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment 10 a0y pther parson. Thank you.



From; Claims [mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sq]

Sent: Thursday, 19 December 2019 6:01 PM

To: 'Admin A'; "SUR'

Cc: 'Claims’

Subject: OD CLAIM FOR SGB 9029 R ON 19/12/2019, VEH IN

Dear all,

Kindly assist to register this case mentioned. Herein attached with the GlA Report
for your reference.

For the estimate repair will forward to you once is available.
Please arrange the survey on tomorrow 20/12/2019@Veh IN our compound.

Thanks

Best Regards,
TRoy Goh
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd meg vo 1osscaiiiw

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408633

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 5828 f, +65 6841 1183

e. claims@ premiumauto.com.sg  w. www.audi.com.sg

audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 158938 p.

S1x comég |n bll:le.

The new Audi A7 Sportback. Do you really need a reason?

+65 6836 2223

Email Disclaimer
This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privilegad.
f you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then deleta this message from your system

Please da not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose Its contents o any attachment to any other person. Thank you.



12/26/2019 Merimen e-Claims

View Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SGBO029R (83141240435G)
oD
Dec 19 2019 8:25AM
[LIM KIM HEONG]
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Reply | Fic_p;.illj Marﬁ .a.‘.;.anread E Print M_essagE | Delete Message ] Fwwarl:l- I__

From ALG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd. (AIG_SG), sent on 261272019 13:02 PM,
To LKK_HQ

Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$28019.50) - SGBI029R - Claim Handler: Azlan, Syazairdina

Apprweu:isn19,50:R&-Insbecu:m for checked / hidden items: supplementary require with CLEAR photos upload in Merimen on the same day once
vehicle dismantle parts, and re-seek mandate. Before paint photos for Front Bumper, Front Fender AH and Bonn

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY ' ' o o
There are no documents.

hitps://singapere.merimen.com/claims/i ndex.cfm?fusebox=SVCmai&fuseaction=dsp_view&mode=1&iinboxid=16051128iDomainld=11&i0bjld=1... 112




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Email: Mora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg / claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Telefax

Estimate :  Accident Repairs
Workshop *  UbiRoad 1l

Contact No T 63662323

Fax No . 6841 1183

Reference : PA/OD/1487/2019/7G
Date : 20-Dec-19

Vehicle IN workshop. Kindly arrange for survey.

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

78 Shenton Way
#07-16 AIG Building
Singapore 079120

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept
Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315

Owner's Name
Address

Telephone
Type of Claim
Policy No.

Vehicle No

Model Code
Model / Year
Engine No
Chassis No
Mileage

Date In
Estimated By
Accident Date
Place of Accident

Mr. Lim Kim Heong
552 Pasir Ris 5T 51
#13-83

Singapore 510552
(HP) +65 96781621
Own Damage Claims
1B00075552-01

SGB 9029 R

A4 Sedan 2.0 TFSI BW
28/6/2018

CVK 061907
WAUZZZF46)A170965

24789 KM

19-Dec-19

Johnny Boo / Allan Wu
19-Dec-19

Carpark At Blk 552 Pasir Ris 5t 51

WIP: 23558



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 4086599

Telb: 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183 "
Teléfax
Estimated Labour Charges for Accident Vehicle SGB 9029 R
Estimated Surveyor's
s/n Mature of Jobs Charges Recommendations

1 To tow and recover vehicle from scene of /N & 280.00 X 4

accident. W
2 Tp carry out first measurement test on car o- S/N S 800.00 / d‘dﬁ "
liner. . .

To remove, check and reinstall front wire

harness for headlights, hur_n5, outside S/N & 480.00 /
temperature sensor, headlight washer assy and

front parking aid.

To remove and renew aircon condenser, charged

air cooler, Iradlatnr. ('._heck eigctrlcal fans and S/IN S 1,200.00 /
control unit. Pressurise cooling system. To carry

out vacuum and regas.

To remove and reinstall engine assy with
R j , /N 2,800.00
gearbox assy to facillitate car o-liner repairs. 5 s fj’\/t'/ o

To remove and reinstall front suspension assy 9
6 with subframe to facillitate car o-liner repairs. S/N $ 2,400.00 //;3 hM‘é X

Inspect for damages and renew if necessary.

SUB TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES : 5 7,960.00




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax

Estimated Labour Charges for Accident Vehicle SGB 9029 R

5/n

Mature of Jobs

Estimated
Cha rges

Surveyor's
Recommendations

7

8

/

10

11

12

To place vehicle on car o-liner.

To dismantle rhs front door panel trim. To
remove and reinstall rhs wing mirror assy.

£,
To dismantle and renew fropt bumper, bonnet,
both front fenders, rhs headlight. Cut gut and
reweld rhs fender su F(Einrt and clasinﬁelement.

Align both front chassis frames to specification .

of origin. Renew front lock carrier and align to
position. Re-organise front crash management
compeonents. Reinstall all parts removed.

/ e ~
Tu'?Epra}r front bumper, both front fenders,
borinet, rhs upper A-pillar, engine
compartment, rhs front fender top support and
rhs front door. To carry out joint selant work
and stone chip treatment.

To renew rhs front rim and rhs front tyre, To
carry out wheel alignment.

To carry out diagnostic checks

TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES

S/IN § 2,400.00

S/N 5 3,000.00

4.5

5 8,050.00

5 6,900.00

S/N S 280.00

S/IN & 152.00

S 28,782.00

/?' Plv{‘cf n N

X ~/NS

{)So.



Premium Automobiles
55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183
Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SBGB 9029 R

Damaged Parts & Prices

S/N Parts Description S/Nett Remarks
1 FRONTBUMPER .~ 9, NN 5 1,999.00

2 FRONT BUMPER FIXING PARTS < e S 258.00

3 FRONT BUMPER SECURING STRIP - s 32.00

4 FRONT BUMPER GRILLE - CENTER ,; fa N/L/ 3 178.00

5 FRONT BUMPER CLOSING ELEMENT - LOWER CENTRE 7/?‘( s A//I/IQI.GD

6 FRONTBUMPERAIRGUIDE-RH .~ 45 ¥i'% $ 56.00

7 RADIATORGRILLE -~ g N’ s 2,015.00

8 FRONT BUMPER AIR GUIDE GRILLE - LH/RH (L'H x M 5 665.00 33>-5o
9  FRONTBUMPER CARRIER 7 +K /‘/MH e 5 g 733.00

10 FRONT BUMPER BRACKET MOUNTING-RH .~ (/S - s 34.00

11 FRONT BUMPER TOPCOVER .~ AR . 5 116.00

12 FOAMFILLER PIECE _~ uﬁA - 3 113.00

13 CAUTION SIGN STICKER .~ S A¢ S 13.00 &l
14  AIRCON STICKER 3 7.00
@ FRONT BUMPER LOCK CARRIER BRACKET{«" Cﬁfdg $ 125.00

16  FRONT BUMPER SUPPORT - LH / RH 3 51.00

17  FRONT BUMPER PARKING AID SENSOR ,z‘zﬂ 7?{\ 2 s 462.00

18  SEALRING AL, 4 s 12.00 W
19 FRONT BUMPER WIRING SET 7 A ﬂ/N s 470.00

20 HORNS - LOW TONE RIGHT ?/ ){ S s 262.00

SUB TOTAL SPARE PARTS v 5 7,792.00




Premium Automobiles
55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SGB 9029 R

Damaged Parts & Prices

S/N  Parts Description S/Nett Remarks
21 SPRING SHACKLE - RH 7/- A /UN $ 26.00
22 FRONTFENDER-RH _~ A% 5 700.00
23 FRONT FENDER ATTACHEMENT PARTS < A ~ $ 183.00
24  FRONT FENDER CLOSING ELEMENT -RH ~~ % $ 45.00
25  FRONT FENDER BRACKET-RH -~ Ls 32.00
26  FRONT FENDER DEFORMATION BRACKET -RH .~ $ 45.00
27  FRONT FENDER BRACKET - LH/RH - S 29.00
28 FRONTFENDERBRACE-RH _~ M S 107.00
29 FRONT WHEEL HOUSING LINER-RH -~ 1 //As/ 220.00
30 WHEEL HOUSING LINER ATTACHMENT PARTS P}ﬁ -5 82.00
31 FRONTWHEELSPOILER .~ WS TBC
32 FRONT FENDER TRIM PLATE S A C 5 33.00
33  STONE CHIP GUARD-RH .~ S 46.00
34 BONNET -~ i $  2,554.00
35  BONNET ATTACHEMENT pARTs X AN S 111.00
36  IMPACT PROTECTION - CENTER _~ 4 bc S 25.00
37  IMPACT PROCTECTION - LH/RH 5 g 50.00
38 FRONTFENDER LEDGE COVER-RH .~ [} S 28.00
39  FRONT FENDER PROTECTION FILM-RH _— 4 . S 21.00
40  STRIKER - RH / A /\’/l/ 5 46.00

SUB TOTAL SPARE PARTS $ 4,383.00




Premium Automobiles
55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408659
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 68411183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SGB 9029 R

Damaged Parts & Prices

S/N  Parts Description S/Nett Remarks
a1 BonneTLDLOCK /) X 5 w\/ s 196.00

42 BOWDEN CABLE - CENTER ﬁ(;{ $ 53.00

43  BRACKET FOR CONNECTOR HOUSING R $ 9.00

44  CABLE CLIP COVER (V T $ 9.00

45  HOOK RELEASE CABLE S 53.00

46  HOOK RELEASE COVER 7 i 3 12.00

47  LID LOCK CABLE 3 67.00

48  PLENUM CHAMBER /6 $ 89.00

49  FRONT FENDER LEDGE COVER-RH e $ 56.00 >
50  BONNET INSULATION )\ﬂ@@ X NN s 311.00

51 FRONTLED HEADLIGHT-RH ~~ W15 5 7,087.00

52 POWERMODULE-RH /7 % i s 716.00

53 CONTROLUNIT-RH /7 yoo @M\ $ 685.00

54  HEADLIGHT HOSE - RH ?/‘ri FVEA 5 32.00

55  REPAIR KIT FOR HEADLAMP HOUSING - RH /? XNV g 120.00

56  LIFTCYLINDER-RH " f $ 192.00

57  LIFT CYLINDER BRACKET-RH .~ #GC . 5 6.00

58  CORRUGATED PIPE 7/ « 5 83.00

59  CORRUGATED PIPE FOR WASHER NOZzZLE/ /% ﬂ//l/s 35.00

60 s 228.00

CONNECTING PLATE - RH ./)/x

SUB TOTAL SPARE PARTS

$ 10,039.00




Premium Automobiles
55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408695
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SGB 9029 R

Damaged Parts & Prices
S/N  Parts Description S/Nett Remarks
61  CONNECTING PLATE - RH //f R g ,{/'ﬂ/ $ 197.00
62 WHEELHOUSING-RH  >< &% » s 54.00
63  RADIATOR SUPPORT PANEL 7 A . S 928.00 I+
64 RAFIATOR SUPPORT BRACKET .~ f}T 3 69.00
65 HOOK RELEASE CABLE ?/ A s 53.00
66  A/C CONDENSER 7/ A Nl/ s 568.00
67 RADIATOR ¥ N S 676.00
68 COOLANT e 4 S 84.00
69 RADIATOR RUBBER BUSH-LOWER /2 | 2 S 17.00
70 RADIATOR RUBBER BUSH - LOWER 7 | NA} 5 24.00
71 INTERCOOLER ﬁ' [ . $ 535.00
72  PRESSURE HOSE - RH /7 5 320.00
73  EXTERNAL TEMPERATURE SENSOR /} S 54.00
4} TEMPERATURE SENSOR BRACKET /ffn/ f)R , 5 17.00
75  ENGINE COOLING FA 7, T 5 242.00
76  COOLING FAN ﬂy ; s 2,107.00
77  RADIATOR AIR GUIDE - RH / PR /WV 5 25.00
78  RADIATOR AIR GUIDE - LOWER RH ﬁ’ | s 11.00
79  RADIATOR AIR GUIDE - UPPER RH 4" | 5 15.00
80 RADIATOR AIR GUIDE - LOWER EH p/ - s 19.00
SUB TOTAL SPARE PARTS $ 6,015.00




Premium Automobiles
55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408659
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SGB 9029 R

Damaged Parts & Prices
S/N Parts Description S/Nett Remarks

a1  INTAKEAIROUCT-RH /)] 5 19.00
B2 EMGINE AIR GUIDE % S 48.00
83  AIR FILTER HOUSING 7 s MM 5 339.00
84  AIRMASSMETER /] S 533.00
85  INTAKE HOSE 7 s 85.00
86 CLAMP ry 3 8.00
87 FRONTFENDER-LH X $ 700.00
88 FRONT FENDER COVER-LH XK N,\/ s 228.00
89  FENDER COVER - LH 7( S 21.00
90 STONECHIPGUARD-LH % S 46.00
91  FRONT ALUMINIUMRIM-RH ,~ A 5 651.00
92 RUBBERVALVE .~ /- 4 s 13.00
93  FRONT WISH BONE LINK - RH /" 3 491.00
94  TRACK CONTROL ARM - RH / S 861.00
95  FRONT UPPER CONTROL ARM GUIDE - RH 7/ 5 466.00
96  FRONT UPPER CONTROL ARM - RH/ Ly /s 466.00
97  WHEEL BEARING HOUSING -RH  / 5 884.00
98  BALLJOINT - RH { 175.00
99 WHEELHUB-RH /I S 451.00
100  BALL BEARING - RH%' 5 232.00
SUB TOTAL SPARE PARTS : § 6,717.00




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax /},ksﬁ\
VS -

Name et Acthericed

Surveyed Date : 3‘) % ~ 52'

Authorised Date : \ o -

Excess Cost : é”‘/( L4 & ﬂnro

Liability

Remarks oM P L"—(’OS ‘*
bef |

’10/@/!,? :

Please Note :  This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle.
Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Norah Khai at
Tel:6768 9828 for appointment.

I_' K Aulo Consyllants hence notify
Yours faithfully, oty camagod ot e
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd phialyly TR -
i i A ¥ - B Fey :l’d
-hﬂ ;:i:-._q:J,_ al fr rgLr ompany
Acknowledged by Repainer
Shgnature;
Johnny Boo Allan Wu

Body Repair Manager Claims Consultant



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 68411183
Email: Nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg / claims@premiumauto.com.sg

WIP : 23558

Telefax

Estimate Accident Repairs
Workshop Ubi Road 1

Contact No 6366 2323

Fax No 6841 1183
Reference PA/OD/1497/2019/TG
Date 20-Dec-18

Vehicle IN workshop. Kindly arrange for survey.

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

78 Shenton Way

#07-16 AIG Building

Singapore 079120

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept

Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315

Owner's Name

Mr. Lim Kim Heong

Address 552 Pasir Ris ST 51
#13-83
Singapore 5105852
Telephone (HP) +65 96781621
Type of Claim Own Damage Claims
Policy No. 1800075552-01
Vehicle No SGB 9029 R
Model Code Ad Sedan 2.0 TFSI 8BW
Model | Year 28/6/2018
Engine No CVK 081807
Chassis No WAUZZZF46JA170965
Mileage 24789 KM
Date In 19-Dec-18
Estimated By Johnny Boo / Allan Wu

Accident Date
Place of Accident

19-Dec-19

Hi Guo Qiang gt
1 1'#&]& exclude 2 Sundays 1 PH

jb 26 Feb 20

Carpark At Blk 552 Pasir Ris 5t 51



Premium Automobiles
55 Ubi Road 1, Sjnrgapnre 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 6541 11583

Telefax

Estimated Labour Charges for Accident Vehicle SGB 9029 R

Estimated Surveyor's
Sin Mature of Jobs Charges ecommendations
1 Totow and recover vehicle from scene of accident. S/N 280.00 NA
2 To carry out first measurement test on car o-liner.  S/N 800.00 NA
To remove, check and reinstall front wire harness
3 for headlights, horns, outside temperature sensor, SN 480.00 b 480.00
headlight washer assy and front parking aid.
To remove and renew aircon condenser, charged
4 r mler._raﬂlator. ;heck ei.ectncal fans and SN 1.200.00 s 1,200.00
control unit. Pressurise cooling system. To carry
out vacuum and regas.
5 Ta remove_a_nd remsta!l_angina assy with gearbaox S/N 2.800.00 NA
assy to facillitate car o-liner repairs.
To remove and reinstall front suspension assy with
7 subframe to facillitate car o-liner repairs. Inspect SIN 2.400.00 NA
for damages and renew if necessary.
SUB TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES : 7,960.00 § 1,680.00




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408698
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax: 5841 1183

Telefax

Estimated Labour Charges for Accident Vehicle SGB 9029 R

Estimated Surveyor's
S/n Nature of Jobs Charges 'ecommendation
§ 1,680.00
7 Toplace vehicle on car o-liner. SN 3 2.400.00 NA
q To dismantle rhs front door panel trim. To remove SIN § 3.000.00 NA

and reinstall rhs wing mirror assy.

To dismantle and renew front bumper, bonnet, both
front fenders, rhs headlight. Cut out and reweld rhs
fender support and closing element. Align both
9 front chassis frames to specification of origin. 3 8,050.00 g 4,750.00
Renew front lock carrier and align to position. Re-
organise front crash management components.
Reinstall all parts removed.

To respray front bumper, both front fenders,
bannet, rhs upper A-pillar, engine compartment, rhs

W front fender top support and rhs front door. To carry $ S.800.00 $ 165000
out joint selant work and stone chip treatment.

1 To renew rhls front rim and rhs front tyre. To carry SN § 28000 s 280.00
out wheel alignment.

12 To carry out diagnostic checks SN 5 182.00 5 192.00

TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES : $ 28,782.00 § 8,552.00




Premium Automobiles
55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699

Tel - 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183
Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SBGE 9029 R

Damaged Pa ri
SIN Parts Description S/Nett Remarks
1 FRONT BUMPER s 1,999.00 §  1,599.20
2 FRONT BUMPER FIXING PARTS $ 258.00
3 FRONT BUMPER SECURING STRIP 5 32.00 § 25.44
4 FRONT BUMPER GRILLE - CENTER 5 178.00
5 FRONT BUMPER CLOSING ELEMENT - LOWER CENTRE s 191.00
6 FRONT BUMPER AIR GUIDE - RH $ 5600 § 44.40
7 RADIATOR GRILLE $ 201500 §  1,612.00
8 FRONT BUMPER AIR GUIDE GRILLE - LH/RH a4 5 665.00 5 266.00
g FRONT BUMPER CARRIER 3 733.00
10 FRONT BUMPER BRACKET MOUNTING - RH - 34.00 3 27.12
11 FRONT BUMPER TOP COVER $ 11600 § 92.40
12 FOAM FILLER PIECE $ 113.00 § 90.40
13 CAUTION SIGN STICKER $ 1300 § 9.76
14 AIRCON STICKER $ 700 8 512
15 FRONT BUMPER LOCK CARRIER BRACKET B 125.00 3 100.00
16 FRONT BUMPER SUPPORT - LH/RH 2 % 51.00
17 FRONT BUMPER PARKING AID SENSOR 2 3 462.00
18 SEAL RING 4 3% 1200 § 10.24
19 FRONT BUMPER WIRING SET $ 470.00
20 HORNS - LOW TONE RIGHT 5 262.00

SUB TOTAL SPARE PARTS - 7,792.00 $ 3,882.08




Premium Automobiles
55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SGB 9029 R

Damaged Part Pri

S/IN  Parts Description SiNett Remarks
c/f 3 3,882.08
21 SPRING SHACKLE - RH $ 26.00
22 FRONT FENDER - RH 5 700.00 3 559.60
23 FRONT FENDER ATTACHEMENT PARTS 5 183.00
24  FRONT FENDER CLOSING ELEMENT - RH ] 45.00 3 36.00
25 FRONT FENDER BRACKET - RH $ 32.00 g 2520
26 FRONT FEMDER DEFORMATION BRACKET - RH 5 45.00 3 35.60
27  FRONT FEMNDER BRACKET - LH/RH $ 28.00 ] 22.64
28 FRONT FENDER BRACE - RH 5 107.00 3 85.60
29  FRONT WHEEL HOUSING LINER - RH 5 22000  § 175.60
30 WHEEL HOUSING LINER ATTACHMENT PARTS $ 82.00
31 FRONT WHEEL SPOILER $ 6540 § 52.32
32 FRONT FENDER TRIM PLATE $ 3300 s 25.84
33 STONE CHIP GUARD - RH $ 4600 § 36.64
34 BONNET $ 255400 § 2,043.20
35 BONNET ATTACHEMENT PARTS 5 111.00
36 IMPACT PROTECTICN - CENTER 3 25.00 § 19.76
37  IMPACT PROCTECTION - LH/EH 2 3 20.00 3 39.68
38 FRONT FENDER LEDGE COVER - RH 3 28.00 ] 22.24
39 FRONT FENDER PROTECTION FILM - RH 5 21.00 5 16.16
40  STRIKER - RH 3 46.00

SUB TOTAL SPARE PARTS . 4,448.40 $§ 7,078.16




Premium Automobiles
55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408655
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SGB 9029 R

Damaged Parts & Prices

S/IN  Parts Description SiNett Remarks
c/f 3 7,078.16
41  BONNET LID LOCK 3 196.00
42 BOWDEN CABLE - CENTER 3 53.00
43 BRACKET FOR CONNECTOR HOUSING 3 9.00 5 6.88
44 CABLE CLIP COVER $ 9.00
45 HOOK RELEASE CABLE 3 53.00
46 HOOK RELEASE COVER $ 12.00
47 LID LOCK CABLE g 67.00
48  PLENUM CHAMBER 3 89.00
49 FRONT FENDER LEDGE COVER - RH 3 56.00 s 44.24
50 BONNET INSULATION 3 311.00
51 FRONT LED HEADLIGHT - RH ] 7,087.00 3 5,669.60
52 POWER MODULE - RH 3 716.00
53 CONTROL UNIT - RH $ 68500 § 548.00
54  HEADLIGHT HOSE - RH 5 32.00
55 REPAIR KIT FOR HEADLAMP HOUSING - RH 3 120.00
56  LIFT CYLINDER -RH $ 19200 8 153.20
57 LIFT CYLINDER BRACKET - RH 5 6.00 5 4.24
58 CORRUGATED PIPE & 83.00
59 CORRUGATED PIPE FOR WASHER NOZZLE & 35.00
60 CONNECTING PLATE - RH 5 228.00
SUB TOTAL SPARE PARTS $ 10,039.00 $§ 13,504.32




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax : 6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SGB 9029 R

Damaged Parts & Prices

S/N___ Parts Description S/Nett Remarks
cif 5 13,504.32
61 CONNECTING PLATE - RH 5 197.00
62 WHEEL HOUSING - RH $ 54.00
63 RADIATOR SUPPORT PANEL B 528.00 § 742.00
64 RAFIATOR SUPPORT BRACKET 3 69.00 ] 54.72
65 HOOK RELEASE CABLE 3 53.00
66 A/C CONDENSER 3 568.00
67 RADIATOR 5 676.00
68 COOLANT 5 84.00 $ 67.20
69 RADIATOR RUBBER BUSH - LOWER $ 17.00
70 RADIATOR RUBBER BUSH - LOWER 3 24.00
71 INTERCOOLER $ 535.00
72 PRESSURE HOSE - RH 3 320.00
73 EXTERNAL TEMPERATURE SENSOR b 54.00
74 TEMPERATURE SENSOR BRACKET 3 17.00 3 13.04
75 ENGINE COOLING FAN 3 242.00
76  COOLING FAN 2 2,107.00
77 RADIATOR AIR GUIDE - RH 5 25.00
78 RADIATOR AIR GUIDE - LOWER RH 5 11.00
79  RADIATOR AIR GUIDE - UPPER RH 3 15.00
80 RADIATOR AIR GUIDE - LOWER EH $ 19.00
SUB TOTAL SPARE PARTS $ 6,015.00

$ 14,381.28



Premium Automobiles

25 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SGB 9029 R

Damaged Parts & Prices

SIN Parts Description S/Nett Remarks
¥ 14,381.28
81 INTAKE AIR DUCT - RH s 19.00
82 ENGINE AIR GUIDE E 48.00
83 AIRFILTER HOUSING 5 339.00
B4  AIR MASS METER 5 533.00
85  INTAKE HOSE 8 B5.00
86 CLAMP 3 8.00
87 FRONT FENDER - LH 3 700.00
88 FRONT FENDER COVER - LH 3 228.00
89 FENDER COVER - LH $ 21.00
80 STOMNE CHIP GUARD - LH 5 46.00
1 FRONT ALUMINIUM RIM - RH : 651.00 5 520.80
92 RUBBER VALVE 5 13.00 3 8.82
93  FRONT WISH BONE LINK - RH 5 491.00
84 TRACK CONTROL ARM - RH 5 861.00
85 FRONT UPPER CONTROL ARM GUIDE - RH -] 466.00
96 FRONT UPPER CONTROL ARM - RH 5 466.00
87 WHEEL BEARING HOUSING - RH 3 884.00
88 BALL JOINT - RH 3 175.00
89 WHEEL HUB - RH 3 451.00
100 BALL BEARING - RH 3 232.00
SUB TOTAL SPARE PARTS $ 6,717.00 $ 14,912.00




Premium Automobiles
95 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SGB 9029 R

Damaged Parts & Prices

SIN Parts Description SiNett Remarks
514,912.00

101 COUPLING ROD - RH B 123.00

102 DRIVE SHAFT - RH 5 242200

103 SHOCK ABSORBER - RH 5 276.00

104 TRACH ROD - RH 3 80.00

105 TIE ROD END - RH 3 180.00

106 FRONT NO PLATE 5 40.00 $40.00

107 ADHESIVE SEALANT 3 180.00

108 CAVITY WAX ] 140.00

108  STONE CHIP 5 180.00

110 FRONT TYRE - RH 5 265.00 $212.00

112  SUNDRIES § 400.00 535.20
TOTAL SPARE PARTS $ 39,307.40 $15,199.20
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES $ 28,782.00 $8,552.00
GRAND TOTAL $ 68,089.40 $23,751.20

All charges are not inclusive of GST.

Legend : Remarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks (X) = Not approved

Spare parts are Special Nett,




Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

55 Ubi Road 1. Singapore 4086399

Tel ! (B5) BI6E 2323 Fax ' (B5) 6841 1183

Supplementary Estimate 1
GST Reg Mo, 19-9902271-W

AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd Estimate No.
78 Shenton Way Date

#0T7-16 AIG Building

Singapore 079120 Pages

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept Regn No
Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315 Model No

Quantity Description

Parts
1

Labours
1

Front LED headlight LHS

To remove and renew headlight LHS.

Labour total
Part total
TOTAL

PAQDA497R2019TG
26-Dec-19

Service Advisor Glory Tan

1of1
SGB 9028 R
Ad Sedan 2.0 TFSI 8W

Unit Price | Amount

5 7,087.00 na

5 7,087.00 X NN

5 700.00
$ 700.00
S 7,087.00
5 7,787.00

For Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Authorised Signature



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax

Name

Surveyed Date
Authorised Date
Excess Cost
Liability
Remarks

Please Note : This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle.
Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms MNorah Khai at
Tel:6768 9828 for appointment.

Yours faithfully,
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Johnny Boo Allan Wu
Body Repair Manager Claims Consultant




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 28 February 2020 10:30 AM

To: Boo seng yak; Guo Qiang (LKKAuto); SUR: Carrine Leong; Chang Chee Sing;
Jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg

Subject: RE: FINAL REVISION - SGB9029R - OD AIG - SURVEYED 20 DEC 19

Dear Mr Boo,

Confirm repair cost of $23,751.20 before GST @ 11 days of repairs

Kindly send us invoice and discharge voucher for us to close file.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Boo seng yak <boojohnny@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 27 February 2020 5:53 PM

To: Guo Qjang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>; Carrine Leong <carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg>; Chang Chee Sing
<claims@premiumauto.com.sg; jiayee yap@premiumauto.com.sg

Subject: FINAL REVISION - SGBS029R - OD AIG - SURVEYED 20 DEC 19

Hi Guo Qiang and all,

Revised estimate and photographs is attached.

Please confirm repair cost 0f $23,751.20 @ 11 days of repairs exclude 2 Sundays and 1 PH.

Your early closure is well appreciated.

Best regards - jb



