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Your Ref: CMTD1905913/AGC
Date: 23/1272019

Our Ref: CS/SMO19022390/T11d3
The Motor Claims Department
SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE P

Dear Sirs'™dm
PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO, SLF 7211M .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above-mentioned vehicle
on _20/12/2019 at the premises of M/s Focus Auto _and have the following to
report: -

Waorkshop Estimate Amount S 6.707.10
Revised Estimate Amount ;8§ 3.918.50
“Check™ ltems Amount :S§ 740.40
Market Value . 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value 5% -
Nett Value 1 8% -

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages

at the front o/s portion and undercarringe
parts.

Repair days: 4

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.

Yours faithfully
Taufikh
Automotive Assessor



. Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 20 December 2019 2:08 PM

To: claims@focusauto.com.sg; ‘admin-d@Ikkauto.com’: ‘assignments@lkkauto.com’
Ce: Chan, Shu Hul Agnes; Ye, Yong Kang Melvin: Henry, Irene James

Subject: CMTD1905913/AGC - LKK/ GBEG603X & SLF7211M ACCIDENT ON 19.12.19

Our Reference: CMTD1905913/AGC
Your Reference: SLF7211M

Without Prejudice
Date: 20/12/2019 EMAIL ONLY
OUR Email: motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg
Attention:
M/S FOCUS AUTO PTE LTD

Dear Aidah,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE6603X & SLF7211M ON 19.12.2019
We refer to your email reply of today.

We will appoint Mr. Marcus Chua of LKK Auto Consultants to conduct the survey.,

Hi LKK Auto,

Please refer to the email below and make the arrangement to survey for SLF7211M on a without prejudice basis and
revert with your report upon completion of survey to my colleague, Ms. Agnes.

Thank You.

Our office will be closed on Christmas, New Year's Eve and New Year Day. Business will resume on 26" December 2019
and 2™ January 2020 respectively
We wish you a Merry Christmas and a Happy New Year!

Besl Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D: 8329 5170 | T. 6461 6555 | F 6221 3147

For motor claims survey request, please email to motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg



; SOMPO
@ A Century of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower Singapaore 048623

Website: www sompo.com sg | Facebook: www facebook com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission' & Product Purchase® via Sompo 5G

A pp Store

Download now @
tEor Travel, Personal Accident & Home Insurance | © Far Traval, Personal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments. is intended for tha persan(si or company named and may contain confidential
and/er legally privileged Information. Unauthonsad disclosure. copying or use of this information may be unlawiul and is prohibited
If you are not the intended recipient. please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Lid. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy This may include disclosure to holding and associaled companies, credit bureau, parties to whom

disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agenis (acting on our behalf). Please dlick here for
our Privacy Palicy

From: claims@focusauto.com.sg <claims@focusauto.com,sg>

Sent: Friday, December 20, 2019 2:01 PM

To: Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>

Ce: Chan, Shu Hui Agnes <agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg>; Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; Henry,
Irene James <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: Re: CMTD1905913/AGC - PRI(NR)/ GBE6603X & SLF7211M ACCIDENT ON 19.12.19

Dear Ms Grace,

Your message is well noted. We are please to select LKK AUTO CONSUTANTS MR MARCUS
CHUA as the surveyor. Do let us know early notice for his arrival to our workshop.

Thank You

Best Regards

Aidah

On 2019-12-20 13:40, Teo, Grace wrote:
Our Reference: CMTD1905913/AGC

Your Reference; SLF7211M

Without Prejudice

Date: 20/12/2019 EMAIL ONLY



OUR Email; motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg

Attention:

M/S FOCUS AUTO PTE LTD

Dear Aidah,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE6603X & SLF7211M ON 19.12.2019

We refer to your Notice of Accident dated 20/12/20109.

Please be informed that Ms. Agnes Chan is the handler of this case who can be contacted at

63295 327/ agnes.chan@sompo.com.sq .

Please be informed that we have yet to receive our insured's accident report.

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client's/your customer's vehicle jointly with your
client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list to conduct
the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

Pre-Repair Survey

Selection (Indicate as
Motor Surveyor Surveyor tick)
1 Raleigh Services Andrew Ow Yong
Vincent Ng
Kenneth Kong [North
2 LKK Auto Consultants area)
Marcus Chua (East area)




Mohd Rasul (West area)
Mohd Taufikh (West area)
3 Priority Services Jimmy Lee

Lawrence Ng

Jeffrey Ong

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select up to two of the listed maotor surveyors. We will bear the cost of
the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert.

Our office will be closed on Christmas, New Year's Eve and New Year Day. Business will resume on 26" December 2018
and 2™ January 2020 respectively,

We wish you a Merry Christmas and a Happy New Year!

Bes! Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D 6329 5170 | T: 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147

For motor claims survey request, please email to motorsurvey®sompo.com.sg

SOMPO
C/ A Century of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd,
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623

Website: www sompg com sg | Facebook: www facebook com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission' & Product Purchase’ via Sompo SG

Download now @ @ App Store

For Travel, Personal Acoident & Home Insurance | * For Travel, Personal Accident, Home & Private Motar Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for tha person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthonsed disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited
If you are not the intended recipient, please delets this message

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Ple Lid. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
staled in our Privacy Policy. This may Include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disciosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf), Please click here for
our Privacy Palicy



From: claims@focusauto.com. se <claims@focusauto.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, December 20, 2019 11:43 AM

To: Claims - Motar Survey <MotorSurvey @sompo.com.sg>

Subject: PRE SURVEY REPAIR - SLF7211M & GBEGG03X ACCIDENT ON 19.12.19

Dear Officer In-Charge,
Good Day,

Please sent surveyor list to arrange the surveyor down to our workshop
as below.

We are instructed by our client to notify you of a road traffic accident

on 19/12/2019 at about 0900 hours at Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2 involving our

client's SLF7211M and GBEG603X driven by your insurer or your insured's authorized driver at the
material time.

As a result of the accident, our client's vehicle has been damaged.Before our client / we proceed
to repair the damaged vehicle please let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of

this notice whether you or your insurer would like to conduct a pre-repair

survey of the vehicle without further reference to you.

Please be informed that the said vehicle can be inspected at :

Name of workshop : FOCUS AUTO PTE LTD

Address . No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6

Autobay #02-48/50

Singapore 417883

Telephone No.: 6844620

Best Regards

Aidah

Focus Auto Pte Ltd

No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6

#02-50 AutoBay Singapore 417883
Tel: 6886 9097 Fax: 6481 9095

Office Hours : Mon ~ Sat, 0900 ~ 1800



Focus Auto Pte Ltd

- No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6

#02-50 AutoBay Singapore 417883
Tel: 6886 9097 Fax: 6481 9095

Office Hours : Mon ~ Sat, 0900 ~ 1800



Denise ng (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 23 December 2019 2:23 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); ‘Teo, Grace'; assignments

Ce: ‘Chan, Shu Hui Agnes'; 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin'; ‘Henry, Irene James’, SUR
Subject: RE: CMTD1905913/AGC - LKK/ GBE6603X & SLF7211M ACCIDENT ON 19.12.19
Attachments: PRELI ADVISED OF SLF 7211M.pdf

Dear Sir™Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLF 7211M
Number of days (estimated) : 4 days

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall: denisetay®kkauto com | fax: 6256-4315
Bik 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408333)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 20 December 2019 2:47 PM

To: 'Teo, Grace' <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Chan, Shu Hui Agnes' <agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg>; 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin' <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>;
'Henry, Irene James' <irene henry@sompo.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: CMTD1905913/AGC - LKK/ GBEG603X & SLF7211M ACCIDENT ON 19.12.19

Resend

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment

Please be informed that due to the unavallabllity of the appointed surveyor Mr. Marcus chua,

Repairer agreed our surveyor Mr. Taufikh to survey this vehicle

Wishes you a Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020 A
Best Regurds

GNIVITHA

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignmenis@|kkautocom | fax: 6256-47315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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FOCUS AUTO PTE LTD i
NO. | KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6 #02-48/50
AUTOBAY (a KAKI BUKIT SINGAPORE 417883
TEL: 6886 9097 FAX: 6886 9095  Email: claims(a [ocusauto.com.sg
GST:200712509E RCB NO:201004495R

M/S : SOMPO INSURANCE
Estimate No: EST0001078

Date: 26 Dec 2019
Veh Reg No: SLF7211M
ATTN:Motor Claim Department Make/Model: TOYOTA COROLLA
Your Reference :SLF7211M TOYOTA Chassis No: MROS3REHI104557696
Claim Type:  Third Party Engine No: 1ZRX3592355
Accident Date: 19.12.19 Reg. Date:  09/07/2016
Estimate Repair Cost to Vehicle No :SLF7211M PAGE:1/2
Description U/PriceQuantity List Price Amount
S$ S$
List Price
| Front Fender - RH 888.10 I PC  888.10 ési W7
2 Front Fender Dust Cover - RH 125.40 | PC 12540 ol
3 Front Fender Dust Cover Clip - RH 12.10 8 PC 96.80 Mt
4 Front Fender Emblem - RH 10.40 | PC 1040 nsc—" s
5 Front Head Lamp - RH 804.10 | PC 804.10 b= 520 %
6 Front Head Lamp Lower Bracket - RH 18.40 1 PC 18.40 tw
7 Front Grille 398.40 - PE 398.40 ¢~
8 Front Grille Clipse - RH 5.50 6 PC 33.00 m—
9 Front Fender Lower Bracket 66.50 | PC 66.50 bt
10 Front Bumper 555.20 | PC 55520 L~
11 Front Bumper Side Retainer 6510 1PC  65.10 &
12 Front Washer Tank 144.20 | PC 14420 M
13 Front Shock Absorber - RH 408.10 | BC 408,10 »ew
14 Front Knuckle Arm - RH 435.10 | PC 435.10 #1~
|5 Front Lower Arm - RH 410.10 1 PC 410.10 g o
16 Front Hub Bearing 210.40 | PC 21040 bt~
233520 466930 3501:§%
250)¢F . Less 25% 1,167.33 3,502.01
Labour
17 Panel Beating i | PC 950.00 KoV
I8 Check Wiring . | PC 60.00 Lo
19 Rust Proofing | PC 60.00 %°

20 Alignment Adjustment | PC 5000 v



FOCUS AUTO PTE LTD
NO. | KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6 #02-48/50

AUTOBAY (@ KAKI BUKIT SINGAPORE 417883
TEL: 6886 9097 FAX: 6886 9095  Email: claims(a focusauto.com.sg
GST:200712509E RCB NO:201004495R

M/S : SOMPO INSURANCE
Estimate No:  EST0001078

Date: 26 Dec 2019
Veh Reg No: SLF7211M
ATTN:Motor Claim Department Make/Model: TOYOTA COROLLA
Your Reference :SLF721 1M TOYOTA Chassis No: MROS3REHI104557696
Claim Type: Third Party Engine No: 1ZRX592355
Accident Date: 19.12.19 Reg. Date: 09/07/2016
Estimate Repair Cost to Vehicle No :SLF7211M PAGE:2/2
Description U/PriceQuantity List Price Amount
ss ss
Labour Price
2] To Remove & Replace Front Under Carriage - | PC  280.00 Jz«
22 To Spray Painting L PC 750.00 l’{a-.?

2.150.00 2.150.00 123

TotalS$ 55‘?555;; {cj'; ]’}
TOTAL: SINGAPORE DOLLAR FIVE THOUSAND SIX HUNDRED FIFTY TWO AND

ONE CENTS ONLY
For FOCUS AUTO PTE LTD

AUTHORISED SIGNATURE

{M..d,wn CARRENT I/L?“E&‘*H 95 0| 47
P2ty €430 [e3e
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COMPUTERISED 4 WHEEL ALIGNMENT
HUNTER DSP700

Company: FOCUS AUTO PTE LTD
VIN: SLF7211 M
Date 21.12.19 14:06 SLFT21 M
TOYOTA ALTIS 2014-
Front : Laft Front : Right
_Actual | Befors | Specified Ran Actual | Before | Specified Range |
047 047" 0°6%"' 0*31' Camber -2°08’ -2°08 0°6%' 0"31" |
2"81 -3l 5708 6°38" Caster 300’ J*00' 508’ 6°38"
0°0% 0708 000" 0°11° Toe 0708 0" 0¥ 0"00" 0*11°
10°33° | 10°37F SA| 1437 | 1437
__9'ar 4 | Included Angle 12°31 | 12°37 |
L | Tuming Angle Diff. L 1 1 |
Front
| _Actual | Before Specified Ra
Cross Camber 1My | 199 0°45’ 0°45°
Cross Caster -0*09 -0"oF 0"45' 0°4F
Total Toe 0718 | oM [ 000 0r22 |
Cross Tum Diff. —_1 - |
Rear : Right
| Actua B-hr- J Bp-u Actual | Before | Specified Ran
-1" II -1 33‘ -1" -ﬂ"ﬂ' Camber 130 125 -1°68' -D"E8'
000 | 000" | 001 0@’ Toe 0708 | 008" | 0°071 018

Cross Camber
Total Toe
Thrust Angle

b SRLERE LI T ra— FOUR.0 ¥ DA TOR



'Y 7d 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

- 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Libi Industrial Park, Singapons 408833
- TEL: 6258 3581 FAX: 6268 4315

Reg. No: 19880T108R GST Reg. No. 18-8607T188-R

SOMPO INSURANCE smsamne F'L Rof cs.rsmmsmanz

50 RAFFLES PLACE
#05-01/06 Date: 02-04-2020

SINGAPORE LAND TOWERSINGAPORE 048623

101+ L4 BeRee  Pe ; _
Insured Veh. GBE 6603X% ‘u‘-h. In:.p.ctld s:r.F 7211M
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. CMTD1905913/AGC Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From GRACE TEQ Assign Date 20/ 2/2019
2, .0 siemiganes v JSRRBRVSRGIRE :
Make & Modal  TOYOTA ALTIS c.c 1508
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. MROS3IREH 104557606 Colour SILVER
Odometer 152306 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GDOD
3. T AT Te e
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/55 R16 CsT |6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/55 R16 csT |6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/55R16 CsT & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/55 R16
LR B = . escript
'THE VEHICLE SUSTMHED DAMAGES AT THE FRDNT ms mnmn AND UHDERGARRLI«GE
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. T WA 1D
Accident Date  19/12/2018
Survey held at FOCUS AUTO PTELTD
NO 1 KAKI BUKIT AVE &
AUTOBAY #02-a8
SINGAPORE 417883
Ba [T Soalesan S5l ~
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CON DucTEn ON N'Mﬂ-iﬂrl.l'l' FHEJU DICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

¥ 4 - .
8b,: + 18 SRR
& - —

=
|ESTIMA.TED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

4 Working Days




’ V L" LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

-y 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ui Ingustrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL 8256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Ne: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:1 of 2

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLF 7211M

1|FRONT FENDER-RH BENT 888.10 B56.00
1|FRONT FEMDER DUST COVER-RH DEFORMED 12540 12540
8|FRONT FENDER DUST COVER CLIP-RH @512.10 MECESSARY 96.80 86.80
1|FRONT FENDER EMBLEM-RH MECESSARY 10.40 10,40
1|FRONT HEAD LAMP-RH cuT 80410 520.30
1|FRONT HEAD LAMP LOWER BRACKET-RH CRACKED 18.40 18.40
1|FRONT GRILLE CRACKED 398.40 388 .40
6|FRONT GRILLE CLIPSE-RH @$5.50 NECESSARY 33.00 33.00
1|FRONT FENDER LOWER BRACKET BENT B6.50 66.50
1|FRONT BUMPER DEFORMED 55520 55520
1|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER DEFORMED 65.10 65.10
1|FRONT WASHER TANK DEFORMED 14420 14420
1|FRONT SHOCK ABSORBER-RH NOT NECESSARY 408.10 .
1|FROMNT KNUCKLE ARM-RH BENT 43510 43510
1|FRONT LOWER ARM-RH NOT NECESSARY 41010 -
1|FRONT HUB BEARING BENT 21040 210,40
LESS 25% DISCOUNT <1,167.33 -833.80
3,501.97 2501.40

LABOUR
PAMEL BEATING. B850.00 400,00
CHECK WIRING. 60.00 30.00
RUST PROOFING. 60.00 30,00
ALIGNMENT ADJUSTMENT 50.00 50,00
TO REMOVE & REPLACE FRONT UNDER CARRIAGE. 280.00 120.00
TO SPRAY PAINTING. 750.00 400.00
2.150.00 1,030.00
GRAND TOTAL 5,651.97 3,531.40
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