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Joy Irene (LKK Auto)

From: Joy Irene (LKK Auto)
Sent: Tuesday, 16 June, 2015 7:19 PM
To: 'Jasmine Tan'; 'Roel'; Zhe Wei
Cc: CS A Team; Kenneth Kong
Subject: 2013 and 2014 outstanding cases to discuss for negotiation settlement in the next 

scheduled round table meeting

Dear Ms. Jasmine, 

 

Kindly include these 2014 cases in your list in preparing the LOD for negotiation settlement. Thank you. 

 

 

  REFERENCE TAXI DOA LIABILITY LOD REMARKS

1 CC3/AIG14014292/Kda3 SHD 329L 24/07/2014 100% X TO NEGOTIATE SETTLE.REQUEST FOR LOD  

2 CC3/AIG14017322/Kde3 SHC 5045C 25/03/2014   X NO OI GIA.TO FOLLOW-UP OI TO FILE.TO REQUEST FOR LOD 

3 CC3/AIG14019009/Kde3 SHD 5032J 03/10/2014 0% X REQUEST FOR VIDEO OR ANY EVIDENCE AVILABLE FOR REVIEW ON LIABILITY AND FOR 

LOD 

4 CC3/AIG14021238/Kdm3 SHB 9502D  07/11/2014 100% X TO NEGOTIATE SETTLE.REQUEST FOR LOD  

5 CC3/AIG14023853/Kde3 SHC 5375A  18/12/2014 50% X REQUEST FOR VIDEO OR ANY EVIDENCE AVILABLE FOR REVIEW ON LIABILITY AND FOR 

LOD 

6 CC3/AIG14023991/Kde3 SHB 9795A 20/12/2014 50% X REQUEST FOR VIDEO OR ANY EVIDENCE AVILABLE FOR REVIEW ON LIABILITY AND FOR 

LOD 

7 CC3/AIG15001736/T1de3 SHD 5975M 24/01/2015 100% X TO NEGOTIATE SETTLE.REQUEST FOR LOD  

8 CC3/AIG15002074/Kdm3 SHC 5950P 31/01/2015 50% X REQUEST FOR VIDEO OR ANY EVIDENCE AVILABLE FOR REVIEW ON LIABILITY AND FOR 

LOD 

9 CC3/AXA14017625/Kde3 SHB 7785S 10/09/2014     FILE WITH KENNETH TO SUBMIT INDEPENDENT REPORT

10 CC3/AXA14017971/Kkdm3 SHD 302M 16/09/2014     FILE WITH PEI LIN FOR OI GIA 

11 CC3/AXA14020175/Kdm3 SHD 9762J  19/10/2014 100% X TO NEGOTIATE SETTLE.REQUEST FOR LOD  

12 CC3/AXA14020947/Kde3 SHC 5035G 04/11/2014 50% X REQUEST FOR VIDEO OR ANY EVIDENCE AVILABLE FOR REVIEW ON LIABILITY AND FOR 

LOD 

13 CC3/AXA14021681/Kde3 SHD 5429Z 15/11/2014 50% X REQUEST FOR VIDEO OR ANY EVIDENCE AVILABLE FOR REVIEW ON LIABILITY AND FOR 

LOD 

14 CC3/AXA14022528/K1da3 SHD 332B 30/11/2014 50% X REQUEST FOR VIDEO OR ANY EVIDENCE AVILABLE FOR REVIEW ON LIABILITY AND FOR 

LOD 

15 CC3/AXA14023245/Kdm3 SHD 5582M 09/12/2014   X FILE WITH PEI LIN-NO OI GIA? 

16 CC3/AXA15000400/Kdm3 SHF 602L  03/01/2015 100% X DISPUTED ON THE CONSISTENCY OF DAMAGES. REQUEST FOR LOD

17 CC3/CAI14021683/Kde3 SHB 7645M 12/11/2014 0% X REQUEST FOR VIDEO OR ANY EVIDENCE AVILABLE FOR REVIEW ON LIABILITY AND FOR 

LOD 

18 CC3/CAI14023812/Kdm3 SHD 9402Z 20/12/2014 100% / PENDING INSTRUCTION FROM CAI AS OI DISPUTED NO CONTACT

 

 
Best Regards, 

Joy Irene | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-6051 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

This email may contain confidential and/or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the 

sender immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email is strictly forbidden. 

 
 

 

From: Joy Irene (LKK Auto)  

Sent: Monday, 15 June, 2015 7:57 PM 
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To: 'Jasmine Tan'; 'Roel'; Zhe Wei 

Cc: CS A Team; Kenneth Kong 

Subject: (27) 2013 outstanding cases to discuss for negotiation settlement in the next scheduled round table 

meeting 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

 

Dear Ms. Jasmine, 

 

We would like to request for your kind assistance on our request for the letter of demand on the following cases. 

 

We also further request to prioritize these (27) 2013 outstanding cases to discuss for negotiation settlement in the 

next scheduled round table meeting. 

 

We hope to receive a positive response from you to clear these old claims. 

 

Thank you. 

 

 

S/N OUR REFERENCE TAXI DOA LOD LIABILITY OFFER  

1 CC3/AIG12018342/Kja3 SHD 9450J 18/09/2012 ����    100% $    2,796.22  100% ON TAXI'S FRONT SIDE POTION ONLY

2 CC3/AIG13010216/Kpt2 SHD 739L 04/06/2013       FILE WITH KENNETH 

3 CC3/AIG13013807/Kjt2 SHD 9564P 28/07/2013 ����    80% $    6,670.00  REQUEST ON ACCEPTANCE

4 CC3/AIG13014055/Kpa3 SHB 7936Z 31/07/2013 ����    100%   REQUEST FOR BOOK VALUE OR PURCHASE INVOICE

5 CC3/AIG13014757/Kra3 SHD 963E 11/08/2013       FILE WITH KATHY. TOTAL LOSS

6 CC3/AXA12000804/Kjm3 SHD 428J 10/01/2012 X 50% $    3,400.00  SETTLED.PENDING LOD

7 CC3/AXA13003355/Kje3 SHB 7543Z 16/02/2013 X 50%   REQUEST FOR LOD A

8 CC3/AXA13004471/Kje3 SHC 5759B 05/03/2013 X 50% $    1,690.00  REQUEST FOR LOD A

9 CC3/AXA13005110/Kjm3 SHD 457A 07/02/2013 X 100%   TOTAL LOSS.REQUEST FOR LOD

10 CC3/AXA13008403/Kje3 SHD 9683D 04/05/2013 X 50% $    4,820.00  REQUEST FOR LOD A

11 CC3/AXA13009690/Kjm3 SHB 7569A 11/04/2013 X 50%   REQUEST FOR LOD A

12 CC3/AXA13009752/Kpm3 SHD 5634Y 28/05/2013 X 50% $    1,560.00  REQUEST FOR LOD A

13 CC3/AXA13010120/Kjm3 SHD 5974R 01/06/2013 X 50% $    2,465.00  REQUEST FOR LOD A

14 CC3/AXA13014524/Kjm3 SHD 5327J 06/08/2013 X 50%   REQUEST FOR LOD A

15 CC3/AXA13018484/Kjy3 SHD 9208T 29/09/2013 ����    50%   REQUEST FOR COPY O

16 CC3/AXA13019115/Kjy3 SHD 5149G 09/10/2013 X 50% $    1,690.00  REMINDER ON OUR OFFER SENT TO TRANSCAB.08.05.15

17 CC3/AXA13019817/Kjy3 SHD 9131E 21/10/2013 X 100% $       956.16  SETTLED.PENDING FOR LOD 

18 CC3/AXA13020069/Kjt2 SHD 9349U 27/09/2013 X     TO CHECK IF TRANSC

19 CC3/AXA13022346/Kjy3 SHD 5294U 22/11/2013 X 50%   REQUEST FOR LOD A

20 CC3/AXA13022427/Kjy3 SHB 7957M 26/11/2013 X 50%   REQUEST FOR LOD A

21 CC3/AXA13023824/Kjy3 SHC 5032P 13/12/2013 X 50%   REQUEST FOR LOD A

22 CC3/AXA13023825/Kjy3 SHD 9173J 25/11/2013 X 100% $    1,500.00  REQUEST FOR LOD 

23 CC3/AXA13023891/Kjy3 SHB 9797U 16/12/2013 X 50%   REQUEST FOR LOD AND SUBSTANTIAL EVIDENCE IF AVAILABLE

24 CC3/CAI13012640/Kpy3q2 SHD 173T 10/07/2013       FILE WITH HSIAO TONG

25 CC3/CAI13016457/Kjm3 SHD 9235P 03/09/2013 ����    50% $    1,966.73  REQUEST FOR $6 LTA DOCUMENT AND EVIDENCE IF ANY

26 CC3/CAI13023226/Kjy3u2 SHD 9640C 03/12/2013 ����    50%   REQUEST FOR $6 LTA

27 CC3/EQI13022527/Kjm3 SHD 584R 25/11/2013 ����        REQUEST FOR SUBSTANTIAL EVIDENCE TO REVIEW LIABILITY

 

 
Best Regards, 

Joy Irene | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
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Phone: 6841-6051 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

This email may contain confidential and/or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the 

sender immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email is strictly forbidden. 

 
 

 


