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®A Singapore Government Agency Website

> Back to OneMotoring

Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration
Date:

Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:

Chassis No.:
Maximum Power
Output:

Open Market Value:
Original Registration
Date:

First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:
Actual ARF Paid:

Singapore NRIC
112F

SJE6140U
Na
20 Dec 2019

TOYOTA

CAMRY 2.4 AUTO ABS
AIRBAG

White

2007

2AZEQ79295
MRO53BK4007021571
123.0kW (164 bhp)

$28,797.00
30 Apr 2008

30 Apr 2008
3
$31,677.00

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry
Date:

PARF Rebate Amount:

Forfeited

$0.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date:
COE Category;

COE Period(Years):
PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:
Message

29 Apr 2023

E - Open Category
5

$20,441.00
$13,729.00
$13,729.00

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/Ita’vrl/action/enquireRebateByPublic Beforel

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars

Please note that the 5-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-registered upon
COE expiry or when the vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if applicable), whichever is earlier

The information contained herein is carrect as at 20 Dec 2019

OK

20/122019, 10:42 &
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-Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Motar Claim - lll <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 18 December 2019 1:30 PM

To: sales@vtecauto.comsg; ‘sur@Ikkauto.com’, Nivitha (LKK Auto)

Ce: Pooi Chin Han Daniel

Subject: RE: Accident involving SJE6140U & your insured SHD4744U

Attachments: Gia Report - SIE6140U.PDF ARG s lia
p-_Ju'h' n

Dear Sir / Mdm,
v In

Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle SIE6140U and let us have your report urgently, 3.1 “mh'ﬂh

This claim will be handled by Daniel.

*Kindly upload this survey request email to merimen.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wea

64 Cecil Street; #05 - |OB Building

Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext - 248

—----Original Message——

From: sales@vtecauto.com.sg [mailto:sales@vtecauto.com.sg)
Sent: 18 December, 2019 10:07 AM

To: Motor Claim - lll <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Subject: Re: Accident involving SJEG140U & your insured SHD47440

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for your help.

Please proceed to arrange with the LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd.

Have a nice day.

Thanks & Regards,

Jalin

V-Tec Asia Automotive Pte Ltd

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 #07-08/09
Premier@KB Singapore 415875
Tel :66352706



HP :8777 1911

Fax 163416232

*Email: sales@vtecauto.com.sg
Website: www.vtecauto.com.sg

On 2019-12-18 09:16, Motor Claim - IIl wrote:

> Dear Sir / Mdm,

>

> We acknowledge receipt of your email,

>

> We proprose using one of the following motor surveyors:
>

> * LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

> * Vicom Assessment Centre Pte Ltd

>

> Please notify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyor
> agreed on or if you have any objections to the above list.
>

>

> Best Regards,

> Gabriel Wee

>

>

> B4 Cecil Street; #05 - 10B Building
> Singapore 049711

>Tel: 6347 6100, Ext - 248
>

>

>

> —--0Original Message-——

> From: sales@vtecauto.com.sg [mailto:sales@vtecauto.com.sg]
»5ent: 17 December, 2019 6:34 PM

> To: Motor Claim - Il emotorclaim @iil.com.sg>

> Subject: Accident involving SIE6140U & your insured SHD4744U
>

> Dear SirfMdm,

>

> Our client vehicle SIE6140U has met in a car accident with your

> insured vehicle SHD4744U.

>

> We wish to file a motor claim on behalf of aur client, currently our
> client vehicle is in our workshop awaiting PRI, rental car has been

> provided to our client.

>

> Please arrange your surveyor to conduct PRI at your soonest to prevent
> further delay resulting in additional expenses to be occurred for this
> case.

>

>

> Kindly let us know when the surveyor will come to our workshop.

>

>

o -

> Thanks & Regards,

>

> Jolin



> V-Tec Asia Automotive Pte Ltd

> B Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 #07-08/09
> Premier@KB Singapore 415875

>Tel :66352706

>HP 87771911

>Fax ;63416232

> Email: sales@vtecauto.com.sg

> Website: www.vtecauto.com.sg

> Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to

> have agreed to us collecting, using, disclosing and processing your

> personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers

> (located both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers

> In the general insurance industry, including the General Insurance

> Assaciation of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing,

> handling and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating

> the said claim, and complying with applicable laws. If you do not

> agree to the same, kindly let us know Immediately.

> DISCLAIMER:

> This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been

> addressed

> It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

> If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if

> this e-mail has reached you by mistake, please delete it Immediately

> and inform us of the error and also be hereby notified that any use,

> distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination of this

> information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may

> be unlawful

> Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as

> information could be intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain

> viruses.

> Therefore, we do not accept liabllity for any errors or omissions in

> the content of this message or any delay in delivery which may arise

> as a result of Internet transmission or any modification.

> Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in

> preservation of environment.

> India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

> Registration No. 198703792-K

Kindly note that by submitting this claim ta us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using, disclosing and
processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located both inside and
outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including the General Insurance
Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling and/or dealing with your claim,
which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable laws. If you do not agree to the same,
kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mall was intended, or if this e-mail has reached you by mistake, please
delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby notified that any use, distribution, transmission,
printing, copying or dissemination of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be
unlawful.

Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be intercepted, corrupted,
lost, delayed or contain viruses

Therefore, we do not accept liabllity for any errors or omissions in the content of this message or any delay in
delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.

India International Insurance Pte Ltd.



Registration No. 198703792-K
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Transaction History Details

Log Date/Time: 07 Feb 2020/
02:57:17

Receipt No.:

Asset Type: Vehicle

Transaction $0.00

Amount:

Asset |D: SJE6140U

Channel: Internet

Transaction Type: 06.01 Apply Vehicle

Deregistration

Business 202002070257175
Transaction 37496
Reference No.:
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Current Vehicle No.:

U Label No.:

Chassis No.:

Engine No.:

Motor No.:

Vehicle Type:

Vehicle Scheme:

First Registration
Date:

Original

Registration Date:

SJE6140U

1121977425

MRO53BK4007021
574

2AZEQ79295

P10 - Passenger
Motor Car

Normal

30 Apr 2008

30 Apr 2008
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Registration Date:

Authorised Person's
ID Type:

Authorised Person's
Country:

Authorised Person's
ID:

Authorised Person's
Name:

Authorised Person's
Mobile Number:

Singapore NRIC

Singapore

S9600112F

SAMANTHA NG

96514920

Information displayed is correct as at the log date

and time.




V-TEC ASIA AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

:ll"‘ii.]:l:h‘H
B KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 4 #07-0809 PREMIER@KB SINGAPORE 415875
Tel No, : 6566352706 ' <65 0610 9610  Fax Mo, - -65 6341 6232

TAX INVOICE

Customer : SJE 6140 U {Toyoua Camry) No, : 20FRO0OD02-VT
Date : 11 February 2020
Address Terms . C.OD
Chassis No
Make / Model : Toyota Camry
Mileage
Altention : MS Samantha Ng Contact 8
Email - Fax -
o, Description Oty Linit Price 5% Amount 5%
| Lump sum Repairs as per recommendation 1.00 Unit I 100000 | 1000 00

CLAIMANT: SAMANTHA NG XI1AO MUNG

Remarks : DATE OF ACCIDENT : 14th Dec 2019 Subtotal (Excluding GST) (W RUCTRA
CLAIM TYPE : THIRD PARTY Discount 00,00

GST 7% on 11.000.00 770,00

SINGAPORE IMMLLAR ELEVEN THOLSAND SEVEN HUNDRED SEVENTY Total | 11,770.00

ONLY I

Grand Total | 11,770.00

Received bn Crond Urder & ©onchidion
Ul Camnd Sonbd are ol refundable " Hetum

* Ay defects o upsatiified conditons after servicing are 10 be nfoemed within ihrea 3§ davs fom DATE OF IKVOILT
* Serviook rendered will be taken s sccepied (M no feedhack s received within threed 3) dios From DATE OF INVOICE

WARRANTY | ALL NEW PARTS REPLACED INCLUDE CONE MONTH WARRANTY AGAINST MANUFACTURER UNLESS OTHERWISE STATED.
PMLEASE CHEQUE SHUOWLD BE CROSSED AND MAKE PAYABRLE TO ="V-TEC ASIA ALTOMOTIVE PTE LTD—

Thank you for your support, we are glad to prawide you with our sennce
Kindly give us a fesdback in oot FRoebook or in Sgearmart =)

Vvarmest Regards |
Singmppae

A =

Nkl kil vy

FOR V-TEC ASIA AUTOMOTIVE PTE




V-TEC ASIA AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

JO)5S3ERTR
8 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 4 207-0809 PREMIER@KB SINGAPORE 415875
Tel Mo, : <63 66332706 639610 9610  Fax No. ; <63 634 6232

TAX INVOICE

Customer : SJE 6140 U {Tovota Camry) M, : 20ACO00002-YT
Date ¢ 11 February 2020
Address Terms : C.OD
Chassis No : -
Make ' Model T -
_ Mileage R
Attention : MS Samantha Ng Contact
Email : Fax :
o. Description Oty Unit Price 55 Amount 55
| Rental Car Of Vehicle (SMM 1709 K Vw Golf) 42.00 Days 180.00 7.560.00
Remarks ¢ Subtotal (Excluding GST) 7.560,00
Discount 0.00
GST 7% on 7.560.00 529.20
SINGAPORE DOLLAR EIGHT THOUSAND EIGHTY NINE AND CENTS Total 8,089.20
TWENTY ONLY
Grand Total 8.089.20

Recetved p Chood Upder & Uoodition

A Cowd Sold are mi refindable | Retium
* Any defects or uhsatisfied condithionn aller servicing are b6 be liiformed within thea 33 davs from DATE OF INVIICT

* Services rendercd will be mken as accepied of oo leedback i recerved within theeei 3) dass from DIATE OF INVONCE

WARKANTY  ALL NEW PARTS REPLACED INCLLUIEH: ONE MONTH WARRANTY AGAINST MANLFAUTURER UNLESS COITHERWISE STATED
PLEASE CHEQUE SHOULD BE CROSSED AND MARE PAYABLE TO -—="YV-TEL ASIA AUTOMOTIVE FIE LD —

Thank you for youl support. we aré glad to provide you with our sanice
Kindly give us a feadback in ourFacabook or in Sgearman =)

Warmest Regards
A

N

& ki L R

FOR V-TEC ASIA AUTOMOTIVE PTE



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Direct Settlement

CLATM SUBFOLDER TRACKING =———
Cage Notified Est Swubmitied Adj Assigned Adj Rpt Ad) Subrmitted Ins Auth'ed Seatus
o |77 002019 i $$10,000.00 | $$10,000.00 w Sur Survny
i ] Edit adi gt | eou tanmates | | _view Aux | Cancel Casa |

Main

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS o [[Created by adjuster] |
Inured: m" TRANSPORTATION PTE I.TII' “Co. Rog. No.: 19930382 1R

Main o
ol ; SAMANTHA NG NIAD MUNG, [D: 556001137

Vehicle “T14/12/2019 01:00 - 159
No.: % |siee1400 Date of LoSS! |1y 39 Monit and 14 Days From LTA Rag Dats (Man Yr]]
Cisim Type: |TP / MCT19120313 haucy/COVE | \acOMO01S (TP, Fire 8 TheR)
:ﬁm e SHD4744U E‘.‘::::ﬂ 1500045196
(I ngured): :

Ercess|
Aspeirer | V-tac Asia Autometive Pie Ltd (HQ) B KAK] BUKIT AVE 4, #07-08/09 PREMIERGKE, 415875 Kaki Bukit - Tel: 66352706

m‘l‘:" India International Insurance Pte Lid (HQ) - Tel: 53476100 ... [Handied by Poal Chin Han Danlel]

Eimants | uie asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid, (SG) - Tel: §5-6419-3000

Insurer:
Adjuster LKK Auto Pre Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 . [Handied by MOHD TAUFTKH BIN HAMID] | [Final Rpt dus
03,/01/2020]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Al | Compose case ai |

1_5G (06/02/2020): Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (5$11407.45) - SIEG140U - Clalm Handler: Pool Chin ...
1156 (23/01/2030): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (550.00) - SIEG140U - Claim Handler: Poaoi Chin Han ..
I11_5G (21/01/2020): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5511407.45) - SIE6140U - Claim Handler: Pool Chin ...
M1_5G (17/01/2020): Alert - Adj Mandate Revoked - SIESL40U - Claim Handler: Pool Chin Han Danlel

HI_SG (14/01/2020): Alert - Adj Mandate Maintained - SJES140U - Clalm Handler: Pool Chin Han Daniel
56 (03/01/2020): Alert - Ad] Mandate Maintained - SJE6140U - Clalm Handlar: Pool Chin Han Danlel
IM1_SG (30/12/2019): Alert - Adf Mandats Approved (550.00) - SIES140U - Claim Handler: Pool Chin Han ...

- F e E R

[Aumﬂnfﬂnﬁ view All_| _Search Tasks ! Croate New Tash | Complete |
Due Date  Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Created On  Done?
Ho results.

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=d... 20/2/2020



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 4

Claim Documents

*5JE6140U (MCT19120313)
[SHD4744U]
™
SAMANTHA NG XIAO MUNG
Dec 14 2019 1:00AM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
V-tec Asia Automotive Pte Ltd

upioss Bocumerts | Upioss Phoms | Composs wew Lester | View [View in Browses| <]
Video { ~| &
No | Finalized On India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) | Thumbnall | Print
1 |#7/12/19 13:4% | Video - Accident TP witness @ | Losd wre
Photos/ Images [perpage  TV]| B4
Mo | Relabel/Reorder | LKM Auto Consultants Pre Lid (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 |15/00/20 14:57 | Genersl View 0| e | H
7 |1spis20 14:57 | General View 0| beaws | A
1 | 15017014:57 | General View 0| tearc | A
4 | 15/01/20 18:57 Ganeral View i_ oad G | &
5 |15/01/20 14:57 Ganeral View 0| eawc | A
|& | 15/01/20 14:57 Ganaral View ! oad G | B4
I |1301/20 1457 | General View O wurs | B
& |15/01720 14:57 General View Q| tcsawc | A
3 |15/01/20 14:57 | Genaral View @) | Lcacrs | B
10 |15/01/20 14:57 | General View Q| owws | B
11 |15/00/20 1457 | Genersl View @0 | s | &
12 |15/01/20 1457 | General View 0| odws | &
13 |15/01/20 14:57 | Geners! View ©| irc | @
14 |15/01/20 14:57 | Genersl View 0| waaws | A
15 |15/01/20 14:57 | General View 0| weawe | A
16 |15/01/20 14:57 General View 0| cadws | M
17 |15/01/2014:57 | General View @ | eiwc | A
18 |15/01/20 14:57 General View Q| wawc | B
19 |15/01/30 14:57 General View 0| wmews | B4
20 | 15/01/20 14:57 Ganeral View 0| waws | B4
21 |15/01/20 1457 | General View 0| ladwc | A
21 |15/01/20 14:57 | Ganeral View 0| toedwc | A
21 [15/01/20 14:57 | Ganaral View @ | weewc | @
24 |15/01/20 14:57 | General View 0| wans | B
|25 |15/01/20 14:57 Ganaral View 0| wwmewc | 4
26 |15/01/20 14:57 General View 0| cadiwc | A
27 |15/01/20 14:57 | Ganaral View O oo | B
I8 |15/01/20 14:57 | General View 0| tears | @A
79 |15/01/20 14:57 | Genaral View 0 eds | H
30 |15/01/20 14:57 | General View 0 | weaws | F
3 |15/0020 14:57 General View 0| eedwpc | M
37 [19/01/20 14:57 | General View @ | todres | 4
33 |15/00/20 14:57 | General View 0| ltoaires | F
34 |15/D01720 14:57 | Genersl View 0| edwrc | A
35 |15/01/20 14:57 | Genersl View 0| i | B
136 |15/01/20 14:57 | Ganarsl View Q| waws | A
37 |18/00/20 1457 | General View O aiws | A
36 |15/01/20 14:57 General View 0| wadws | A
39 | 15701720 14:57 General View 0| oears |
40 |15/01/20 14:57 | General View O | G
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Video 1perpage  [v]| &
tig | Finaleed On India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HG) Thurminsll | Print
]
41 [15/01/20 14:57 | Genersl View ﬂ_ Load PG | BA
42 |15/01/20 14:57 | Genarsl View 0| o | B
43 |15/01/20 14:57 | General View 0 | weaws | B
44 | 15/01/20 14:57 | Genersl View 0| s |
45 |15/01/20 18:57 | General View 0| cedirc |
ag | 15/01/20 14:57 General View 0| edws | A
{47 [15/01/20 14:57 | Chassis Number 0| ware | B
{48 |15/01/20 15:05 | meinspection Photo @ | waaws | A
au |15/01/20 15:05 | Reinspection Photo 0| waws | M
50 |15/01/20 15:05  |Relnspection Photo O waivc | M4
51 |15/01/2015:05  |Reinspectian Photo © | wodrs | A
57 |15M1/20 15:05 | Reinspection Photo @ | weawc | B
53 |15/01/20 15:05 | Reinspection Photo g wad P | B
54 |15/01/20 15:05 | Rsinspection Phato 0 wxors | F
55 |15/01/20 15:05 | Reinspection Photo 0| icdvc | &
56 |18/01/20 15:05 | Reinspection Photo ﬂ__ Load PG | &
57 |18/D1/7015:05 | Reinspection Phota O waurs | B
58 | 15/01/20 15:05 Reinspection Photo a ioad WG | M
%9 |15/01/2015:05 | Relnspection Photo 0| waarws | &
60 |15/01/20 15:05 Reinspection Photo 0| ledirs | M
&1 |15/01/20 15:05 | Reinspection Photo A s || A
62 |15/01/701%:05 | Relnspection Phata 0| wars | FA
63 |15/01/20 15:05 | RMeinspection Phata 0| wers | B
§4 |15/01/2015:05 | Relnspection Phato O | wvaaws | A
|65 |15/01/2015:05 | Relnspection Photo 0| waarwc | A
|66 |15/01/20 15:05 | Relnspection Photo Q| wrs | &2
&7 |15/01/20 15:05 | Relnspection Photo Q| ers | &
68 |15/01/20 15:05 | Reinspection Phato 0| wesws | A
169 |15/01/20 15:05 | Reinapection Photo @ | sewe | B
70 |15/01/20 15:08 Reinspection Photo 0| edwc | A
7 |15/01/20 1505 Reinspection Photo Q| sadwc | A
72 |15/01/2015:05 | Reinspection Photo 0 oeaws | A
73 | 15/00/20 15:05 Reinspection Photo | s | A
74 |15/01720 15:08 Relnspection Photo | wuws | B
75 |15/01/20 15:05 | Relnspection Photo @ | oG | & |
76 |15/01/20 15:05 | Relnspection Phots @ | s | @A
77 |15/01/20 15:05 | Relnspection Photo @ waws | B
78 |15/01/20 1505 | Reinspection Photo Q| wevs | B
79 |15/01/20 15:05 | Relnspection Photo Q| weaws |
BO |15/01/20 15058 | Reinspection Photo 0| oadirc | A
Bi |15/01/20 15:05 | Reinspection Photo Q| loaewc | A
B2 |15/01/20 15:05 Reinspection Phots 0| tadrs | B
B [15/01/20 1505 | Reinspection Photo © | waaws | A
B4 |15/01/20 15:05 | Reinspection Photo | waaws | A
B5 |15/01/20 15:0% Reinspection Photo 0| adc | A
86 |15/01/20 15:05 | Reinspection Photo Q| G | A
B7 |15/01/20 15:05 | Reinspection Photo @ | wasrs | B
B |15/01/20 15:05 Reinspection Photo 0| waars | A
89 |1%5/01/20 15:05 Relnspection Phets | waaws | B4
o0 |1%/01/20 15108 Reinspection Photo @ | taswc | B4
51 |13/01/2015:05 | Relnspection Photo © | tads | BB
92 |15/01/20 15:05 | Reinspection Photo 0| teaws | B
93 |15/01/2015:05 | Reinspection Photo @O ware | B
94 |15/01/20 15:05 | Reinspection Photo O oers | B
95 |15/01/20 15:05 | Reinspaction Phota Q| wdwc | &
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Video 1 vl B
No_ | Finalized On India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
'86 |15/01/20 15:05 | Reinspection Phota O s | A
97 [15/01/20 1505 | Reinspection Photo 0 lceawc | A
9 |15/01/20 1505 Reinspection Phote O wrs | 2
(99 |15/01/20 15:05 | Reinspection Photo @ | wearws | B |
100 | 15/01/20 15:08 Reinspection Photo Q| wadvc | A
101 [ 15/01/20 15:05 | Relnspection Photo 0| s |
102 [ 15/01/20 15:05 | Relnspection Photo 0| edwe | B
103 | 15/01/20 15:08 Reinspaction Photo ﬁ Load PG E_}__
104 | 15/01/20 15:05  |Reinspection Photo 0| weaws | B
108 | 15/01/20 15:08 Relnspection Phato g_ wad 0 | &
106 | 15/01/20 15:05 | Reinspection Phots 0| wedwc | M
[107 | 15/01/20 15:05 | Reinspection Photo O | wews |
| 108 | 15/01/20 15:05 | Reinspection Photo 0| wacws | B
1108 | 15/01/30 1505 | Reinspection Photo 0| weaws | A
110 | 15/01/20 15:05 | Reinspection Photo )| weaws | A
111 | 15/01/20 15:05 | Reinspection Photo @ | e | &
112 | 15/01/20 15:05 | Relnspection Photo 0| weaec | A
113 |15/01/20 15:05 | Reinspaction Photo 0| wews | A
114 |15/01/20 15:05 | Reinspection Photo 0| weaws | A
115 | 15/01/20 15:05 | Relnspection Photo 0| weaws | &
116 | 15/01/20 15:05 Relnspection Photo ﬁ Load PG | )
117 | 15/01/20 12:05 | Relnspection Phato 0| edws | &
118 | 15/01/30 15:05 Ruoinspection Phota 0| tsediec | F
1119 | 15/01/20 15:05 | Reinspection Photo 0| wers | B
120 | 15/01/20 15:05 | Relnspection Photo 0| woare |
121 |15/01/20 15:05 | Relnspection Phato 0| wws | @
127 |15/01/20 15:05 | Relnspection Phato 0| warc | A
133 | 15/01/20 15:05 | Reinspection Phato 0| erws | A
134 | 15/01/20 15:05 | Reinspection Phato Q| wews | A
(125 [15/01/20 15:05 | Relnapection Phate Q| weews | A
[126 [15/01/20 15:05 | mainspection Photo 0| s | A
127 | 15/01/20 15:05 | Reinspection Photo Q| wars | A
126 | 15/01/20 15:05 | Reinspection Phato Q| aers | A
129 |15/01/20 15:05 | Reinspection Photo 0| wews | B
130 | 15/00720 15:05 Reinspection Phato g Load G | B
131 | 15/01/20 15:058 | Reinapection Photo 0| aaws | A
1332 | 15/01/20 15:08 Reinspection Photo 0! adws | A
133 | 15/01/20 15:05 Reinspection Photo @ | Load PG &
134 |15/01/20 15:05 | Reinspection Phote 0| wuwrs | B
115 [15/01/20 15:05 | Relnspection Photo 0| csows | BB
136 | 15/01/20 15:05 | Reinspection Photo )| edirc | &
137 |15/01/20 15:05 | Reinspection Photo QO cws | 2
138 |15/01/20 15:05 | Reinspection Photo Q| Ladws | B
139 [15/01/20 15:05 | Reinspection Photo Q| wors | F
140 | 15/01/30 15105 Relnspection Photo i wad G | &
|341 | 15/01/20 15:08 Relnspection Photo )| et | A
142 | 15/01/20 15:05 Relnspection Photo 0| cadirs | &
143 | 15/01/20 15:05 | Reinspection Photo Q| adivs | B2
144 | 15/01/20 15:05 Reinspection Photo 0| wears | A
145 | 15/01/20 15:05 | Reinspection Photo O waaws | A
148 | 15/01/20 15105 | Reinspection Photo © | weivs | B
147 | 15/00,/20 15105 Relnspection Photo l! toad v | B4
148 | 15/01/20 15:05 Rainspection Phate 0| teewc | A
144 | 15/01/20 15:05 Reinspection Photo 0| coawc || A
150 | 15/01/20 15:05 | Reinspection Photo 0| wews | A
151 | 15/01/20 15:05 | Meinspection Photo D | v | B
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No_| Finakzed On India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) Tnumbnail

152 [15/01/20 15:08% Helnspection Photo

| 153 | 15/01/20 15:05 Reinspaction Phota

154 | 15/01/20 15:05 Reinspection Photo

155 | 15/01/20 15:05 Relnspection Photo

Documentation

Relabel/Reorder | LXK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ)

g
3
LIRS SIS

Mo

1 [23/12/19 11:13 | TP GIA REPORT O | oea PoF

2 lzyizie 111 [ACKMOWLEDGEMENT EMALL TO IT1 0D 19.12.19 Load POF

13 15/01/2015:25 | PARF COE REBATE Load POF

(4 | 2002720 09:37 AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM Lowd POF

§ | 20y02/30 09:37 DISCHARGE VOUCHER Load POF

6 |I0/02/20 09:37 DE-REGISTERED Lond FOF

7 |20002/20 09:37 LOD Load PDF

No_| Finallzed On India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail| Print

i 24/13/19 11:10 Singapore Accident Statement

Load PDF

Documents Checklist

'DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST

neset | Save | print |

There are no document checllists configured

Aemarks - Auto Pie Lid (HO)

Show Remarks To: L] Handling Insurer
Bicdm ! Rl @8 et B1E il EEE i Ghiss B 10 BENES pErEE
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoreq no 1sssor1ssr)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CCa/11180223685T1GA302

Data: 2010272020
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer India International Insurance Ple Lid  Policy No: MCOMDO015
Claimant .
Vehicle No : SJEB140U Insured Vehicle No : SHD4T440
Date of Loss: 14M12/2019 Mature of Claim: TP Claim No: MCT18120313
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SJEG140U
Make & Model: TOYOTA CAMRY, 2.4 (A) Engine No: 2AZE0T92685
Reg. Date: 30/04/2008 (Man. Year: 2007) Chassis No: MRO53BK4007021571
Colour White Cdometer: 0 km
Engine Capacity 2362 cc
Market Value/New Car NJA
Price
Sum Insured (S$): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbraka (Serviceable); Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
From Tyre Size 215/55 R17 Rear Tyre Size: 215/55 R17
Front Left Side: Continental 8 mm Rear Left Side Continental & mm
Front Right Side: Continental 6 mm Rear Right Side Continental 6 mm
The above values regresent the remaining fyre reeds depth
ICOST OF CLAIMS Repairers  Adjuster's Difference  DIff %
Paris 0.00 0.00 0.00
Miscellaneous llams 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 0,00 0.00 0.00
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (8§) 0.00 0.00 0.00
Approved Total (Overridden) (S§) 10,000.00
Nett Amount (5§) 0.00 10,000.00 <10,000.00
+ Loss of Use (10.0 x 55100.00/day) (S§) 1,000.00
Nett Liability (SS) 11,000.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 18122018
Date Inspected 18/12/2019 Inspected At V-tec Asia Automotive Pte Lid (HQ)
B KAKI BUKIT AVE 4, #07-08/09
PREMIER@KEB
Singapore 415875
Estimated Period of Repair: 0.0 days
Adjuster: MOHD TAUFIKH BIN HAMID Manager: Chong Pui Lin
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NOTE: Thia repert tepresents our findings at the time and place of inapection stated hersin. Such ingpection has been camed ouf fo the best of our
knowlkedge and abilty but any oitfer llabiily under any other circumstances (s hereby sspresaly excluded.
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PLEASE BE INFORMED OWNER THAT THE VEHICLE NOT ECONOMICAL FOR REPAIR.
MARKET YVALUE - $24,000.00

LTA REIMBURSEMENT VALUE (RV) : §13,729.00

NETT VALUE - $10271.00

IN VIEW OF THE ABOVE, THE VEHICLE IS UNECONOMICAL TO BE REPAIRED.
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REPAIR DETAILS _
Reference ‘
Part Source: MRM-SG Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 23 Dec 2019)

Parts: 143 TOYOTA CAMRY 2.4 (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)

Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard List)

Print Coade: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SJEB140U)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the prinl code (above) on all estimate pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

Further Info: llems/values nol in reference catalogue are p:‘jﬂxnd with an aslerisk *, |

Recommended Parts
There are no new pars selected.

[ Report was unsubmitied during this print-out. |
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellansous lems selected.

Recommended Labour

There are no labour items selected.
| Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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