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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Sent: Friday, 20 December 2019 9:34 AM
To: Shirlene YEO (CNB)
Cc: Chris TAN (CNB); Wenzheng LIEW from.TP (CNB)
Subject: RE: HOMCNBECI19301131  - Accident Vehicle PC3362E (OUR REF: 

CC2/CNB19022362/g)

 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 3362E (CNB) & PA 8894P (CIVILIAN) ON 10 DECEMBER 2019 ALONG 
KALLANG ROAD 1. 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
According to our driver accident report and accident scene photo, the accident occurred solely caused by the 
negligence driving of civilian driver by changing of lane and collided onto PC 3362E. 
 
Therefore, we are seeking your approval to apply the Insurance Search for vehicle PA 8894P to enable us to 
process Potential Recovery from the respective insurer. Please note the Insurance Search fee is $2.00/-. For 
your approval please. 
 
Once repair is done, please let us have the followings in order for us to proceed further:- 
 

1. Final Repair Bill. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 
"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020" 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749-4274 | email:  CeciliaChong @lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Shirlene YEO (CNB) [mailto:Shirlene_YEO@cnb.gov.sg]  
Sent: Thursday, 19 December 2019 2:56 PM 
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Chris TAN (CNB) <Chris_TAN@cnb.gov.sg>; Wenzheng LIEW from.TP (CNB) <Wenzheng_LIEW_from.TP@cnb.gov.sg> 
Subject: RE: HOMCNBECI19301131 - Accident Vehicle PC3362E 
 

Message Classification: Restricted 

Hi Cecilia 
 


