4/22/2020 Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook
RE: FW: AXA REF: C0314940 ; TCS REF: AAD1408-280--Accident involving SKM7612P
(AXA) & SHB 9948B ON 26/08/2014 // LKK REF: CC3/AXA14016319/Kpa3q2-1

CHAN Kian Chuan <kianchuan.chan@axa.com.sg>
Wed 22/4/2020 12:05 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Hi Hsiao Tong,
Approved settlement at 50/50 quantum as proposed.
Thank you.

*Please note that contents of this email should not be construed as any admission of liability on the part of our
insured and/ or insurers. We hereby maintain full reservation of rights and all defences available to us.

Warmest Regards

KC Chan | Senior Specialist, Motor Claims Department

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 | www.axa.com.sg
Email: kianchuan.chan®axa.com.sg

Customer Care No. 1800 8804888

iEL

50 Years
in Singapore

GLOBAL INSURANCE
# BEANDFORIO

CONSECUTIVE YEARS

Please consider the environment before printing this message
This message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is
prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, April 21, 2020 2:43 PM

To: CHAN Kian Chuan <kianchuan.chan@axa.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: FW: AXA REF: C0314940 ; TCS REF: AAD1408-280--Accident involving SKM7612P (AXA) &
SHB 9948B ON 26/08/2014 // LKK REF: CC3/AXA14016319/Kpa3q2-1

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

No video footage from both parties. Third party had submitted a copy of witness statement for our
review.
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Our insured was reversing into the parking lot while third party decided to pass by our insured vehicle.
We are of the view that both parties should exercise caution. We seek you mandate to settle the

Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook

matter at $2,546.34(all-in). Breakdown as follows: -

Liability: 50%

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $4,163.22
2. Loss of Rental (5days x $133.75) $ 668.75
3. Loss of Income (5days x $50.00) S 250.00
$ 5,081.97
@ 50% | $2,540.99
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee $ 5.35
Total | $ 2,546.34

Kindly let us have your mandate/ instruction.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related

documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256 3561 | email: chewht@]lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: CHAN Kian Chuan <kianchuan.chan@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 20 April 2020 2:12 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: FW: AXA REF: C0314940 ; TCS REF: AAD1408-280--Accident involving SKM7612P (AXA) & SHB

Hi,

TP is chasing for offer.
Fyna, please.
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Thank you.

*Please note that contents of this email should not be construed as any admission of liability on the part of our
insured and/ or insurers. We hereby maintain full reservation of rights and all defences available to us.

Warmest Regards

KC Chan | Senior Specialist, Motor Claims Department

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 | www.axa.com.sg
Email: kianchuan.chan@axa.com.sg

Customer Care No. 1800 8804888

Please consider the environment before printing this message
This message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is
prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

From: Roman De Alban <cst@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, February 17, 2020 8:07 AM

To: CHAN Kian Chuan <kianchuan.chan@axa.com.sg>

Cc: SG AXA Insurance SM Motor Doc <motor.doc@axa.com.sg>

Subject: FW: FW: AXA REF: C0314940 ; TCS REF: AAD1408-280--Accident involving SKM7612P (AXA) & SHB

Dear Kian Chuan,

For Claim no. C0314940, 3rd Party, TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD, chasing for offer.
For your file record and necessary action.

With regards,

Roman De Alban | Specialist, Gl Call Centre AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore
068811 | www.axa.com.sg

Email: cst@axa.com.sg

Phone: 1800 880 4888 (Within Singapore) / (65) 6880 4888 (International)

--------------- Original Message ---------------

From: Ng Wai Yin [waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: 14/02/2020 16:13

To: motor.email@axa.com.sg

Cc: claims@transcab.com.sg; cst@axa.com.sg; motor.doc@axa.com.sg

Subject: [EXTERNAL] FW: AXA REF: C0314940 ; TCS REF: AAD1408-280--Accident involving SKM7612P (AXA) &
SHB9948B on 26.08.14

Urgent!

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir
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Please refer to the above subject matter, are there any offer making to us?

Enclosed is the witness statement for your investigation. Our taxi's was travelling straight inside the carpark, your
insured which was stationary on the right without any signal on and suddenly reversed his vehicle to the parking
lot that resulted damage on our taxi's right side portion.

Hope you can review this matter and let us have your best offer as soon due to time-bar period is approaching.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department

TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg
<mailto:claims@transcab.com.sg>

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111

Tel: 6287 6666 Fax: 6287 7764

From: Ng Wai Yin [mailto:waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, 3 October, 2019 4:39 PM
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To: 'motor.doc@axa.com.sg' <motor.doc@axa.com.sg>; 'CST' <cst@axa.com.sg>

Cc: 'claims' <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: AXA REF: C0314940 ; TCS REF: AAD1408-280--Accident involving SKM7612P (AXA) & SHB9948B on
26.08.14

Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/ Mdm

We are making a claim against your client SKM 7612P.

AAD1408-280

C0314940

Please provide survey report

Enclosed is our LOD, estimate marking and witness statement for your easy reference.

This case was survey by LKK Auto consultants, normally LKK will direct send the survey report to your good office.

Hope to receive your offer soon.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department

TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308
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*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg
<mailto:claims@transcab.com.sg>

<https://urldefense.proofpoint.com/v2/url?u=http-
3A__ www.transcab.com.sg_&d=DwICAg&c=796x8)GkxccfSDHIxuHxeg&r=x4uBbPytZhNG1pVilnEXLg&m=2G_79C
0JX-OLXTJgDgrd1bbf6EtQbpBsVY76LZprBLO&s=7mMpWnuGbiCpJRXzCACc-oKxyNaRg1QUhOr2oRI7ssc&e= >

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other
legal rules. If you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system;
you may not copy this message or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing
deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message
cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG.

https://urldefense.proofpoint.com/v2/url?u=https-
3A__www.avg.com&d=DwICAg&c=796x8jGkxccfS5DHIxuHxeg&r=x4uBbPytZhNG1pVilnEXLg&mM=2zG_79C0JX-
OLXTJgDqrd1bbf6EtQbpBsVy76LZprBLO&s=MGd_RI6iUIhLDXpEcGtv4vcuiyviDzaTYuryjOcqgnGM&e=

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by AXA except where provided forin a
written agreement between you and AXA. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or
partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.
ref:_00DbOKy1f._5002v2gUpjM:ref

————— Disclaimer-----

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you are
not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you
have received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in
this message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or
any other entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said
companies.

————— Disclaimer-----

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you are
not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you
have received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in
this message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or
any other entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said
companies.

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by

AXA except where provided for in a written agreement between you and AXA. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is
prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify

the sender immediately.
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This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named
addressee. If you are not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the
content of this message. If you have received this message by mistake, please notify the sender
immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this message are solely those of the author and do
not necessarily represent those of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or any other entity of the AXA Group, unless
otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named
addressee. If you are not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the
content of this message. If you have received this message by mistake, please notify the sender
immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this message are solely those of the author and do
not necessarily represent those of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or any other entity of the AXA Group, unless
otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by

AXA except where provided for in a written agreement between you and AXA. Any

unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is

prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify

the sender immediately.
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