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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Teo, Grace <grace teo@sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 19 December 2019 2:13 PM

To: Elaine Toh; ‘admin-d@Ikkauto.com’; 'assignments@Ikkauto.com'’

Ce: ¥e, Yong Kang Melvin; Henry, Irene James; Hwang, Shiang i

Subject: CMTD1905878/5SYH - LKK/ SCY1131G & SLC3291Z ACC ON 17 DECEMBER 2019
ALONG MALAYSIA CUSTOM TOWARDS SINGAPORE CUSTOM AT ABOUT 0015
HOURS

Our Reference: CMTD1905878/SYH
Your Reference: SLC3291Z (Y1)

ithout Pr ice

Date: 19/12/2019 EMAIL ONLY
OUR Email: molorsury ey @ som . com,sg
Attention:
M/S VISION LAW LLC
Dear Elaine,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SCY1131G & SLC3291Z ON 17.12.2019
We refer to your email reply of today.

We will appoint LKK Auto Consultants to conduct the survey.

Hi LKK Auto,

Please refer to the email below and make the arrangement to survey for SLC32912 on a without prejudice basis and
revert with your report upon completion of survey to my colleague, Ms. Shiang Yi.

Our office will be closed on Christmas. New Year's Eve and New Year Pay. Business will resume on 26™ December 2019
and 2™ January 2020 respectively
We wish you a Merry Christmas and a Happy New Yoar!

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D 63285170 | T 6461 6555 | F 5221 3147

For motor claims survey request, please email to MolOrsurvey@sompo.com.sg




INSURANCE

(@ SOMPO A century of Trust
O entury of Trus

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte, Lid,
50 Raffles Place #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623

Website: www.sompo.com sg | Facebook: www.facebook com/SompoSG

Quick & Fasy Claims Submission' & Product Purchase® via Sompo SG

P> Google Play

® App Store

rop Pravel Ferssmal Acciden) & Flome Tisorsmni e TravEl Personal Adcident Hiomme & Private Motos lnsuratice

i mlovsadd moow @ or

Disclaimer: This =-mail, ncluding attachments. 18 intended for the persan(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legaily prvleged information. Unauthonsed disclosure, copying or use ol this information may be unlawiul and is prohibited
If you are not the intended recipient. piease delele this massage

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte Lid may collect, Lise and disclose your personal data for the purposes
slated in our Privacy Policy This may imclude disciosure o holding and associaled companies, credit bureay, parties (o whom
disclasure is permittedirequired by laws. our third party service prowiders and agenis (acting on our behall). Please click hare for
our Privacy Palicy

From: Elaine Toh <Elainetoh@visionlawlle.com>

Sent: Thursday. December 19, 2019 12:32 PM

To: Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>; Hwang, Shiang Yi <shiangyi.hwang@sompo.com.sg>
Ce: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; Henry, Irene James

<irene henry(@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: RE: CMTD1905878/SYH - PRI/ SCY1131G & SLC3291Z ACC ON 17 DECEMBER 2019
ALONG MALAYSIA CUSTOM TOWARDS SINGAPORE CUSTOM AT ABOUT 0015 HOURS
Importance: High

Our Ref: SLC 3291 Z (YL)
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer 1o your letter dated 18 December 2018 informing that you wish to conduct a pre-repair survey and your List of Surveyors.
Our client confirmed appointment of LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS as the Single Joint Expert for this matter.

Please be informed that the said vehicle can be inspected at:

Venue: M/s Flying High Spray Painting
1 Kaki Bukit Ave &
#01-29 Autobay @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883
Contact: Mr. Zack @ 6749 2997 (Please call before going)

Ityou fail to conduct the pre-repair inspection within the next 2 working days excluding any intervening Saturday, Sunday or Public
Hollday, the said workshop will commence repairs thereafter without further reference to yau.

Thank you. EOR S
Please initial here after com pletion of pre-repairins pecton
Thank you
Regards, Appainied sunayor
|_ -
Elaine Toh (Secretary) E | Name & Signaturo)

Vision Law LLC
Date & Time of Inspection




“ Tel: 65342811 (Ext. 122)
Fax: 65356802

ce: SLC 3291 Z - By emall anly

From: Teo, Grace [mailtv:grace leoud sompo,com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, |8 December, 2019 5:35 PM

To: Elaine Toh; Hwang, Shiang Yi

Ce: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin; Henry, Irene James

Subject: CMTD1905878/SYH - PRI/ SCY1131G & SLC3291Z ACC ON 17 DECEMBER 2019 ALONG
MALAYSIA CUSTOM TOWARDS SINGAPORE CUSTOM AT ABOUT 0015 HOURS

Our Reference: CMTDI1905878/SYH
Your Reference: SLC3291Z (YL)

Without Prejudi
Date: 18/12/2019 EMAIL ONLY

LR Email: motorsuryvey #sompo.con.sg

Attention:
M/S VISION LAW LLC

Dear Elaine,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5CY1131G & SLC32917 ON 17.12.2019
We refer to your Notice of Accident dated 18/12/2019.

Please be informed that Ms. Hwang Shiang Yi is the handler of this case who can be contacted at 63295

205/ shianeyvi hwanga'sompo.com P .

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s vehicle jointly with your
client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list to conduct
the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

Pre-Repair Survey
Selection (Indicate as
Motor Surveyor Surveyar tick)
1 Raleigh Services Andrew Ow Yong
Vincent Ng
Kenneth H-ung (North
2 LKK Auto Consultants area)
Marcus Chua (East area)
Mohd Rasul (West area)
Mohd Taufikh (West area)
3 Priority Services Jimmy Lee
Lawrence Ng
Jeffrey Ong

|



* Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select up to two of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost of
the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert.

Our office will be closed or Christmas, New Year's Eve and New Year Day. Business will resume on 26" December 2019
and 2™ January 2020 respectivaly
We wizh you a Merry Christmas and a Happy New Year|

Besi Regaros

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D 83295170 | T: 6461 6555 | F 6221 3147

For motor claims survey request, please email to motorsurvey(@sompo.com.sg

@/ SOMPO A Century of Trust

IN SURAN

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte, Ltd.
50 Raffles Piace #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623

Website: www sompo com sg | Facebook: www facebook.com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission' & Product Purchase® via Sompo SG

& App Store

for I3 i (R Ty Sy " (L8 Fam Vo Feramal Acewdent, | homwe & 'rvaie Moior Tnsumnce

Phivws nloadd nows

Disclaimer: This e-mall. including attachmenis s imanded for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
andior legally privileged miormatian  Unauthonsed disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited
If you @re not the intended recipient. please delete this message

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Fre Ltd may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated In our Privacy Palicy This may include disclosure to helding and associated companies, credil bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is parmitted/required by laws our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Palicy

From: Elaine Toh <l lainctoh ¢ visionlawlle com>

Sent: Wednesday, December 18, 2019 5:03 PM

To: Claims - Motor Survey <MuotorSur ey i suimpo.com.sg=>

Subject: PRE REPAIR SURVEY --- YOUR REF: SCY 1131 G | ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLC 3291 Z
& SCY 1131 GON 17 DECEMBER 2019 ALONG MALAYSIA CUSTOM TOWARDS SINGAPORE
CUSTOM AT ABOUT 0015 HOURS

Or Rel: SLOC 32491 Zi1Y1)
WITHOL T PREJUDICE

Dear Sie/hadam,

We are instructed by TAN JUAT NGOH JOYCE to notify you of a road traffic accident on 17 December 2019 at about
0015 howurs along Malaysia Custom Towards Singapore Custom involving our client’s vehicle registration number SLC
3291 Z and vehicle registration number SCY 1131 G driven by you/your insured at the material time.

As a resull of the accident, our client’s vehicle has been damaged. Before our client proceed to repair the damaged
vehicle, please let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice whether you or your Insurer would like



* to tonduct a pre-repair survey of the vehicle. If we do not receive any reply from you within the stipulated timeline,
our client shall proceed to repair the vehicle without further reference to you.

Thank vou,

Regards.

Elmne Toh

Vision Law LLC

Tel: 65342811 (Ext, 122y
Fax: 63336802

ce: SLC 3291 2 - By fax only

VISION LAW LLC

Advocates & Solicitors

(Incorporated with limited liability)

Unique Entity No. 200721 148H

Head Office: 133 New Bridge Road #18-01/02 Chinatown Point, Singapore 059413
Branch: 490 Lorong 6 Toa Payoh #03-11 HDB Hub (Biz 3 Lobby 1), Singapore 310490

DISCLAIMER:

The contents of this email (including any attachments) are confidential and privileged and only intended for
the recipient(s) addressed above. If vou received this email

by error, please notify the sender immediately and destroy it (and all attachments) without reading, storing
and/or disseminating any of its contents (in any form) 10 any

person. Email communication is not secure. Vision Law LLC is not liable for any losses arising out of any
errors or omissions in the contents resulting from email

transmission or any illegal or unauthorised usage or tampering of its email system.

VISION LAW LLC

Advocates & Solicitors

(Incorporated with limited liability)

Unique Entity No. 200721 148H

Address : 133 New Bridge Road #18-01/02 Chinatown Point, Singapore 059413

DISCLAIMER:

The contents of this email (including any attachments) are confidential and privileged and only intended for
the recipient(s) addressed above. If you received this email

by error, please notify the sender immediately and destroy it (and all attachments) without reading, storing
and/or disseminating any of its contents (in any form) to any

person. Email communication is not secure. Vision Law LLC is not liable for any losses arising out of any
€ITors or omissions in the contents resulting from email

transmission or any illegal or unauthorised usage or tampering of its email system.



VISION LAW LLC

Advocates & Solicitors

(Incorporated with limited liability)

Unique Entity No. 200721148H

Address : 133 New Bridge Road #18-01/02 Chinatown Point, Singapore 059413

DISCLAIMER:

The contents of this email (including any attachments) are confidential and privileged and only intended for
the recipient(s) addressed above. If you received this email

by error, please notify the sender immediately and destroy it (and all attachments) without reading, storing
and/or disseminating any of its contents (in any form) to any

person. Email communication is not secure. Vision Law LLC is not liable for any losses arising out of any
errors or omissions in the contents resulting from email

transmission or any illegal or unauthorised usage or tampering of its email system.




Denise Ta: {LKHAutnz

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 20 December 2019 B:43 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); 'Teo, Grace’; assignments

Cc 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin'; 'Henry, Irene James'; ‘Hwang, Shiang Yi'; SUR

Subject: RE: CMTD1905878/5YH - LKK/ SCY1131G & SLC3291Z ACC ON 17 DECEMBER 2019
ALONG MALAYSIA CUSTOM TOWARDS SINGAPORE CUSTOM AT ABOUT 0015
HOURS

Dear Sir/Madam,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SLC 3291Z on 19/12/2019
We are pending estimate from repairer.

Hes1 Regards,
Denise Tay | Case Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

Phone: 6256-3361 | email: denisetavialkknuio.com | fax; 62564315
Blk 31, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4085933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d(@lkkauto.com=>

Sent: Thursday, 19 December 2019 2:33 PM

To: 'Teo, Grace' <grace.teo/@sompo.com.sg>; assignments <assignments(@lkkauto,com>

Ce: 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin' <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; 'Henry, Irene James'
<irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>; 'Hwang, Shiang Yi' <shiangyi.hwang@sompo.com.sg>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com=>

Subject: RE: CMTD1905878/SYH - LKK/ SCY1131G & SLC3291Z ACC ON 17 DECEMBER 2019
ALONG MALAYSIA CUSTOM TOWARDS SINGAPORE CUSTOM AT ABOUT 0015 HOURS

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank vou for the assignment.

Wishes you a Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020 A

Best Regards
G.NIVITHA

LEK Aulo Consultants Pte Lud
Phone: 6841-1972 | email: pssignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)
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Best Car Repair Workshops in Singapore
8rowse more than 3,000 car workshops in Singapare,
You can read customers’ reviews & ratings on their services too.
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* > Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner ID Type Singapore NRIC
Crener 1D 1408
[ 7 O s e ]
Vehicle No SLC3291Z
Vehicle to be Exported Yes
Intepded Deregistration Date 19 Dec 2019
WVehicle Mako TOYOTA
Vehicle Model: COROLLA ALTIS 1.6 AUTD
Primary Colour Silver
Manufacturing Year 2008
Engine No JZZ45T54248
Chassis Na MROSIZEC 107121458
Maximum Power Dutput 810 kW (108 bhp)
Open Market Value: $15.950.00
Original Registration Date 12 Jun 2006
First Registration Date: 12 Jun 2006
Transler Count 2
Actual ARF Paid: $17.545.00
ERinic o PARE Bebite Dol
PARF Eligibility Farfelted
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date -
PARF Rebate Amount $0.00
Elnsneed CERebate Datails R L
COE Expiry Date 31 May 2021
COE Category A - Car (1600cc & below)
COE Period|Years) 5
PP Paid: $22.78%.00
COE Rebate Amoun) $6.603.00
Total Rebate Amount $6,603.00

Please note that the S.year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renswed. The vehicle must be de-registered upon COE expiry or when the
vehicle reachies |8 statutory lifespan |If applicable), whichever is sarlier.
The indormation contained herein s correct asat 19 Dec 2019

OK
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CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

Pl OTER VEMIELEL | Trm0-RAETy AL il (958 (SEIH RN OF Ritiarus)

Pl DTOR RIS [Ty AERL ARD CORMFFRETION ATT T AF 108 TF T SFVATTD FETrea
BEFUI CF LArORL)
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SRR T T WNCARTHED OF ANY ARTEAEWT &2T OF ATTS BRTEID M SUETTITITES T8 0F

ARE RS ETET AT T | R R AR
[ CERTIFICATE NUMBER, 10952478

1) VEHICLE REGISTRATION NO. S1C33917

#) NAME OF INSURED
AR Pt Ty
CHIVE R b LIKT NGO WvCE

3) EFFECTIVE DATE OF COMMENCEMENT OF INSLURAMNCE FOR THE 11-Pec- 2019 14 200wy
PURPOSE OF THE ACT

4) DATE OF EXPIRY OF INSURANCE 10-Dec-J020 23 38 hours

5) PERSONS OR CLASSES OF PERSONS ENTITLED TO DRIVE
Wi aned 1 naemad desei

Famndedd thad the penar e & prrretied in actordEnce weth e ey of ST lies o reguiation e arwe (e Mo vetecle o b
bmar v permetied and @ not deguaihed by order of 8 Court of Liw oF Dy ary neson ol ey eracumant o6 regulmion o ket bekall fom dreng
he Motar vehids.

Anel prowided fartter Tt the Mator Whicle & regemamd undes tha Boad Tratfic S ara m egtsason wnder The Baad Traffc Act fas ot Been
carcried Bt ihe e of Bcoeeal o s

Piasia sl b e podey Socumert lor bl e gns condilions

B] LIMITATIONS AS TO USE*
Ui aanby Do miaciil, cdarmeschis s plemiie purprenes and lal the el s buseen, The Palcy duoey el oot s Us e o seversd, bilon o dimy
te, ricing. pane-masking, maabding ok, speed-aeeimg or the rarmage of gy after M sersles in ronreTn itk aey e o Busme & uie i
@ pUERE ) COReLTn WLl Thie WA Tiee

* LimfAnts revterg inegaraiieg By Soriess B of the Mot vefedes [Thit fercty Riks s Compenarirond At (Chapter 1L s Seotmn B3 o e
Hoad P det, PRAT Mlalapiaal mew st F2 b incluvied Leges shee b ssings

NAMED DRIVER
PAMET WAk "o
CIVEN NANE CHLIAS [t
7) FINANCE COMPANY TOEYD CENTLIRY | EASING SINGAPORE FTE

Lo

1/'Wee mpreby Contify that tha paiicy 10 which this Certificate relited |1 lisued in sccordance with the provisons of the Motor Vetades
[Thed-Party Riks aned Compansatean) A (Chater 189 and Part IV of the Boad Trarmport Act, VOR7 (Maleysial or any amendmant
BT 07 acts panted i b uben Thareal

kssued In Singapare: 17-Dec-2019 a4 14:20hgwurs Aviva Lid,

IMPORTANT NOTT:

o W pong wwanl 43 Eanasd v pokny 2t ey e, g well el 1T ntes the cevetieat Toa ﬂ

* Wi it fepert sl acoicerin 19 Ui wethem 24 hour of fhe ccouriende g0 Uy 1he resd seovkiog diy al ol scodent
wonrhmg cenire regardiess of shwtiver o e 10 clim on po e paley o net, o whelher yous e 8 -
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Fur the it of ouir mcderd reparting CerSIes, pinase Wit WITIT A e c0m S5 mfirpaness. Allenataty Nihe Mamuoer
vour nay call un w6333 1220 for swseiency (NOUBng eonatance on enciceen demace) Chiet Expeltivn Ofticar

[

In case of vehicle breakdown, accident or windscreen damage, please call 6333 2222 (24 hours) immediately.
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SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PL

50 RAFFLES PLACE
#05-01/06
SINGAPORE LAND TOWERSINGAPORE 048623

SCY 11316

CS/SMO

Rel

Data :

12-03-2020

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01.25 Pays Ubl Indusiriai Park, Singapore 408933
TEL 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 188607188R GST Reg. No. 18-9607198-R

18022329/A1d3n2

IR

Assign From

Make & Model TOYOTAALTIS

Insured Vah. SLC 322

Policy No. Coverage (3) 0.00

Claim No. CMTD1905878/SYH Excess (§) 0.00
GRACE TED 19/12/2019

J8sC

DAMAGES SEE DETAILS,

171212018

Accident Date

THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.

1568
Engine No, HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2006
Chassis No. MROS3ZEC 107121668 Colour SILVER
Odometer 271074 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
Ganaral GOOD
R/H Front Tyre |[18570R14 DUNLOP & mm
LH Front Tyre |18570DR14 DUNLOP 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |18570 R14 DUNLOP 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre [1B570R14 DUNLOP B mm

1841212019

Survey held at

BLK 1 KAK] BUKIT AVE &
#01-26 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

FLYING HIGH SPRAY PAINTING

AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJLIIJC" BASIS. -
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
B1 Ubi Ave 1 #0125 Paya Uibl Indusirial Park. Singapare 408833
TEL: B258 3581 FAX: G258 4315
Reg. No: 100607198R GST Reg: No. 18-D607198-R

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLC 3291Z

[ REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT RH DOOR DENTED 1,109.20 1,108.20
1|FRONT RH DOOR PROTECTOR cuT 88.90 88.80
1|REAR RH DOOR TO REPAIR SEE 1,085.20 -
LABOUR
1|REAR RH DOOR PROTECTOR cur 83.50 83.50
1|REAR BUMFER DEFORMED 484 80 484 80
1|REAR BUMPER CLIPS NECESSARY 30.00 30.00
1|REAR BUMPER SIDE HOLDER RH NOT NECESSARY 32.20 -
LESS 25% DISCOUNT - 45413
283390 1.362.37
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT RH DOOR BLACK TAPE (SN) NECESSARY 60.00 60.00
1|REAR RH DOOR BLACK TAPE (SN) NOT NECESSARY 60.00 ’
1|REAR RH WHEEL RIM (SN) curt 600.00 380.00
720,00 440,00
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR B00.00 500.00
RH DOOR.
SPRAY PAINTING. 1,000.00 800,00
WIRING, 50.00 30.00
TO TRANSFER DOOR FITTINGS. 300.00 80.00
2.150,00 1,510.00
GRAND TOTAL 5,803.90 331237

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE.AMEAE-A M MATAI
Licensed Appraiser
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