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Your rel: CMTDI1905866/GPL

Qur ref: CS/SMO19022308/Kvd3 Date:24/1272019

The Motor Claims Department
M/s SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD

Dear SirrfMadam
PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.SLO 4108R

We thank for your instruction on  19/12/2019

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

23/12/2019 at the premises of M/s ESTEEM PERFORMANCE PTE LTD
Workshop Estimate Amount : S8 2,799.03
Revised Estimate Amount : S§ 200.00
“Check"” Items Amount : 8%

Market Value : 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5%

Nett Value : 8%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the ragr
rear portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

Kenneth Kong
Licensed Appraiser



" Veron Chen SLKI{Autu!

From: Veron Chen (LKKAutD)

Sent: Tuesday, 24 December 2019 11:24 AM

To: Teo, Grace'; SUR; 'Gnoh, Pau Loong’

Ce: *Ye, Yong Kang Melvin'; 'Henry, Irene James’

Subject: RE: CMTD1905866/GPL - LKK/ FBP5069L & SLQ4108R ACC ON 14.12.19
Attachments: SLQ 4108R PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLQ 4108R
Date of survey: 23/12/2019
Number of days (estimated) : 1 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 19 December 2019 11:08 AM

To: ‘Teo, Grace' <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: ‘Gnoh, Pau Loong' <Pauloong.Gnoh@sompo.com.sg>; ‘Ye, Yong Kang Melvin' <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>;
'Henry, Irene James' <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: CMTD1905866/GPL - LKK/ FBPS069L & SLQ4108R ACC ON 14.12.19

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle is not in the workshop, repairer arrange on 23/12/2019.

Wishes you a Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020 A’

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkdsouto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, 202-25 | $(q08933)

From: Teo, Grace [mailto:grace teo@sompo.com.sg|
Sent: Thursday, 19 December 2019 10:58 AM



Ti::-:']tznm.uI chong <jenny@esteemperf.com.sg>; ‘admin-d @lkkauto.com’ min-d@lkkauto.coms=;
‘assignments@lkkauto.com’ <assignments@Ikk Lom>
Cc: Gnoh, Pau Loong <Pauloong.Gnoh@sompo.com.sg>; n@esteemperf.com.

serence@esteemperf.com sg; kaeley@esteemperf.com.sg; shanice@esteemperf.com.sg; Ye, Yong Kang Melvin

<melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; Henry, Irene James <irene henry@sompo.com.sg>
Subject: CMTD1905866/GPL - LKK/ FBP5069L & SLQ4108R ACC ON 14.12.19

Qur Reference; CMTD1905866/GPL
Your Reference: SLOQ410BR

Without Prejudice
Date: 18/12/2019 EMAIL ONLY
OUR Emall: motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg

Attention:
M /S ESTEEM PERFORMANCE PTE LTD

Dear Jenny,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBP5069L & SLQ4108R ON 14.12.2019
We refer to your email reply of today.

We will appoint LKK Auto Consultants to conduct the survey.

Hi LKK Auto,

Please refer te the email below and make the arrangement to survey for SLQ4108R on a without prejudice basis and
revert with your report upon completion of survey to my colleague, Mr. Pau Loong.

Thank you.

Our office will be closed on Christmas, New Year's Eve and New Year Day. Business will resume on 26" December 2019
and 2" January 2020 respectively.
We wish you a Merry Christmas and a Happy New Year!

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D. 6329 5170 | T: 6461 6555 | F. 6221 3147

For motor claims survey request, please email to motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg

@ SOMPO ' A century of Trust
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Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo.com.sq | Facebook: www facebook com/SempeSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission®' & Product Purchase® via Sompo 5G

® App Store

' Far Travel, Personal Acoident & Home Insurance | £ For Travel, Personal Accident, Home & Private Motor Inturance

Download now @

Disclaimer: This e-mall, including altachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information, Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Lid, may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding 8nd associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third parly service providers and agents (acting on our behalf) Please click here for
our Privacy Palicy

From: jenny chong <jenny@esteemperf.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, December 19, 2019 10:53 AM

To: Teo, Grace <grace. mMpo.Ccom.sg>

Cc: Gnoh, Pau Loong <Pauloong Gnoh@sompo.com.sg>; carmen@esteemperf.com.sg;
serence@esteemperf.com.sg; kael esteemperf.com.sg; shanice @esteemperf.com.sg; Ye, Yong Kang Melvin
<melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; Henry, irene James <irene_hen mpo.com.sg>

Subject: Re: CMTD1905866/GPL - PRI/ FBP5069L & SLQ4108R ACC ON 14.12.19

Dear Grace
We are prefer LKK kenneth to survey the car.

Thank you

“ -

Freundliche GriiBe / Best Regards

Jenny Chong
Senior Operation Executive | Operation Division

Esteemn Performance Pte Lid

P: 6484 1221

F: 6484 7829

E: enny@esteemperf com.sg

5033 Ang Mo Kio Industnal Park 2 #01-259
{Head Office)

385 Sin Ming Drive Vicom Inspection Centre
{Showroom)

i mpearformance com

Gon/

On Thu, Dec 19, 2019 at 10:42 AM Teo, Grace <grace.leo{@sompo.com.sg> wrote:

3



Our Reference: CMTD1905866/GPL

Your Reference:; SLO4108R

Without Prejudice

Date: 19/12/2019 EMAIL ONLY
OUR Emall: motorsurvey(@sompo.com.sg
Attention:

M/S ESTEEM PERFORMANCE PTELTD

Dear Jenny,

AcclnENTm\‘omNG FBP5069L & SLQ4108R ON 14.12.2019
We refer to your Notice of Accident dated 19/12/2019.

Please be informed that Mr. Gnoh Pau Loong is the handler of this case who can be contacted at 63295 217/
Pauloong. h mpo.cOm.Sg .

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s vehicle jointly with your
client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list to conduct
the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

Pre-Repair Survey



Selection (Indicate as

Motor Surveyor Surveyor tick)
1 Raleigh Services Andrew Ow Yong
Vincent Ng
Kenneth Kong (North
2 LKK Auto Consultants area)

Marcus Chua (East area)
Mohd Rasul (West area)
Mohd Taufikh (West area)
3 Priority Services limmy Lee

Lawrence Ng

leffrey Ong

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select up to two of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost of
the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert.

Our office will be closed on Christmas, New Yoar's Eve and New Year Day. Business will resume on 26™ December 2019
and 2™ January 2020 respectively.

We wish you a Merry Christmas and a Happy New Year!

-

Best Regards
Grace Teo
Claims Division

D: 6328 5170 | T- 6461 6555 | F- 6221 3147

For motor claims survey request, please emall to motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg

B SOMPO
O' A Century of Trust



Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www sompo.com.sq | Facebook: www face

Quick & Easy Claims Submission’ & Product Purchase® via Sompo 56

F* Google Play

[ ;ﬁpplﬁlujr::'

Download now @ or

iFor Travel, Parsonal Accident & Home insurance | ¢ For Travel, Personal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments. is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contan confidential
andior legally prvileged informalion. Unauthornsed disclosure, copying or use of this information may be uniawful and 1s
prohibited. Il you are not the intended recipien!, please delete lhis message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Lid, may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties 1o whom
disclosure is permittedirequired by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: jenny chong <jenn steemperf.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, December 19, 2019 9:34 AM

To: Claims - Motor Survey <MotorSurvey@sompo.com.sg>
Cc: carmen lim <carmen@esteemperf.com.sg>; serence ctc <serence@esteemperf.com.sg>; Kaeley Ng

<kaeley@esteemperf.com.sg>; Shanice Leong <shanice@esteemperf.com.sg>
Subject: REQUEST FOR PRI SURVEY S5LQ4108R

[

Dear Sir / Mdm,

Accident involving SLO4108R & FBPS069L on 14.12.2019

NOTICE TO INSURER TO CONDUCT PRE-REFAIR INSPECTION WITHIN 2 WORKING DAYS PURSUANT TO PRE-
ACTION PROTOCOAL FOR NON INJURY MOTOR ACCICDENT CASES (NIMA)

We act for Goldbell car Rental Ple Lid who has appointed the under-mentioned workshop to repair his motor vehicle no . SLQ 4108 R

Please be informed that the said vehicle can be inspected at

Mame of workshop : Esteem Performance Pre Lid



Address : BLK 5033 ANG MO KIO INDUSTRIAL PARK 2 #01-259 (S) 569536

Tel : 8799 0066

Fax : 6259 3326

We hereby give 2 clear days notice to conduct a pre-repair inspection of the said vehicle at the above-mentioned workshop during office
hours.

If you fail to conduct the pre-repair inspection within the next 2 working days excluding any intervening Saturday, Sunday or Public
Holiday, The above-mentioned workshop will commence repairs should you fail to conduet the pre-repair inspection.

Vehicle will be in for survey on 23.12.2019 12:00pm

Thank you.

Freundliche Grilfe / Best Regards

Jenny Chong
Senior Operation Executive | Operation Division
Esteem Performance Pte Lid

P: 6484 1221

F: 6484 7829

E: jenny@esteemperf.com sg

5033 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2 #01-258
{Head Office)

385 Sin Ming Drive Vicom Inspection Centre
(Showroom)

www esieemperformance com

f v RO

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
AVG. WWww.BvE.com



. Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.comsg>

Sent: Thursday, 19 December 2019 10:58 AM

To: jenny chong; ‘admin-d@lkkauto.com’; ‘assignments@Ilkkauto.com’

Cc: Gnoh, Pau Loong; carmen@esteemperf.com sg; serence@esteemperf.com.sg;

kaeley@esteemperf.com.sg; shanice@esteemperf.com.sg; Ye, Yong Kang Melvin;
Henry, Irene James
Subject: CMTD1905866/GPL - LKK/ FBP5069L & SLQ4108R ACC ON 14.12.19
Attachments: SLQ 4108R.PDF

Our Reference: CMTD1805866/GPL
Your Reference: 5LQ4108R

Without Prejudice
Date: 19/12/2019 EMAIL ONLY

OUR Email: motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg

Attention:
M/S ESTEEM PERFORMANCE PTE LTD

Dear Jenny,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING FEPS069L & SLOQ410BR ON 14.12.2019
We refer to your email reply of today.

We will appoint LKK Auto Consultants to conduct the survey.

Hi LKK Auto,

Please refer to the emall below and make the arrangement to survey for SLQ4108R on a without prejudice basis and
revert with your report upon completion of survey to my colleague, Mr. Pau Loong.

Thank you.

Dur office will bo closed on Christmas, New Year's Eve and New Year Day, Business will resumo on 26" December 2018
and 2 January 2020 respectivaly
We wish you a Merry Christmas and a Happy New Year!

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D 6328 5170 | T: 6461 6555 | F 6221 3147

For motor claims survey request, please email to motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg
1



) @ SOMPO A Century of Trust

INSURANCE

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffies Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower. Singapore 048623

Website: www sompo com.sg | Facebook: www facebook com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission’ & Product Purchase’ via Sompo $G

& .ﬁpp “S'tnrc-

Download now @ or i
For Travel, Personal Accident & Homa Insurance | ¥ For Travel, Persondl Accident, Home & Private Motor Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mail. including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be untawlul and Is prohibited
It you are not the intended reciplent. please delete this message

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompe Insurance Singapore Ple, Lid may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permifted/required by laws. our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please dlick here for
our Privacy Palicy

From: jenny chong <jenny@esteemperf.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, December 19, 2019 10:53 AM

To: Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>

Ce: Gnoh, Pau Loong <Pauloong.Gnoh@sompo.com.sg>; carmen@esteemperf.com.sg;

serence @esteemperf.com.sg; kaeley@esteemperf.com.sg; shanice@esteemperf.com.sg; Ye, Yong Kang Melvin
<melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; Henry, Irene James <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: Re: CMTD1905866/GPL - PRI/ FBPSOG9L & SLO4108R ACC ON 14.12.19

Dear Grace
We are prefer LKK kenneth to survey the car.

Thank vou

Freundliche Grufe / Best Regards

Jenny Chong
Senior Operation Executive | Operation Division
Esteam Performance Ple Lid

P: 8484 1221
F: 6484 72D

E: enny@esteemperf com sg

3033 Ang Mo Kio Industnal Park 2 #01-259
(Head Office)

385 Sin Ming Dnve Vicom Inspection Centre
(Showroom)

www estegmperformance com

Bon




On Thu, Dec 19, 2019 at 10:42 AM Teo, Grace <grace.teo/@so .COM_Sp> wrote:
Our Reference; CMTD1905866/GPL

Your Reference: SLOQ4108R

Without Prejudice

Date: 19/12/2019 EMAIL ONLY

OUR Emall: motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg

Attention:

M/S ESTEEM PERFORMANCE PTE LTD

Dear lenny,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBP5069L & SLQ4108R ON 14.12.2019

We refer to your Notice of Accident dated 19/12/2019.

Please be informed that Mr. Gnoh Pau Loong is the handler of this case who can be coritacted at 63295 217/
auloong. G SOMPo.COM.SE .



We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s vehicle jointly with your
client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list to conduct
the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

Pre-Repair Survey

Selection (Indicate as
Motor Surveyor Surveyor tick)
1 Raleigh Services Andrew Ow Yong
Vincent Ng
Kenneth Kong [North
2 LEK Auto Consultants area)

Marcus Chua (East area)
Mohd Rasul (West area)
Mohd Taufikh (West area)
3 Priority Services limmy Lee

Lawrence Ng

leffrey Ong

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select up to two of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost of
the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert.

Our office will be closed on Christmas, New Year's Eve and New Yaar Day. Business will resume on 26™ December 2019
and 2" January 2020 respectively.

We wish you a Merry Christmas and a Happy New Yaar!

Best Reagards
Grace Teo
Claims Division

D 6329 5170 | T 6461 6555 | F 6221 3147

For motor claims survey request, please email to motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg
&




G, SOMPO A century of Trust

INSU Pﬂ.hﬂ- E

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www sompo.com sg | Facebook: www facebook com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission’ & Product Purchase® via Sompo SG

& App Store

Download now @

For Travel, Partonal Accident & Home Insurance | © For Travel, Peonal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mall, including attachments. is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
andfor legally privileged mformation Unauthonsed disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawiul and is
prahibited. If you are not the mtended recipent, please dalete this message

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pie. Lid may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
staled in pur Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure {o holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties 1o whom
disclosure is parmittedirequired by laws, aur third pany service providers and agenis (acting on our behalf). Please click hers for
our Privacy Policy

From: jenny chong <jenny@esteemperf.com.

Sent: Thursday, December 19, 2019 9:34 AM

Ta: Claims - Motor Survey <MatorSu 50 5g>

Cc: carmen lim <carmen@esteemperf.com.sg>; serence ctc <serence@esteemperf.com.sg>; Kaeley Ng
<kael teemperf.com.sg>; Shanice Leong <shanice @esteemperf.com.sg>

Subject: REQUEST FOR PRI SURVEY SLQ4108R

Dear Sir/ Mdm,

Accident involving SLO4108R & FBPS069L on 14.12.2019

NOTICE TO INSURER TO CONDUCT PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION WITHIN 2 WORKING DAYS PURSUANT TO PRE-
ACTION PROTOCOAL FOR NON INJURY MOTOR ACCICDENT CASES (NIMA)



We act for Goldbell car Rental Pte Ltd who has appointed the under-mentioned workshop to repair his motor vehicle no . SLQ 4108 R
Please be informed that the said vehicle can be inspected a1 -

Name of workshop : Esteem Performance Pre Lid

Address : BLK 5033 ANG MO KIO INDUSTRIAL PARK 2 #01-259 (S} 569536

Tel : B799 0066

Fax : 6259 3326

We hereby give 2 clear days notice to conduct a pre-repair inspection of the said vehicle at the above-mentioned waorkshop during office
hours.

If you fail to conduct the pre-repair inspection within the next 2 working days excluding any intervening Saturday, Sunday or Public
Haliday. The above-mentioned workshop will commence repairs should you fail to conduct the pre-repair inspection,

Vehicle will be in for survey on 23.12.2019 12:00pm

Thank vou

Freundliche Griile / Best Regards

Jenny Chong
Senior Operation Executive | Operation Division
Esteem Parfdormance Ple Lid

P: 6484 1221
F: 5484 7829

E: jenny@esteemperf com sq

5033 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2 #01-259
(Head Office)

385 Sin Ming Dnive Vicom Inspection Centre

(Showroom)

www esteemperformance com
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ELTD

- ESTEE ERFORMANCE
’FES”E” S1 M PER NCE

Tel +65-6484 1221 Fax +65-6484 7820 Websita: www esteempert com.sg

5’, P[ﬂ’ﬂﬂ”‘”ﬂ Bik 5033 Ang Mo Kio, Ind Park 2 #01-251/ 259, 589538,

—

Repair Estimates SLQ4108 R
Parts (a) Cost/List Price ltems 5 1,278.70
Plus/Less 25% 5 319.68
Total of Cost/ List - 959.03
{b) Nett Price llems
Less
Total of Nett ltem
ic) Special Nett ltems s 200.00
Total Parts Cost ] 1,159.03
Labour $ 1,640.00
Total $ 2,799.03

The above total will be subjected o 7% G.S.T

Vot Nrzhoyg
/ﬂf«r? A, /‘3?,,.?

Name of Surveyor /% 214¢ 74
Company { /qﬂ"
Survey conducted on .z_?/!!ffff’ al

Remarks By Surveyor

(a)

{b)

(c)

(d)

e)

The repair of this vehicle EV{I'MH / ts not authorized until further natice

Recommanded Days ol Repair &, ./ day(s)
Resurvey Required / Wmd
Excess $

Signature of surveyor fpc Date:

2342479
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Bik 5033 Ang Mo Kio, Ind Park 2 801-251/ 258, BEG536.
Tel: «65-6484 1221 Faxr -65-6484 TE2E Websie www esteempert com sg

Spare Parts
Vehicle No SLQ 4108 R Submit By JENNY
Make & Model : TOYOTA ALTIS Year Manufacture 2016
Chassis No MROS3REH 104560574 Engine No
Cost/ List
SiNo. Part Description Qty Unit Price Disposition by
Price Surveyor

1 |Reverse sensor & 1 |sz0000 SN ¥

2 |Rear bumper 1 |s406.50 X

3 |Rear bumper clip afv 10 [$38.90 X

4 |Rear bumper side retainer LH Ty, 1 [$11040 X

s |Rear bumper side retainer RH /N1 [s11040 4

& |Rear bumper sponge 1 | X

7 |Rear bumper reinforcement M1 [s3ss70 X

g |Rear bumper reflector LH ™~ 1 |s67.90 X

s |Rear bumper reflector RH 1=~ 1 |se7.80 Y

10

1

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

Note: If any of the quoted parts are recommended fo be repaired, then an additional labour charge

will be charged accordingly under supplementary.

Bk 5033 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2 #0]-259 Sinsgpore S69536 Tel p484127| Fax! 64847829

Conppuny Heg Mo 200005485 |/ GST Mo, 20-0005485-4
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l « . ESTEEM
. MWEH‘”a Bl 5033 Ang Mo Ko, Ind Park 2 #01-251/ 250, 569636
Tol +65-6484 1221 Fax «G5-6484 TEZY Websile: www exwemport com ag

Labour
Vehicle No : SLQ 4108 R Submit By : Carmen Lim
Make & Model TOYOTA ALTIS Yedr of Manufactiure ; 2016
SiNo Labour Description Esimated Adjusted
Price Price
1 |TO RENEW DAMAGED PARTS & KNOCK OUT ACCIDENT
REPAIR AREA. [REAR BUMPER, TAIL DOOR END PANEL) Ara4 5600.00 }(:
2 |TOPUTTY. RESPRAY PAINT FOR AFFECTED ACCIDENT
REPAIR AREA [REAR BUMPER TAIL DOOR.END PANEL) S500.00 Z e (
3 |TO check wiring Acds | 55000 X
4 |Toremove & refit spare tyre, spare tyre board, carpet irm A4 | 5150.00 X
lo assis!t work load
5 |To conduct water leakage lests 1o ensure proper air and Aca_| 512000 X
sealing
6 |Toramove & refit reverse sensor S el 5120.00 X

Note: The above estimale of repair is based on visual assessment of the extermal affected areas, Any
additional damages observed dunng the course of repair will be quote accordingly as a supplementary

L
Comipany Reg No. 200005485N / GST No. 20-0005485-NM
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| Repair Estimates SLQ4108 R /&
!I-’ /4 éﬁ. f? i
7 Py
Parts {a) Cost/ List Price ltems $ 1,278.70
Plus/Less 25% ] 319.68
Total of Cost/List $ 959.03

(b) Nelt Prica ltams

Lass

Total of Nett Item

(c) Special Nett ltems 5 200.00
Total Parts Cost 1,158.03
Labour s 200 W 1sa000
Total s 2001 2,799.03

The above total will be subjected o 7% G.5.7.

Name of Survayor : /éé raeds

Campany t !ft{{'

Survey conducted on g}ﬁ}ﬁf al
ama u r

(a) The repair of this vehicle igadflored / is not authorized until further nofice

() Recommended Days of Repair 2 day(s)
{c) Resurvey : Required / Wmd
(d) Excess 3

0& Date: 33/52 ny

(@) Signature of surveyor
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Pailt 2 401-251/ 250, 568530,
405.6484 TEZ9 Websia: ww.astoamper com. 59

Spare Parts
Vahicle No. SLQ 4108 R Submit By JENNY
Make & Modal : TOYOTA ALTIS Year Manufacture 2018
Chassls No MROSIREN 104660674 Enging MNo.
Cost/ List
S/No. Part Description Qty Linit Price Disposition by
Price Surveyor
1 |Reverse sensor L. 1 |$200.00 SN ¥
2 |Rear bumper A 1 |s4s8.50 X
3 |Rear bumper clip w10 |$38.80 X
« |Rear bumper side retainer LH ML 1 [s110.40 X
s |Rear bumper side retainer RH N1 lsnoa0 ¥
5 |Rear bumper sponge I 1 | X
7 |Rear bumper reinforcement f 1 |s3se70 £
e |Rear bumper reflector LH 1~ 1 |ser.90 K
s |Rear bumper reflector RH 1~ 1 |se7.90 y
10
1
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23

Nota: If any of the quoted parts ara recommendad lo be repairsd, then an additional labour change
will ba charged accordingly under supplementary.

-
Blkc 5033 Ang Ma Kio Industrial Park 2 #01-259 Singapore 569536 Tel: 64841221 Fux 64847829
Company Reg No. 200005483N / GET Ne, 20-0005485-1N
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Labour
Vehicle No. - SLQ 4108 R Submit By Carmen Lim
Make & Model TOYOTA ALTIS Year of Manufaciune 2016
S/ho Labour Description Esimatod Adjustad
Price Price
1 |TD RENEW DAMAGED PARTS & KNOCK OUT ACCIDENT
REPAIR AREA. (REAR BUMPER,TAIL DOOR.END PANEL) Asa $800.00 X
2 |TO PUTTY, RESPRAY PAINT FOR AFFECTED ACCIDENT
REPAIR AREA, [REAR BUMPER.TAIL DOOR.END PANEL) $800.00 Zce {
3_|TO check wiring Ay | $50.00 X
4 |To remove & refit spare lyre, spare tyre board, carpet trim /A $150.00 i
in assist work load.
5 |To conduct water leakage tests o ensure proper air and Aa|  §120.00 K
sealing
6 |Toremove & refil reverse sensor v | §120.00 A

Nate: The above estimate of repair is based on visual assessment of the external affected areas. Any
addilional damages obsorved during the course of repalr wiil be quole accordingly as a supplementary.

-—

Company Reg No. 200005483N / GST Ne. 20-0003483-M




Veron Chen {LKI[Autn!

From: jenny chong <jenny@esteemperf.comsg>

Sent: Tuesday, 14 January 2020 5:08 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Cc carmen lim; serence ctc

Subject: FINALISED 5LQ47108R

Attachments: 20200114170531136.pdf; 5df77324-1d4e-49ac-bceb-b526914f7dee jpg;

3711af47-Bce9-4baa-89a0-71e501bfaf5d jpg; bB46dc9a-1c02-4b2b-
abed-8ef7a3c957eb jpg; casee3le-5cd3-4e90-8890-84547d27ab48 jpg;
e93b9Bee-3992-4699-bbad-a09d375adbdf jpg; f0aBa157-0dc1-4ac3-
acb2-550fde120569.jpg

Dear Veron
Pls refer as attached.
Kindly confirm the finalised amount asap.

Thank you

a1

Freundliche Grille / Best Regards

Jenny Chong
Senior Operation Executive | Operation Division
Esleem Performance Ple Lid

P: 6484 1221
F: 6484 7829
E: lenny@esteemperf.com. sq

5033 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2 #01-259
{(Head Office)

385 Sin Ming Drive Vicom Inspection Centre
(Showroom)

www esteemperformance cam

&= [=] [=

- Forwarded message

From: <RicohMPC2504@singnet.com.sg>
Date: Tue, Jan 14, 2020 at 5:03 PM

Subject: Message from "RNPO02673C346EA"
To: jaynee <jenny@esteemperf.com.sg>




This E-mail was sent from "RNPOD2673C346EA" (MP C2504).

Scan Date: 01.14.2020 17:05:31 (+0800)
Queries to: RicohMPC2504 @singnet.com.sg



y L LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Al A 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Indusirial Park. Singapore 408333
- TEL: 6258 3561 FAX: 8258 4315

Reg Mo: 199807188R GST Reg. Mo, 18-9607T108-R

Affillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PL Raf CS/SMO19022308/Kvdan2

50 RAFFLES PLACE
#05-01/06 Data 16-01-2020

SINGAPORE LAND TOWERSINGAPORE D4B623

Code : SMO
1] , _Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. FBP 5069L Veh. Inspected SLG 4108R
Policy No. Coverage (5) 0.00
Claim No. CMTD1905866/GPL Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From GRACE TEO Assign Date 18/12/2018
2. : Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA ALTIS (A) c.c 1598
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. MROSIREH 104560574 Colour METALLIC BLACK
Odometer 181682 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Medification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres \
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |[215/45 R17T MICHELIN 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/45 R17 MICHELIN 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre [215M5R17 NEXEN 8 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215M45R17 NEXEN B mm
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
Accident Date  14/12/2019 |inspection Date 23/12/2019
Survey held at ESTEEM PERFORMANCE PTE LTD
BLK 5033
ANG MO KIO INDUSTRIAL PARK 2
#01-259
SINGAPORE 588538
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

IEETIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 1 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 201-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapora 408533
TEL G256 3581 FAX: G256 4315

Reg. No: 190607188R GST Reg. Mo 18-0607108-R Page No:1 ol 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLQ 4108R
aty . ] =
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|ReAR BUMPER TO REPAIR SEE 49650 :
LABOUR
10|REAR BUMPER CLIP NOT NECESSARY 38.90
1|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LH SERVICEABLE 110.40 -
1|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER RH SERVICEABLE 110.40
1|REAR BUMPER SPONGE (NPA) SERVICEABLE i 4
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT TO REPAIR SEE 386.70
LABOUR
1|REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR LH SERVICEABLE 67.80
1|REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR RH SERVICEABLE 67.90 o
LESS 25% DISCOUNT 319.68 -
959.02 -
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REVERSE SENSOR (SN) SERVICEABLE 200.00
200.00
LABOUR
TO RENEW DAMAGED PARTS & KNOCK OUT ACCIDENT |NOT NECESSARY 600.00 -
REPAIR AREA (REAR BUMPER, TAIL DOOR END PANEL).
TO PUTTY ,RESPRAY PAINT FOR AFFECTED ACCIDENT £00.00 200.00
REPAIR AREA (REAR BUMPER, TAIL DOOR END PANEL)
TO CHECK WIRING. NOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
TO REMOVE & REFIT SPARE TYRE,SPARE TYRE NOT NECESSARY 150.00 -
BOARD,CARPET TRIM TO ASSIST WORK LOAD.
TO CONDUCT WATER LEAKAGE TESTS TO ENSURE NOT NECESSARY 120.00 -
PROPER AIR AND SEALING
TO REMOVE & REFIT REVERSE SENSOR. NOT NECESSARY 120.00
1,840.00 200.00
GRAND TOTAL 2,799.02 200.00

Report Ref No. CS/SMO198022308/Kvdin2
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Report Ref No. CS/SMO19022308/Kvd3n2

Ae

KOMG SENG CHEOMNG
Licensed Appraiser
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