Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: HKL Lim Team Motorsport <hkllimteam@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 23 July 2020 2:36 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: FBM 8059L DOA : 14/12/19

AGREE

On Thu, Jul 23, 2020 at 2:27 PM Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi James,

Refer to attachment
Finalised amount is $ 1,050.00 / 3 days of lump sum repair

Kindly confirm

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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Thank You.

Best Regards

James Lim ( Keong )
Tel:+65 9242 3895

BLK 1008 #01-24 Bukit Merah Lane 3, Singapore 159722
Tel:+65 6275-6656, 6275-6566 Fax: 6272-9291



