
 

Our Ref: CC4/AIG19022220/Bha3 
 

Date: 20 January 2020     By Registered Mail 

        (1st Reminder) 
         

Wong Tuck Tien 
132 Tanjong Rhu Road Pebble Bay  

#08-03  

Singapore 436919 
 

Dear Sir, 

 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKJ 4066B AND SBW 320G ON 13/12/2019 

ALONG/AT NICOLL HIGH WAY TOWARD GUILLEMARD 
 
We, LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd has been appointed to act on the behalf of your insurer, 

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to settle a THIRD PARTY claim against you for an accident 

which happened on the above-mentioned date and location. 

 

Our record shows that to date, you/your driver have not reported the accident to us. We would 

appreciate it if you could urgently file a report at any of AIG reporting centre. You may refer 

to your Certificate of Insurance for the list of the reporting centre. 

 

Please note that you had been notified by our via mail by post from our office on 23 December 

2019. 

 

To enable us to look into the matter immediately, please let us hear from you within fourteen 

(14) days from date of this letter (by 04 February 2020).  

 

Please be reminded that in accordance with the terms and conditions under your policy, failure 

of compliance, our principal M/s AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd reserves the right to 

repudiate liability.  

 

If you need further assistance or clarifications, please contact the undersigned. 

 

Yours faithfully, 

 

 
Vic Alpeh Sanghilan 

Claims 

Tel : 6841 2096 

Fax: 6741 4108 

Email : vicalpeh@lkkauto.com 

 

 c.c. Claims Manager 

 AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd 

 (Motor Claims Dept) 
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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
Sent: Wednesday, 20 January 2021 11:23 AM
To: TeamAuto Pro
Cc: Admin A
Subject: Our Ref: SBW 320G and Your Ref: SKJ 4066B (AIG) / DOA: 13-12-2019 *** LKK REF: 

CC4/AIG19022220/Bba3

Without Prejudice 

Dear Sir/Mdm, 

We refer to the above matter. 

Please be informed that our principal M/s AIG ASIA PACIFIC PTE LTD had repudiated the claims in view of our 
insured has breach of policy terms and conditions. 

Kindly re-direct your client’s claim to our insured for redress. 

Thank you. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 

Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: TeamAuto Pro <teamautoffice@gmail.com>  
Sent: Monday, 18 January 2021 12:02 PM 
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: LOD - Our Ref: SBW 320G and Your Ref: SKJ 4066B (AIG) / DOA: 13-12-2019 *** LKK REF: 
CC4/AIG19022220/Bba3 
 
Dear Jasper, 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
With reference to our LOD submitted 07-11-2020, kindly be informed that our company has been officially GST 

registered dated 13-01-202 as such all COR will be subjected to a 7% GST, pls refer to attached letter from The Inland 
Revenue Authority of Singapore (IRAS) confirming our GST status. 
 
Also attached herewith is our revised LOD with GST for your reference and soonest settlement. 
 
Thank you. 
 


