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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Daphne J Lim <Daphne.J.Lim@aexp.com>

Sent: Friday, 31 January, 2020 9:38 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SJS 60H - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJS 60H AND SLE 6131Y ON 

14/12/2019 

Vic, 

 

Please note that your email was sent in error to an incorrect email address.  I am the owner of SJS 60H, not Max Ng. 

 

Please send all correspondences to me at this email address going forward. 

 

Lim Jia (Daphne) 

 

From: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Thursday, January 30, 2020 5:09 PM 

To: Max Ng <max.ng@gateway-law.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Your Ref: SJS 60H - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJS 60H AND SLE 6131Y ON 14/12/2019  

 

Our Ref: CC4/AIG19022208/Qhb3                                                         

 

 

30 JANUARY 2020                                                                                                              

 

LIM JIA                                                                                                                 By Post & By Email  

5 PECK HAY ROAD 

#09-05 

SINGAPORE 228307 

 

Dear Sir/Madam, 

 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJS 60H AND SLE 6131Y ON 14/12/2019  

 

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against 

you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them. 

 

We have received a claim from Body Repairer/Workshop acting on behalf of the owner of SLE 6131Y against your 

motor insurance policy. 

                 

Based on the accident report, accident scenario and evidence at hand, liability is down against us. We will therefore 

proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party. 

 

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us 

within 10 days from the date of this letter. 

 

Please call us if you have further queries. 
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Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 

 

 

American Express made the following annotations  

 

 

"This message and any attachments are solely for the intended recipient and may contain confidential or 

privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, use, or distribution of 

the information included in this message and any attachments is prohibited. If you have received this 

communication in error, please notify us by reply e-mail and immediately and permanently delete this 

message and any attachments. Thank you."  

 

 

American Express a ajouté le commentaire suivant 

 

Ce courrier et toute pièce jointe qu'il contient sont réservés au seul destinataire indiqué et peuvent contenir 

des renseignements confidentiels et privilégiés. Si vous n'êtes pas le destinataire prévu, toute divulgation, 

duplication, utilisation ou distribution du courrier ou de toute pièce jointe est interdite. Si vous avez reçu 

cette communication par erreur, veuillez nous en aviser par courrier et détruire immédiatement le courrier et 

les pièces jointes. Merci. 


