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Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

From: kentsengcarservices@gmail.com
Sent: Tuesday, January 21, 2020 10:30 AM
To: Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)
Subject: Re: Finalisation of SJR 1643 A

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged

Dear Sun Pin 
 
Good day, 
 
We accept the L/S COR:$1400 at 3 working days.  
 
Thank You 
Best Regards 
Susan 
Kent Seng Car Services 

On 21/1/2020 10:22 am, Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto) wrote: 

Dear Susan, 
  
Kindly refer the updated finalize amount $1,400. Repair day 3 days. (L/S, before gst). 
  
  
Thank you. 
  
Best Regards, 
Oi Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor 
  
LKK Auto Consultants 
  
Phone: 6256 3561 | Email:  Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  
From: Susan Seng [mailto:kentsengcarservices@gmail.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, 7 January, 2020 1:33 PM 
To: Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto) 
Subject: Finalisation of SJR 1643 A 
  
Dear Surveyor Sun Pin 
  
May we check if you can finalise for the vehicle SJR1643A? 
  
Thank you 
Kane 
 
Kent Seng Car Services 

 


