RPORSCHE
FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD
38 Robinson Road
#16-01 City House
Singapore 0BBBTT
Attn : Motor Claims Department ~T B T
P e
DATE :  13/02/2020 > G
e 2o %)
Your Ref SHA3007TL EE n O L
- fud S
Car Regn No' SFD8383A 3 3 =
=
Accident involving SFDB383A & SH SN/

Direct Setllement Claim

Dear Sirs

DA /3459 0 [ 30

Aftersales Centre

274 r.,.-.l. ] I‘-m-| fii
Singubiome S09042
Teiephone. [55] 6331 70K

The repairs have been completed for SFDB3BIA We submit the following documents far

your perusal :

1) Invoice No 13205633 5 6,505.45
2) LTA search lee s 7.45
3) Loss of Use ($180.00 x 3 days) 5 540.00

4) Letter of Authority
5) Discharge voucher signed by client

TOTAL § 705290

Pleasa pay Stuttgart Auto Ple Lid the sum of §7,052.90 as soon as possible
and mail your cheque o 12 Sungei Kadut Avenue Singapore 729648

Yours faithfully,

LS
W=

|

Stephanie Loke

Manager - Service & Development
DID: 83310588

FAX 53310690

e-mail stephanie loke@eurokars com sg
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M5 Frst Capital Insuranee Limited Lo fep Ne (930001080  GFT Beg Me MI.00018 -8
MSs @FirstCapital § R 0 e G
Tel; (65) 6222 2311 Fax; (65) 6222 3547

Clams & Mot Underiting Dept= 16 Robineon Soad #1601 City House Singapore

DISCHARGE RECEIPT
CLAIM REFERENGE :  D1800785E8MFSH Without Prejumce
ACCIDENT DATE © 10122019 to Injury Claim
ACCIDENT LOCATION WESTHEUT ADAD
INSURED ! COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTELTD
INSURED DRIVER LEE BUCK KHOON PETER
INSURED VEHICLE : SHA JDO0TL
INVOLVED PARTY . SFDB8383A
SETTLEMENT SUM : §6,962.90

I'We, the undarnated CLAIMANT beling the person/entily snliled (o receive the compansation in relation to the accidenl
hereby agree to accept the SETTLEMENT SUM as tull and final settiement ol all claims for damages, cosis &
disbursamants arising oul af the ACCIDENT, and I'WE aiso agree thal the sald seitlemant sum:

1. is paid without admission of liabikty on the part of MS Frst Caplital Insurance Limited and/er i1s
INSURED andlor Its INSURED DRIVER In respect of the said lase and lor damage whether
now or hereafier to become manifest,

2. s accepled by ma/us Lo the intent thal the sald MS First Capital Insuranee Limiled and Jor is
INSURED andior ks INSURED DRIVER be absolutely and finally discharged from all laims
whalsoever which UWE now or harealler may have anising oul of or conneclied with ar
tracoable 1o the sald acoldenl

IWVE acknowledge that this DISCHARGE AECEIPT is not io be construed as an admission of linbilily on the part ol MS
First Capltal Insurance Limited and/or Its INSURED and /or its INSURED DRIVER and it shall not be used as ewidance
in any claims or actions which may be made against them or any of thom.

CLAIMANT . ﬁ-%ﬁbp‘ Signature and B )63\ et

[

WITNESS | 5 Signature and Date - |
Jawice Sy |
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> Back to OneMotoring

Land Tramspor Authority

Land Transpor] Authonly
10 Sin Ming Drree
Singapore STETOY
GST Reglstration Ne © Ma-0008520-2
Print Date/Time 11 Dec 2019/ 17:14.57

Recaipt DateMima : 11 Dec 2018/ 171457

Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt No. : [TNET-D0000-181211-002738
Previous Recaipt Mo,
&IN ltem Dascriptioni Amount GS5T Amount
Eusiness Transaction Reference Before Amount After GET
Na. GST(5%) (5%) (ss)

Resull of Insurance Enguiry - SHA3IDOTL

As al 10 Dec 2018/21.:20:00

Insuranca Co: MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED
1 Insurance Enquiry - SHAI0G7L

Enguiry Fea 700 D49 748
2001211 T 35E0221 54
Siib-Total T.00 049 748
Total Befors Rounding 7.00 .49 TAE
Reunding Ditferance 0,04
Total Amount Payable 745
Paid By
Credit Carg:
Ernnaa s 0 TAS
YisaiMasterCarn
Total TAS
Cash Change 0.00
Tendesed Amour TAS
Excess Rsfundable Amount 0.00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY

Please ensure that all payments (o the Authority are good and promptly settied by the paymenl sarvice
providar / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and recelpt is considered void and late fee
may apply.



ﬁsher Snﬂ (LKKAuto)

From: Joanne Yong <loanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 27 February 2020 2:05 PM

To: Asher 5ng (LKKAuUto)

Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: [PROPOSAL ON LIABILITY] EXPRESS SETTLEMENT - Claim

No: D19007859MFSH/1 // LKK Ref: CC4/FC119022191/Eeb3, ACCIDENT INVOLVING
SHA 3007L AND SFD 8383A ON 10/12/2019

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Completed
Dear Asher,

Please proceed as per your email below.

Thank you

Regards,

Joanne Yong
Motor Claim Department

Change of email address
joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sqg

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited

& Member of B insurance Group
36 Robinson Road

#16-01 City House

Singapore 068877

Tel: 6507 3846

Fax: 6507 3849

From: Asher 5ng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@|kkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, February 26, 2020 12:15 P

To: Joanne Yong <loanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: [PROPOSAL ON LIABILITY] EXPRESS SETTLEMENT - Claim No: D19007859MFSH/1 //
LKK Ref: CC4/FC119022191/Eeb3, ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA 3007L AND SFD 8383A ON 10/12/2019

Your ref : D19007859MFSH/1
Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA 30071 (Ol) AND SFD B383A (TP) ON 10/12/2019

1



We refer to the above matter,

The accident occurred when our insured hit third party parked vehicle.
Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 100% liability.

We seek your approval to offer repairer ¥ STUTTGART AUTO PTE LTD " at § 6,962.90 [all-in],
The summary is as follows: -

Amount Claimed Amount Revised

1. Cost of Repairs (w/GST) $ 9,142.79 $6,505.45
2. Loss of Use (3days x $180) S  540.00 S 450.00 (3days x $150)
3. LTA Search Fee $ 7.45 $ 745

Total $ 6,962.90

Surveyor recommended 3days for repair.

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

Kindly let us have your approval / instruction.

Thank You.

fartt Resgourcts

Asher Sng | Cove Hancdle

LEK Auta Comultants Ple Lid

phone: 484 1-4051 | emol gshensno@lkkauld,.com | fox &741-2108

Bk 51, Poya Ul industriol Par, Wbl Avenue |, #0225 | 5/408¥33)

From: Asher 5Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 20 February 2020 12:34 PM

To: Joanne Yong <loanneyong@msiirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: [PROPOSAL ON LIABILITY] EXPRESS SETTLEMENT - Claim No: D19007859MFSH/1 // LKK Ref:
CCA4/FCI19022191/Eeb3, ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA 30071 AND SFD 8383A ON 10/12/2019

Hi Joanne,

Thank you for the email, we will look into the matter and revert soon.

Thank You.



Best Regonds

Ashes Sng | Case Honclies

LKE Auto Consultants Ple Lid

phona: &4 16051 | emoi gEnesng@kkouto com | fox 67414108
Bk 51. Poyo Ut Indusiricl Porke, Uk Avenue | 802.25 | 5(408933)

From: Joanne Yong <loanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 20 February 2020 12:22 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@|kkauto. com>

Subject: RE: [PROPOSAL ON LIABILITY] EXPRESS SETTLEMENT - Claim No: D19007859MFSH/1 // LKK Ref:
CC4/FC119022191/Eeb3, ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA 3007L AND SFD B383A ON 10/12/2019

Dear Asher,

Please find the attached LOD and our insured GIA report.

Please do express settlement for this matter.

Our insured has amended the GIA report regards to the TP vehicle.
Please contact the workshop accordingly.

Please acknowledge receipt.

Thank you

Regards,

Joanne Yong
Maotor Claim Department

Change of email address

ioanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg

MS First Capital Insurance Limited

A Member of B Insurance Group
36 Robinson Road

#16-01 City House

Singapore D6BB77

Tel: 6507 3846

Fax: 6507 3849

From: loanne Yong
Sent: Monday, December 30, 2019 5:53 PM
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@ikkauto.cam>



Subject: RE: [PROPOSAL ON LIABILITY] EXPRESS SETTLEMENT - Claim No: D19007859MFSH/1 // LKK Ref:
CC4/FCI19022191/Eeb3, ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA 3007L AND SFD 8383A ON 10/12/2019

Dear Sir,
We are checking with our insured driver regards to the TP's vehicle number.
Will revert to you soon,

Thank you

Regards,

loanne Yong
Motor Claim Department

Change of email address
icanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sq

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
A Member of IEEIEH insurance Group
36 Robinson Road

#16-01 City House

Singapore 068877

Tel: 6507 3846

Fax: 6507 3849

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@|kkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, December 30, 2019 2:28 PM

To: Joanne Yong <Joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com sg>

Subject: [PROPOSAL ON LIABILITY] EXPRESS SETTLEMENT - Claim No: D19007859MFSH/1 // LKK Ref:
CC4/FCI19022191/Eeb3, ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA 3007L AND SFD 8383A ON 10/12/2019

Claim No: D19007859MFSH/1
LKK Ref: CC4/FCI19022191/Eeb3

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA 3007L AND SFD 8383A ON 10/12/2019

We refer to the above matter,
Liability: 100%
Remark: B:22 Insured hit third party parked vehicle.

Kindly let us have your approval on liablility.



**Insured ird vehicle incorrectly.

Thank You.

Best Regorgs

Asher Sng | Cose Handler

LKK Aula Consullants Ple Lid

phone: 48414051 | emall: gshenng@kkouto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Bik 51. Parya Ui inciustdal Park. Uibl Averie | #02-25 | 5(408933)




