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SERVICE EST IMa | (0w by R
95SB08 - CO0001 SL: SERVICE SALES - PC Signature:
Mr Alaxios lliopoulos Date
149 Pasir Ris Grove Inv.No. D a
HO1=-77 Inv,date 17/12/2019
D' Nest WIP No. .. : 50828
Singapore Veh. In/Out:
Singapore 518139 £ Tel . No. .. : Maobile: 92339388
Reg.No. .. : FBM2355X / DVL
Closed by .... : Tony Alfred Desire D Reg.date . : 30/06/2014
Sve Consultant : 0746 Mileags .. (1]
Remarks ...... : Mr Alexios Iliopoulo Chassis No.: IDMGlO3AAEBOZ1547
Variant... : Diavel Carbon
Op. Mo Description CCC Mech Qty Price Disc% Pkg Amount
MOTES FOR ACCIDENT REPAIR 0.00 0
287 TO REPLACE DAMAGED rpnnrsfﬂ” Ji#0 3200.00 O 3200.00
DUCT-S FRAME SLIDERS ~ (¥ 415.00 O 415 .00
DUCT-S REAR SET KIT /~ T 1840.00 © “1B40.00
EXHAUST PIPE, H~ (T 1.0 EA 309.90 ~309.90
GASKET, EXHAUST -~ % 1.0 EA 5.00 -5 .00
EXHAUST PIPE VE~ [ 1.0 EA 309.90 7309.%0
PIPE, EXHAUST ¢~ M (M) 1 o EA 813.50 A13.50
EXHAUST VALVE €~ T 1.0 EA 16.10 A6 10
WASHER “ 9.0 EA 0.60 ~5.40
WASHER -~ ¢ 7.0 EA 0.60 74.20
HaNDLEBAR ~ O 1.0 EA 254 .30 254, 30
RADIATOR, WATER -~ OF 1.0 EA 787.70 #~787.70
RUBBER PAD -~ AN I.0 EA 1.20 X360
VIBRATION DAMPE »~ e 3.0 EA 2.60 ~7.80
FUEL TANK COVER X pn 1.0 EA 1210.80 «¥1210.80
EMBLEM DUCATI X Www 2.0 EA 31.60 ¥ 61.20
COVER, RADIATOR - 1.0 EA 594.00 < 594,00
EMBLEM DIAVEL © ~ M¢ 1.0 EA 26.40 ~ 26.40
COVER RADIATOR .~ (W7 1.0 EA 310.00 ~ 310.00
Sy < /e
-%%;? /o
Amount 10,176 .80
Amount 10,176.80
Labour Total 5,455.00 GET & 7 % 712.38
Parts Total 4,721.80 Total Amount 10,889 .20
Package Total 0.00 Le=s Amt Paid 0.00
Nett Amount 10,889.20

GST: S=StdRated; 0=0utOfScope;

i=IaroRated

Service Estimates are valid for 10 days from the above date.
This is a computar generated invoice. no signature is required.

Wearnes Automotive Ple. Lid,

45 Lang Kee Aoad, Singapore 150103 T +65 6430 4930 www swarnesaulo com
Coreg rn. 1ES0S00R / G5T reg no. M2BR206TEX

)

—
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner |D Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Detalls

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date;
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Calour;
Manufacturing Year:

Engine Na.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years);

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Foreign Identification Number
A6TK

FEBM2355X

No

17 Dec 2019

DUCATI

DIAVEL CARBON

Red

2014
ZDM1198WMO02052
ZDMGI103AAEBD21547

$24.455,00
30 Jun 2014
30 Jun 2014
1

$3,649.00

No

$0,00

2% Jun 2024

D - Motorcycle
10

§4,001.00
$1.813.00
$1,813.00

The infarmation contained herein is correct as at 17 Dec 2019

OK

"
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Used MotorCyclas/Bikes For Sale in Singapore by Owners & Dealers - 5GBikemart
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‘I!.I"ITHIDW Ducatl Diaval Carbon, Motorbikes, Motarbikes for Sale, Clags 2 an Carousell
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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

. From: Maotor Claim - Il <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 17 December 2019 10:40 AM
To: Paul Ong Qing Yong; 'sur@lkkauto.com’; Nivitha (LKK Auto)
Ce: Zuhaidah Samsuri
Subject: RE: TP Claim - FBM2355X; TP Vehicle SHC1051K DOA 19/11/2019
Attachments: DAIS-MARSDD001979-GIA AMENDED.PDF; ESTIMATE FBM2355X PDF
Dear Sir / Mdm,
Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle FEM2355X and let us have your report urgently. ,}
This claim will be handled by Ms Aida, 0 79! Y
L |
*Kindly upload this survey request email to menmen /[ "9

Thank You. us M

S e
Best Regards, 1 I
Gabriel Wee AN <
A\
. IHDM
P [NTERNATIONAL
( [nsurance
i N @O aPFDNR
. Aarvang o rager pare | Y

&4 Cecll Street; #O5 - 108 Bullding
Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext — 248

From: Paul Ong Qing Yong [mailto:paul.ong@wearnes.com)

Sent: 17 December, 2019 10:30 AM

To: Motor Claim - Ill <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Cc: Tony Alfred Desire Devaux <tony.devaux@wearnes.coms

Subject: Re: TP Claim - FBM2355X; TP Vehicle SHC1051K DOA 19/ 11/2019

Hi please arrange LKK

Paul Ong
Service Consultant
Bodyshop & Paint

Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd
45 Leng Kee Road Singapore 159103
M (65) 8126 1237 D (65) 6378 9336

WwWww wearnesauto.com paul ong@weames.com

Dutiook for Android

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message
from your system.




. 'Please do not copy it or use il for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other

person. Thank you.

From: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim @iil.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, December 17, 2019 10:27:35 AM

To: Paul Ong Qing Yong <paul ong@wearnes.com>

Ce: Tony Alfred Desire Devaux <tony. devaux rmes.cams>

Subject: RE: TP Claim - FEM2355X; TP Vehicle SHC1051K DOA 19/11/2019

Dear Sir / Mdm,
We acknowledge receipt of your email.
We proprose using one of the following motor surveyors:

* LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
* Vicom Assessment Centre Pte Ltd

Please notify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyor agreed on or if you have any objections to the
above list.

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee

. [N DIA
P INTERNATIONAL
InsurancE

BN G AFOR)
Jeruity Che Fagiie smoe ] WIT

&4 Cecil Street; #05 - /0B Building
Singapore 045711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext — 238

From: Paul Ong Qing Yong [mailto:paul.ong@wearnes.com)
Sent: 16 December, 2019 5:23 PM

To: Mator Claim - Il <motorclaim@ili.com.sg>
Ce: Tony Alfred Desire Devaux <lony.devaux@wearnes com>

Subject: TP Claim - FBM2355X; TP Vehicle SHC1051K DOA 19/11/2019

Hi,
Can check if SHC1051K is insured by 11?7

If so0, please arrange for a survey, bike is in at 45 Leng Kee.

Paul Ong
rvice C VU
& Paint

Weames Automotive Pte Ltd

45 Leng Kee Road Singapore 158103

M (65) B128 1207 D (65) 8376 9338

www wearmnesaufo com  pauleng@weames com
WEARNES

2




This emiill, Including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in amor, please noltify us immediafely by reply email and then dalate this massage from your system
Please do not copy it or use if for any purpose, or disciose |ts confents ar any attachment fo any other person. Thank you.

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed 1o have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person 1o whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended. or if this e-mail has reached
vou by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed 1o us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted. corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Lid.

Registration No. 198703792-K




Hsiao Tnnﬂ (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 26 December 2015 8:10 AM

To: Paul Ong Qing Yong

Cc Admin A

Subject: Your Ref: FBM2355X% *Our Ref CC4/11119022177/Epb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC
1051K(II1) AND FBM 2355X ON 19/11/2019]

Attachments: STATEMENT OF SHC1051K pdti

Your Ref; FBM2355X Without Prejudice

Our Ref: CC4/11119022177/Epb3

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC 1051K(Il) AND FBM 2355X ON 19/11/2019

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that liability is unclear. Attached is a copy of our insured accident report for your easy reference.

As per Il instruction, we would like to request for evidences (ie: video footage/ scene photos / PIR) for our
necessary action.

Appreciate an early reply.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole Intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of llability, whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement,

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by elther party that will materially affect/Influence on the issues
of fiability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

“Best Wishes for Merry Christmas, and Happy New Year 20207

Best Repards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3107 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | ${408933)




11242020 Menmen e-Claims

Claim Audit

- AUDIT TRAIL
1 Bl B arrenels L
17 Dec Al L2
12008 MM Claimant's Name: -> ILIOPOULDS ALEXIOS, Clsimant's ID: -> G3348467X, I L
15:13
17 Dec  Cim Veh [A] Lau
2 201% Model [203136) DUCATL DIAVEL 1.2. Shu Pl
15:13 Changed
17 Dec iteg Mo- FEBM2355X. Acct Date: 2019/11/19. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: India International Insurance Pte L [A] Lau
3 2019  Cim Created td [HQ), TP Insurer: Direct Asia Insurance (Singapore) Fie Lid (HQ). Workihop: Wearnes Automotive Pte o b
15:13 Lid [Leng Kee 2)
17020 44§ co [A] Lau
4 3211193 Assigned Lk Autn Consultants Pte Ltd (HOQ): Zhu Pei
17 Do Adj Next Al La
5 2013 Rpt Next Apt:Final Rpt,Due Date:2019/12/27 g
15:13  Changed
17 Dee 40 . [A] Lau
-] fglz’ﬂa Mandate ”Awmm.-n.nn.m.mg decides, Shu Pei
17 Dec [A] Law
7 2019 Label Added [30653):Direct Settlement. Shu Pei
15:13
17 Dec  Adj (A] Law
H 201%  Adjuster [Nona] == MOHD TAUFIKH BIN HAMID Ehu el
1513  Assigned
23 Dec Adj [A] Law
9 2019 Adjuster MOHD TALFTKH BIN HAMID -= CHEN TSUE YEE Shu Pei
11:08 Assigned
23 Dec
Cim Dti , [A] Lau
b1+ ?‘-'l.ﬂl Modified Insured Name: -> COMFORT TRANSPORTATION FTE LTD. Shu Pel
11:09
11 ::E'“ :’:jm Curfeq:0.00:PODS Liabikty: TBA Remarcs: Kindly upload insured videa in Merimen for our viewing, Curr l"uiﬁw
0811 Req ently pending for evidence fram 3rd party. TONG
(1
28 Dec !
Video Zunaidah
12 2019 Downloaded Video - Accident (01D)
4.1 Downloaded B“:m
Next (1
26 Bac. My 3 Zuhaidah
13 2019 Rpt Next Rpu:Final Rpt.Due Date:2019/13/27, Mandate Remariks: OID0 video footage uploaded Bie
14:33  Changed SAMEUn
(1
26 Dec
Ad) d Zuhaidah
14 zu_m Mandat “mm:nmnd.m'ﬂ video footage uploaded Be
14:23 Gt
26 Dec video Iuh[ltfdlh
15 221;1] D load Ilhowﬂluaand video - Accident (O10) Bte
28D oo JA] CHEW
16 2019 Downloaded Video - Accident {010
sy ownkicuien TONG
3 ;gf‘;‘ :‘fm Cur.Req:0.00: From insured video, It is likely that 3rd party was riding straight instead of turning left and [‘;_lm'_:l':g""
14:24  Regquest resulted the accident. Seek approval to reject 3rd party claim, TONG
1
18 2018 Rpr % Cur RptFinal Rpt. Cur Dus Date:2013/12/27. Mandate Aemarks; Please procesd to reject TP claim as pe  Zuhaidan
09:09 Changed ' Video footage, Whcicr®
m
10 DS ngy ' . Zuhaidah
13 2018 o Approved:0,00: Mease proceed to reject TP claim as per video feotage.
E andate Sat Bte
09:0% Samsuri
Date From 4|74 »| pateTo 4/ 7E »| Audit Type none v G|
Na record —
Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History
16 Dec 2019 | TP Case o TR T Vet
F X H 1K 11.77
2380131 Of:34:01 (In ) Motor Cw Iisiiesries PLh BM2355 SHC105
! | | ! Ld(HQ) | :
2387618 26 Dec 2019 | Video Upload Matar Il Inedia FBM2355X Zuhaidah Bre A

lttps-lsingapeore merimen comiclaimsaindax cfm¥fusebox=MTRadjusterAuseaction=dsp_viewhisioryAcaseid=B975338extid=3260644CFI0=640...




‘Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 2 January 2020 10:04 AM

To: Paul Ong Qing Yong

Cc Admin A

Subject: <REJECTION»> Your Ref: FBM2355X *Our Ref: CC4/11119022177/Epb3 [ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SHC 1051K(II) AND FBM 2355X ON 19/11/2019)

Attachments: STATEMENT OF SHC1051K pdf; SHC1051K-01 VIDEO.MP4

Your Ref: FBM2355X Without Prejudice

Our Ref: CC4/11119022177/Epb3

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC 1051K((ll) AND FBM 2355X ON 19/11/2019
We refer to the above matter.

Attached is a copy of our insured accident report and video footage for your easy reference. From the video, your
client was riding straight on the left-turn only lane and resulted the collision. We are of the view that our insured
driver is not liable for the accident.

In view of the above, we regret to inform you that we have our principal instruction to deny liability and unable to
look into your chient's matter.

Thank you.

Note: This video footage is solely for investigation and shall not be reproduced. You undertake to preserve its
confidentiality and will not disclose, provide or make available the video footage in whole or in part, to any third
party.

Best Regoards,

Hsino Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKRK Auto Consultants Pte Lud

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
i1k 51, Paya Ubi Induostrinl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S(408933)




Mernmen e-Claims Page 1 of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

We

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING |

Cass Maotified Est Submitted Adj Assigned Ad] Rpt Adj) Subirmitted Ins Auth'ed Sratun |
vy |0 Nev 2018 s 4018 S$8,400.80 | SS8,402.80 Pending for Survey I
Foit flag | | !MM:IM'II ﬂtm] w-lu_ ] r.-uur.—|

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS [ [Cruated by adjuster]
Insured. COMFORT TRAMSPORTATION PTE LTD, Co Aeg No.: 199303821R

Main i
Claman.  |TLEOPOULOS ALEXIOS,  [D: GI348467X

Vehicle Reg 19/11/2019 09:00 - :59
No. FBM2355X Date of Loss. |\ g4 months and 20 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man Yr}]
Clam Type: TP/ MCT19110468 pOSCYICIVEr | MCOMODLS (TP, Fire & Theh)
VEnicle Reg.
No. SHC1051K :'g“"' ":t-:__ MC/00575387
[Insured): :
Excess:
Repairer: Wearnes Automotive Pta Ltd [Leng Kee 2} 45 Leng Kes Road, 159103 Leng Kee - Tel:
Hanoing India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel 63476100 . [Handled by Zuhaldah Bte Samsuri - 6347 6070]

Direct Asla Insurance [Singapore) Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 65322888
Adjuster: LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Handled by CHEN TSUE YEE] _ [Final iptdun 27/12/2019]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED wiew All | Compese Case Wil |

« [T1_5G [20/12/2019). Alert - Ad) Mandate Approved (5$0.00) - FAMIAS5X - Claim Handler: Zuhaidah Bte S....
» [11_5G [26/12/2015) Alart - Adj Mandate Maintained - FRM2Z355X - Claim Handler: Zuhaidah Bte Samsuri

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ \iew Al | Searcn Tasss | Croate tew Task | _Complate |

Due Daste  Priorfty Type  Task Graup  Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On  Done?
o resuls.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=d... 16/3/2020




Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 2
Claim Documents
*FBM2355X (MCT19110468)
[SHC1051K]
™
ILIOPOULOS ALEXIOS
Nov 19 2019 9:00AM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd
Upioss Bocuments || Unloed Shoms | Compose Mew Lettse | View [View in Browser ]
Video liperpage [v] 4
Mg | Finafired On India International Tnsurance Pte Ltd (H) 1| humbnail|print
1 |26/12/19 14:32 | Video - Accident (OID) @ | Losames
Photos/Images Goerpage  [V]| &
No | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) | [Thumbnall| Print
1t |171219 1732 | Genarsl View 0| wawc | A
7 Tynwie 12 Ganaral View 0| leedrc |
3 (1712191732 | General View 0| edvs | H
4 |1TH1917:32 General View Q| weaws | & |
5 |17/12/1917:32 | General View Q| waaws | B
& [1712/1917:32 | Genaral View 0| weawc | A
7 171219 17:92 | General View 0| adws | M
|8 |17/12/1917:32 | Ddometer Reading 0| saaws | A
& 1712191737 | Chassis Number Q| edvc | A
T 1771219 17:32 Genaral View ‘ Load oG | EA
11 |17/12/1917:32 | General View 0| woaxws | B
12 |17112719 17:32 General View ! lead s |
13 |17/12/1917.32 | General View Q! acws | H
14 |17/12/1917:37 | Genarsl View 0| eews | HA
15 |17/12/19 1732 | General View 0| taaws | A
16 [17/12/1917:32 | General View @ | oews | B
17 |17/12/1817:32 | General View 0| ows | A
18 171219 17232 | General View 0| edrrs | A
19 (1712191732 | Ganaral View Q! ads | A
0 (1712191737 | Ganeral View © | osaws | @
21 |17/12/1917:32 | Geners) View @ | waws | 4
22 [17/12/1917-32 | General View 0| adire | A
21 [17/1219 1732 | General View 0| esarwrs | A
24 |17/12191731 | Genersl View @ | Losd G | &
(25 |17/12/19 17327 | Ganeral View Q wars M
26 [17/12/191737 | Genersl View Q| waws | B
27 |10 General View )| teadirc | A
28 171219 1702 General View 0| lcediec |
29 [17/12/191737 | General View O koirs | 2
30 |17/12719 1732 General View )| eears | B |
31 |17/12/19 17:32 | Genersl View @ | woaws | A
312 |17/12/19 1732 Ganaral View 0| icodiec | 4
31 1712191732 | General View @ | ediec | B
34 |17/12/191732 | Genaral View @ | ceows | B
35 |17/1219 1732 Genoral View 0 | lcedies | B
W 1712191737 | General View Q| wors |
37 |17/12/1917:32 | Genaral View 0| wodws | BB
3B [17/12/19 1732 | Genernl View O | oodvs | &
3% (171318 17:32 | Genersl View © | irs | A
40 [17/12/1917:37 | General View O | ed s

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_... 16/3/2020




Merimen e-Claims Page 2 of 2
Video i «] &
No_ | Finalized On india International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) [ [thumbnall | Print

%
a1 |17/12/1917:32 | Ganersl View Q| csdec | A
42 |17112/1917:32 | Genersl View 0| tosdwc | A
43 [1nansina General View 0| losiwc | &
44 |17/12/1917:32 | Geners! View Q| coavc | A
a5 112191732 | Genersl View Q| wiwc |
46 [17/12/1917:32 | General View 0| oaws | A
47 |17/1219 17:32 General View ! Load G | &
48 |17/121917:32 | Genaral View Q| waaws | |
49 1771218 17:32 | Genaeral View 0 | Load wo E_.
150 (1712191732 | General view O | wars | B
| Documentation 0 +]| &
(%o |Relsbel/Recrder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbmnail | Print |
'y [1212/1215.13 | EMAIL FROM II1 DD 17122018 Load POF
2 1711219 15:13 | TP ESTIMATE Load POF
3 [17/12/1915:13 | TP GIA REPORT Laad POF
& | J4/13719 09:37 TP ESTIMATE- MARKED Load POF
5 |0R0L/20 10:05 EMAIL TO THIRD PARTY_REJECT DD 020120 Load POF
No | Finalized Cin India International Insurance Pte Lid (HQ) Thumball | Print
1 18/12/19 0B:33 Singapore Accident Statemant Load PDF
Documents Checklist
DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST meset | Save | print

There are na docoment checklsts configured.

Checklist Remarks - LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd {HQ)

Show Remarks Ta: |:I Handling Insurer
Fiore . Bemavkn are orivebs ehiesl vos $Sus U 1D OINET Sartes.

hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp ... 16/3/2020




Adjuster Report Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd ico reg mo 1sseo71s8m
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, F&‘fﬂ Ubi Industnal Park
Singapore 408933
Tel; 6256-3561 Fax 6844-8B05 Email: sur@lkkauto com;assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our Fila No:  CC4/1I18022177/EPS302

Date: 16/03/2020
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: India International Insurance Pte Lid  Policy No: MCOMODD15
Claimant a
Vehicle No : FBM2355X Insured Vehicle No : SHC1051K
Date of Loss: 19/11/2019 Nature of Claim; TP Claim No: MCT19110468
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: FBM2355X
Make & Model: DUCATI DIAVEL, 1.2 Engine No: ZDM1188WMD02092
Reg. Date: 30/068/2014 (Man. Year: 2014) Chassis No: ZDMG103AAEBO21547
Calour: Red Cdometer: 0 km
Engine Capacity: 1188 ec
Markat Value/MNew Car NIA
Price:
Sum Insured (S$): Markel Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 120iT0Z R17 Rear Tyre Size: 240/45Z R1T
Front Left Side: Piralli 5 mm Rear Laft Side: Pirelli 5 mm
Front Right Side: 0 mm Rear Right Side: 0 mm
The above values represent the remaining tyre reads depth
\COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference Diff %
Parts 6,976.80 5,702.80 1,274.00 18.26
Miscellaneous Items 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 3,200.00 2,700.00 500.00 1563
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S§) 10,176.80 8,402.80 1,774.00 17.43
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%) 712.38 588.20 124.18 17.43
Nelt Amount (S§) 10,889.18 8,991.00 1.888.18 17.43
Global Sum Settlemant (S5) 0.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 17122018
Date Inspected: 171122019 Inspected At Wearnes Aulomotive Ple Lid (Leng
Kee 2)
45 Leng Kea Road
Singapore 158103
Estimated Period of Repair: 3.0 days
Adjuster: CHEN TSUE YEE Manager: CHEW HSIAD TONG

NOTE: This report represents our findings af iha fime and place of mspection sated herein. Such ingpection has been camied oul fo the bes! of our
knawledge and abifity but any olher Nabiify under any other circumatiances is heraby expressly excluged.

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfim?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 16/3/2020
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Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4
REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

[Part Source: (Last Synchronised: 13 Mar 2020)

Paris: NIA DUCATI DIAVEL 1.2 (Model not available in dalabase)

Iubnur: Repairers {Price-denominated Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no prini-code for FEM2355X)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page

numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the lasl estimate page

|Further Info: ltems/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an astensk *

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

T 1 *FRAME SLIDERS Cut 415.00FS *415.00F5
2 1 *REAR SET KIT Benl 1,840.00FS *1,840.00F5
3 1 *EXHAUT PIPE H Cut 309.90FS *308.90F5
4 1 "GASKET ,EXHAUST MNecessary 5.00F5 *5.00F5
5 1 ‘EXHAUST PIPE VE Cut 300.00FS *309.90FS
6 1 *PIPE,EXHAUST C Cut B13.50FS *813.50F5
T 1 *EXHAUST VALVEC Beni 16.10FS *16.10F5
B 9 *WASHER Necessary 540F5 *5.40F5
8 7 "WASHER Necessary 420FS *4 20FS
10 1 *HANDLEBAR Bant 254 30FS *254 30FS
11 1 *RADIATOR ,WATER Bent 787.70FS *787.70FS
12 3 *RUBBER PAD Necessary 3B60FS *A60FS
13 3 *VIBRATION DAMPE Necessary 7.B0FS *7.80FS
14 1 *FUEL TANK COVER Not Necessary 1.210.80FS *.FS
15 2 *EMBLEM DUCATI Not Necessary B83.20F5 *“F5
18 1 *COVER ,RADIATOR Cut 504 00FS *504 DOFS
17 1 *EMBLEM DIAVEL C Necessary 28 40FS *2640FS
18 1 *COVER RADIATOR Cut 310.00F8 *310.00FS
F=Franchise parl S=SpcNatt

Total Parts (S§) 6,976.80 5.702.80

Report was unsubmitted during this print-oul_

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 16/3/2020




Adjuster Report

Page 4 0f 4
Recommended Miscellaneous ltems
Thare are no new miscellaneous items salected.
Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 TO REPLACE DAMAGED PARTS New 3,200.00 2.700.00

Gross Labour Cost (S$) 3,200.00 2,700.00

| Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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