MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

BLK 3023A UBI ROAD 1 #01 - 61

SINGAPORE 408717

GST REG. NO : 200501102H

TEL : 6748-4422 ] 6744-4422 FAX :6-747-6720
Email: chin@modernautomotive.com.sg

Your Ref : SLKA4366T
Our Ref : SLP2586L
Date 07.02.2020

The Claims Manager

AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
AIG Building

78, Shenton Way #07-16

Singapore 079120

Tel: 6-419-300 Fax:6-415-3727

Attn : The Motor Claim Dept

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLP2586L & SLK4366T ON 15.12.2019
ALONG PIE (TUAS) BEFORE EXIT 17

We refer to the above matter.

We have been authorized by our client Mr Chew Wah Lam to make claim against your
insured vehicle No.SLK4366T in respect of the above accident for the following:

Repair Cost $ 7,650.50 (Incl GST)
Loss of rental ($120 x 9 days) $ 1,080.00
Search fee 3 7.45

Total: § 8,737.95

Enclosed herewith a copy each of the supporting documents for your perusal.
Kindly process the above and remit the payment to us asap

Yours faithfully

-

Modern )\utomotive Pte Ltd



Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Subject: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK4366T & SLP2586L ON 15/12/2019 ALONG/AT PIE

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 22 July 2020 9:10 AM

To: ADMIN@SG-CARLEASING.COM

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK4366T & SLP2586L ON 15/12/2019 ALONG/AT PIE

Our Ref: CC6/AIG19022140/Aka3

SG CAR LEASING PTE LTD
[POLICY HOLDER]

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK4366T & SLP2586L ON 15/12/2019 ALONG/AT PIE
We refer to the above subject matter and our e-mail dated 08/01/2020.

We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor insurer, AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

In addition to our previous e-mail, please be informed that there is an excess of $52,000.00 (plus GST) in accordance to
your motor insurance policy.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Sent: Wednesday, 8 January 2020 4:07 PM



To: ADMIN@SG-CARLEASING.COM
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK4366T & SLP2586L ON 15/12/2019 ALONG/AT PIE

Our Ref: CC6/AIG19022140/Aka3

SG CAR LEASING PTE LTD
[POLICY HOLDER]

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK4366T & SLP2586L ON 15/12/2019 ALONG/AT PIE

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor
insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your favour. We will therefore
proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial vehicles)
upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed
utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

“Wishing you a happy and a prosperous New Year!”

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




LETTER OF AUTHORIZATION

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN
Dear Sir,

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE

......................................................................................................................................

.....................................................................

.......................................................................................................................................

This letter is to authorize MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD at Block 3023A, Ubi Road 1,
#01-61, Singapore 408717 to resolve the above matter.

In respect of this authorization, MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD has my/our authority to
decide on my/our behalf whether to accept any offer of settlement from the third party
insurers. I/we also agreed that all payments include Loss of Use to make in favour of
MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD.

MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD is also authorized to sign all the required documents
include Discharge Voucher from the third party insurers on my/our behalf.

Yours Faithfully

...................................

Signature of Owner

Cliew Waly Lawa

.....................................

Name /NRIC S co0RAENOT



RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

“We/l, MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD(“the workshop™) hereby confirm that we/l have
reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd LKK
AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for
$$8,450.00(Global Sum) for vehicle no. SLP2586L that was damaged pursuant to the accident
which occurred on 15/12/2019 (date) along PIE (TUAS) NEAR EXIT 17 involving vehicle no/s
SLK4366T.

This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 18/12/2019 (date) at “the workshop™.

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner CHEW WAH LAM(the third party
claimant”) of vehicle no. SLP2586L._make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l
have full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/I deem fit. We/l enclose
herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”.

We/l further confirm that we/I will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party
claimant” after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and
expenses suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the
damage to SLP2586L. (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant” pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a
without prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have

exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Dated this__ €% (day) of A\k:\v\S‘r (month) 20 2O (year)
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Signed by appointed surveyor Signed by “the workshop” (with chop)



MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

BLK 3023A UBI ROAD 1#01-58/61 SINGAPORE 408717
TEL : 67474422, 67454422 FAX : 67476720
GST REG. NO: 200501102H

AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD . T: oice : TP001480
78 SHENTON WAY #07-16 ax Inv '
SINGAPORE 079120 Date : 07/02/2020
Vehicle Num. : SLP 25861
Attention : Motor Claim Department Cmas‘;?s%?\%i MAZDA 3-2017
Contact : 6415-3727 6419-3000 Accident Date : 15/12/201¢9
Claim No. :
Reference :
Policy No. : 5100494036
SN Quantity Particular Unit Price Amount S$
LABOUR :
ACCIDENT REPAIR (LUMPSUM) ’ 7,150.00
Labour Total % : 7.150.00

Total S% - 7,150.00
GST@ 7% S$ - 500.50
Amount Due S$ : 7,650.50

MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD



DAWN ENTERPRISES

21 SELETAR WEST FARMWAY 1
SINGAPORE 798125
TEL: 6383 2661 FAX: 6484 2836

REG. NO. 430058/00D NO- 2 O 2 ‘5%4 i
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DAWN ENTERPRISES

21 Seletar West Farmway 1
Singapore 798125

Tel: 63832661 Fax: 64842836

Reg No.430058/00D

RENTAL AGREEMENT

HIRER’S PARTICULARS

' e Wodn L awy
Address {@:3}“‘ &i}\’xﬁ Q}g &\g (?E\Q\ K:M‘«

T SRS N

11

Occupation
Date of Birth

Driving Licence No.

PR O
or Passport No. - ‘ Country

Age

Date Passed

: (HP) C\a‘@/i&i\\ﬁ%

DATE

DRIVER’S PARTICULARS

Name

Address

1/C or Passport No. Country
Occupation
Date of Birth Age

Driving Licence No.

Date Passed

Tel (Residence) Tel: (Office) (Residence)
IMPORTANT NOTES: CHARGES

1 No Insurance Coverage if the dgeg{d?ﬁelow 24yrs old or less than 2 years driving licence. i} 7 T - R
2 This vehicle is licenced to carry { passengers only. Day at $ \\% * D E} per days N 1&@ * @ E)
3 Hireris liable to pay first § d}wﬁ} f;g E:} as excess all claims any accident plus loss “E

of earning while damaged vehicle is under repair. Day at $ per week
4 For usage to Malaysia suject to higher excess ali claims of $$5,000.00 and different rental rate
5 Please notify our office should there be any accident involving this hired vehicle within 24 hrs Day at $ per month
6 No refund will be given for vehicle returns early.
7 No refund will be given for petrol left in vehicle.
8 Hirer is liable to pay all parking fee and traffic summonses. -

N . - 3 '\k Y

9 Veh!cles. to be returﬁ dun‘ng office hour only. :% E @g@ ’k} ij
10 No Service on Public Holiday and Sunday. TOTAL AMOUNT ol E\

SCHEDULE ‘ - \m E} 7

AL PR TTIAY AMOUNT PAID = U L

g / 3’(7’ Beag ‘ N VV L

Eﬁ\ﬁ B Z;i '
L N BALANCE DUE
: i Mileage
Time ag Days Extension From To
)

Amount Deposit (refundable) $

TO

l/we have read and understood the terms and conditions
above and hereby agreed to abide

Hirer's Signature

Driver/Gurantor’s Signature

DAWN ENTERPRISES



Feedback Page 1 of |

> Back to OneMotoring

Land Transport Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575701

GST Registration No. : M4-0006529-2
Print Date/Time : 16 Dec 2019/ 10:25:05

Receipt Date/Time : 16 Dec 2019/ 10:25:05

Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt No. : ITNET-00000-191216-000711

Previous Receipt No. :

S/IN Item Description/ Amount GST Amount
Business Transaction Reference Before Amount After GST
No. GST (S9) (S%) (S9)

Result of Insurance Enquiry - SLK4366T

As at 15 Dec 2019/11:20:00

Insurance Co: AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
1 Insurance Enquiry - SLK4366T

Enquiry Fee 7.00 0.49 7.49
20191216102345130237
Sub-Total 7.00 0.49 7.49
Total Before Rounding 7.00 0.49 7.49
Rounding Difference 0.04
Total Amount Payable 7.45
Paid By
XXXXXXXXXXXX3760 Credit Card: 7.45
Visa/MasterCard
Total 7.45
Cash Change 0.00
Tendered Amount 7.45
Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee

may apply.

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/completePayment?FUNCTION_ID=F1301001TT 16-Dec-19



Chin

From:
Sent:
To:

Subject:

LTA <LTA-VTL®Ita.gov.sg>

Monday, December 16, 2019 10:25 AM
CHIN@MODERNAUTOMOTIVE.COM.SG

Notification of Successful Vehicle Insurance Search for Receipt No.:
[TNET-00000-191216-000711

Dear Sir/Madam

We wish to inform you that your transaction on "Enquire Vehicle Insurance Particulars"
performed on 16 Dec 2019 was successful and the Receipt No. is ITNET-00000-191216-

000711.
2. The details of the search results are as follow:
Vehicle No. Search Date  Search Time  Search Result
SLK4366T 15Dec 2019  11:20:00 AIC ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE.
3. Please contact our customer service officers at tel : 1800-CALL LTA (1800-2255 582)
should you require further assistance.

4. Visit www.onemotoring.com.sg for more information, or go to www.lta.gov.sg/feedback if
you have any feedback. This email is auto-generated, please do not reply to this email.

5. Thank you.

If you are not the intended recipient of this communication, please delete it.

As it may contain confidential or official information, do not retain it or disclose the contents to any person as it
may be an offence under the Official Secrets Act.



