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31 UNTAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA LIHD INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL ; (065) 62563561 FAX : (D65) 62364012

Your Ref; CMTD1905825/THE
Date: 15/01/2020

Our Ref: CS/SMO19022111/A113

The Motor Claims Department
SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE P

Dear Sirs/Mdm

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO, JSR 9400 .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above-mentioned vehicle

on _17/12/2019 _at the premises of M/s ___SM Automotive and have the following
10 report: -

Workshop Estimate Amount ;8% 32 0
Revised Estimate Amount 8 400,00
*Check™ Items Amount (8§ 000
Market Value 1 S§

LTA Reimbursement Value 1 S% -
Netl Value 1 58 -
Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages
at the rear portion and parts.

Repair days: 10

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.

Yours faithfully
Adrian Ling
Automotive Assessor



Summer Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Teo, Grace <graceteo@sompo.comsg>

Sent: Monday, 16 December, 2019 3:06 PM

Tao: sm automotive; ‘admin-d@lkkauto.com": ‘assignments@lkkauto.com’
Ce: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin; Henry, Irene James: Choo, Thelma

Subject: CMTD1905825/THE - LKK/ SLX6266S & JSR9400 DOA:14.1219
Attachments: J5R3400 PRILpdf

Our Reference: CMTD1905825/THE
Your Reference: JSR9400

Withou udi
Date: 16/12/2019 EMAIL ONLY

OUR Email; mntngyweg&mgg.cnm.“

Attention:
M/S SM AUTOMOTIVE

Dear Sukyi,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLX62665 & JSR9400 ON 14.12.2019
We refer to your email reply of today.

We will appoint LKK Auto Consultants to conduct the survey.

Hi LKK Auto,

Please refer to the email below and make the arrangement to survey for JSR9400 on a without prejudice basis and
revert with your report upan completion of survey to my colleague, Ms. Thelma.

Thank You

Our office will be closed on Christmas, New Year's Eve and New Year Day. Business will resume on 26™ Decembar 2018
and 2™ January 2020 respectively.
We wish you a Merry Christmas and a Happy New Ysar!

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Divislon

D: 6329 5170 | T 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147

For motor claims survey request, please email to mntnrsung!@gmgo.ggm.sg



e @ SOMPO A Century of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/08 Singapore Land Tower. Singapore 048623

Website: WWW sompo.com.sq | Facebook: www facebook com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission’ & Product Purchase’ via Sompo SG

¥ Google Play

Download now @ e App Store or

"For Travel, Personal Accident & Homi Insurance | * Far Travel, Personal Accident, Home & Private Motor insurance

Disclaimer: This a-mail. including attachments, is intended for the persan(s) ar company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited
If you are not the intendad recipient please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sempo Insurance Singapore Ple. Lid. may callect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy This may include disclosure 1o holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com>

Sent: Monday, December 16, 2019 2:58 PM

To: Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com sg>; Choo, Thelma -cthelma.chua@sumpn.cnm.sp

Ce: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; Henry, Irene James <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>
Subject: Re: CMTD1905825/THE - PRI/ SLX62665 & JSR9400 DOA: 14.12 .19

Without Prejudice

Hi Grace

Please arrange for:-

||_2 | LKK Auto Consultants

Regards,

Sukyi Chong
SM AUTOMOTIVE

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6

Blk C #01-43

Singapore 417883

Tel: 6747 9241 Fax: 6741 7276

From: Teo, Grace “Erace.teo@sompo.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, December 16, 2019 2:47 PM
To: sm_automotive@hotmail.com <3 _automotive@hotmail.com>; Choo, Thelma <thelma.choo@sompo.com.sg>

Cc: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye@sompo.com sg>; Henry, Irene James <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: CMTD1905825/THE - PRI/ SLX6266S & JSR9400 DOA:14.12.19

Our Reference: CMTD1905825/THE
Your Reference: 1SR9400



Date: 16/12/2019

Without Prejudice

EMAIL ONLY

OUR Email: motorsurvey@som pPo.com.sg

Attention:
M/S SM AUTOMOTIVE

Dear Sukyi,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLX6266S & JSR9400 ON 14.12.2019

We refer to your Notice of Accident dated 16/12/2019.

Please be informed that Ms, Thelma Choo is the handler of this case who can be tontacted at 63224 681/

:helma.thnu@ggmgu.mmxg i

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the dama

client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one
the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

BE Lo your client’s/your customer’s vehicle Jointly with your

of the motor surveyors named in the attached list to conduct

Pre-Repair Survey
Selection (Indicate as
Motor Surveyor Surveyor tick)
1 Raleigh Services Andrew Ow Yong
Vincent Ng
Kenneth Kong (North
2 LKK Auto Consultants area)
Marcus Chua (East area)
Mohd Rasul (West area)
Mohd Taufikh (West area)
3 Priority Services limmy Lee
Lawrence Ng
leffrey Ong

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether

You agree to the appointment of any of these motor

surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select up to two of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost of
the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert,

Qur office will be closed on Christmas, New Year's Eve and New Year Day. Business will resume on 26 December 2019

and 2™ January 2020 respectively
We wish you a Merry Christmas and 2 Happy New Year!

Best Regards



i;rm.:a Teo
Claims Division

D: 6329 5170 | T: 6461 8555 | F: 6221 3147

For motor claims survey request, please email to motorsu S0Mpo.com.s

@ SOMPO A Century of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte, Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623

Website: www.sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www facebook com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission® & Product Purchase’ via Sompo 56

" A
Download now @ ar
YFor Travel, Persanal Bt Ident & Home insurance | < Eor Traval, Pertongl Accident, Home & Private Matar Insurance

™ ] wn

pp Sto

re

Disclaimer: This e-mail_ including attachments, is intended for the persan(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged Information Unauthorised disclosurs. copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited
If you are not the intendad fecipient. please delete this message

Privacy Palicy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Fte. Lid may collect. Use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
slated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties o whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third parny service providers and agenis (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Palicy

From: sm automotive <iM_sutomotive@hotmail.com>

Sent: Monday, December 16, 2019 12:53 PM

To: Claims - Motor Su rvey <MotorSurvey@som po.com.sg>
Subject: ISR9400 CLAIMING AGAINST SLX6266S DOA:14.12.19

Without Prejudice
Hi Motor Claim Dept

Please send us your surveyor list,thanks,

Regards,



) ;ukyl Chong
SM AUTOMOTIVE

1 Kakil Bukit Ave &

Blk C #01-43

Singapore 417883

Tel: 6747 9241 Fax: 67417276



Denise Ta: [LKKAutn!

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 18 December 2019 3:37 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); 'Teo, Grace’; SUR; assignments

Ce: *Ye, Yong Kang Melvin'; 'Henry, Irene James'; 'Choo, Thelma'
Subject: RE: CMTD1905825/THE - LKK/ SLX62665 & JSR9400 DOA:14.1219
Dear Sir/Madam,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle JSR 9400 on 17/12/2019
We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,
Denise Tay | Case Handier
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall: denisetay@|kkauto com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.coms>

Sent: Monday, 16 December 2019 3:12 PM

To: 'Teo, Grace' <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin' <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; 'Henry, Irene James' <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>; 'Choo,
Thelma' <thelma.choo@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: RE: CMTD1905825/THE - LKK/ 5LX62665 & ISR9400 DOA:14.12.19

Dear Sir/Madam,

Thank you for your assignment,

Best Regards,
Summer Lee | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6741-8434 | emall: gssignments@kkauto.com | fax: f256-4315
Blk 51, Payn Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | 5(408033)

From: Teo, Grace <grace.ieo(@sompo.com.sg>

sent: Monday, 16 December, 2019 3:06 PM

To: sm automotive <sm_automaotive@hotmail.com>; ‘admin-d@lkkauto.com' <admin-d@lkkauto.com>;
‘assignments@Ilkkauto.com' <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye @sompo.com . sg>; Henry, Irene James <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>; Choo,
Thelma <thelma.choo@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: CMTD1905825/THE - LKK/ SLX62665 & JSR9400 DOA:14,12.18

Our Reference: CMTD1905825/THE
Your Reference: JSR9400



SM AUTOMOTIVE

I €aki Bukit Ave s

Our Ref J5RS400 Bl C @ Autobay, #01-43
Your Ref SLX626R5 Singapore 417883
Date 16/12/2018 Tel - [B5) 6747 9241

Fax (G5} &741 727h

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Lid BY EMAIL
mgﬁmuwa!&umgn l:ﬂm.!-ﬂ

Attentian Motor Claims Department

Dear Sirs,

DATE OF ACCIDENT © 14 DEC 2019 @ 18:30 hours
NOTICE OF INSURER TO CONDUCT PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION WITHIN 2 WORKING DAYS
PURSUANT TO PARAGRAPH 6.2 OF PRE-ACTION PROTOCOL FOR NIMA CASES

We act for JUDE HENG who has appaointed the
undermentioned workshop to repair motor vehicle no. JSR9400

Please be infarmed that the said vehicle can be inspected at

SM AUTOMOTIVE

1 KAKI BUKIT AVE &
#01-43 BLK C @ AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883

Contact Person : Office @ 6747 9241 (Reena / Sukyi)
if you failed to conduct the pre-repair inspection within the next 2 working days excluding

any intervening Saturday, Sunday or Public Holiday. The said warkshop will commence
repairs thereafter without further reference to you.

For Surveyor.
Yaurs Faithfully Please initial here after compleion of
Pre-repair inspection. Thank you

f ) Surveyor Name

/ & signature
/) Date&Time




POLICE FORCE VR T

Tr20191215/2080
Police Station Of Origin: 103
Ang Mo Kio South N.P.C Report No. T/20121215/2080
81 Ang Mo Kio Avenue 3 SINGAPORE
569929

Tel No 1800-4519999
REPORT OF A TRAFFIC ACCIDENT

Date/Time Report Made: Vide Report No. | Station Diary No

15/12/2019 1459 - 54

Name of Informant | Address:

JUDE HENG APT BLK 11 WOODLANDS DRIVE 72 #08-37 WOODSVALE
| SINGAPORE 738094 —

ID Type / ID No. | Contact No..

FIN NO / G8002977U | Home/Office: Mobile: 81230084

Nationality: | Email:

MALAYSIAN

Sex: Age Date of Birth: | Type of Informant:

Female 33 07/04/1986 Driver

Race: Language: | Institution / School Name:

Chinese English

Occupation: Driving Licence Information:

SALES Class: Date of Expiry.

Type of Non-Injury _ Type of Location:
Accident: l Foreign Vehicle : - | Straight Road
No | 14/12/2019 18:30
Location:
Along Road 1
CENTRAL EXPRESSWAY
Lamp Post Number: 405F
Weather: Road Surface: Road Speed Limit:
Clear Wet
Traffic Flow: Traffic Control: Traffic Volume:
Dual Carriage Way Not Controlled Moderate
Type of Collision: Anyone conveyed by
Between Moving Vehicles - Head To Rear ambulance:
% Mo
JSR9400 | Car Slightly |0
! Damaged

SLX6266S | Car Slightly | 1

I ' Damaged

Any Pedestrian Involved: No
No. of Pedestrians Injured: NIL | Use of Pedestrian Crossing: NA




0 RO

Ti20191215/2080

Police Station Of Origin. vigy2
Ang Mo Kio South NPC Repart No. T/2019121462080
81 Ang Mo Kio Avenue 3 SINGAPORE
560929 CONTINUATION OF REPORT
Tel No: 1800-4519689
Name JUDE HENG ID No GB8002977U
| ! | =]
| Related Vehicle | JSR9400 (Car) | Contact No.| 81230084
| | i
| Hospital/Clinic | NIL | Classof | Class: NIL
Driving | Date of Expiry: NIL '
Licence &
| | Expiry Date | |
Date Treatment | NIL Date Discharge | NIL
No._of Days granted Medical Leave | NIL ree of Injury | NIL

Name | JONATHAN THONG Z1 XIAN ID No. | 59314396E
: | =N
Related Vehicle | SLX6266S (Car) Contact Nu.i 86555859 ; |
- I
Hospital/Clinic | NIL Classof | Class: NIL I
Driving Date of Expiry: NIL
Licence & | |
| Expiry Date
Date Treatment | NIL | Date Discharge | NIL |
No. of Days granted Medical Leave | NIL | Degree of Injury NIL

Brief Details.

On 14/12/2018 at about 1830hr, | was travelling along CTE on the 1st lane when | spotted the vehicle in
front jamming brake. | then applied my brake and was traveliing slowly when suddenly, | felt an impact an
the back of my vehicle. | then alighted from my vehicle and check the damages. | then found out that il
was a chain collision. We then took pictures of the accident before exchanging particulars. | left the scene
after that



SINGAPORE
POLICE FORCE

Police Station Of Onigin:

Ang Mo Kio South NP C

81 Ang Mo Kio Avenue 3 SINGAPORE
569929

Tel No: 1800-4519988

Sketch Plan
Informant is not able to provide sketch plan

w

A

Ti20181215/2080

Jof3

Reapon No. T/20181215/2080

CONTINUATION OF REPORT

IMPORTANT Please attach a copy of your vehicle’s Insurance Certificate to this report. If you don't have
the certificate with you now, please fax a copy to 65474885 stating the report number as reference.

Signature Of Officer Recording The Report: |
F/
Sgt 2 JEREMY KHOO WEI LIAN

Signature Of Informant.

foplt

Signature Of Interpreter:
Not applicable

Date/Time:
15/12/2019 14:58

Officer In Charge Of Case:
TP/ AEIT/

S| MOHAMAD ZULFAZDL! BIN ABDULLAH |

Classification Of Case:

Contact No.: 65476204 1

__==
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- @ wmsic

PFRIVATE CAR - INDIVIDIL A Form MXT

ROAD TRANSPORT ACT, 1987 (MALAYSIA) MOTOR VEHICLES (THIRD PARTY RISKS) RULES. 1959 (MALAYSLA)
WOTOR VEHICLES (THIRD PARTY RISES AND COMPENSATION ) ACT (CAl 189) REPUBLIC OF SINGAMRE MOTOR
VEHICLES ITHIRD FARTY RISKS AND COMPENSATION) RULES 196 (REMUBLIC OF SINGATORE)

MOTOR VEHICLES INSURANCE (THIRD PARTY RISKS) ACT (CAPF 490}, NEGARA BRUNEI DARLSSALAM

Certificate No MC-87749800-MPD

I. Index Mark and Registration
Vihicle Registration No:  |SR9400

Vehicle Make . 05 | MERCEDES BENZ

Vehicle Model 9 | C

Vehicle Description . MERCEDES BENZ C250
2 MName of Policy Holder JUDE HENG

3. Effective date of the Commencement of Insurance for the purpose of the Regulations, Ordinance
or Enactment 29/03/2019
4. Date of Expiry of Insurance: 26/03/2020

5. Persons or Classes of Persons entitled to drive *

(a) The Policyholder, (b) Any other person who is driving on the Policyholder's order or with his
permission

Provided that the person driving is permitted in accordance with the licensing or other laws or regulations
to drive the Motor Vehicle or has been permitted and is not disqualified by order of a Court of Law or by
reason of any enactment or regulation in that behalf from driving the Motor Vehicle.

6. Limitations as to use

Use only for social, domestic and pleasure purposes and for the Policyholder's business

The Policy does not cover use for hire or reward, racing, pacemaking, reliability trial speed-testing. the
carnage of goods other than samples in connection with any trade or business

Limitations rendered inoperative by Section 95 of the Road Transport Act 1987 (Malaysia) or Section 8 of
the Motor Vehicles (Third Party Risks and Compensation) Act (Cap 189) Republic of Singapore or Section 7
of the Motor Vehicles Insurance (Third Party Risks) Act (Cap. 90) Negara Brunei Darussalam are not
included under this heading,

LWe cortify that the Palicy to which this Certificate relates s ssued m sccosdanoe with the provisions af Part 1V ol the Road rl'ill'l'l-rH-'r' Agt,
1987 [Malaysia). Motor Vehicles (Third Party Risks and Compensation) Act (Cap 189) Republic of Singapore and the Motoe Velileles [nsurance
{Third Party Risks] Act (Cap 90) Negars Brunei Darussitam,”

Approved lnsurers
RTD - 32
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MC-87749800-MFD |
MCA$I18-A— 8

1 DRIVER'S PA INSURANCE POLICY

B60407-23-5320
ADMINISTRATION MANAGER

Caover + COMPREHENSIVE
Vehicle Lise 1 Private Car for Private Lise
Log Book No. 1 NA

Cubie Capacity : 1,991 CC
Year of Manufacture ; 2018
Excess (RM) 10

: _ Accessories

(Mal. ] Jﬂ!h‘.l (degpa.w)  Cuslomar S ::E__'j.'.h-- !
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SECTION 1- PERSONAL ACCIDEN |

DEATH
FERMANENT TOTA| (15AKL FAENT
PERMANENT PARTIAL 1154 FMENT
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Perceitage of each benefits as o vicy

MEDICAL EXPENSES [PER PERSON| gAL ) 000
FUNERAL CREMATIUN REPATRIATION RAL 2000 @
BEREAVEMENT ALLOW ANCI KAL 50000
AMBULANCE FEES RA 50000
HOSPITAL INCOME (PER DAY MM 3
DENTAL/COSMETIC SURGERY A i
DOLUBLE INDEMNITY BM 200000000
I L gLl M-S0 MITY Mage 2

MSIG Insurance (Malaysia) Bhd

I BOC-BER-M31G (6734

VWelisile waa meiy com ms
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Insured's Telephone:

Chus Seck Guan
Chiel Executive Officer
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CHUA GEK EE

: (IRO018146-U)
NO 25 . JALAN DESA 21.
/ TAMAN DESA SUNGAI ABONG |
84000 MUAR _ IOHOR
TEL NO 012-6788855/FAX NO 06-9555497
INVOICE
NO: ADOS5
JUDE HENG DATE : 09/03/2019
NO 4 JALAN TREH ,
TAMAN SRI TREH |,

84000 MUAR, JOHOR .

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
RM

NAME : JUDE HENG

VEHICLE NO : JSR9400

POLICY NO : MC87749800-MPD

SUM INSURED : RM 248,000

PERIOD OF INSURANCE :29/03/2019 - 28/03/2020

INSURANCE PREMIUM 6257.68

ROAD TAX 375.50

SERVICE CHARGE 10.00
TOTAL AMOUNT 6643.18

IANK ACCOUNT

AAYBANK :101049276353
UBLIC BANK :3174856032

CHUA GEK EF



‘ MSIG

Biller Code

P JI. 1]
Invoice J

by
Rel-1 MCETTaphLuli
Ret-2 Froes ¥

h

gt Creriuect Mrnitied

Intans JOmPAY (reivie 1 ity ancd bidom Bty it g

Ciarmets | Bisernafy Comsill Tabe moTapil

MSIG INSURANCE 1M AL A YIATRHD RS TIL, ¥ W s WETLLL ] el

LEVEL 15 MENARA FLA SENG, 2

PLAZA HAP SENG NO T TALAN 1" RAMLEL Dt Tiviai
50350 KUALA LLAMILRK

SERVICE TAX REC ~iY Wil Iais 100 TRS

Insured /! Pl oo Cal s Ay UL HENG

Address | Al Nubd JALAN TREH
S0 AMLTAR

Account Number  Nomibve Akaun MOCA4I8-A

Transaction Type | Jens Transalss NEW BUSINESS

Policy Number / Nomtbor Pulis MC-S7749800-MPD

Product / Produk PHIVATE CAR WITH DRIVER'S 'A
Period OF Insurance [ Tempoh [rserans 29/0372019 28/03,2020

Gross Premiom
Prevuum Kasar

Service Tax an Premium & 6'%
Cubai Perklidmatan alas Premium

Summary

Total Premium
Jusmlal Presiung
Total Service Tax
Cukas Perkhidmatan
Stamp Duty

Duili Setem

REM

KM

RM
RM

RM

5.894.04

353.64

5894.04
353.64
10.00

Total Amount Payable

ﬁ.ﬁ?.ﬂ

Jumlah Periu Dibavar

This s a compiter generated document. No signature required

MSIG Disurance (Malaysianl Bhd SETE Mol 1EBND BEMEIG (Br4d
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endaftaran
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o
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N
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o

Buatan/Nema Mode|
Keupaysan Enjin

Bahan Bakar

Status Asal

Kelas Kegunsan

Jenis Badan/Tahun Dibust
Tarikh Pendaftaran
B.D.W/B. 0.K/BTM |
Syarat Pendsftaran 1

dyarat Pendaftaran ?

Syarat Pendaftaran 3

SIJIL PEMILIKAN KENDERAAN

JABATAN PENGANGKUTAN JALAN

- JSR9400
860407235320
JUDE HENG

NO 4 JALAN TREH TAMAN SRI TREH
4000 MUAR JOHOR

WDD2050456L033901 / 2740203130907
- MERCEDES BEMZ / C250-W205A
1881
- PETROL
- PEMASANGAN TEMPATAN
PERSEND IR IAN-MOTOKAR INDIVIDU
- MOTOKAR / 2018
20/03/2018




SM AUTOMOTIVE

Email ‘:'-H AdeI‘u‘ICﬁTiUE ol HCITMAII EDM

16/12/2019
Blk 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 TP Saiins
#01-43 =
Singapore 417883 _
Accident date: 14/12/2019
Estimated repair cost for vehicle no: JSR9400 MERCEDES C250

CHASSIS: WDD2050456L033901

S/n Qty Items U/price Amount
1 1 RearBootlid Th.tid $2,226.00
2 2 Rear Boot Lid Hinge ALt o $262.00 §524.00 A
3 1 Rear Boot Lid Emblem Logo $51.00 —
4 3 Rear Boot Lid Emblem Logo Clip | A& 58.00 52460 =
5 1 Rear Boot Lid C250 Logo . $90.00 “ .
6 1 Rear Boot Lid Number Plate  jpe==== nlt_ $50.00 /
7 1 Rear Boot Lid Inner Lock "o g $335.00 «
8 1 Rear Boot Lid Inner Rubber ot ¥ $191.00 —
] 1 Rear Boot Lid Inner Trim Board = Af¢ as $248.00 *
10 10 Rear Boot Lid Inner Trim Board Clip  Ace ~ $8.00 $80.00 «
11 1 Rear Boot Lid Centre Chrome Moulding 7,., $244.00 *
12 1 Rear Boot Lid Top Spoiler | ~ $855.00 °
13 1 Rear Boot Lid Camera phf - S680.00 ~
14 2 Rear Tail Lamp Lot —C $716.00 $1,432.00 ~
15 4 Rear Tail Lamp Clip  »*~ $8.00 $32.00 -
16 1 Rear Bumper 3 st niad §3,077.00> b Es
17 1  Rear Bumper Lower Lid L L — $386.00 «
18 8 Rear Bumper Clip o $8.00 $64.00— o
19 2 Rear Bumper Side Retainer A $68.00 $136.00 ~
20 1 Rear Bumper Center Lower Garnish ca (_¢& $355.00
21 4 Rear Bumper Reverse Sensor 3 D Gaam $232.00 $928-00 aé
22 1 Rear Bumper Towing Cover  » == $70.00 4
23 1 Rear Bumper Reinforcement et $682.00 -
24 1 Rear Bumper Top Beam b o $110.00 +~
25 2 Rear Fender Je s $2,820.00 $5,640.00 +
26 2 Rear Fender Inner Trim Board LH forn $381.00 57620055 |
27 16 Rear Fender Inner Trim Board Clip e $8.00 $128:00— 305




28 1 RearEnd Panel Assy  Teadtd $1,480.00
29 1 Rear End Panel Top Garnish G ld $168.00—"
30 1 Rear Spare Tyre Panel Forn C 51,890:008° <
31 1 Rear Spare Tyre Panel Top Cover ¢ La~——d $340.00 —
32 1 Rear Spare Tyre Panel Sealant  Ma~ $450.00- €]
33 1 Rear Exhaust Btr Doyl ed $1,255.00 +~
34 1 Rear Centre Exhaust wst ~— $1,300.00 #
35 2 Rear Exhaust Mounting 1t $55.00 $110.00 +
36 2 Rear Exhaust Chrome Pipe  Red - $398.00 ¢ $796: 65Y
37 4  Rear Exhaust Aluminium Cover (sl d $189.00
I8 ) R Bt fd Ao Lacie Staror ¢ "'IJ Jl E "S-' *;, /8%.
36, | fuu Speme A Fevel Tip Spangy e Eﬁl-f oS Subtotal :- $27,945.00
M0 | Rear Ed Toral Sesdest we i
Labour charges

(4R =i
To remove & refit cushion & trim board | 307,59 SM 120

To remove & refit rear top spoiler

To remove & refit reverse sensor

To remove & refit camera

To remove & refit rear & centre exhaust

To reset computer

To check wiring

Tuff kote

Panel beating

Spray painting

“Z6/D

Aleics K,
L}i F'?f,;/,g_

! 5
D I’/E'éi.xl:ntv:}t.all -

r,_: K Aulo Cane,, ants hencs nably
[ hm & "N ﬂtﬂ
¥ 1
s i T l'-
||'||:| )
M) durry iutwiy !
1 e ’r
s contomaten Totn! (67580

' on & “Wehout P e base k
* No s mesf il i 3

= ) 2 alowar ' - J‘.ﬁ
M =la| Tl eALEFy ) st be '-'—:.i-‘l"'f'! 'nﬂ r \ ) I_'

B BLSpect 1o fina abproval rom r g *::;_1 [mw‘- S
fc-nnluo}e-:hqmm i o
Bigradume:

Cate

$380:00 /6o
$380.00 ‘2
$100:00 7~
$150:00 ¥o
$1,600:00 ‘v
SI'EM /500
$4,950.00
$32,895.00
33558



' 74 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

dldB 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL' 6256 3581 FAX: 6258 4315

Reg. Mo 108607196R GST Reg. No. 18-8607188-R

SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PL Rel CS/ISMO18022111/AH302

50 RAFFLES PLACE
#05-01/06 Dale : 08-02-2020

SINGAPORE LAND TOWERSINGAPORE 048623

Code . SMO
1. _Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM L &
Insured Veh. SLX 62665 B Veh. Inspected JSR 9400
Policy No. Coverage (5) 0.00
Claim No. CMTD1805825/THE Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From GRACE TEO Assign Date 161122018
2. _ Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MERCEDES BENZ C250 c.C 1891
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. WDD2050456L033901 Colour WHITE
Odometer 26442 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Moedification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3 _Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |245/40 R18 BRIDGESTONE B mm
L/H Front Tyre |245/40 R18 BRIDGESTOMNE & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |24540R18 BRIDGESTONE B mm
L/H Rear Tyre |245/40 R18 BRIDGESTONE & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. & i ‘General Information 2
Accident Date 14/1272018 Inspection Date 1712/2019
Survey held at  SM AUTOMOTIVE
BLK C, 1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 8 #01-43 SINGAPORE 417883
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BJIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INS"I"HU‘C'I'IDNS WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED FIEPAIHE

5b. Estimale Days of Repalr

lEE'I'IMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 10 Working Days




Reg Mo 199607188R GST Reg No. 19-9607108-R
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. JSR 9400

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ui Ave 1 #0725 Paya Ubl Industnal Perk, Singapore 408533
TEL A258 15681 FAX' G258 4315

136.00
355.00
928.00

70.00
B682.00
110.00

5.640.00

762.00
128.00
1.480.00

el — « o _ .;:E | e | Estimate By
Q0 BT SiDesenption s IOt
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BOOT LID DENTED
2|REAR BOOT LID HINGE @©$262.00 NOT NECESSARY
1|REAR BOOT LID EMBLEM LOGO NECESSARY
3|REAR BOOT LID EMBLEM LOGO CLIP {@%8.00 MECESSARY
1|REAR BOOT LID C250 LOGO NECESSARY
1|REAR BOOT LID NUMBER PLATE NECESSARY
1|REAR BOOT LID INNER LOCK DAMAGED
1|REAR BOOT LID INNER RUBBER cuTt
1|REAR BOOT LID INNER TRIM BOARD NOT NECESSARY
10|REAR BOOT LID INNER TRIM BOARD CLIP @%8.00 NOT NECESSARY
1|REAR BOOT LID CENTRE CHROME MOULDING NOT NECESSARY
1|REAR BOOT LID TOP SPOILER NOT NECESSARY
1|REAR BOOT LID CAMERA NOT NECESSARY
2|REAR TAIL LAMP @5$716.00 CRACKED
4|REAR TAIL LAMP CLIP {@$8.00 MECESSARY
1|REAR BUMPER DISTORTED
1|REAR BUMPER LOWER LID DEFORMED
8|REAR BUMFER CLIP @858.00 MNECESSARY
Z2|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER @$68.00 MECESSARY
1|REAR BUMPER CENTER LOWER GARNISH CRACKED
4|REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR @$232.00 g:mfsen (3PCs
1|REAR BUMPER TOWING COVER NOT NECESSARY
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BENT
1|REAR BUMPER TOP BEAM CRACKED
2|REAR FENDER {@52820.00 TO REPAIR SEE
LABOUR
2|REAR FENDER INNER TRIM BOARD {@$381.00 MNIS TORN
16|REAR FENDER INNER TRIM BOARD CLIP %800 MECESSARY
1|REAR END PANEL ASSY DENTED
1|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH CRACKED

Report Rel No. CS/SM0O19022111/AH3n2

168.00

2,226.00

51.00
10.00

682.00
110.00

381.00
30.00
1,380.00
168.00




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ui Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 8258 3581 FAX: 6258 4115
Reg. Moo 1996507 188R GST Reg Mo, 18-9607198-R

1|REAR SPARE TYRE PANEL TORN 890, ;
1|REAR SPARE TYRE PANEL TOP COVER DEFORMED 340.00 340.00
1|REAR EXHAUST DENTED 1,255.00 1,255.00
1|REAR CENTRE EXHAUST NOT NECESSARY 1.300.00 -
2|REAR EXHAUST MOUNTING @$55.00 NOT NECESSARY 110.00 .
2|REAR EXHAUST CHROME PIPE @$398.00 BENT 796.00 654.00
4|REAR EXHAUST ALUMINIUM COVER @$189.00 CRUMPLED 756.00 189.00
1|REAR BOOT LID AUTO LOCK SENSOR CRACKED 295.00 2085.00
1|REAR SPARE TYRE PANEL TOP SPONGE CRACKED 268.00 268.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -1,446.20
28,058.00 13,015.80
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR SPARE TYRE PANEL SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 450.00 60.00
1|REAR END PANEL SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 100,00 80.00
550.00 120.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE & REFIT CUSHION & TRIM BOARD. 280.00 120.00
TO REMOVE & REFIT REAR TOP SPOILER 180.00 80.00
TO REMOVE & REFIT REVERSE SENSOR. 100.00 60,00
TO REMOVE & REFIT CAMERA 180.00 80.00
TO REMOVE & REFIT REAR & CENTRE EXHAUST. 380.00 160.00
TO RESET COMPUTER. 380.00 120,00
TO CHECK WIRING 100.00 30.00
TUFF KOTE 150.00 80,00
PANEL BEATING INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR 1,600.00 1,400.00
FENDER.
SPRAY PAINTING. 1,600.00 1,500.00
4,850.00 3,610.00
GRAND TOTAL 33,558.00 16,745.80

Report Rel No. C5/SMO1902211 1/At13n2
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'RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 13,400,00
(TOITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
Report Ref No. CS/SMO19022111/At3n2

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI
Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAER OF LIARILITY TD THIRD PARTIES - This Aaport s mads ssisly ior the s and benalit of ihe Clisnt named on the from pegs of ihis Beporl.




