Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Ong Shiying <shiying.ong@fastechauto.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 26 June 2020 11:37 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Jason

Cc: Lina Pang

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SJIF3846G *Our Ref: CC6/11119022100/Apa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING

SMH 2890M(lII1) AND SJF 3846G ON 12/12/2019]

Without Prejudice

Dear Hsiao Tong,

We are pleased to accept your offer of $3,350.00 (all-in) for my client’ s vehicle property claim.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Shiying

Choo Motor Spray Painter

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-39
Autobay Singapore 417883
Tel: 6746 5405

Fax: 6745 8520

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any personal injury claim (if
any) of the owner/ claimant.

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, June 26, 2020 10:09 AM

To: Jason <Jason@fastechauto.com.sg>; Ong Shiying <shiying.ong@fastechauto.com.sg>

Cc: Lina Pang <Lina.pang@fastechauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SJF3846G *Our Ref: CC6/11119022100/Apa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMH 2890M(l11) AND SJF
3846G ON 12/12/2019]

Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to your below email.

We had reviewed the matter and we are prepared to improve our offer at a global sum of $3,350.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

From: Jason <Jason@fastechauto.com.sg>

Sent: Saturday, 11 April 2020 11:03 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>; Ong Shiying <shiying.ong@fastechauto.com.sg>

Cc: Lina Pang <Lina.pang@fastechauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SJF3846G *Our Ref: CC6/11119022100/Apa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMH 2890M(IIl) AND SJF
3846G ON 12/12/2019]

Without Prejudice

Dear Hsiao Tong,

We are unable to accept your offer.
Please refer to the attached photo, your client was supposed to stop as he was coming out from the minor road.
Kindly review the case.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Tang Jun Zhong

Choo Motor Spray Painter

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6

#01-39 AutoBay

Singapore 417883

Tel: 6746 8443
ChooMotorClaim@gmail.com

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/
claimant.

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, April 10, 2020 1:37 PM

To: Ong Shiying <shiying.ong@fastechauto.com.sg>

Cc: Jason <Jason@fastechauto.com.sg>; Lina Pang <Lina.pang@fastechauto.com.sg>
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Subject: Re: Your Ref: SJIF3846G *Our Ref: CC6/11119022100/Apa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMH 2890M(l1I) AND SJF
3846G ON 12/12/2019]

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to your below email.

The accident took place along Driveway of Car Park, we are of the view that both drivers need to be exercise
cautious.

Kindly let us have further evidence(ie: video) in order for us to review the matter.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256 3561 | email: chewht@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ong Shiying <shiying.ong@fastechauto.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 9 April 2020 2:50 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Jason <Jason@fastechauto.com.sg>; Lina Pang <Lina.pang@fastechauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SJF3846G *Our Ref: CC6/11119022100/Apa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMH 2890M(l11) AND SJF
3846G ON 12/12/2019]

Without Prejudice

Dear Hsiao Tong,

We are unable to accept your offer, therefore we are counter proposing global sum of $3,800 (all in) for

my client’ s vehicle property claim.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shiying

Choo Motor Spray Painter

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-39



Autobay Singapore 417883
Tel: 6746 5405
Fax: 6745 8520

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any personal injury claim (if
any) of the owner/ claimant.

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@I|kkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, April 9, 2020 1:41 PM

To: Jason <Jason@fastechauto.com.sg>; Ong Shiying <shiying.ong@fastechauto.com.sg>

Subject: Re: Your Ref: SJF3846G *Our Ref: CC6/11119022100/Apa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMH 2890M(lII) AND SJF
3846G ON 12/12/2019]

Without prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement at a global sum of $1,850.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256 3561 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 2 January 2020 10:49 AM

To: Jason Fastech Auto (jason@fastechauto.com.sg) <jason@fastechauto.com.sg>

Subject: Your Ref: SIF3846G *Our Ref: CC6/11119022100/Apa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMH 2890M(lll) AND SJF
3846G ON 12/12/2019]

Your Ref: SIF3846G Without Prejudice
Our Ref: CC6/11119022100/Apa3

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMH 2890M(111) AND SJF 3846G ON 12/12/2019

We refer to the above matter.



Enclosed herewith in this email is a copy of our insured's accident report for your perusal. The accident took place
along Driveway of Car Park, both drivers need to be exercise cautious.

Strictly without admission of liability whatever, but with a view towards a resolutions of your client’s claim in the
above matter without resort to litigation, we propose 50/50 on this matter.

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

“Best Wishes for Merry Christmas, and Happy New Year 2020

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



